Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 3 October 2018 3:25 PM

To: 'irenelsk@vfixauto.com.sg'

Cc: 'kentsh'

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD7022X & SLR8029D ON 04/08/2018 *** LKK REF:
CC6/LCR18014315/Upa3

Attachments: DV_XD 7022K.pdf

Without Prejudice

Hi Irene,

We confirm settlement at $3,125.00(all-in).

Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: irenelsk@vfixauto.com.sg <irenelsk@vfixauto.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 1 October 2018 4:07 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'kentsh' <kentsh@vfixauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD7022X & SLR8029D ON 04/08/2018 *** LKK REF: CC6/LCR18014315/Upa3
Dear Hsiao Tong

Thanks for your prompt reply.

We regret to inform you that we unable to accept your offer at $3,050.00. For quick amicable settlement, we would
like to counter proposal at $3,125.00.

Thank you.

Best regards,



Irene Lee

Vfix Auto Service Pte Ltd

60 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Ark@KB Singapore 417892 |

E: contact@vfixauto.com.sg |

T. +65 6455 2957 (Line 1) ; +65 6385 4138 (Line 2) ; +65 6448 9268 (Line 3) |
F. +65 6445 2368 |

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 1 October 2018 3:52 PM

To: irenelsk@vfixauto.com.sg

Cc: 'kentsh' <kentsh@vfixauto.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD7022X & SLR8029D ON 04/08/2018 *** LKK REF: CC6/LCR18014315/Upa3

Without Prejudice
Hi,
We refer to the above matter.

We have our principal instruction to offer at a global sum of $3,050.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 1 October 2018 1:28 PM

To: irenelsk@vfixauto.com.sg; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'kentsh' <kentsh@vfixauto.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD7022X & SLR8029D ON 04/08/2018 *** LKK REF: CC6/LCR18014315/Upa3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.



Please note that: -

LKK ref Officer in charge

CC6/LCR18014315/Upa3 Hsiao Tong - 6742 3197

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: irenelsk@vfixauto.com.sg <irenelsk@vfixauto.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 1 October, 2018 11:53 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'kentsh' <kentsh@vfixauto.com.sg>

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD7022X & SLR8029D ON 04/08/2018

Dear Sir

Please find attached Letter of Demand for your kind perusal.

Thank you.

Best regards,

Irene Lee

Vfix Auto Service Pte Ltd

60 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Ark@KB Singapore 417892 |

E: contact@vfixauto.com.sg |

T: +65 6455 2957 (Line 1) ; +65 6385 4138 (Line 2) ; +65 6448 9268 (Line 3) |
F: +65 6445 2368 |

From: irenelsk@vfixauto.com.sg <irenelsk@vfixauto.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 29 August 2018 9:14 AM

To: marcuschua@|lkkauto.com

Cc: irenelsk@vfixauto.com.sg; joannelsy@vfixauto.com.sg

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD7022X & SLR8029D ON 04/08/2018

Dear Marcus

We confirm estimate for your kind perusal as per attached.

Thank you.

Best regards,

Irene Lee



Vfix Auto Service Pte Ltd

60 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Ark@KB Singapore 417892 |

E: contact@vfixauto.com.sg |

T: +65 6455 2957 (Line 1) ; +65 6385 4138 (Line 2) ; +65 6448 9268 (Line 3) |
F: +65 6445 2368 |

From: irenelsk@vfixauto.com.sg <irenelsk@vfixauto.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 28 August 2018 10:41 AM

To: 'marcuschua@lkkauto.com' <marcuschua@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD7022X & SLR8029D ON 04/08/2018

Dear Marcus

Please find attached after paint & confirmed estimate for your kind perusal.

Thank you.

Best regards,

Irene Lee

Vfix Auto Service Pte Ltd

60 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Ark@KB Singapore 417892 |

E: contact@vfixauto.com.sg |

T: +65 6455 2957 (Line 1) ; +65 6385 4138 (Line 2) ; +65 6448 9268 (Line 3) |
F: +65 6445 2368 |

From: irenelsk@vfixauto.com.sg <irenelsk@vfixauto.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 6 August 2018 3:30 PM

To: 'assignments@lkkauto.com' <assignments@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD7022X & SLR8029D ON 04/08/2018

Dear Catherine

Please find attached copy for your arrangement.

Best regards,

Irene Lee

Vfix Auto Service Pte Ltd

60 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Ark@KB Singapore 417892 |

E: contact@vfixauto.com.sg |

T: +65 6455 2957 (Line 1) ; +65 6385 4138 (Line 2) ; +65 6448 9268 (Line 3) |
F: +65 6445 2368 |




