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' Vd V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

ad 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6255 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Na: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 18-8807195-R

[

]
by
L

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL Ref :  CS/SMO18014203/R1qd3
fosdioo " [N
#05-01/08 Date: 086-08-2018 |
SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623
Code: SMO
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GX 31608 Veh. Inspected SLF 8262Y
Policy No. Coverage (%) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD1803343/AGC Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  GRACE TEO Assign Date 06/08/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model C.C 0
Engine No, HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mim
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  01/08/2018 Inspection Date av/oe/2018
Survey held at MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
BLK 1008 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 #01-04/06/08 .
SINGAPORE 156722
5a, Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)JIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




51 UBLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UKI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 40E931 TEL : (065} 62563561 FAX : (065} 62564315

Your Ref: CMTD1803343/AGC Date: 08" August 2018
Our Ref: CS/SMO18014293/R 1qd3 Without Prejudice

The Motor Claims Department
Sompo Insurance

Attn: Grace
Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO._ SLF 6262Y .

We thank you for the instruction on _06/08/2018.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on (7/08/2018 at the premises of M/s MOVA AUTOMOTIVE and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 8% 5,179.76
Revised Estimate Amount :S§ 2,640.56
“Check™ Items Amount . 5% 1,532.40
Market Value : 53 -
LTA Reimbursement Value (5% -
Nett Value 5% -

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the

n/s front portion. e

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages consistent.

Days of repair: 5 days.

We have not authorized repair.

Yours faithfully

Rasul
Automobile Assessor



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Ce:

Subject:

Teo, Grace <grace.tec@sompo.com.sg>

Monday, 6 August 2018 11:38 AM

nitha; admin-d@lkkauto.com; assignments@Ilkkauto.com

tanyw@mova.com.sg; Chan, Shu Hui Agnes; Henry, Irene James; Ye, Yong Kang
Melvin

CMTD1803343/AGC - LKK(LIA)/ GX3160S & SLF6262Y DOA 01/08/18 AT SLIP ROAD
INTO BRADDELL RD FROM UPPER SERANGOON ROAD

QOur Claim Reference: CMTD1803343/AGC

Your Reference: SLF6262Y

Hi Nitha,

We acknowledged receipt of your claim documents.

Please be informed that Agnes Chan the handler of this case.

Please be informed that we have appointed LKK AUTO to conduct the survey.

Aside to LKK AUTO,

Please make arrangement to conduct the survey for SLF6262Y on a without Prejudice Basis and without any

admission of liability basis.

Please submit with your report to my colleague, Ms. Agnes Chan.

o
Aside to Agnes,

Please refer to the liability request from Mova Automotive Pte Ltd.

Best Regards
Grace Teo
Claims Division

D: 6325 5170 | T. 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

Innovation for Wellbeing

@/ SOMPO

A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
30 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sqg | Facebook: www facebook.com/SompoSG




Quick & Easy Claims Submission® & Product Purchase? via Sompo SG

b GETITOM
Download now @ ﬁﬁp Stﬂre i GODQ!EPIQY

"For Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance | ? For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom

disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: nitha [mailto:nitha@mova.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, August 03, 2018 5:47 PM

To: Claims - Motor Survey

Cc: tanyw@maova.com.sq

Subject: TP CLAIMS - SLF6262Y AGAINST GX31605 DOA 01/08/18 AT SLIP ROAD INTO BRADDELL RD FROM UPPER
SERANGOON ROAD

Dear Sir/Madam,
Good day

REF : GX31605
Kindly assist revert officer in charge and liability and arrange surveyor for the above mention case.

Best Regards,
MNitas
Ciaims Officer

Mova Automotive Pte Lid
Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314

@MOVA ¢ o

Auvtomolive Ple Lid



Rasul (LKKAuto)
B b e T e s e e e e e

From: Tan Yoong Wei <tanyw@mova.comsg>
Sent; Tuesday, 2 October, 2018 10:06 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FINALISE SLF6262Y

Hi rasul,

Yes sorry we accept the amount 53300 with 5 working days lumpsum
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Tan Yoong Wei

Estimator

Mova Automaotive Pte Ltd

Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314

@MOVA ¢ o

Automolive Ple Ltd

This message is cenfidential and is for the use of the intended recipiant only. If you have received this message in error, please do not copy. disclose or use
its content. We would be grateful if you would retify us by email and delete the original lransmissian and any attachment from your system

Any attachment 1o this e-mall may contain software viruses that could damage your compuler system. Althowgh we will take reasonable precaution to
minimize this risk. we do not accapt any liability resulling from software viruses. Please carry oul your own virus checks before opening any attachment

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) [mailto:Rasul@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 2 October 2018 9:21 AM

To: Tan Yoong Wei

Subject: RE: FINALISE SLF6262Y

Hi Yoong wei,

The parts must be discounted to 20% and the labour u calculate supposed to be 970 not 910
Finalised amount is 5 3,300.00 / 5 days lumpsum
Kindly confirm

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@ lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(a08933)
F LFLS -

SeSRER min Suue phe Earthe Print oy when recessary



From: Tan Yoong Wei [mailto:tanyw@mova.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 1 October, 2018 3:24 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: FINALISE SLF6262Y

Hi rasul,

Recarrection for finalise.

Kindly avise whether we can finalise cost of repair lumpsum 53850 with 5 working days?
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Tan Yoong Wei
Estimator

Mowva Automotive Pte Ltd
Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314

@MOVA ¢ o

Autlomolive Ple Ltd

This message is confidential and is for the use of the intended recipient only. If you have raceived this message in error, please do not copy, disclose or use
its content. We would be grateful if you would notify us by emall and delete the original transmission and any attachment from your sysiem

Any attachment o this e-mail may contain software viruses that could damage your computer system. Although we will take reasonable precaution to
minimize this risk, we do not accept any liability resulting from software viruses. Please carry out your own virus checks before opening any attachment,

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) [mailto:Rasul@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 26 September 2018 10:08 AM

To: Tan Yoong Wei
Subject: RE: FINALISE SLF6262Y

Hi Yoong Wei,

Kindly assist

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@ kkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | 5(408933)

¥ RSES

= e

= REE W Save the Earth- Print oy when fecessary:

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 24 September, 2018 10:56 AM
To: 'Tan Yoong Wei'

Subject: RE: FINALISE SLF6262Y

Hi Yoong Wei,

Kindly check the finalised amount again and confirm



Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)
74 7

e P LR

| Save the Earth. Print only when AECESTIIY

From: Tan Yoong Wei [mailto:tanyw@mova.com.sq]
Sent: Monday, 17 September, 2018 11:56 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)
Cc: SUR
Subject: FINALISE SLF6262Y

Hi rasul,

Please advice whether we can finalise cost of repair lumpsum 53200 with 3 working days?
Attached photo after repair

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Tan Yoong Wei

Estimator

Mova Automotive Pte Ltd

Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314

@MOVA ¢ o

Automotive Ple Lid

This message is confidential and is for the use of the intended recipient only. If you have received this message in error, please do not copy, disclose or use
itz content. We would be grateful if you would nofify us by email and delate the criginal transmission and any attachment from your system.

Any attachmant 1o this e-mail may conlain software viruses that could damage your computer system. Although we will 1ake reasenable precaution to
minimize this risk, we do not accept any liabilty resulting from software viruses, Please carry out your own virus checks before opening any attachment.



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

f

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 8 August 2018 2:06 PM

To: 'Teo, Grace'; assignments; Chan, Shu Hui Agnes

Cc 'Henry, Irene James'; 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin’; SUR

Subject: RE: CMTD1803343/AGC - LKK(LIA)/ GX3160S & SLF6262Y DOA 01/08/18 AT SLIP
ROAD INTO BRADDELL RD FROM UPPER SERANGOON ROAD

Attachments: C55M018014293R1gd3.pdf

Dear Agnes,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SLF 6262Y.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: f256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8{408033)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 6 August 2018 4:15 PM

To: 'Teo, Grace' <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Ce: 'Chan, Shu Hui Agnes' <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>; 'Henry, Irene James' <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; 'Ye,
Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: CMTD1803343/AGC - LEK([LIA)/ GX31605 & SLF6262Y DOA 01/08/18 AT SLIP ROAD INTO BRADDELL RD
FROM UPPER SERANGOON ROAD

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer arrange on 07/08/2018,

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Teo, Grace [mailto:grace.teo@s0ompo.com.sg

Sent: Monday, 6 August 2018 11:38 AM

To: nitha <nitha@mova.com.sg>; admin-d@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: tanyw@mova.com.sg; Chan, Shu Hui Agnes <agnes.chan(@sompo.com.sg>; Henry, Irene James
<irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: CMTD1803343/AGC - LKK(LIA)/ GX3160S & SLF6262Y DOA 01/08/18 AT SLIP ROAD INTO BRADDELL RD
FROM UPPER SERANGOON ROAD

Our Claim Reference; CMTD1803343/AGC
Your Reference: SLF6262Y



AI32N1R PARFI/CNE Rahata Frmiine

= Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owiner 1D Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner |D: 5197F

Vehicle Details

Vehicle Mo SLFo2eY

Wehicle to be Exported: Yes

Intended De-registration Date: 03 Aug 2018
Vehicle Make: HOMDA

WVehicle Madel: VEZEL 1.55X HYBRID A
Primary Colour: Gold
Manufacturing Year: 2016

Engine No.: LEB5911330
Chassis Mo RU3I1211328
Maximum Power Cutput: 112.0 kW (150 bhp)
Open Market Value: $25,132.00
Orriginal Registration Date: 01 Sep 2016

First Registration Date: 01 5ep 2014
Transfer Count: 1]

Actual ARF Paid: £5,000.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 31 Aug 2026

PARF Rebate Amount: $3,750.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 31 Aug 2026

COE Category: B - Car above 1600cc or 27kW (130bhp)
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: £56,500.00

COE Rebate Amount: $45,200.00

Total Rebate Amount: $48,950.00

The information contained hereinis correct as at 03 Aug 2018

OK
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LMY BDAGET 301 § Mova Autemative Pia Lid = Buiil Moerah
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 02062016 10:05
SURMITTED BY: Manitha Gunasskarsn

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT
IMPORTANT NOTICE

. Pleass report cormelly the details of the accident to speed up the claims procass,

2 This Form must be complated by the Policyholdar andlor the Authonised Driver.

3. Infarmation provided must be as truthful and accurale as possible. Any wiliul misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies 1o
repudiate policy aollity.

4, The kesue and acceplance of this Ferm by insurance companies is ned an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance companies.

5, Any falsa reporting may ba refarred to the Polics for investigation.

. This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GLA Records Management Cenlre estzblished by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and Ihal copies of this repart will, for a fee, be made available upon application by inlerested parties.

7. By the lodgemaent of this repart ko tha insurars, you hereby consent to the archiving af this report at the cantra and Lo eopies of the report being made avadabla
aforesaid.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report 02/08/2018 10:06
Date Of Accident 01/08/2018 18:05
Exact Location Of Accident SLIP RD INTO BRADDELL RD FROM UPFPER SERANGOON ROAD
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
Wehicle Registration Mumber SLFG262Y
Insured/Policyholder
Mame Of Registered Chwner CHRISTINE ANG LAY SIM
MRIC Mo 51165197F
Email Address NOEMAIL
Mobile Phone Mo (LOCAL) +55-97337608
Alternative Phone Mo OTHERS-NOPHOME
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer HOMDA
Model VEZEL 1.5X HYBRID A

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy

far repair to your vehicle? a

If Mo, Please siate action lo be taken THIRD PARTY

Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR

Insurance Company

Mame of Insurance Company AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
Type Of Coverage COMPREHENSIVE

Fleet Policy NO

Policy Mumber 2100480038-01

Cover Mote Number

Drriver

Name of Driver PETER THOMG LIM CHIN
NRIC No 525035304

Date Of Birth 16/07/1952

Occupation INDOOR

Date Of Driving Pass 03M12/1980

Driving Experience 37 YEARS AND 7 MONTHS
Gender MALE

Maobile Number (LOCAL) +65-96406683
Fax Mumber

Contact Murmbaer

EMail Address PETERTLCOT@SINGMNET.COM.SG

Page 1 of 16



Address

Fostcode
Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company
If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Wehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own
WVehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident

Weather Conditions

Road Surface

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident?
Number of vehicles involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident?

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged?

| have been approached by unknown person(s)
solicitingfoffering accident claims assistance,

Mumber of Passengers (Including Driver)
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported lo the police?

If Yes,Please state which Police Station
Was notice of intended Prosecution given?
If ¥es,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

27 SEA AVENUE
#02-02

424247

NO
SPOUSE

SIDE SWIPE
CLEAR
DRY

NO

NO
MO
YES

NO

NO

NO



Sketch Plan Pg. 1

SKETCH PLAN

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1.

&

Please report correcthy the detzils of the accident 1o spead up the claims process.

This Form must be complete he Palicyholder and/or the Auth

. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misreprasentation or withholding of materiat

tacts may allow insurance companices to repudiste policy lability.

. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurancs companies is not #n admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance

companies,

Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

. The report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GiA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance

Association of Singapare (GI&] for archiving and that coples of this report will for a fee be made available upon application by
Interested parties,

By the lodgment of this repert to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of
the report being made available aforosaid.

. Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act [PDPA)

| understand, acknowledge, agree and consent that:

[a) My insurer, my workshop and the General Insurance Association of Singapaore ["GIA") may/are permitted to collect, use,
disclose and/or process my personal data/personal information set out in this [form] and any other persanal information
provided by me or possessed by my insurer (collactively the *Personal Information”) and disclose and transfer such
Persanal Infarmation to all insurer(s) who heve insured vehicle(s) Involved in this accident {all insures|s) who have insured
vehiclels) involved in this accident shall be collectively referred to as the “Insurers”), the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, the
Monetary Authority of Singapore and any relevant government agency/authority (such as the police), for the purpose(s)

{i} processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims including the settlement of the claims and any necessary
investigaticns relating to the daims;

{1} investigating the accident and/or my claims;
(i) carrying out and/for dealing with my Instructions or responding to any enquiries by me;

[iw) administering my claims [including the mailing of correspondence, statements, invoices, reports or notices to me,
which could involve disclosure of certain personal data about me to bring about delivery of the same as well as on the
external cover of envelopes/mail packages); and/or

|} complying with applicable law In administering, processing, handling andfor dealing with my clalms.{collectively the
“Purposes”]

(o] aliinsurer(s) wha have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident and the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, may/are permitted
to collect, use, disclose and/or process my Personal Information for one or more of the above Purposes; and

(e} my Persenal Infarmation may/can be disclosed by any of the Insurers and/or GlA ta their third party service providers or
agents{including their lawyers/law firmg), which may be siled outside of Singapore, for one or more of the above Purpeses.

{d)  my Personal information will alse be collected and used to compile claims history for the purpose of fraud detection,
investigation and management in present and afl future claimas.

{e) the information so collected under (d] above may be shared [ disclosed:

{it toallinsurers and/or any other third parties that assist in evaluating, investigating, contreliing or managing fraud,
regulators, law enforcement and government agencies as reasonably required for the purposes stated, or

{il} far complying with requirements under any regudations, lews or court erders.

O~ Y

Pallwhold:u's-ﬁlanatu:c Driver's Signaturc Roporting Centre Personnal’s Signature
Cate & Time: {If driver is not the policyholder) Mame:
Date & Time: NRIC/FIN No.:

Pago 3 of 16



Sketch Plan Pg. 2

SKETCH PLAN

A BLHJU‘{
@ Gi%lf.{}s

DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

ucensepate: Ol F 626 ACCIDENT DATE & TIME. | Aug 201§ .r'- 1806 Wr
conTacT numBeR: 1640 bEER )( ﬁ?}g?{.ﬂg E-MAIL ADDRESS: p,&\ﬂ-lt[,_._ ol @‘ﬂﬂﬁﬁi‘ comSq
LocaTioN: iy road @uks B reddel voad -&rﬁm Upper Sevaugoow -

O\ Aug™08, ak arawd \&Obhr, T wos -’i."r‘tmdhh.} from dpper
%M'Biﬁmn anbr a ﬁ1prma T % o Brodd 21 rq,qd

from a = lowe road, slp mod mecg me a awdle lane.
AL Hae poit vohere Al slp road LR ks Broaddel raad, I
Aried 1 Rlier onh Brodd4l rood Voud Ldas pmable B da so,
€v T conbmue dfdit Dycwsond. Witouk warning . a blie
Togote \orcy  (&ix 2bo -i}raddqn'q ovekake from vy ,!,J,:a_ Lefk
st gamd Wik wuy froat Luh*.}lzm«:i.u

Drwer nema - Woaq ‘\'uuc_; Buu

WRic ne % S 86 Hbr3 S s 2568442 T
Rddtess y Bk 267, Tawpiuas st 20, 4o5-u (1852)
118 419494763

NOTE: PLEASE NOTE THAT YOUR INSURER MAY HAVE 14 DAYS TIME FRAME FOR YOU TO SUBMIT AN
OWHN DAMAGE CLAIM UNDER YOUR OWN POLICY. PLEASE CHECK YOUR POLICY FOR MORE INFORMATION

Please slale:

B

=
{ ) Claim Own Policy V(/}’malm Thirg Party { ) Claim ODITP 1 oiher warkshap ;d%mlnn Only
DECLARATION

I/We deglare the foregoing particulars are true in every respect,

e Gl

Policyhotder's Signature E:\-er's Signaturc Reporiing Centre Personnei's Signature
Diate & Time: {if driver is not the policyholder) MNarme:
Date & Time: MRIC/FIN No.:
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@Mov

Main Office:
Mionia Building
Mo, 22, Jalan K

Singapore 156419

Lid

Page # =1 Tel: |65) 6476 3333
E'ﬁmte ax: (BS)B271 5891
WINW,MOVE,COIMLSg
Veh # . SLF&262Y
w i
03/08/2018 o ek 1008,
Veh Model - HONDA VEZEL 1.5 kit b
SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD Estimate# - CK417796 Singapare 159722
50 RAFFLES PLACE Tal: (65) 6272 3802
i - Fax: (BRI B2 !-.-= 14
#05-01/06 SINGAPORE LAND TOWER Claim # o i
SINGAPORE 048623. ACC. Date - 01/08/18 ST Fleg M
Terms - C.OD Days
Aflention - XA018 Remarks -
Mo Description Oty U.Price Amounts S
LIST ITEMS :
1. FRONT FENDER LH 1 PC #30.00 M es000
2. FRONT FENDER LOGO (HYBRID) 1 PC B2 90 A -"”f 82.90
3. FRONT HEADLAMP LH 1 PC 1.850.50 2 M4 gso.s0
4 FROMT HEADLAMP LOWER BRACKET LH 1 PC E5.00 % £5.00 '
5 FRONT WHEEL ARCH LH 1 PC 230.00 AT 7 23000
8. FRONT COWLING LH 1 PC 165.0004 < 165.00
7. FRONT COWLING CLIPS LH 10 PC 480 M — 4800
B. FRONT BUMPER RETAINER LH 1 PC 30.60 M7 3060
9.  FRONT BUMPER 1 PC gp1.70 OF ~ 90170 _
10.  FRONT FOG LAMP GARNISH LH 1 PC 65.00 XC < 65.00
11,  ERONT FOG LAMP LH - BHESK 1 PC L
12, FRONT BUMPER LOWER GARNISH i P 481.003CI* 481.00
13, FRONT GRILLE BASE - CHECK 1 PG
14.  FRONT GRILLE CHROME - CHECK -Te ‘A
15.  FROMNT GRILLE OUTER - CHECK 1 pC | An
LIST TOTAL S5 4.549.70
20% DISCOUNT S§ 809,94
3,639.76

LABOUR

TO REFPAIR FROMT BONNET & REALIGN ACCIDENT
AFFECTED AREAS. TO REMOVE & REFLACE ALL

ACCIDENT PARTS

TO SPRAY PAINT ON ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREAS

TO REMOVE & REFIX FRONT PARKING SENSOR

TO CHECK WHEEL ALIGNMENT

TO INSPECT FRONT LIGHTING & WATER LEAKAGE

TEST

TO RUST PROOF ACCIDENT AREAS

LABOUR TOTAL 5%



@MOVA

Main Office:

Singapore 1554149
Page # - ] 132224 Ted (65) 64763333
Estimate Fax:.(B0) By Boa L
Veh# .. SLF6262Y d
03/08/2018 Works tlupll:llept
Veh Model - HONDA VEZEL 1.5 Lyl
SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD Estimate# - CK417796 Singapare 15972;
50 RAFFLES PLACE Tel: (B5) 6272 3892
#05-01/06 SINGAPORE LAND TOWER Claim # bt
SINGAPORE 048623. ACC.Date :- 01/08118 GST Fog, M2-DOBBBES-2
Terms .. £.0D Days
Attention - XAD1S Remarks -
Mo.  Description Qty U Price Amounts S5
£ 80E
i e NON-TAX AMOUNT §
AMOUNT S5 5,179.76
GST@ 7% 362.58
[ AMOUNT DUE S$ 5,542.34

/



Estimate

03/082018

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTELTD
50 RAFFLES PLACE

#05-01/06 SINGAPORE LAND TOWER
SINGAPORE 048823,

Allenlicn = XAD18

Page# - 1

Veh# .. SLFB2E2Y

Veh Model - HONDA VEZEL 1.5
Estimate# = CK417706
Claim# =

ACC. Date :- 01/08M18

Terms « C.0D Days
Remarks -

@MOVA

Automolive Ple Lid

Main Office:

Mova Building

N, 22, Jalan Kllang,
Singapone 159419
Tel: (55) 64763333
Fax: [65) 62715881
W ITIOVE, COM. 50

Werkshop Dapt:
Biock 1008,

Bukit Marah Lane 3,
HO-D4/0B0804
Singapare 150722

Tl : *Eﬂ] 62720802
Fax: (BS) 6270 8314

o, Reg. 1965040336
G5 Asg, ME-D0SLAE4-2

Mo, Description Qty U.Price Amounts 5%
LISTITEMS :

1. FROMNT FENDER LH 1 PC ﬁau.ﬂut'{f 830.00
2. FRONT FENDER LOGO (HYBRID) 1 FC 82.90 A4 < §2.90
3, FRONT HEADLAMP LH 1 PG 1,850.50 2 1.850.50 £ o
4, FRENT HEADCAMP LW ER BRACKET HH —Pe oA = £5:00
5. FRONT WHEEL ARCH LH 1 PC oap.00Med < 230,00
8. FRONT COWLING LH 1 PC 165.008f < 16500
r FRONT COWLING CUIPS LH 10 PC 4.80 M-~ 4300
B,  FRONT BUMPER RETAINER LH 1 FC 30,60 M-~ 30.60
9.  FRONT BUMPER i PG a01.70@F — 80170
10. tH P WGGR'—'—HG
11. FREHTFOSEAPE-cH=CHECK T PG b
12, RO T RO P ER TOWER SARM S TPt _ﬂl.wh it
13, —FRONT-ORILLEBASE-GHESHK e —-
14, PFRONTGRICCECHROME=CHMECK T PC
15, T FRONT GRILLEOUTER -THECK T FC

LIST TOTAL 5%
20% DISCOUNT 53

LABOUR :

TO REPAIR FRONT BONNET & REALIGN ACCIDENT
AFFECTED AREAS. TO REMOVE & REPLACE ALL

ACCIDENT PARTS

TO SPRAY PAINT ON ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREAS

Porte $3038 70 -20%6

$ 315096 -

7O REMOVE & REFIX FRONT PARKING SENsOR  S-0D0UY -r Qo

TO CHECK WHEEL ALIGNMENT

TO INSPECT FRONT LIGHTING & WATER LEAKAGE

TEST
TO RUST PROOF ACCIDENT AREAS

LABOUR TOTAL S§

total ;{ 3306 H<
5 pAYe

N

4,549.70
-809.94

3,630.76




@MOVA

Automotive Pte Lid

Main Office:
W Bu
HNo. 22, Jalan Kilang,
i Tol: (05) 476 3933
Estimate Rogn® = 1 T Fax: (65} 6271 5&:;
WAL MO Sa M,
Veh# « SLFB262Y Workshop De
03/08/2018 Block 10%:
Veh Mode! - HONDA VEZEL 1.5 Buklt Merah Lare 3,
#01-D4/06/08/54
50 RAFFLES PLACE F‘Eaig Eg:;ggﬁggﬁ
#05-01/06 SINGAPORE LAND TOWER Clalm# = . i
SINGAPORE 048623 ACC. Date :- 01/08/18 ST leg. M2-0088354-2
Terms .. C.OD Days
Altention - XAD18 Remarks -
Mo, Description Qty U.Price Amounts S$
0.E

NON-TAX AMOUNT 5

AMOUNT 8%
GET@ 7%

AMOUNT DUE S§

Customer's Sianature/Co. Stamp MOVA 7LIT OMOTIVE PTELTD

LKK Auto Congulanis hence nolify

the Repairer of the following:

= To resurvey beforafalier spray painting

« Ta disphay damaged par{s) during resuriey

» Parls prices ane subject o confirmalan

« Third perty survay Is on a “Withoul Prejudice” basks
» Mo liegal medifigalion(s) is allowed

» Supplementary Hem[s) must be resunmyed and
s suject ba linal approval from insurance Company

Arknowledged by Repairar
Signalure:
Diates

(?45 ub

S
W)

i [w[ris' @ Lo

R abbr

5,179.76
3g2.58

5,542.34



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

H; 8 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL Ref : CS/ISMO18014293/R1gd3n2

50 RAFFLES PLACE

LT

#05-01/06 Date . 08-10-2018
SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623
Code: S5MO
Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GX 31605 Veh. Inspected SLF 6282Y
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD1803343/AGC Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  GRACE TEO Assign Date 0B/08/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA VEZEL 1.5X A c.c 1496
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. RU31211328 Colour BROWN
Odometer 37863 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/80 R16 DUNLCP & mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 DUNLOP 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 DUNLCP 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |21560R18 DUNLOP & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  01/08/2018 Inspection Date 07/08/2018
Survey held at MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTELTD
BLK 1008 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 #01-04/068/08 .
SINGAPORE 158722
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
Sb. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days




|

T

1 Ve /4

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg, No. 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLF 6262Y

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Uibi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

Page Mo.-1of 2

Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Work shnpal:;] Iﬁli'
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT FENDER LH BENT 630.00 £30.00
1|FRONT FENDER LOGO (HYBRID) NECESSARY 82.90 82.90
1|FRONT HEADLAMP LH CRACKED 1.850.50 1.850.50
1|FRONT HEADLAMP LOWER BRACKET LH SERVICEABLE B5.00 .
1|FRONT WHEEL ARCH LH MISSING 230.00 230.00
1|FRONT COWLING LH cuT 165.00 165.00
10{FRONT COWLING CLIPS LH @34 80 NECESSARY 48.00 48.00
1|FRONT BUMPER RETAINER LH NECESSARY 30.60 30,80
1|FRONT BUMPER DEFORMED 801.70 801.70
1|FRONT FOG LAMP GARNISH LH SERVICEABLE 65.00 .
1|FRONT FOG LAMP LH (NPA) SERVICEABLE - .
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER GARNISH SERVICEABLE 481.00 -
1|FRONT GRILLE BASE (NPA) NOT NECESSARY - -
1|FRONT GRILLE CHROME (NPA) NOT NECESSARY - -
1|FRONT GRILLE OUTER (NPA} NOT NECESSARY - -
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -809.94 -787.74
3,639.76 3,150.96
LABOUR
TO REPAIR FRONT BONMNET & REALIGN ACCIDENT 550.00 400.00
AFFECTED AREAS.TO REMOVE & REPLACE ALL
ACCIDENT PARTS.
TO SPRAY PAINT ON ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREAS. 750.00 400.00
TO REMOVE & REFIX FRONT PARKING SENSOR. 60.00 40.00
TO CHECK WHEEL ALIGNMENT. 60.00 60.00
TESI:_JSPECT FRONT LIGHTING & WATER LEAKAGE 60.00 30.00
TEST.
TO RUST PROOF ACCIDENT AREAS. B0.00 40.00
1,540.00 g970.00
GRAND TOTAL 5,179.76 4,120.96
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 3,300.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/SMO18014293/R1gd3n2
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Report Ref No. CS/SMO18014293/R1qd3n2
MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS ADRIAN LING WAI PING
Automotive Assessor B.Eng, AMSOE,AMIRTE AMSAE-AM.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser




