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Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 22 january, 2019 5:18 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’; assignments

Cc 'Sithara'

Subject: RE: (REMINDER) REQUIEST OF SURVEY REPORT-OUR
REF:D1B00STE2MESHACCIDENT INVOLVING SHABE32Z AND SKS9514U ON
28-07-2018

Desr Sir / Madam,
Please be informed that we will close this file at ourend without billing.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Adiin
LERK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | emall: gssignments@lkkagto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Bl g1, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #oz-25 | S{go8oaz)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 4 January, 2019 5:18 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’ <cwsmotorclaims@msfirsteapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Sithara' <5Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: (REMINDER) REQUEST OF SURVEY REPORT-OUR REF:D1B005762MFSH;ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHABGI2Z
AND SKS9514U ON 28-07-2018

Dear Sir / Madam,
Please be informed that according to the repairer, TP owner already convert to OD claim.
Kindly adwvise

Best Regurds,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | emall; gssgnments@ikkaotooom | fax: ba56-4315
Blk 5t, Paya Ubl lndustrial Pack, Ubi Avenue |, #o2-25 | Sl408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailte:cwsmatorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)
Sent: Friday, 4 January, 2019 4:59 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Cc: Sithara <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; CWS Mator Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: FWD: (REMINDER) REQUEST OF SURVEY REPORT-OUR REF:D18005762MFSH;ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SHAEB22Z AND SKS9514U ON 28-07-2018

Dear Sir,

We received LOD from workshop/solicitor.
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MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 30-07-2018 Our Ref No. D1BOOSTE2ZMFSH
Accident Date 28-07-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHABG32Z Third Party Vehicle. SKS95140
Survey Location SECTOR A, BLK 21, SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE#01-56/58/60
Contact Person. JENNY LIM
Contact No. B463B110/ 0 Fax No. 5459 6267
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE:
Ep, LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyar
Contact Person MNA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. NA
FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey reporl.,

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

LAl HUAT (MENG KEE)
) i L
MOTOR PTE LTD i
NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
SITHARA
IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly subrmit the survey teport via CWS within 14 days lor survéy assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computar genarated letter, no signature requlred.
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