
Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Subject: Acknowledgement: Your ref:GBG7190C Our ref :S8M00eLZ MC/CL LKK REF

CC4 / ASIAI 801 41 99 / Af a3

Attachments: GBG 7190C - GtA report.pdf; SCENE PHOTO.JPG; SD.PDF

From: chan pick yuen [mailto:chris chanbebe@hotmail.com j
Sent: Friday, 7 September, 2018 8:55 PM
To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A
subject: Re: Acknowledgement: Your ref:GBG7190C Our ref :58M00QLZ MC/CL

Dear Sir / Mdm ,

Enclosed is our client's invoice, LOA & log card .

As request following :

1. RC $6586.44 ( Sefss.ss +7%GST )-Asagreed
2. LOU S1050 ( 5150 X 7 DAYS - 2982CC , Oct2OlT lessthan lyears- 5 days Recommend + l day

waiting PRS + l day weekend )

@ looo/o ( refer to scene photos)

Total s 7636.44

Please let us have your offer soon . Thanks

Regards,

Chris Chan Pick Yuen

6reen Forest Automobile Pte Ltd
HP:92772274

From: chan pick yuen <chris cha nbebe @ hotmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, August 1, 2018 1:03 PM
To: RATAN BHOSALE Pragati
Subject: Re: Acknowledgement: Your ref :GBG7190C Our ref :S8M00QLZ MC/CL

Dear Sir / Mdm ,

Lkk Auto Consultant Pte Ltd.
Please let us have your confirmation & reply soon . Thanks

Get Outlook for iOS
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14rh August 2018

SIVASANKAR CHINNAIYAN
Block 396 Yishun Avenue 6,
#04-1140,
Singapore 760396.

Dear Sir,

OUR REF : CC4/ASM18014199/Afa3
YOUR REF : SJT 6681X
ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJT 6681X AND GBG 7190C ON 3{.07.2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, AxA lnsurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party
Property Damage claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from M/s Green Forest Automobile, acting on behalf of the
owner of GBG 7'190C against your motor insurance policy-

Based on the accident report, accident scenario, it was reported that your vehicle had
collided into the Third Party vehicle GBG 7190C while moving off from parking lot. As
such, liability is down against us.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the
claim against your policy.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according
to the rights afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your
policy and seek to take conduct of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your
own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 davs from the date of this letter.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the
following to oohkin@lkkauto.com within 7 davs from the date of this letterjl nql@iglCd
at AXA'S reportinq centre. The list below is not all inclusive and further document may
be r€qui'€d

o Police report, Police lnvestigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence
and status (if any)

. Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

. Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

. Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (lf any)

. Video footage of accident (if any)

. Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)

. lf you or your passenge(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third
Party(s), you are to keep us informed of your legal representative(s) and the
status of the claim
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To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with
any.of the Third Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or
settlement without AXA's prior knowledge and consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any
claim because of any breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or youi authorised
driver may have committed.

ln the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep
you informed of the final indemnity upon conclusion of the matte(s).

lf you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us al6g41 2132or email us
at oohkin@lkkauto.com.

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more
effectively.

Yours sincerely,

..t!"'LN

Poh,J(in, Chong
Case Handler
DID:6841 2132
FAX:6741 4108
Email: oohkin@lkkauto.com

c.c. AXA lnsurance fte Ltd (AXA)
(Motor Claims Dept)
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AUTHORISATION TO ACT
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hL'rc b\

authorize Cireen Forcst r\LrtDnrohilc Ptc l,ld. i- fhe lvorkshop") t0 aet ti)l rrlu/Lrs tr ith lgspect to tttl2ur
.)Q (a1lAO Lauthorize cireen Forcst r\LrtDnrohilc Ptg l,ld.i-rhe lvorkshop") t0 aet lol lrlu/Lls r\ltn rgspecl t() rl

claim tbr rhe repair costs and/or rcntal and/or loss ofuse lbr nty'our rchiclc SL9lyC
vehicle

l/we turthcr authorize the workshop t0 sellle my/our above mentioned claim in a manner that thcy deem

llt and I'he workshop is t-unher authorized to receive payment lur1hel to settlemenl of my/our claim uith

pay-ment cheque being nraile in thvor of Creen Forest Automobile fte l'td'

ThCsettlementTheWorkshopmay.,reachonmy/ourbehallis0llwithoutprejudiceandwithout
admissionofliabilitybasisinsothrasthedriverlowner/insurersoltheothervehic]e/sisconcerned.

Punuant to Personal l)ata Protection Act 201 2, l/We herebl' 88ree that 'fhe Workshop nray disclose or

share my personal data to any authorizetl service providers whom The Workshop would necessarily need

*,.oopirrr.. interact or rork in one way or another in serving tne or meeting m) requests'

lf ltwe ffe rot ablc to recover lull amount for the repair cost from the third Pany's Insurance Company

in6(six)m0nths.timel.romirrvoicedate.GreenForestAutomobilel,tet,tdshallbilltoyor,t/your
Companl,fbrthebalance/fullamountoitherepaircost..I.heWorkshopwillclosethiscasewithou!prior
notice if we are unable to recover wilhin 2 yean'

,r*" tkv;t\g h,&-104s t {o \,+d understand the above explanation bv creen Foresr

Automobile Re Ltd.

Dated this 0\ ,tuy nr
rI (month) 18 (year)

\t'ti\nrss
Claimant's Signature
(Conrpan)'s stantp tbr company vehicle) GrEen Foresl Automobilc Pte L.td
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wel tvlll[,4lllal&3l*l!!9Alt UMIII& Co REG llo.llul][!Hl!$ hs{3by a{ree to *rrepl
the sum oI dothrs lr6vrr! thgpsald two hundrcd €l€htv-r.)| lrrd .!ntr forlehtglihl (St 7lP6.141
o.id to u./me by AXA lll$URAt{tE pTt tTO ai lull i.!d thil *rtlement of rll clti.rs of wirtover lind
krcluding drBr.Scs for pe.laral injuri?! and dama8er to propcrl} thrt w€/l may h*ve rgainrt trlc
eaid AXA a[{SURAtllCE P.{ l,]D or thef lnru.ed or the ddver oI motor veiiicle no; SJT 6681X as I
fosult ol an &(cldcfll r)R tl'r lulr_.lolE o, whldr w:/l wrrtlwis th€ d{iv.r/ own€r/ hircr/
Fasse,rBerlrid€r/pillionf jnsurer of motor vehi.la no. 9!g:l&
Wc/l hereby declnre thit Sx srid insurB. o. owner aad/or drivE{ of ins{rad }ehide ihall .ot be
arbll for any funhor cbinr{s) whattow€r alr, wholoerr€r present o. futurc that vrel m*y hi\.(
18ni,r5f th€ s.ad lns!.rer, o*ner andlEr driver gf vehi.l. no. SlUllJLm co.mectlon dir.ctly or
mdirgctly tvith the rrid accideot and give our/nry lull and tnal dirrbaryc,

Well hereby ds(lar€ lhat wdl u8/am lhe personls) efltlled to rer.h.. tlr. above retuern€'nt ard
}|c||by underu\t to lfldemnily $(A lltuRAflf[ yff tm aeilnit lny {}rkn mrd. o. to bc mad* ir
.aspracl qf this settlemeot.

lr ir undeEtood ard agreed that payment hersin is made witrout rdm$slon o, liibility x&at5oc{r*r
oo thc pan oa the t&rd rrsurtr. ownAt endl$r drser o{ vehrle no. g[.]Eel!!L
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CREEN FOREST AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD
fi Krki ButI Aydnu3 d l$l-lt ltrmrLr @ Krki $u$r fifugrp{re {lsg?s

TAX INVOICE

I{EVI' I g AU?O PAR1S PTE i-YB
S Xeki Brd(*t A$3fil,ll 4
,O5-25 Prerni6r @ K.A Euki:
Singrpor. {tS87t

Daap: 7€6p.1 I
OST n.g.l{o:20trz323t t

Accldrnt d.ts: 3tE July 3010
Finel Elll For Vshicl, No: cBG?rgoC TOYOTA Dyt'lA ?Ot,

5rOLF8:$lX THOUSAND FIV€ I{ITNORED EtOHtY 6lX AtlO Ct}rg FORTY FOUE OiILy

by pfi rwrir ao.t s }ltl,lturiand.d by
A,iJTO COI{SIITAI'TE PTE LTO


