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ENGINEERING
ﬂ“mnmﬁi{ Date/Time: 02.08.2018 14:30 Page : 1
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COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
REPAIR ESTIMATE 7/30/2018 9:26
VEHICLE : SHA 2300X

\ "'._ e : I: N ' o \ '\\\
MODEL :TOYOTA PRIUS
0Ty PARTS DESCRIPTION TYPE UNIT PRICE AMOLUNT
REAR BUMPER s 4 /458.60°
REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER § adt~-112.70-
REAR BUMPER CLIPS §  ARE2200
RETAINER, REAR BUMPER, SIDE, LH it § "? 0480
SEAL. REAR BUMPER SIDE. LI S aq X RR.90
TAIL LAMP ASSY (UPPER) .ara—?'. s s57.00
TAIL LAMP ASSY (LOWER) ¥ ox S48.40
iy
SUB T{}TAI_,_ 5 1,883.30
LESS 20%. | 5 376.66
DISCOUNTED TOTAL s 1.506.64
ﬁ»)g’hﬁ» 4344 5H4
Lfs||s LA p- LKX Ao Consuliant] hence notly
the Regairer of tha fol :
ol «To
«To
Rtmvvb Mt- * Parta
; ST
sgur @ lhde asde Gan « o flaghl modsicaions)
» Sy " i
Iy Ayt
AzE 20°
Labour Charge [ —_ $ 350.00
Spray Painting Charge Date: 5‘1 << 250,00
Wiring Charge $ «~ 30.00
Remove/Refix Reverse Sensor £ 320 12000
TOTAL LABOUR s T50.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL s 2.256.64

This is an initia] estimate based on o visual inspection of the above vehicle. The final repair quoantum will

be prepared afier the vehicle 15 surveyed by a motor Surveyvor appoinied by the isurance company,

Page 1 of 1



COMFORIDELGRO

ENGINEERING
VEHICLE NO : SHAZ300X TYPE OF CLAIM :
MODEL PRIUS SURVEYED BY
JOB NO 305195301 DATE

3P | AXA

LKK / TAUFIKH

06/08/18

SUPPLEMENTARY OF PARTS AND LABOUR COSTS

DESCRIPTION
REAR BUMPER UNDERCOVER

4

ESTIMATE
§552.804

REMARKS

2  |REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT 1

$318.80,

TOTAL:




COMFORIDELLRO
ENGINEERING

Our Job Ref No 305105301

Ciale G Au_g 2018 mx‘l‘rm ;l;';;:i
Faw 9546 0158

FINALIZATION FORM

To : LKK Fax

Ann TAUFIKH

Vahicte Reg No SHAZI00X Dtz of Accident 2. Aug, 2018

The survey ard estimates of the jepairs of the sbove-mantioned vahicle are as follows:-

1 [t repair job shall bl o) AXA SJK3555U
F Thas finalized amount shall ba: =
(8]  Spare Parts afier Lisi discaunt $1,088.5%
()  Labour Cnanges $480.00 )
Total for Part-By-Part Repair Cosi 5155853 |

(el Lumpsum Regair (if applicable)
Total for Lumpsum repair cost afler Less

Final Lumpsism Rapair cosd

3 Eslimuted narmsl peried for repairs 2 WOrking oEyE

'] We shall treat the above smount as Correct and Confinmed if there |s no reply from you

within 7 working days
g Thank you far your sssistanca, Whe confirm the estimates and
firmflzed amaun
P ;a —
Signature ; & = Signature
Nome Lairy Ng Namea
Tal ¢ E214 B31B D
Fax ;6546 8155
For Dfficipl Use Only
Pocumest
[ Amaunt Attached ﬁ:”mf qu’] Herrarks
Yes ar No
1 Rantal Rate PIOay YES
@ Lossg of Incoms Paid
[ Survey Fees
LTA Search Fes
Medical Faes [on behalf
aof drivar, If spplicabile)
Ovarrun

Remans




COMPORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD Diite: Ub.GR.21S

it 8:38:31
REPAIR ESTIMATE Page: |
COMPA NY THIRD PARTY'S CLAIMS [CAS) JOn NO nstassnl
CLUSTOPMER 70]0045 REGN NO SHAZI00N
ADDRE S5 COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD MILEAGE OnaOm0CTI0
IH3 SIN MING DRIVE MARKE : TOYUTA
SINGAPORE SINGAPORE 575717 MODEL : PRIUS HYBRIDNGE)
ASSNRTSS DATE OF REGN T M052017
DATETIME IN ;o R2UR2018 | 1:45
ACCIDENT DATE ;o 2R20IR
JOBR PARTS DESCRIPTION QTY IND UNIT-PRICE DISC AMOUN]

PART REQUISITION

00T (=01 aN2-2282-G PRIGA COVER REAR BUMPER | 45880 2500 34395
-

Q002 (4-01-40002-2287-G PRIGA GUARD-REAR BUMPERC | 55260 25.00 41445 ot~

(003 04-0140302-2267-G  PRIVC BUMPER PIECE 10 2200 2500 1650

0004 04-01-0302-3837.G - PRIGH RETAINER RRBUMPER 1 11270 2500 8452 ~fe—

D005 04-010202-2288.G PRIGH REINFORCEMENT SUB-A | 11880 2500 230 40 bt
SUB-TUTAL LMK S?

TOH SATURE

(LU S PANMEL HEATING MLDEUL

0001 23-502 SPRAYPAINT ON AFFECTED AREA 2001 00

D02 1701 WIRING CHARGE 0,000

0603 1 REMOVE REFIN REVERSE SENSOR 30,00

SUB-TOTAL 46000



COMFORTDELGRO FNGINEERING PTE LTI Dope (608 201K

Tume, 08 3851
REPAIR ESTIMATE Page2
CUMPA NY THIRD PARTY S CLAIMS (CAS) JOB NO E19530
vusTONIER To10045 RECGMN O - SHAZWOX
ADDRIESS - COMIORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD MILEAGE QOO
IR3 SIN MING DRIVE MAKE TOYOT A
SINGAPMORE SINGAPORE 375717 MODED PRIUS HYHRIDIC
hI3U8TSS PATE OF REGN 005 M1 F
DATETIME IN 02 (8 2018 | 1-45
ACCIDENT DATE . 0208218
JOB ! PARTS DESCRIPTION Y IND UNIT-PRICE DISCY AMOUNT
TOTAL ¢ 155852

ALUTHURISELR : YES ' NO

MVA NAME & SIGNATURE SURVEYOR NAME & SIGNATURL
DATE : DATE -




Hsiao Tﬂl‘lﬂ {LI{I{Autn!

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 30 August 2018 9:20 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Ce: ngnp@cdge.com.sg: SUR
Subject: FW: SHA2300X FINALISATION DOA: 02082018 *** 3rd email ***
Attachments: img-806085014-0001 pdf
DOy 248
Importance: High

Diear Hsloo Tang,

CC4/ASMIBD14198/TIpa3

Bas| Regoards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultanis Ple Lid

Phore: 6254-3561 | email: denisetay@likkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park. Ubi
Avanue |, #02-25 | 5[408933)

-—Qriginal Message—

From: Mg Nyuk Phin <ngnp@cdge.com.sg>

Senl: Thursday. 30 aAugust 2018 9:18 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: SHAZ300X FINALISATION DOA: 02.,08.2018 ==* 3rd email ***
Importance: High

Dear Taufikh,
Please finalise ASAP.

Regards,

Lamy Ng

COGE

Loyang Taxi Crash Repairs
6214 8316

From: Ng Nyuk Phin

Senl; Tuesday, 21 August 2018 B:14 AM

To: sur@kkouto.com

Subject: FW: SHAZ300X FINALISATION DOA: 02.08.2018 = 2nd emall **

Dear Taufikh.
Please check whether you have finalised yel.

Regords,

Loy Ng

CDGE

Loyang Taxl Crash Repairs
42148316

From: Ng Nvui?hin



Senl: Monday. & August 2018 9:03 AM

To: sur@|kkauto.com

Cc: kalvinang#lkkauto.com

Subject: SHAZ300X FINALISATION DOA: 02.08.2018

Deor Taufikh,

Please see attached Finalisation Form and a Supplemeniary List for the rear bumpet undercover and rear
bumper reinforcement.

Regords,

Lamy Ng

CDGE

Loyang Taxi Crash Repairs
£214 B314

From: ApeosPort-IV C5570 |sbs-singnalling@sbsiransit.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 6 August 2018 B:50 AM

To: Ng Myuk Phin

Subject: Scon Dala from CDG_LO._AW_AS5570

Numiber of Images: 4
attachment File Type: PDF

Device Name: ApecsPort-Iv C5570
Device Location:

This message and any attochments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you
are not the intended recipient. kindly notity us and delete this message and its attachments immediataly,
and please be advised that using. copying. distributing or disclosing any contents therein is not allowed.
Statements pertaining o any matter outside our business are not 1o be taken as endorsed by
ComlortDelGro Corporation Limited or is related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for
discussion purposes only and are subject fo appravals. Nothing herein shall constitute a binding agreement
between the parties, Neither party shall be bound in any way to any lerm or condition excep! as agreed in
a written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parfies.

ComtortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to
preserving the environment. We encourage you o print this only it necessary.

SBS Transit Lid [Reqgisiration No. 199206653M|

This message and any attachments may conlain confidentiol, privileged or proprietary infermation. If you
are not the intended recipient, kindly notify us and delete this message and its attachments immediately,
and please be advised that using. copying. distributing or disclosing any contents therein i not allowed.
Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by
ComioriDelGro Corporation Limited or its reloted companies. The comments/proposals provided are for
discussion purposes only and are subject lo approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a binding agreement
between the parties. Neither party sholl be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in
a written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of bath parties,

ComiortDelGro - a Green Office cerfified by the Singapore Environment Council - s committed lo
preserving the environment. We encourage you to print this anly if necessary.

585 Transit Lid |Registration No. | 99206453M]




This message and ary attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you
are not the intended recipient, kindly notify us and delete this messoge and its attachments immediately,
and please be advised that using. copying. distributing or disclosing any contents therein is not allowed.
Sigtements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be ltaken as endorsed by
ComlortDelGro Corporation Limited or its related companies. The commenis/proposals provided are for
discussion purpases only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein shall conslitute a binding agreement
between the parlies. Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition excepl as agreed in
a written agreement signed by the duly authorised representalives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office cerfified by the Singapore Environment Council - is commitied fo
preserving the environment. We encourage you to print 1his only il necessary.

ComiortDelGro Engineering Ple Lid [Registration No. 199508048W|



T " | p Covmspnesy Wmgasbratian P 190000 ° SRR

R AN b RS AN D IR s R PR s AP Ao T it ARRR AT AN cnme g A2 Red N

Immediate Advice
To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd Date: 24.09.2018

Survey Details:

Date of loss 02.08.2018
Date of appointment 02.08.2018
Date of survey 02.08.2018
Location of survey CDGE LOYANG

Vehicle Details:

Claim Type: Third party

Vehicle number SHA 2300X

Make and Model Toyota Prius (1798cc)

Date of registration 30.05.2017

Excess MIL

Market Value/ Book Value (est)
Parf/COE Rebate (est)
MNett Loss {est)

Repair details:

Initial Estimate | s 2,816.03 |
Proposed/Revised repair cost:

Parts S 1,098.53
Check items (estimate) NIL

Labour 5 460.00
Supplementary NIL

Total S 1,558.53
Lump Sum(if applicable) NIL

|[Number of days for repair | 2 |
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Date: 24.09.2018
Remarks:

The total quantum fs < 55,000.00. We will proceed to negotiate
settlement with third party

Mandate:
Liability(TP) 100%
Proposed repair cost (w/GST) s 1,667.62
Loss of use NIL
Loss of rental 5 313.50 | (2.5days x 5125.40)
Loss of income 5 125,00 | (2.5days x 550.00)
LTA/GIA search fees 5 7.49
Others NIL
Proposed Total 5 2,113.61




RIZAIATIR

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type

Owner | D
Vehicle Details

Vehicle Mo

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vishicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo

Chassis No.;

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Detalls
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibllity Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Data

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

PP Paid;

COE Rebate Amaunt:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Please note that the B-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed, The vehicle must be de-registered upen COE expiry or when the

PARFICNNF Rahnia Fom i

vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever is earlier

The information contained herein is correct as at 24 Sep 2018

OK

Compary
3H2IR

SHAZI00X

No

14 Sep 2018

TOYOTA
PRIUSHYBRID 1B CVT
Blue

2017

2ZR5044240
JITOKBIFU203557330
F0.0 kW (120 bhg)
£29.007.00

30 May 2017

30 May 2017

]

$5.000.00

Yes
29 May 2025
§3.750.00

29 May 2025

A - Car up ta 1600cc & F7kW (130bhp)

-

$40.532.00
$3384400
$37.594.00

NIPSIYIL . gOY SQranTVacuonenguieMECEIED Y UDNCO BTCE LIS Mg ImpUT rE U | M _IU=rudusuus | o
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Hsiao Tuna (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 29 September 2018 2:14 PM

To: 'williamtan@cdge.comsg'; 'catherinekoh@cdge com.sg’

Subject: Your ref: T 0818/ SHA2300X/ WT(st) *Our Ref: CC4/ASM18014198/T1pa3

[ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJK 3555U(AXA) & SHA 2300X ON 02/08/2018]

Tour ref: T0818/ SHA2300X/ WT(st) Without Prejudice
Our Rel: CC4/ASMIB014198/T1pa3

Hi Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING S5JK 3555U(AXA) & SHA 2300X ON D2/08/2018
We refer fo the above matter,

We propose settlement at a glabal sum of 52,020.00(all-in).

Please confi aocceplonce.

“Please note that our propasal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of llability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenoe 1, #02-25 | S(408033)



COMFORIDELCRO

Our Ref : T 0818/ SHA2300X /WT(st) ENGINEERING
Your Ref :
Date D3-Sep-18 CDGE Tax Claims Depl
5% Loyang Drive 4th Fir
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd Singapore 508869
8 Shenton Way
#24-01, AXA Tower
Singapore 068811
Attn : Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir
ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAXI SHA2300X YOUR INSURED SJK3555U
AND OTHER ON 02.08.18

We are the authorised repair workshop for Comfort Transportation Pte Lid, the owner

of motor vehicle No:  SHA2300X which was involved in the captioned accident with your
insured vehicle. The vehicle owner and the taxi driver condemed have requested and
authorized us to assist them in presenting their claims against the party responsible

for all applicable matters arising from the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving - SJK3555U
we are submitting these claim for your consideration on behalf of the claimants

TAXI OWNER'S CLAIM

1 Costof Repair S 166763

2 3 days Loss of Rental @ $ 12540 perday $ 376.20

3  Survey Report Fees (Surveyed by M/s LKK) $ -

4 GIA/LTA Search Fee 749

§ GIA/Palice Report Fees $ -

& Towing Fees 5 -
Sub Total: § 205132

HIRER'S CLAIM

7 3 days Loss of Income @ $ 80.00 per days $ 240.00

Total Claims: § 229132

We enclose herewith the following documents to support the claims: -
a) Onginal repair bill and photocopies of photographs 8 pecs
b) LTA search slip/s of - SJK3555U
¢) GIA/ Palice report/s of | ~ SHAZ300X
d) Letter of authonty from owner / hirer / operator
{ ) Pholocopials of Accident Scene Phaotals { ) Traffic Compound ( ) PIR
{ ) Witness statement's ( x ) Rental Rate letter ( x )} Downtime/Mileage record

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of the said claims
as scon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settiement reached that it shall be without
prejudice to any personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver.

Yours faithfully

Watliam ‘Lan

Deputy Manager

CDGE Claims Department

Tel: 6214 B737 Fax:6214 1843 Email : willlamtan@cdge.com.sg

This is a computer generated letter. No signature 1s required

COMFORIDELGRO



SLERBIAVE Band- S Payal BEISEL STRINE PARER. sING AT BT S08%Ey TEL S altniSn) FAM LN TR
04 SEPT 2018
MOHD ALWI BIN A PATTAH
BLK 649 WOODLANDS RING ROAD
#11-430
SINGAPORE 730649
Diear Sir Mdm

OUR REF : CCHASMIBULAI98/ T pud

YOUR REF  : GADG4024/] (SIK 35550

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJK 3555U AND SHA 2300X ALONG/AT BKE BEFORE PIE
EXIT ON 02/082018

We refer to the above subject matter, We write to inform vou that we are the loss adjuster appointed
hy vour motor insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against vour policy.

We have received a claim from CDGE LOYANG acting on behalf of the owner of SHA 2300X
against your motor imsurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in our
favour. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim
against your policy,

We shall proceed to deal with the claimis) subject to the merits of the case and according 1o the
rights afforded under the policy. Should vou not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek
to take conduct of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please
reply to us within |0 days from the date of this letter. Your intent must be formally expressed 1o us
and acknowledged by us.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the fallowing to
chewhti@ Ikkauto.com within 10 days from the date of this letter if not provided at our reporting
centre. The list below is not all inclusive and further document may be required:

o Palice report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the TrafTic Police offence and status
(if any)

Diriver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

Video footage of accident (if any)

Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)

If vou or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you
are to keep us informed of yvour legal representative(s) and the status of the claim



To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of
the Third Partyis) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without
AXA's prior knowledge and consent.

This letter should not be regarded as & waiver by AXA of their nights to repudiate any claim because
of any breach of policy terms and conditions vou and/or vour authorised driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep vou
informed of the final indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate 10 comact us ar 6742 3197 or email us m
chewhi@lkkauto.com.

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more effectively.

Yours sincerely

Chl:uﬁsia{} Tong

Case Handler

DID: 6742 3197

FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: chewht@lkkauto.com

Ce AXA Insurance Pte Lid
(Morar Claims Dept)
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LETTER OF AUTHORISATION
(MAF / PAF)
ACCIDENT INVOLVING TOYOTA PRIUS SHA2300X , SIK3555U ON 02-Aug-18 06:45
ALONG BKE(PIE) BF ERP GANTRY
1/ We NG KIM FOOK {Hirery NRIC No.! S1174366H
and/ar {Relief} NRIC Na.:
Taxi Number SHA2300X

hereby autherise ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd(CDGE):

1. To submit my/faur claims for damages, costs and expense, including loss of income, loss of rental,
medical fee and legal costs.

2. To have absolute discretion to agree to any settlement or compensation amount in respect of my/our claim
against third party (except personal injuries and medical claims).

3. To sign Discharge Youcher an my/four behalf,

4. To accept any payment (claim procesds) in respect of the claim against third party and payment by chague
shall be farward directly to COGE in accordance with CDGE's Instruction and made in favour of
“ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd".

Date D2-Aug-2018
Mame of Hirer NG KIM FOOK
Hirer NRIC S1174366H Signature ;
Address 208 PETIR ROAD #04-527
670208
Contact No. 918568393

httrve{ledmal Yerme Y R untima/Rantma/Runtma/Rontima A iaw CTWG W NYNRINIR



M redefining / insurance

CLAIM REF : SEMO0QSQ
INSURED ¢ MOHD ALWI BIN A PATTAH

DISCHARGE VOLCHER

We. ComfortDelgrs Engincering Pte Ltd confirm that by letter of authorisation dated 02.08 2018, we are
authorised 10 and do hereby give this discharge for ourselves and on behall of Comfort Transporiation Pie Lid
and the Hirer, Ng Kim Fook of vehicle no. SHA 2300X.

Now we ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd for ourselves and the sad Hirer and the driver jomtly and
severnlly:-

b)

agree (o accept the sum of Singapore Dollars Two Thousand Twenty only (SS2,020.00) in the aggregate
in full and final settlement of all claims of whatever kind mecluiting damages for personal injuries and'or

damage 10 property that all and any of us may have against AXA INSURANCE PTE LTI and 'or their
Insured and'or the driver of vehicle no (S1K_3555U) arising out of an accident with (SHA 2300X) on
0208 20]8.

declure that AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD and/or their Insured and'or the driver of the Insured vehicle
shall not be liable for any further claim(s) whatsoever or howsoever present or future that any of us may
have agmnst AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD and'or their Insured and/or the driver of vehicle no. SIK
35551 ansing directlyindirectly as a consequence of the scoideny and hereby give our full and final

discharge.

We hereby declare that I/we amfare the personis) entitled to receive the above settlement and hereby
undertake 1o indemmify AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD agamst any claim made or to be made in respect
of this settlement,

It is undersiood and agreed thal payment herein is made in favour of ComforiDelgro Engineering Ple Lid s

made

without anv admission of lHability whatsoever on the part of AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD and/or their

Insured and/or the driver ol vehicle no, SJIK 35350

) i
Dared vhis 4 ?:' day of C" Oofvhey 2018
Signed by }’,L*—__ . e made paph
mmuuf;s&ﬂ,aﬂ;mrumw T NGINEERING
Company Stamp shia 3t

Witness iL

Nume

T No :
Address : ¢ e rrg | & B

AXA insurance Pte Lid [Compary Reg No. 199803512M|

B Shenton Woy, #2401 AA Towe:, Singapore 088811

Customer Centre #8101

Ted: +65 GBA0 ABRE Fax +65 6338 25220 Webnite: wwwans tom 58



COMFORIDELGRO

ComfiortDelGro Engineering Pla Lid

NGINEERING e
par of COMFORDELGRD __ g SRS
GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3 TAX INVOICE COMPANY REG. NO.: 1993332‘:‘3‘;
8010010
VEHCLE NO INV. NO/DATE
AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD SHA2300X 91393435 31.08.2018
MAKE JOB NO.
8 SHENTON WAY AXA TOWER #24-01 TOYOTA 305195301
SINGAPORE SG 068811
MODEL READING
CONTACT NO: 63387288 PRIUS HYBRID(G4)
DATE OF REG m:gém N
30.05,2017 02.08.2018 11:45
CHASSIS CODE
) Description : 3P 02.08.2018 JTDKB3FU203557330
8/No Part No. gty Unit Price %Disc Net
PART REQUISITION
0001 04-01-0302-2282  PRIG4 COVER REAR BUMPER 1 458.60 25.00 343.95
0002 04-01-0302-2287 PRIG4 GUARD-REAR BUMPER C 1 552.60 25.00 414,45
0003 04-01-0302-2267 PRIVC BUMFER PIECE 10 2.20 25.00 16.50
0004 04-01-0302-3837 PRIG4 RETAINER RR BUMPER 1 112.71  25.00 84.53
0005 04-01-0302-2288 PRIG4 REINFORCEMENT SUB-A 1 318.80 25.00 239.10
SUB-TOTAL : 1,098.53
JOB NATURE
® o001 L PANEL BEATING 200.00 200.00
0002 23-502 SPRAYPAINT ON AFFECTED AREA 200.00 200.00
0003 17-01 WIRING CHARGE 30.00 30.00

ComfortDelGro Engincering e Lid
A e of COMFORT N CRG

Hend Office

205 Braddell Road

Singapare 579701

Kingly note thal no receipt shall bé issued unlass reguasied.
CUSTOMER'S COPY

ACCOUNT No INVOICE No AMOUNT BANK/CHQ No.

8010010 91393435




COMFOR“DELGRO Cqu?rtnﬂlﬁr? Engi.neennn Pte Ltd
ENGINEERING S ey e

| COMFORIDELCGROD 45 Pard prarm S0 ! t Py L

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3 TAX INVOICE COMPANY REG. NO.: lgggﬂagg?ﬁ;
8010010
NO INV. NO/DATE
AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD Mﬁ 91393435 31.08.2018
MAKE JOB NO.
8 SHENTON WAY AXA TOWER #24-01 TOYOTA 305195301

SINGAPORE S5G 068811

MODEL ODOMETER HEADING
CONTACT NO: 63387288 PRIUS HYBRID(G4)
DATE OF REG DM!%‘HHB IN
30.05.2017 02.08B.2018 11:45
CHASSIS
5] B PU203857330
S/No Part No. Qty Unit Price %Disc Net
0004 L REMOVE/REFIX EEVERSE ZSENSOR 30.00 30.00
SUB-TOTAL ] 460.00
Items total 1,558.53
Add GST @ 7.000 % 109.10
Invoice amount 1,667.63
Issued by : CHEWBEELENG 03.09.2018 14:26:06

Repair t : CLS0/57/57
Payment l%afTarm: f(:reditfm days

ComforiDeltiro Englneering e Lid
A mamber of COMIORDLCE

ACCOUNT No INVOICE No AMOUNT BANK/CHQ No

Hemd Ciifice
205 Braddell Road
Simgapore 579701

91393435 ‘ 1,667.63

!

Kindly note that no recaipt shall be issued unless reguasted %
CUSTOMER'S COPY




OurRef: CT18080033 h

Dale: 03 September 2018

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear Sirfadam

ACCIDENT ON 02/08/2018 @ 06:45hrs
ALONG BKE(PIE) BF ERP GANTRY
INVOLVING SJK3555U

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform thal Comfort
Transportation Pte Ltd is the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration
number SHA2300X (the "Taxi"). The Taxi was hired to NG KIM FOOK IC NO
S1174366H a registered hirer-operator of Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd at the time
of occurrence of the aforementioned accident at a rental rate $125.40 per day
(inclusive of GST).

Please be advised that the Taxi was insured with MS First Capital Insurance Ltd on
a third party basis at the material time of the accident

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission lo
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the sald accident with a motor
workshop of his choice.

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for

settlement of claims with third party's insurance company in respect of the said
accident

Yours faithfully
Christine Tay

Assistant Manager, Fleet Safety

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapare 575717 Mainlina +B5 B555 1188 Facsimile +65 6453 3183
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nsurance Parmculars Enguiry By Agents Detal

Enquire Vehicle Insurer
Vehicle Mo.  Incident Date/Time

SIKI555U 02 Aug 2018 / 06:45:00

lorl

SearchStatus  Insurance Company Code

Successiul Al2

Previous

hitps: Al I govsgMtasvilactiondinsPanDetmill By AATFUNCTION ..

OK

Insurance Comparny Name

AXA INSURANCE FTELTD

02082018, 1:40 M



THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BEREAKDOWN)
Vahicle No: SJK 35550 (Insd veh) | Modael: OYOTA PRIUS
SHA 2300X (TP vah)
Date of Accident: |02/08/2018
Global Sum Settiement l : l [X] Yes [ 1 Mo
Repair Estimate ' 3,160.52
Final Repair Cost $ 1,667 531
Loss of Token Sum 1 100.00 2days al $50.00 per day
Rental (if any) 5 250.80 2 days
LTA f GIA Search Fee -] ?.451
| Others: ] sl 0.00 I
Final Setllernent Sum (Global Sum) s 2,020.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [X] YES [ ] NO {Kindly indicate
below)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability (%)
BOLA Applicable: Yes/ Ne _BOLA Scenario No
B) For GIA Registered Workshop: - Ahrken e
BOLA Liability: 100 (%) Assessed Liability (*):__________ (%)

* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases whare BOLA does not apply

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |[COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD o 2.020.
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 08M10/2018
LKK Aute Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill: Rantal Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation ta Act; Survey Report; Medical
Roport/ Bill (if any)
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL: 62566 2561 FAX: G255 4315

Reg. No: 160807108R GST Reg. No. 19-8807188-R

AXA INSURANCE PTELTD

8 SHENTON WAY #24-01
AXA TOWERSINGAPORE 068811

Rt CC4/ASM1B8014158/T1pa3q2

Date  08-10-2018

IR

ATTN:KIAN CHUAN Coda: ASM
: - Policy Particulars ;- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh, SJK 35551 Veh. Inspected SHA 2300X
Policy No. GADBA024/1 Coverage ($) 000
Claim No. SEMO0QSQ Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 02/08/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA PRIUS c.c 1798
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. JTDKB3FU203557330 Colour BLUE
Odometer 213533 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/65R15 WEST LAKE 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/85 R15 WEST LAKE 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[195/85 R15 WEST LAKE & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/65R15 WEST LAKE 6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  02/0872018 |inspection Date 02/08/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTELTD
58 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 5089580
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BJIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

IESTIMJ\TEU NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Uibi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408633
TEL. 8255 3581 FAX: B258 4315

Aeg. No 199607196R GST Reg. No. 16-6607198-R Page No.1af 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHA 2300X
Qty Description of Parts. Condition | Eetimate B | Our Adiinted
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER (COMSISTENT) DEFORMED 458 60 45860
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 11270 112,70
1|REAR BUMPER CLIPS (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 2200 2200
1|RETAINER REAR BUMPER.SIDE ,LH (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 84 B0 -
1|SEAL REAR BUMPER SIDE LH (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY B88.90 -
1| TAIL LAMP ASSY (UPPER) (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 557.90
1| TAIL LAMP ASSY (LOWER) [CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 548.40 -
1|REAR BUMPER UNDERCOVER (ADDITIONAL) DEFORMED 55280 552 60
(CONSISTENT)
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT (ADDITIONAL) BENT 318.80 318.80
(COMNSISTENT)
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -550.94
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -366.17
220378 1.088.53
LABOUR
LABOUR CHARGE 350.00 200.00
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE. 250.00 200.00
WIRING CHARGE 30.00 30.00
REMOVE/REFIX REVERSE SENSOR 120.00 30.00
750.00 480,00
GRAND TOTAL 2,853.7T6 1,558.53
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | 4 | | assss
Report Ref No. CC4/ASM18014188/T1pa3q2
oudin. fﬂ"ﬂ
[
MOHAMAD TAUFIKH HO LEONG CHUAN
MMATAI AMSAE-A Automotive Assessor
Automotive Assessor

DIBCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIND PARTIES: - This Anpon is mads saialy o0 the uss snd beneiil ol e Cliani neemed an the ironi pege of this R

Hmgorl in wihide of I Ganl daoss &0 &l ids or bee gwen risk,

e oy regky




