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&im mE = Pte Ltd Company Registration No. 199607198R
STUBLAVE L #02-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : 1065) 62563561 FAX : (65) 62564315
Your ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020803 Date: 10.08.2018

Owr ref: CC4PC18014196/Kwa3l

The Motor Claims Department

M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
Dear Sir/Madam,
PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SKZ 3530A

We refer to the above matler.,

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 03.08.2018
at the premises of M/s Autoworx House - Sin Ming have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 1 5% 5,494.68

Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 2,472,770

"Check" Items Amount 1 5% 1,808.40

Total (Including Check Ttems) : 8% 4.281.10

Market Value 1 8% - fest)

LTA Reimbursement Value . 5% - fest.)

Nett Value : S$ - (est)

Description of Damage: —

The vehicle sustained damages at the i r=lf_=_‘—|‘§ta i

Rear O/5 Portion S8 .;‘I:'_—ﬁ.:l
ot e

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 4.0  days

Yours faithfully,

KENNETH KONG
Licensed Appraiser



AUTOWORX HOUSE

C/0.176 SIN MING DRIVE #02-01 SINGAPORE 575721

TEL: 64520715 FAX: 64529250 A ,
£,
ESTIMATE 202 82 f
fore, A 2.
EKZM @ /%‘f"?‘
c/o 46 Lentor Plain
Singapore 786548 ﬁﬁ/ =r
Date: 3/8/2018
QUANTITY PARTICULARS AMOUNT (%)
RE: TOYOTA ALTIS /| SKZ 3530 A
1 pc rear bumper éw"m 567.30
2 pc rear bumper side retainer @ 69.40 -}H 138.80
1pec rear bumper reflector A, - 175.00
1 pe rear boot lid )i % 878.90
1 pc rear boot lamp 477.60
1 pc rear boot lock 7T 214.00
1pc rear boot lock catch Fe—— 7t 87.90
1pc rear tail lamp E LKK Auto Consuitants hence noty ; T 378.40
1pc rear boot emblem 'logo’ I fha ) | e, 67.20
1pc rear boot emblem 'COROLLA' | * " e 55.60
1pc rear boot emblem 'ALTIS' | s A 57.00
1pc rear boot lid hinge ;' /T 164.00
1pc rear end panel | /T 576.00
1pc rear end panel garnish  ™pir 31520
L sub-tolral 4,132.90
— e e 1255.23% 1,033.23
Total  |__3.099.68
S
1 pc rear bumper centre chrome moulding s.nett . 100.00
2 pc rear bumper side chrome moulding s.nett @ 60.00 Yt 120.00
1 pc rear boot emblem 'F TOYOTA' s.nett e, 65.00
To remove and replace the parts mentioned above, panel beat and
realign the necessary affected areas. 1,000.00
To check wiring system. Ze¢ 5000
To apply waterproof sealant on affected areas. A A 140.00
To apply rust proofing on affected areas. S 140.00
To apply putty & spray painting on affected areas. u/(-r( 780.00
Total 2,395.00
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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Thursday, 2 August 2018 5:09 PM

To: c35@singnet.com.sg; admin@supreme.sg; ‘Nivitha (LKK Auto)’;
assignments@|kkauto.com

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020803 RE: reply to admin@supreme.sg

Attachments: SKMBT_C35180802165400.pdf 6‘5{? g[g |{' &

\}L\‘q {'r\
Without Prejudice ‘}}Q,nﬁ-r“@ \flﬂu

Dear Sir/Mdm p\Wl’)‘, a0 3]!“5

We shall appoint LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (your choice) to conduct the survey.
Dear Nivitha
Please refer to the attached and make the necessary arrangement.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: c35@singnet.com.sg [mailto:c35@singnet.com.sq]
Sent: Thursday, 2 August, 2018 4:54 PM

To: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: reply to admin@supreme.sg



AUTOWORX HOUSE

I'76 Sin Ming Drive, #02-01 Sin Ming Autocare Singapore 575721
oTel: 6452 8211 e Fax: 6451 7420

Attn: Motor Claims Department

Dear Sir,

RE: Request for PRI for "~ in an accident involving

R

We have been authorised by / B . the registered owner
of motor vehicle: A2 sl 204 at the material time of accident to make a claim
against your insured.

Please give us the list of panel of your 10 survey firms for our selection to inspect the above
said vehicle or you may assign our choice from either one of the 3 survey firms,

I} Premier Appraiser Services

2) LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

3) AJAX Inspection Services Pte Lid

We will direct settle the claims with you if the survey is conduct by either of one the firms
mentioned,

Kindly contact us at 64528211 before coming to ensure the vehicle is in the workshop.

Thank vou,
Yours Sincerely.

hppe
p— ..;‘Il
oL

o+

Autoworx Houze
Email; autowory house@hotmail.com



Mei Kwan {LKKALto}

S—— == ——
From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 10 August, 2018 10:43 AM
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN
Cc: MT Claim_SG; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Thin Thin (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020803 RE: reply to admin@supreme.sg
Attachments: Preliminary Advice.pdf; TP ESTIMATE - MARKED pdf; TP GIA REPORT pdf
Categories: HMK

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

LPC ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020803
LKK REF: CC4/LPC18014196/Kwa3

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed revert of vehicle: SKZ 35304
We have not authorized repairs,

Enclosed for your perusal is:
» TP estimated cost of repair
= TP GlAreport
* Preliminary advice

Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Vivian and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 8625,

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank vou.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email; MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com=

Sent: Monday, 6 August, 2018 10:45 AM

To: Mei Kwan [LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020803 RE: reply to admin@supreme.sg

Dear Mei Kwan,

Attached copy of insured’s GIA report for your attention.

Best Regards
Gerald Poh



Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Mdm

We shall appoint LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (your choice) to conduct the survey.
Dear Nivitha

Please refer to the attached and make the necessary arrangement.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: c35@singnet.com.sg [mailto:c35@singnet.com.sq]
Sent: Thursday, 2 August, 2018 4:54 PM

To: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: reply to admin@supreme.sq

‘ AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software,
© WWW.aVE.Com



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

/4’4

P 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Ref : CC4/LPC18014196/Kea3n2
31704707 THE GONCOURSESINGAPORE 199655 D8 16:08:2019 Mmmwm"” ‘ ‘IN
Code: LPC2
1: Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJS 5962 Veh. Inspected SKZ 35304
Policy No. Z18NPO5/018883-001 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. 18/18/18/\VP05/020803 Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From  GERALD Assign Date 02/08/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAALTIS (A) c.c 1598
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. MROS3REH104546441 Colour METALLIC PEARL WHITE
Odometer 85847 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER. Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre [205/55 R16 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/55 R16 YOKOHAMA & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[205/55 R16 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R16 YOKOHAMA, 6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR O/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5 General Information
Accident Date  01/08/2018 Inspection Date 03/08/2018
Survey held at AUTOWORX HOUSE
176 SIN MING DRIVE
#02-01
SINGAPORE 575721
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|ESTII‘I.|'1PLTED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKZ 3530A

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapaore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R

Page Mo.:1 of 2

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
D Condition
Qty escription of Parts n Workshop ($)) ()
CEMEN ART
1|REAR BUMPER BUCKLED / 567.30 567.30
CRACKED
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER @$69.40 SERVICEABLE 138.80 .
1|REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR SERVICEABLE 175.00 .
1|REAR BOOT LID BUCKLED / BENT 878.90 B78.90
1|REAR BOOT LAMP cuT 477.60 477 60
1|REAR BOOT LOCK TO REPAIR SEE 214.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR BOOT LOCK CATCH TO REPAIR SEE 67.90 -
LABOUR
1|REAR TAIL LAMP SERVICEABLE 378.40 .
1|REAR BOOT EMBLEM 'LOGD' NECESSARY B7.20 B7.20
1|REAR BOOT EMBLEM 'COROLLA’ NECESSARY 5580 5560
1|REAR BOOT EMBLEM 'ALTIS' NECESSARY 57.00 57.00
1|REAR BOOT LID HINGE TO REPAIR SEE 164.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR END PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 576.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR END PANEL GARNISH MTG DISTORTED 315.20 31520
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -1,033.23 -604.70
3,099.87 1,814.10
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR BUMPER CENTRE CHROME MOULDING (SN) NECESSARY 100.00 60.00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE CHROME MOULDING @$60.00 (SN} |NECESSARY 120.00 60.00
1|REAR BOOT EMBLEM 'F TOYOTA' (SN) NECESSARY £5.00 65.00
28500 185.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE AND REPLACE THE PARTS MENTIONED 1,000.00 500.00
ABOVE ,PAMEL BEAT AND REALIGN THE NECESSARY
AFFECTED AREAS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR
BOOT LOCK,REAR BOOT LOCK CATCH REAR BOOT LID
HINGE AND REAR END PANEL.
TO CHECK WIRING SYSTEM. 50.00 20.00

Report Ref No. CC4/LPC180141586/Kea3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

;_‘ - ." - 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
/—_. TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 189607198R GST Reg. No. 13-9607198-R Page No.:2 of 2
: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ()
TO APPLY WATERPROOF SEALANT ON AFFECTED NOT NECESSARY 140.00 -
AREAS.
TO APPLY RUST PROOFING ON AFFECTED AREAS. 140.00 30.00
TO APPLY PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED 780.00 660.00
AREAS.
2,110.00 1,210.00
GRAND TOTAL 5,494 67 3,209.10
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,400.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CC4/LPC18014196/Kea3n2

Y 4va

KONG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appraiser




