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-Asher Sna !l_.l(l{Autn}

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 25 February 2019 11:34 AM

To: 'Loh, Chee-Heng'

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] Your ref : 88993559275G, ACCIDENT ON 28/07/2018 INVOLVING

SLL 3485) (Ol) & SHF 524D (TP)
Your ref : 88993559275G
Our ref : CC3/AIG18014183/Kea3
Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENT ON 28/07/2018 INVOLVING SLL 3485] (Ol) & SHF 524D (TP)
We refer to the above matter.
The accident occurred when our insured exit from the parking lot hit third party vehicle.
Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability.
We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be affected.
We seek your approval to offer repairer " TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD" at § 8,959.55 {all-i
The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repairs (with GST) $52,589.02 $7,757.50
2. Loss of Rental (8days x $99.32) S 79456 $ 794.56 (8days x $99.32)
3. Loss of Income (8days x 550) $ 400.00 $ 400.00
4, LTA Search Fee S 7.49 s 749
Total §53,791.07 $ 8,959.55

For your approval in merimen please.

Thank You,

Best Regords,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Phe Lid

phone: 6841-5051 | emall: gshersng@lkkgulo.com | fox 4741-4108
Bl 51, Faya Ubi Indusiriol Park. Ubl Avenue |, #02-25 | 5{408%33)



Print Received Message

This mall is associated with ;

*SHF524D (B8993559275G)
(SLLM85.]

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
Jul 28 2018 9:00AM
[HONG LAI PENG (KONG LIPING))
Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Lid

From AlG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. (Express) (AlG_SG_EXPRESS), sent on 26/02/2019 17:58 PM.
To LKK_HQ
Subject

Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (5$8261.58) - SHF5240 - Claim Handler: Loh, Chee-Heng
Approved:8261.59.




Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63

Tel No.: 6287 6666 Fax No. 6281 1400
Co./GST Reg. No. 200303878K

Our Ref : AAD1807-265
Your Ref : SLL3485)
Date : 16.November 2018

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE
Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHF0524D AND SLL3485) ON 28/07/18 09:40 AM ALONG BLK
524 ANG MO KIO STREET 52 CARPARK

It appears that the above accident was caused by your insured's negligence. We, therefore
seeking compensation from you for our financial loss as itemized below :-

1 Cost of Repair (inclusive of 7% GST) 5 7,757.50

2 Loss of Rental for _= _ days @ 57934 per day $ 79456

3 Loss of Income for B days @ § A per day s 400.00

4 LTA Search Fee 5 749

5 Survey Fee 3 0.00
Total s 8,959 55

We enclose a copy of the following documents for your consideration :-

GIA report lodged by our driver Rental rate and mileage records

Certificate of Insurance Authorization To Act

Original final repair bill LTA Search Fee

Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 14 days, failing which we shall
proceed to hand over the conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further
reference to you.

Yours Faithfully

Tranj!ﬂ:ab Services Pte Ltd

!

Jasmine Tan
General Manager

Tel No. : 6603 1250 (DID)
Mote : Please email any further correspondence to claims@transcab.com.sg (6603 1259)
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' Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Cwner 1D Type:

Chvner 10

Vehicle Details

Wehiche Mo

Yehiche to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Wetiche Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour
Manufacturing Year

Engine No.:

Chassis No.

Mamimum Power Output
Oipen Market Value

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transler Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibllity:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE PeriodiYears):

POP Paid:

COE Rebate Amaunt:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

PARFITMF Rakata Famdr

Company
JA7EK

SHF524D

Yes

30l 2028

REMALULT

LATITUDE 2.0L DC1 AUTO DvaB DR
Red

2014
MPRBEIFCO01561
VFIABLISALC27B271
1270 kW 1170 bhp]
$19.998.00

13.um 2014

13 Jun 2014

0

£12.498.00

Yes
12 Jum 2022
§9.373.00

17 Jun 2022

A - Cor up to 1600cc & 7w (1306ho)
a

$57.338.00

$27.73200

$37.105.00

Please note that the 8-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the
vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicablel, whichever is earler

The infarmation contained herein is correct as at 30 Jul 2018

OK

FULR.0 VL ITA. GOV, BE/IA/ VL BCHOMN ENGU NERBORIEDS ) FUDICEEIDMBLETEIINPUL fF UNL | IDN_ILSHUIUS US| |

Wi



Asher Sni !LI(KAutu!

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Wednesday, 12 September 2018 3:03 PM

To: ‘LIPINGOT@GMAIL COM'

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLL 3485) AND SHF 524D ON 28/07/2018

Our Ref: CC3/AIG18014183/Kea3

12 SEPT 2018

HONG LAI PENG

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLL 3485) AND SHF 524D ON 28/07/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid to resolve the claim
against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to
negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact
us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if vour policy has a NCD
protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and vour NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Asher

Case Handler

DID: 6841 6051

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: Ashersng@lkkauto.com

c.c AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)

17



Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63

Tel No.: 6287 6666 Fax No. 6281 1400
Co./GST Reg. No. 200303878K

Authorization To Act

We, Trans-cab Services Pte Ltd of Company Registration No. 200303878K hereby authorize
Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd to act on behalf to claim for all losses incurred for the
accident involving SHF0524D and SLL3485) along BLK 524 ANG MO KIO STREET 52 CARPARK
on 28/07/18 09:40 AM.

In addition, we also hereby authorize the above payment to be made in favour of Trans-cab
Auto Services Pte Ltd upon settlement.

Dated this 16 (day) of November 2018
s

|
Yours Faithfully
Tran%{ab Services Pte Ltd

/

Jasmine Tan
General Manager



RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We/l, TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l
have reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid LEKK
AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
5$7,757.50 (Repair Cost), S$496.60 (Loss of Hse/Rental), $$7.49 (Disbursement) for vehicle no.
SHF 524D that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 28/07/2018 (date) along

BLK 524 ANG MO KIO STREET 52 CARPARK (location) involving vehicle no/s SLL 3485].

This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 31/07/2018 (date) at “the workshop”.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD (“the
third party claimant”) of vehicle no. SHF 524D make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and

we/l have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l
enclose herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant™
after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage to SHF
524D (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant"” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have

exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this ________(day)of ______ " (month) 20_"_ (ye:

Signed by “the workshop” (with chop)



Trans-Cab Auto Services Pte Ltd
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111
Tel: 65287 6666

Fasx: 6287 7764

Co. Reg. No: 2010196266

GST Reg. No.: 2010196266

Tax Invoice / Debit Note

TO:
AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTELTD INVOICE NO. tINVI1B10-324
78 Shenton Way DATE : 31, October 2018
#07-16 CHARTIS Building REFERENCE NO : AAD1BOT-265
079120 Singapore TERMS : Net 30 Days
DUE DATE : 30. November 2018
ATTENTION! PAGE |
NO. CODE DESCRIPTION QTY  UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
1 BOS0107 REFAIR-SHF0524D,00A4 28.07 1B{LUMP SUM-18) 1 7.757.50 7.757.50
Total SGD Excl. G5T : 7.250.00
7% G5T: 507.50
#+** SEVEN THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED FIFTY SEVEN AND FIFTY Y
— 2 ROINE Total 5GD Incl. G5T : 7,757.50

1) All cheques snould be crossed and mage payable 10" Trans-Cab Auto Senvices Ple Lid”

2] Fiease quote our invoce MumiBer dunng payment

) We reserve the night to charge interest @ 1.5% per month an overdug invoice

4] Any dispute a5 10 the accuracy, charges e1c of this mvoece must be communicated within 10 days fram the date hereof failing which it shall be

desmed to have been unconditionally accepted

THIS IS A COMPUTER GENERATED INVOICE WHICH REQUIRES NO SIGNATURE



Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63

Tel No.: 6287 6666 Fax No. 6281 1400
Co./GST Reg. No. 200303878K

16 November, 2018

To Whom It May Concern

Dear Sir / Madam,
Accident on 28/07/18 02:40 AM at BLK 524 ANG MO KIO STREET 52 CARPARK

1. We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd is the
registered owner of the tax) beaning vehicle registration no. SHF0524D. The taxi was hired to LIM KWANG
YONG LAWRENCE a registered hirer-operator of Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd at the time of occurrence of
the aforementioned accident at a rental rate $99.32 per day (inclusive of GST).

2. Please be advised that the Taxi is insured with AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD on a third party basis at the
material time of the accident

3. Please liaise with us directly for any settlement of claims in respect of the said accident

Yours faithiully,

Jasmine Tan
General Manager

This is a computer generated print-out. No signature s required.



Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63

Tel No.: 6287 6666 Fax No. 6281 1400
Co./GST Reg. No. 200303878K

28-07-2018

Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that the taxi was undergo acadent repair in the workshop as follow:

Date In Date Out Vehicle No.
Accident No. AAD1807-265 Accident Date 28-07-2018
F728/2018 10:00 B/a/7018 1545 SHEOZZ24AD
Yours Faithfully,
Tranv{.‘.ah Services Pte Ltd
.'Ill
Jasmine Tan

General Manager
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OK Save as PDF
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Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

.+.CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Express

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
| Case | Notified Est Submitted Ad) Assigned Adj Rpt Ag) Subrmipted Ins Auth'ed SEatus
1
e |02 Aug 2018 e $$7,250.00 | 5$7,250.00 Pending for Survey
e £an Adj Kot | ==t J | _om om | Cancel Case |

Rafersnce Claim Detalls

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by adjuster]
mmnm(mupm;_. 1D: 579253846

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No.: 200303878K

. |28/07/2018 09:00 - :59
SHF524D Date of Loss: [49 Months and 15 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ‘)]

TP / 889935592756 RaeoeeT | 2100501243 (Comprehensive)

Poliey Mo,
{Claimant):

YPX/PIEBOSID

| Encess:
| Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd () No 3 Ang Mo Ko Streef 63, 569111 Ang Ma Kio - Tl

| AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. [Express) - Tel! £5-6419-3000 ... [Handled by Loh, Chee-Heng] Chee-Hang. Loh@aig .com

| AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6338 7288
|LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handied by KENNETH KONG] ... [Final Rpt due 15/08/2018]
riew All J Emltnehui_l

|= AlG_SG_EXPRESS (26/02/2018) Alert - Ad) Mandate Approved (588261.59) - SHF524D - Claim Handler: Loh, Ches-He...
* AIG_SG [15/08/2018)! OI GIA report

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= View All | SearchTasks | Create new Task | compiese |

Due Date Priority Typa  Task Group Subject  Mandlar Assigned By Caompleted On Created On Done?
No results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp_... 22/5/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page | of 2
Claim Documents
*SHF524D (88993559275G)
[S5LL3485]]
™
TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
Jul 28 2018 9:00AM

[HONG LAI PENG (KONG LIPING)]

Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd
‘Letters/ Correspondences [1 per poge v]| &
_Hu | Finalized O | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Pring
{3 [{Draft) | Third Party Express Settiement = Payment Breakdown (1] Extjt
‘lnl_ﬂm.ntm tP;PlF Ei M
Mo | Fmnafized Cn ALG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, [SG) Thumbnail | Print

. Accident Statement |
POMSORAB 09I | pmon - Aeg. No: SL3485), Clnmant: rOWG LAl PENG @ | tosdHv
" Accident Statement

2 [UARLA 100 From 00 - Reg. Mot SLLIAESL, Cluimant) HONG LAT FENG © | Losdtim |
Photos/Images 3 per page E =+
Mo | Relabel/Reorder | LNK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbmall Print
o DyII9 1701 | General View 0 eaws | B
2 ONOZ1917:01 | General View D | weaws | A |
3 0U02/1%17:01 | General View Load 106 | B
4 010218 17:01 | General View 0D | ceows || A
g anwmn:m | Ganeral View D | weaws | &
6 D019 17:01 | General View D wwre |
7 010219 17:01 | General View D | wawvc | 4
& 00218 17:01 | General View D | tssaws | B
5 |BY0L1% 17:01 | General View 0| tosawc | A
10 [DL02/1% 17:01 | Genersl View D | adws | I
11 [0102/1917:01 | General View 0| adrs | A
12 |01/02/18 17:01 | General View 0| waws | A
13 (010219 17:01 | General View 0 | woscirc | &
14 |01/02/1817:01 | General View D | ossrc |
15 (04/02/18 17:01 | General View O waws &
16 |01/03/19 17:0) Odometer Reading ﬂ Losg PG | B
17 |01/02/19 17:01 | Chassis Number 0D | lsdwc | A
18 |0L/02/19 17:01 | General View 0D | wawc |
I
iﬂnnnnnﬂﬂun l2 E =]
(Mo | Relsbal/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
|1 |DS/DB/18 22:50 | TP ESTIMATE-MARKED ) | Load POF
2 |05/08/38 22:50 | TP GIA REPORT i | 1ood FOF
|3 |12/09/1815:13 _ |LETTER TO O1 Lowd POF
|4 123/01/19 10:15 RENTAL RECEIPT = Load POF
S 2M/D1/15 1015 | RENTAL MILEAGE Load POF
B |23/01/15 10:15 | LTA SEARCH Load POF |
7 |22/05/1912:36 | WORKSHOP INVOICE D | Losd FOF
B 22/05/1% 12:36 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM @) | Losd POF
§ |32/0519 12:36 Releass Voucher LeadPDF | |

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 22/5/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2

Documents Checklist

[ROCURENTS ORI reset | save | primt |
There are no docurment checkiists configured.

Dur = Consultants Pte Lid )]

Show Remarks Ta: [ Handling Insurer
Fain- Bemarks oom orisats wnless you BN L fo oEfer parhes

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc... 22/5/2019



Preview Page 1 of |

NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| Vehicle No: SLL3485J (Insd veh) Model: ENAULT LATITUDE 2.0 DCI
SHF524D (TP veh) UTO D/AB 4DR (A)

| Date of Accident: |28/07/2018

Global Sum Settiement [ ] | | Yes | [X] No

Repair Estimate $ 52.580.02

Final Repair Cost 3 7.767.50

Loss of Use s days al $0.00 per day
Rental (if any) '8 4096860| 5 days

LTA / GIA Search Fee -1 7.449

Others '8 0.00

: §

Final Sattlement Sum '8 8,261.59

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [X ] NO (Kindly indicate
below)

A) For MIA. Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenaria N
B) For GIA Registered Workshop: OLA Applicable: Yes/No BOLA Scenario No

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessad Liability (*): (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filied only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does nol apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |Trans-cab Auto Services Ple Lid - B.261.58
Z) ' 9
3) -
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 22 May
2018
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report: Medical
Report/ Bill (if any)

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doclt... 22/5/2019



Adjuster Report

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ico reg ne 19se071s8m

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408833

Page | of 6

Tel 6266-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Emall: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Flle No: CC3/AIG18014183/KEA3QZ

Date: 221062018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid Faolicy No: 2100501243
E':','"‘“‘ Vehicle g irs24p Insured Vehicle No:  SLL3485J
Date of Loss: 2B8/07/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: BBS93550275G
R ON N OF
Reg No: SHF524D
Make & Model: RENAULT LATITUDE, 2.0 DCI AUTO D/AB 40DR (A) Engine No: MBRE838C001581
Reg. Date: 13/06/2014 (Man. Year: 2014) Chassis No: VF1ABL15AUCZ278271
Colour Metallic White/Red Odometer: 412818 km
Engine Capacity. 1885 cc
Markel Value/New Car Prica; N/A
Sum Insured (S$); Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME QF SURVEY
General Condition Steering (Serviceable): Yes Fooltbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabla): Yes Engine Modificalion: No  Pre-accident Condition.
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size 215/80R16 Rear Tyre Size: 215/60R16
Front Left Side: Giti 8 mm Rear Left Side: Giti 8 mm
Front Right Side: Giti 8 mm Rear Right Side: Giti 8 mm
The sbove valles represant the remaming hyre esds depth
(COST OF CLAIMS - " Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 34 258 62 6,852.06 27 A06.56 80.00
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 14,890.00 2.240.00 12,650.00 84,96
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0,00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 49,148.62 9,002.06 40,056.56 81.50
Approved Total (Overridden) (5%) 7.250.00
(5%) 49 148.62 7.250.00 41,898 62 B5.25
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S$) 3.4420.40 507.50 2,8932.90 85.25
Nett Amount (5§) 52,580.02 T,757.50 44,831.52 B5.25
+ Car Rental (5.0 x 5$599.32/day) (5§) 406 60
+ Docl/Search Fee (S§) T7.49
Nett Liability (S§) 8,261.59
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment 31/0772018
Date Inspecied: 310772018 Inspected At Trans-cab Aulo Services Ple Lid
No 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 83
Singapore 568111
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Estimated Pariod of Repair; 5.0 days

Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: Asher Sng Rong Yi

NOTE: This report represents our fndings af ihe fime and place of inspechon stated hern. Such inspection has bean camed oul fo the bear of owr
knowiedge and abiily tut any other fability under any other circumatances (g hareby expresely arcludod
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REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Parliculars Condition Repalrer's Amount
L *BUMPER COVER FRT Senviceable 125842 FL *-FL
2 1 “BUMPER SPOILER FRT Serviceable 181.75FL *-FL
3 *BUMPER ABSORBER FRT Serviceable 304 BAFL “FL
4 1 *BUMPER RETAINER FRT LH Serviceable 151 41FL *-FL
] 1 *BUMPER SUPPORT FRT Serviceable 123.88FL *-FL
B 1 *BUMPER RETAINER FRT RH Serviceable 150.7TFL “FL
71 *BUMPER SUPPORT FRT Serviceable 123.88FL *-FL
B 1 *BUMPER UNDERTRAY FRT Serviceable 472.83FL *-FL
B 1 *BUMPER GRILLE LOWER FRT Serviceable 266.80FL *-FL
0 1 *BUMPER FOG LAMP GRILLE LH Serviceable 207.21FL *-FL
1 1 “BUMPER FOG LAMP GRILLE RH Serviceable 207.21FL *FL
12 1 *BUMPER BEAM FRT Repair 814.08FL *-FL
13 1 *FENDER PANEL FRT LH Bent 783 83FL *TB3IBAFL
14 1 "WHEELARCH FRT LH Sarviceable 278.B4FL *.FL
15 1 *FENDER BRACKET LOWER LH Serviceable 15.T9FL FL
16 1 *FENDER INSULATOR LH Serviceable 130 84 FL “FL
17 1 *DOOR PANEL FRT LH Bent 2,844 B6FL "2 844 E66FL
18 1 *DOOR HINGE UPPER LH Repair 2681.28FL *-FL
19 1 *DOOR HINGE LOWER LH Repair 300.55FL “FL
20 1 “‘DOOR CHECK FRT LH Serviceable 184 7T FL “-FL
21 1 *DOOR LOCK FRT LH Repair B08.75FL *-FL
2 1 *DOOR CATCH FRT LH Serviceable 131.23FL *-FL
23 1 *DOOR HANDLE OQUTER FRT LH Serviceable 4TT.TBFL *“-FL
24 1 *DOOR HANDLE COVER FRT LH Serviceable 13.22FL “-FL
25 1 *DOOR HANDLE MODULE FRT LH Serviceable 133.60FL *-FL
26 1 *‘DOOR REGULATOR FRT LH Serviceable 505.18FL *-FL
27 1 *DOOR REGULATOR MOTOR FRT LH Serviceable 796 46 FL *-FL
28 1 *DOOR REGULATOR GUIDE FRT LH Serviceable 120.87 FL -FL
29 1 *DOOR PANEL REAR LH Bant 2.B44 6EFL *2.B44 6G6FL
o 1 *DOOR GUIDE REAR LH Sarviceable 176.B2 FL *-FL
N 1 *DO0OR HINGE UPPER LH Repair 274 50FL *-FL
2 1 *DOOR HINGE LOWER LH Repair 300.55 FL *-FL
B 1 *DOOR CHECK REAR LH Serviceable 203.06 FL “~FL
M 1 *DOOR LOCK REAR LH Repair 808.75FL *-FL
B 1 *DOOR HANDLE OUTER REAR LH Serviceable 126.49FL *-FL
B 1 *DOOR HANDLE CAP REAR LH Serviceable 35.52FL *-FL
r 1 *DOOR HANDLE SEAL REAR LH Serviceable 7.89FL *-FL
3 1 *DOOR HANDLE COVER REAR LH Serviceable 13.22FL *FL
I’ 1 *DOOR HANDLE MODULE REAR LH Serviceable 133.80FL *~FL
40 1 *DOOR REGULATOR REAR LH Serviceable 1,135.10FL "-FL
41 1 *DOOR REGULATOR MOTOR REAR LH Serviceable BO3T5FL “FL
42 1 *DOOR REGULATOR NUT REAR LH Serviceable 12.43FL *FL
43 1 *DOOR REGULATOR MOTOR SCREW REAR L70Y Serviceable B31FL “FL
44 1 *DOOR FINISHER REAR LH Serviceable 423 10FL *-FL
45 1 *DOOR MOULDING REAR LH Serviceable 17T6.82FL "-FL
48 1 *DOOR MOULDING CLIP LT0Y Not Necessary 592FL *-FL
47 1 *DOOR MOULDING SCREW LT0Y Serviceable BO1FL *FL
48 1 *DOOR CASING REAR LH Serviceable 1.508.06 FL *-FL
48 1 *‘DOOR WATER SHIELD REAR LH Serviceable 30.38FL =-FL

Reporl was unsubmitied -:Iur!ng this print-oul.
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Ne. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

50 1 *DOOR CASING CLIP Not Necessary 1263FL “.FL
5 1 "*DOOR CASING LIGHT L70Y Sernviceable 48 TAFL *-FL
62 1 *DOOR FINISHER INNER REAR LH Serviceable 32344 FL *-FL
52 1 “DOOR FINISHER BRACKET INNER REAR LH Repair 46,97 FL *-FL
54 1 *DOOR FINISHER BRACKET INNER REAR LH Repair 20.33FL " FL
85 1 *DOOR FINISHER BRACKET INNER REAR LH Repair 20.33FL *-FL
56 1 *DOOR FINISHER BRACKET INNER REAR LH Repair 20.33FL *-FL
5 1 *DOOR GRAB HANDLE REAR LH Repair 21086 FL *FL
58 1 “‘DOOR BLIND REAR LH Serviceable T41.80FL *-FL
58 1 *DOOR WEATHERSTRIP REAR LH Serviceable 410.66 FL *-FL
1 *DOOR SEAL REAR LH Serviceable 162.02 FL *-FL
B1 1 "DOOR GLASS RUNNER SEAL REAR LH Serviceable 22931 FL *FL
62 1 *DOOR WAIST SEAL OUTER REAR LH Serviceable 334 BAFL “FL
83 1 *DOOR WAIST SEAL INNER REAR LH Serviceable 115684 FL *-FL
B4 1 *FENDER PANEL REAR LH Repair 3280 13FL *-FL
65 1 *FENDER PANEL INNER TRIM REAR Serviceable 671.45FL *FL
66 1 *WHEELARCH REAR LH Serviceable S43.4TFL *-FL
67 1 *‘DOOR MIRROR ASSY LH Serviceable 14683 40FL *-FL
68 1 *ROCKER PANEL INNER GARNISH LH Serviceabls 468.51 FL *FL
68 1 *ROCKER PANEL INNER LH Repair 1,024 7T9FL *-FL
m 1 "ROCKER PANEL CENTER LH Bent 98025FL “880.25FL
o1 *LOWER ARM LH L70Y Serviceable B85.76FL *FL
72 1 *KNUCKLE ARM LH LT0Y Serviceable B4B.9BFL “FL
31 *ABSORBER FRT LH LT0Y Serviceable 360.54 FL *-FL
4 1 *HEADLAMP LH Serviceable 1,184 43FL *.FL
B 1 *AIR CLEANER BOX Serviceable 464 20FL *-FL
s 1 “AlR CLEANER HOSE Serviceable 175.85FL "FL
m o1 *SET FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL CLIP Not Necessary T0.00FS *-FS
m 2 *FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL NUT Mot Necessary 20.00FS *F5
79 2 *FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL STUD Not Necessary 30.00FS *-F5
BO 1 *SET WHEELARCH CLIP FRT LH Not Necessary 30.50FS *-FS
a1 1 *FRONT DOOR STICKER TRANS-CAB Necessary 80.00FS  “BO.0OFS
B2 1 *FRONT DOOR STICKER CHASSIS MNecessary 50.00FS  "15.00FS
B3 1 *REAR DOOR STICKER 65553333 Mecessary BO.OOFS  *60.00FS
B4 1 *‘DOOR CHECK BOLT Serviceable 2269F5 *-FS
B5 1 *‘DOOR GUIDE SCREW Serviceable 10.85F5 *-F5
86 1 *DOOR HINGE BOLT Serviceable 10.85FS *-FS
B 1 *DOOR HINGE NUT RH Serviceable 14 60FS *FS
B3 1 *DOOR CHECK BOLT Semviceable 22 69FS *FS
Bg 1 *DOOR CHECK NUT Serviceable A75FS -
80 1 *DOOR LOCK SCREW L70Y Serviceable 6.12FS *-FS
91 1 *DOOR CATCH SCREW L70Y Serviceable 10.06FS *-FS
82 1 *SET RADIATOR GRILLE FRAME CLIP Mot Necessary 52.00FS “Fs
g3 1 *SET BUMPER CLIP FRT Mot Necessary E6.00FS *-FS
84 1 *BUMPER BRACKET CLIP FRT LH Mot Necessary 12.00FS *Fs
85 1 *BUMPER SUPPORT CLIP FRT LH Not Necessary 10.50FS -F§
86 1 *BUMPER BRACKET CLIP FRT RH Not Necessary 1200FS *-FS
ar 1 "BUMPER SUPPORT CLIP FRT RH Not Necessary 10.50FS *-Fs
88 1 *TOW COVER FRT Not Necessary 14 50F5 *-FS
g9 1 *SET RADIATOR GRILLE SCREW Not Necessary 16.00FS "FS
100 1 *SET BUMPER GRILLE LOWER CLIP Not Necessary 69.00FS "-FS
101 1 *FRONT LEFT TYRE Serviceable 330.00F5 *FS
102 1 *FRONT LEFT TYRE RIM Serviceable 380.00FS *-FS

Repor was unsubmitted during this print-out
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No. Qty Pari No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
F=Franchise parl S=SpcMett. L=_LstitemDisc

Sub Total (S8) 37905.73 7,598.40
- List ltem Discount on L ltems 10.00/10.00% (S%) 364711 746.24

Total Parts (S5) 34,258.62 6,852.06

[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out |
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Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous Items

Thare are no new miscellansous Hems selocted.

Recommended Labour

Page 6 of 6

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour tems
1 PANEL BEATING,KNOCKING AND STRAIGHTENING THE New 6,000.00 B80O.00
NECESSARY PORTION,REMOVE AND RENEWAL OF
PARTS.,ADJUST AND REALIGN THE SAME
2 PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING OF THE AFFECTED PORTION New 5,000.00 1,100.00
3 TO RUST-PROOFING OF THE AFFECTED AREAS New 170.00 120.00
4 TO REMOVE AND REFIT INTERIOR MNew 380.00 80.00
FITTINGS, TRIMINGS,GARNISH,FITTINGS AND OTHER,TO
ENABLE REPAIR
5 TO CHECK STEERING GEOMETRY AND COMPUTER WHEEL Mew 220.00 0.00
ALIGNMENT
6 TO TRANSFER OF REAR FENDER FITTINGS ATTACHMENT New 380.00 0.00
AND PERFORM WATER SEEPAGE TEST
T TO TRANSFER OF FRONT BUMPER FITTINGS ATTACHMENT New 380.00 0.00
AND PERFORM WATER SEEPAGE TEST
8 TO TRANSFER OF TIRE,RIM AND ON WHEEL BALANCING New 170.00 0.00
TO CHECK ELECTRICAL LIGHTING CONCERNED New 170.00 20.00
i TO TRANSFER OF FRONT FENDER FITTINGS.ATTACHMENT New 380.00 0.00
AND PERFORM WATER SEEPAGE TEST
11 TO TRANSFER OF FRONT DOOR FITTINGS ATTACHMENT New 380.00 B0.00
AND PERFORM WATER SEEPAGE TEST
12 TO TRANSFER OF REAR DOOR FITTINGS ATTACHMENT AND  New 380.00 60.00
PERFORM WATER SEEPAGE TEST
13 TOWING FEES New 120.00 0.00
14 TO PULL AND JACK OUT CHASSIS FRAME AND CORRECTIT  New 360.00 0.00
TO SYMMETRICAL POSITION WITH THE AID OF HYDRAULIC
PNEUMATIC JACK
13 LABOUR CHARGE TO MOUNT AND DISMOUNT VEHICLE ON MNew 360.00 0.00
JIG BENCH,TO FACILITATE REPAIR
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 14,890.00 2,240.00
I_ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out
< END OF ESTIMATES >
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