1 cs|pedigoj4185 /R l:;Js | -

A CU\]S ASSIGNMENT (Offic
ﬁmm L Rt i 3lghed a-40pm

I Fall &

““ TIPRES [ OD RESTEVA NV I MV 7CS

o Tnspect Veliele 11 XE 3 TQQ—_B [hisurad SH' 66 5q ‘T
i%“ " %U j_ 1 q236821¢

No. 2 KLGD“ﬂ Min Rool
- DIg60O6IEINFs ¢

[olicy Tan
S Insured

Make of Vel

1.' '|i'|1.|'_;4§l--l:.|:l. (Y 80!0:} \g’olqg'
CAJREY | KEP. j Ry 24 s DS |||r

6lale — tq\ué "”T uhm R - ~ Iidieh .
}In (4&1‘.4 h)  30/nlg- vehide <hill pot-h
01Tk cqud whep v shi pot- UH 110V G 4o uneeioilly of ).

1s]elg_ ool 3
30/4hs mﬁﬁwﬂh&n . TJM&T‘_ '3& iRl



o2laligq

O o s A TN Y

Xg 31228

13 pioner Qeefor |

ASM Aufomofive

(17572

¥e 3nrh w7 I
o Wb il £ Dot oo d D omey el 1 0ne Maswir |
inele d Fradler

Quapar oo Lk
PG

12

12741

Pt 4t M HA

o Bl Pt Jnsuineel ] S0 PR RA

(R
O
o (i %}P%KMWL?EW
iy ol ol J@ I Provoe | Binind
| | i gl 1 ammed | Leakod {Bwl of
IERTHIRN (3]
i i i Bk Rt b L] T Lealed § Larg @
|t e il
bl e ool Wl Ml iflil'.l SMm § 5TH AR dn
Tyar Vi I+ 3[{{'/&0 R11 %
iy o s ~ “ I
chinil Fhe vl B commmenaed (b 1 LM B DUM [ EXHOVAS G PES LA TMIC T ORTSU T PIR §SUmi
popatke b e Hnee of Tnspoction i TOYO | YOKO o
[ T TR T Faoml (1G]
IRAL Awaidenl B Cemptadatent? ;Y on on Mo Rkl 3 e ik 5{3 i
Sk PR S Conbslant¥ : You o No RILT 8 1l LI 1

E st Fapaiint ‘:V tlety Hoa ' Yos of M

Gl O REN 4 REP. ) .'-1III-:'.'D5)

Hirw M
%/x’ 4 (&7l

Ve Lﬂ‘-'df.-'l

Fariog Ueritie el

""[} ": £ LA

Provel Prnadised Lnad

(RaA & $71:%0,

L

RECEIVED

(TR P TETTR TR L T

1 f}f"? Jﬂl/“'f-l?"r-f D Finid ol

Ll e ke ek b

T
16b» T

b

FWal: Yos or No

Lo

¢al /I

DOL (|
RA Wﬁﬂ

Fri b Wear | O 1 NG ING ! Roaftap

N[s P

My WG 1 Chagsls fame ¢ Body Stoasture allockod o b collishg

) DA Bﬂltﬂ![g
sy il al
Pirer ol Ll

IO

.-"'.I
.l-":.»:, = | -

J%%r #6233, 2 dap>

S

Ly O Raerpair:

oy Mo, of Trip: no

Sy | o

_J

Add Fees] | o .
]
iR
| w

i
[
i
I



51 UBI AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA URI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D18005783MFSH Date: 25 February 2019

Our Ref: CS/FCI18014155/R1qd3

The Motor Claims Department

First Capital Insurance L.td

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _XE 3122B .
Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 22/02/2019 at the premises of M/s ASM AUTOMOTIVE . and have the following to
reporti-

Workshop Estimate Amount :88  2.184.27
Revised Estimate Amount :S§  1.662.37
“Check” Items Amount : 8% -
Market Value : 8% -
LTA Reimbursement Value : 5% -
Nett Value : S§ -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages
at the n/s front portion.

Yours faithfully

Rasul
Automotive Assessor



MS @ FirstCapital

& Raftles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tek (B5) 6222 2311 Fax: (656222 3547

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited CoReg e 1950001006 G37 Reg, Ho H2 0001675 9

(lalms & Motor Undenwriting Dept 36 Robinsan Road #16-01 City House Singapore 00BETT

Tel: (65) 6507 3848 Fax (B5) 6507 3849
whan msfirstcapital.comosg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

31-07-2018 Our Ref No.
3p-07-2018 Claim Type.
SHEB58T Third Party Vehicle,

NO 2, KWONG MIN ROAD
JACLYN LAI
62650980/ 92368218

DIRECT SETTLEMENT: EST. COR - $2,184.27

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD

WA Fax No.

NA,

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Fax No.

D18005783MFSH

Third Party

XE3122B

62656068

68416315

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

ASM AUTOMOTIVE

Attention.
SERVICES PTE LTD
MNA TP Solicitor Fax No.

SERENE

IMPORTANT NOTE

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

NIL

NA

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is & computer generated letter, no signature required.




Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

#

From: ASM Jaclyn <jaclynlai@asmauto.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 1 March 2019 4:23 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: Finalization: XE3122B (TP claim - MS FCI)

Attachments: IMG_20190223_151822 jpg; IMG_20190223_151839.jpg; IMG_20190223_151850,jpg;

IMG_20190223_151858 jpg; IMG_20190223_151903 jpg; IMG_20190223_151910jpg;
IMG_20190223_151914 jpg; IMG_20190223_151922 jpg; IMG_20190223_151928 jpg;
IMG_20190223_151946 jpg

Dear Rasul,
Kindly refer attached before paint and damaged parts’ photos.

COR pbp 51,662.37 and 2 days. Please confirm.

Thank you

Our office & workshop is now at No. 13 Pioneer Sector 1, Singapore 628424,
== All contact numbers and fax number are remoin unchanged.

Best Regards,
Jacbyn Lai
Maotor Claims Executive

ASM Automotive Services Pte Ltd
MNo. 13, Pioneer Sector 1, Singapore 628424,

Hp: 9236 8218 | DID: 62650026 | Fax: 6265 6068
Web: www.asmauto.com.s
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Li

Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) 4

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 25 February 2019 2:11 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System’; assignments

Cc: SERENELER@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005783MFSH/1
Attachments: CSFCI18014155R1qd3.pdf

Dear Serene,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of XE 3122B.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email; siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 3 August 2018 3:53 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: SERENELER@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005783M FSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1072 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 3 August 2018 2:39 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cec: CWSMOTORCLAIMS @ MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SERENELER@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005783M FSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,
Admin Team
Claim Workflow System



ASM Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Mo 2, Kwong Min Road, Singapore 628705
Tel: 6265 0980 / 6265 BB0E Fax: 6265 BOEBE

' =
Email: enquiry@asmauto com sg 5{@[—}.
Co. /| GST Reg. No.201203813C [

3 g

ANV

FROM : Jaclyn Lai DATE : 02.08.2018
TEL. NO. : B265-0980 / 9236-8218
EMAIL : jaclynlai@asmauto.com.sq VEHICLE NO. : XE3122B

MODEL NO. ¢ SCANIA P400LAAX2ZMSZ
TO : MS First Capital Insurance Lid CHASSIS NO. : YS2P4X20005463605
ATTN : Motor Claim Department ENGINE NO. : DC13113L017005914
TEL. NO. 1 B507-3848 LTA REG DATE : 11-Jul-17
EMAIL : motor _claims@first-insurance.com.sg

CLAIM TYPE : Third Party - SH 6659 T
ccC : Lim Guan The Logistics Pte Ltd D.O.A : 30.07.2018
ATTN : Mr. Joe Lim CLAIM REF NO. : asm/AC18069/JL

Quotation for Accident Repair

SIN SPARE PARTS QUANTITY UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

1 Bumper, LHs -~ 1 $ 105000 S  1,050.00

2 End piece. LHS St~ 1 3 9530 § 95.30

3 Step cover, center LHS Y SvC 1 $ 191.00 $ 191.00

4 Step plate, lower LHS < £ — 1 g 42400 $ 42400
SUB-TOTAL : 1 5(9Jp $§ 176030

LESS 10% : K $ 176.03

BALANCE : ' lo §  1.584.27

g ..’1 - 'ti:‘“n
_._._.."'_

LABOUR CHARGES

1 To remove and replace damaged parts, jack and straighten step beracket. > f 5 }506 20U
15U
2 Spray painting ,-" 3 299?&] _{' O
TOTAL LABOUR : 3 600.00

GRAND TOTAL : 2,184.27




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapare 408833

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607T198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

36 ROBINSON ROAD

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877

Ref : CS/FCI18014155/R1gd3n2

Date 13-03-2019

Code: FCI2

LM

1:

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. SH 6653T Veh. Inspected XE 3122B
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. D18005783MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From SERENE Assign Date 03/08/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model SCANIA P400LA C.C 12742
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. ¥S2P4X20005463605 Colour BLUE
Odometer 166124 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |315/80 R22.5 GOODYEAR B mm
L/H Front Tyre |315/80 R2Z25 GOODYEAR 8 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |315/80 R22.5 (D) GOODYEAR 8/B mm
L/H Rear Tyre |315/80 R22.5 (D) GOODYEAR 8/8 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  30/07/2018 Inspection Date 22/02/2019
Survey held at  ASM AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
2 KWONG MIN ROAD
SINGAPORE 628705
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5h. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

2 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408333
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607193-R Page No.1of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. XE 3122B
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
Qty pti : Workshop ($)) ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BUMPER, LHS BENT 1,050.00 1,050.00
1|END PIECE.LHS SCRATCHED 85.30 9530
1|STEP COVER,CENTER LHS SERVICEABLE 191.00 -
1|STEP PLATE LOWER LHS SCRATCHED 424 00 424 .00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -176.03 -156.93
1,584 27 1,412.37
LABOQUR
TO REMOVE AND REPLACE DAMAGED PARTS JACK AND 350.00 200.00
STRAIGHTEN STEP BERACKET.
SPRAY PAINTING. 250.00 &0.00
600.00 250.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,184.27 1,662.37
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | I 1,662.37)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18014155/R1gd3n2

U

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS

‘2‘
ADRIAN LING WAI PING
Automotive AsSsessor

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report Is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the frant page of this Report.




