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Hsiao Tuna !I.Kltﬁutu!

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 7 August 2018 12:08 PM

To: soumator@hotmail.com

Ce: Lalitha Krishnan - IlI; ‘Motor Claim - 1II'; Admin A
Subject: RE: FBKSOBEM *** LKK REF: CC4/111180714125/R1pa3
Without Prejudice

Hi Sirs.

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties. the liabiiity is clear
and shall proceed with direct settlement for the abcove mentioned case.,

Please note that this e-mall is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an autharisatian of
repait to your client's vehicle,

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the
accident.

And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our survevor.
Flease nate that all finalisation subject insurer’s approval,

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on 8 without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of [lability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affectfinfluence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Hest Rogards,

Hsino Tong. Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phane: 67g2-5197 | emall: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrin] Parle. Ubi Avenue 1. so2-25 | SI408¢773)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 3 August 2018 3:13 PM

To: soumotor@hotmail.com

Cc: Lalitha Krishnan - |Il <lalitha@iii.com.sg>; ‘Motor Claim - |II' <motorclaim @iii.com.sg>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FBKS086M *** LKK REF: CC4/11118014125/R1pa3

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the below email.



'I{indiy nate that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Hsiao Tong at 6742 3197,
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Think youw.

Hest Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 vos5 | emall: MeiBwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67314108
ik 51, Pava Ubi Industrinl Pork. Ubi Avenuoe 1, #o2-25 | SlaoBo1)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 3 August, 2018 10:10 AM

To: 'Motor Claim - IIl' <matorclaim@@iil.com_sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto com>
Cc: 'Lalitha Krishnan - ' <lalitha@iil.com.sg>

Subject: RE: FBK5086M

Dear Gabriel,
Thank you for the emall,
Crear All,

Kindly assist,

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pie Lid

Phome: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@kkauto.com | fax; 62563315
Bk 51, Payva Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408073:3)

From: Motor Claim - lll [mailto:motorclaim @iil.com sg]

Sent: Friday, 3 August 2018 10:02 AM

To: Catherine Chong [LKK Auto) <admin-d@|kkauta coms; Lalitha Krishnan - 1ll <lalitha @iii cam se>
Ce: Southern Motor <soumotor@hotmall.com>

Subject: FW: FBKS086M

Dear Sirs,

Please assist,

Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee

Motor Claims Dept

India International Insurance Pte Ltd

64 Cecil Street | £05 108 Bullding | Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: Southern Motor [mallto:soumatar
Sent: 03 August, 2018 9:59 AM

hotmail.com]




_Tn: Mator Claim - lll <motorclalm&Eiil.com se>
Subject: FBKS086M

Dear Sirs,

We shall be much obliged if you would let us know whether
the above motorcycle No FBKS086M is authorized for direct settlement.

Thank you

Yours Faithfully,
Southern Motor

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed 1o us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing vour personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This emall Is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mall was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and infarm us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful,
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of internet transmission

or any maodification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K

. AVG This emall has been checked for viruses by AVG antlvirus software
WWW.BVE.COIM
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Merimen e-Claims
Claim Audit
AUDIT TRAIL - e
Ho, On Audit Romarhks By
1 932482018 cim veh Model Changed (201617) KAWASAKI ZG1400A 1.4 (M). (Al T
Reg No: FBK5S0B6M. Acct Date: 2018/07/12. Claim Type: TP, Insurer: India Internat
2 125777 cm created jonal Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ). TP Insurer: Great American Insurance Company (H 1 1ot ME1
g Q). Workshop: Southern Motor (HGQ)
03 Aug 2018 i [A] HOW MET
3 S Adj Co Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): e
4 $37059 7918 Adj Next Rpt Changed  Next Rot:Final Rpt.Due Date:2016/08/15 PO
03 Aug 2018 ) ) [A] HOW MEI
s Adj Mandate Set Approved:D.00.Reinsp:Ad) decides. Jow,
03 Aug 2018 ) [A] HOW MEL
s Label Added {30653):Direct Settiement. Mo
03 Aug 2018 i [A] HOW MEI
G Ad) Adjuster Assigned  [None] -> MOHD RASUL il
03 Aug 2018 Merimen
g3 Cim Veh Model Changed (201617) -> (205891) KAWASAK] ZGL400E 1.4, P\ st
06 Aug 2018 Cur.Req:0,00:PODS Liability: 100% Remarks: Insured vehicle collided onto third pa  [A] CHEW
¥ 1027 Adj Mandate Request . Darked motorbike. HSIAQ TONG
07 Aug 2018 : : [1] Lalitha
10 ’ .
Lo Adj Next Rpt Changed  Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2018/08/15 oo
07 Aug 2018 - 1] Laliths
ke, Adj Mandate Set Appraved:0,00, [KII 1
13 Aug 2018 Cur Rgt:Final Rpt, Cur Due Date:2018/08/15, Mandate Remarks: LIABILITY [S CLEA [1] Lalitha
12 gg:23 Adj Next Rpt Changed "0 e INTIATE A DIRECT SETTLEMENT AND REVERT ON QUANTUM Arais
13 Aug 2018 Approved:0.00: LIABILITY IS CLEAR, PLEASE INTIATE A DIRECT SETTLEMENT AND (1] Lalitha
13 oa:23 Adj Mandate Set REVERT ON QUANTUM i
021 9 [A] JOANNE
L e — LEE KHANG
A] JOANNE
15 130039 cim ou Modified Insured Name: -> -, LEE KMANG
MIN
A] JOANNE
16 330 27 cim ot Modified Claimant's Name: -> -, Claimaint’s ID: > - LEE KHANG
MIN
A} JOANNE
17 AT cim DU Modified I¥) Reg. Date: -> 2015/10/03. {2E KNG
MIN
02 Jan 2019 [A] JOANNE
T it Cim Detalls Notified LEE kianG
CurReq:%155.26:PO0S Uabllity: 100% Quantum: {a)CORw/GST: §9,195.26 + (b)L
19 333 2%1% Adj Mandate Request  OU(3days x $20.00): $60.00 = Total: $9,255.26 Vehicle Model: Kamasakl 2G i -t oot
E (1352¢c) 3 recommendation repair days. For your spproval please. |
Date From 4|7H »| pateTo AT [»] Audit Type none v|| 6o
ACTIVITY |
Mo recaord
Merimen Bllling for this case - Transaction History — ]
Bili Ret & Bill Date Eze Type Az Bigrme i .Hr:‘;l..:'.l:l" (L Bl 3 ATTrdiet
LKK Auto LKK Auto
2016975 g Motor Consultants Pre | Consultants Pte | FBKSDBEM XD3520 10.70
4 Lid Ltd (HQ) |

https:/isingapore. merimen.com/claims/findex. cim Musebox=MTRadjuster&fussaction=dsp_viewhistory&caseid=7308178extid=2T02694CFID=465...

12



192049 Meriman e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

"FBKS086M
[xD3520]
TP

HASSAN BIN OTHMAN
Jul 12 2018 6:00PM
I
Southern Molor

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (Ill_SG), sent on 07/01/2019 09:42 AM.

To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$9255.26) - FBK5086M - Claim Handler: Lalitha Krishnan

Approved:9255.26:LIABILITY IS CLEAR, PLEASE INTIATE A DIRECT SETTLEMENT AND REVERT ON QUANTUM

hitps://singapore. mermen. com/claima/index cfm Musabox=SVCmailSfuseaction=dsp_PrintACFID=46716TI28CFTOKEN=fd57 119d44Tbe4Te-DE... 1N



Hsiao TnnE (LKKAuto)

From: Southern Motor <soumaotor@hotmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 4 Decemnber 2018 12:24 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FBKS0BEM *** LKK REF: CC4/11118014125/R1pa3
Attachments: 20181204122254 pdf

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We would like to claim as below:

Repair Cost: $9,195.26 (Incl G5T)

LOU (S20x 3 days): $S60.00

Total: 59,255.26

We enclosed herewith our LOD for your perusal.

Thank you

Yours Faithfully,
Southern Motor



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT
1, BALLeN RN O THMgN (“the third party claimant”)
of Rlkiss &g Mo ko v s wo P Prv depame "L,

Hd A

being the owner of Fi ke (vehicle no) hereby authorize

LY -
ri oW h ecen ﬂ* siov (“the workshop™) to act

for me

with respect to my claim for repair cost and/ or rental and/ or loss of use (“claim™) for my
vehicle

bearing registration no F D PP 6™ hat was damaged pursuant to the accident

’ i -~ p ’ '-" ' ] I-q I
which occurred on | &) Yl f" et rflse alﬂﬂg T e R (ol __‘;l_,t'__
Q"’Ir."'l“""*— ll £ok o h.:r 3'}’ darie )
"L" “ N
iﬂ\"ﬂ]‘l"i:ng vehicle P R 3 (“thﬂ
accident™)

I further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that
they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized 10 receive payment further to
settlement of my claim with payment cheque/s being made in favour of the workshop.

1 further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability in so far as the driver/owner/insurers
of the other vehicle is concerned.

hNo
Dated this un day of ‘e (month) 20 (year)
[
Illl.
TSme—
-.-j \
= '
L.::_:}F l 7% }-;;_\
' 77— PR <
Signed by “the third pm* claimant” Sigﬁd/ by “the workshop"

SOUTHERN MOTOR
Bix 1006, Bukit Marah Lans 2

#01-10 Singapors 159762
Tel: 62730368 Fax 62748614



:‘\L (AT NIR L ALY |
l;'\n.'l' wi |

EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

Ili- Direct Settlement (PODS)
India Ref: X0 3520
Clalmanit Ref FBK 50880
Wil Southem Molor “the warkshop”) hereby confirm that wefl have reached an agreemant
with the appoirited Survayor of India Intemabonal Insurance Pie Lid LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid {name
of Surveyar) with respect to the amount claimed for S$ 818526 {repair cosl), 5§ 6000 {lnss of

usaimmal), 5% _——  (search fes), vehicle no FBK S0BSM thal was damaged pursuant to the acodent which accured
on 120772018 (date) at O T Tuch Fioad Open CPark (Bok Seng Logistisl {lacation) invalving vehicke no XD 352D (insured
vehicie) This 1 pursuant to the inspection canducted on 02MBZ01E [hate) 3t the workshop”

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authonzed by the owner Hassan Bin Othman ~ {"the third party
cigimant) of vehicie no FBK 5086M 1o make the claim as sat out in the above paragraph and weil have full suthonty To seltie
the matter on hisiher behalf in @ manner that well deem fit Wail enclose herein the latter of authority given by “the third
party claimant”

Wil furtter confirm that wedl will indemnify India Intemational Insurance Pie Ltd for all darmages, loss andior expense thatl
they will or have alneady incurred in ihe svent thal "the third party clamant” after the above sald sgreement lodges a
further clam against the former for any loss and expenses sulfered partaining 10 cost of repairs andier rental andlor loss
of use pursuant to the damage to FBK S086M (uanice no) s a result of the accident

\Well confirm thai the agresment reached above is in full and final setlemant of all claims of “the third party claimant”
wﬂmmtmmmﬂmw this settlemant s reached an a without prejudice and without admission of liability
basis

This agresmant is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have exciuswve junsdichion over any
dispute arising out ofthe same

S5 0,255 26 I Southem Molor

W/l authorize you to pay the tptal amount of i ]

Dated this ./ > Paay (..%.u-“‘f‘..‘fff;' 20 1]
CLAIMANT: ; WITNESS:
S Mg

Signature. Bl Signature: .
Sig workshop" (with chop) Signed by appointed Surveyor

Mame: Name: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
NRIC: - NRIC: 199607198R
Address: Address 51 Ubi Avenus 1

#01-25 Paya Ubi Ind. Park S(408833)

s

Natonality ﬂ Mationalily = =




SOUTHERN MOTOR
Bk 1006, Bukit Merah Lane 2 #01-10 Smgapore 159762
Tel 62730369 Fax 62746614 COGST RegNo 234147001

TAX INVOICE NO . INV280T9

invoice Date - 4th December 2018

Paymeant Terms : CASH

Vahicle No. - FBKS0B6M - KAWASAKI GTR
1400

Mechanic - CASH

india international Insurance Pte Ltd - oo
54 CECIL STREET #05-00 |0B BUILDING Singapore 049711

Tal 63476100 Fax: 62244174

S/No DESCRIPTION Qry U/PRICE  Amount
1 7% GST ON COST OF ACCIDENT REPAIR 1 $601.56 $601.56
2 COST OF ACCIDENT REPAIR 1 $8,593.70  $8,593.70
3 LOSS OF USE FOR 3 DAYS AT §20.00 PER DAY 1 §60.00 $60.00
TOTAL $9,255.26
BALANCE §9.255.26

it S Are Mol Aetimatie. Deposi Paid Ano Not TaTordatis Al ShagLe=s pheul be mste payaH 10 *SOUTHEAM MOTOR".
prittoriest Fster il % i mionih will be noosed on ovardus Accounts. Thank you.

Received by

jirgha [aicwrmss 4 POV0 1T 08 e

“1of1



Merimen e-Claims

Page | of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Settlement

| Case  |Notifed | E5t Suomitted i) Asmgned Ad) Rpt Ad) Sunmitied Ins duth’ed STt
ay |28 Aug 2018 | gé:';“;" 010 £48,593.70 5$8,503.70 Panding for Survey
g feg_| ak adj At | et Estimates | | view gt | ondcuiciia|

Main

CLATM SUBFOLDER DETAILS

~ |[Created by adjuster]

Insured:

BOK SENG LOGISTICS PTE LTD, Co. Aeg. Moo 1993050104

Main
Cladrriant:

HASSAN BIN OTHMAN, [Dv 51723625C

Vehicle Reg
Mot

FBKS086M Date of Loss: | 12/07/2018 18:00 - :59

Claim Type:

|[33 Months and @ Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr)]
Palicy Cover

TP Note No.: !H-IISI 76

|‘I"EME1E Rag
Mo
| Insured):

Policy Mo.

sl DIBTROO7TES

KD3ISI0

|mT2

Repairer-

| Excess;
Scuthern Motor (HQ) BLE 10056 BUKIT MERAH LANE 2, #01-10, 155763 Bukit Marah - Tel: 637303659

Handling
Insurer:

India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tei: 63476100 ., [Handied by Lalitha Krishnan - 6347 6139]

Great American Insurance Company (HQ) - Tel: 6804 6047

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HGQ) - Tel: 615863581 . [Handled by MOMD RASUL] ... [Final Rpt due 15/08/201E]

view Al | Compose Case Mai | |

« 1I_S5G (07/01/201%9) Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved ($$9255.26) - FBNS0BEM - Claim Handler: Lalitha Kri...
+ I1_5G (13/08/2018) Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (S$0.00) - FAKSO086M - Claim Handler: Laliths Krishn...

I- II_SG (07/08/2016) Alert - Ad) Mandate Approved [53%0.00) - FEKS0S86M - Claim Handler: Laliths Krighn...

ALL ASSD

Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject

|Nﬁrﬂuﬂl

CIATED TASKS™ “view All | Search Tasks | Create New Task

Assigned By Compieted on

https://sin
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Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*FBKS086M
[XD352D]
™

HASSAN BIN OTHMAN
Jul 12 2018 6:00PM
[BOK SENG LOGISTICS PTE LTD]
Southern Motor

Page 1 of 2

Upkoad Documents | _Upload Phatos | _ Compose tew Letter | View
Photos/Images |3 per page E ||
No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |OBF12/18 14:43 Odometer Reading O | osaws | &
2 |08/12/18 14:43 Ganeral View D | adws | A
3 |08/12/18 14:4) | General View D | osdws | &
4 [(08/12/18 14:43 General View ﬁ Load PG | &
S |08/12/18 14:43 General View g Load 1rG | A

;i OM/12/18 14:43 General View D | esarc | A
7 |0B/12/18 14:43 General View 0 wws | A
B |DB/12/18 14143 | Genaral View © | e | B
9 |0B/1/18 14:43 | Gemeral View O | oasws | A |
10 |OR/12/18 14143 | Genersl View O | issawc |
11 |0B/12/18 14:43 General View D | oaors | A
12 |[0B/12/18 14:43 General View D | lcecws | M
13 |08/12/18 14:43 | Ganeral View 0 | e | 2
14 |08/12/18 14:43 General View 0 | s | &
15 |08/12/18 14:43 | Ganeral View O  ioaws | M
16 |0B/12/18 14:43 | Genersl View D | lesdwc | (A
17 |08/12/18 14:43 | Ganeral View 0 | swerc | B
18 |08/12/18 14:43 | General View 0  cwrc | M
19 [08/12/18 14:43 General View D | tcediec | 4
30 |DB/1L/1B 14:43 | General View 0 | ceowc | BA
21 (08/13/18 14:43 | General View 0D | wwrs | F
22 |08/12/18 14:43 General View D  osdws | B
23 |08/12/18 14:43 General View D sdwe | A
24 |0R/12/16 14:43 | General View D cwwc | A
25 |0RANIB 14:43 | Ganaeral View 0| lcors ||
26 |08/12/18 14:43 General View D | Loadies | B
27 |oa/12/18 14:43 Genersl View D | lesawc | A
I8 |08/12/18 14:43 | General View 0 | wadws | A
29 |0B/12/18 14:43 | General View @ | aws | BB
30 |081/18 14:43 | Genersl View D | leadies | BA
31 |DB/141E 14:43 | General View D | Load » g
32 DBAZ/1E 14:43 | General View 0 | cws | A
33 |08/12/18 14:43 General View 0| cadws | A
34 |0B/12/18 14:43 General View g Load G | RA
35 |0B/12/18 14:43 | Genaral View D | lcadwc | B
16 |0R/12/16 14:44 | Geners! View 0| oarws | A
37 |08/12/18 14:44 | Reinapection Photo © | edws | BA

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc... 18/1/2019
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Page 2 of 2

Photos/Images Iperpage  [v] B |
‘ho | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
30 |0B/12/18 14:44 Reinspection Phata load PG | 4 |
1.:! OB/12/18 14:44 Heinspection Photo _g Load G | BA
*'-ln OB/12/18 14:44 Reinspection Photo ﬂ Load 7G| B
41 |08/12/1A 14:44 | Reinspection Photo 0| lcadws | A
42 |DA/12/18 14:44 | Relnspection Phote 0 | lsawwc | B
43 |DE/12/18 14:44 | Reinspection Photo 0| aiec | (A
44 |08/12/18 14144 Reinspection Photo O | aas | A
a5 |D8/12/18 14:44 Reinspection Photo 0| leadirc | A
45 |DE/12/18 14:4¢ | Reinspection Photo O | losawc | BA
47 |08/13/18 14:44 | Reinspection Photo _g Load PG |
48 |08/12/18 14:44 | Relnspection Photo 0| sasirs |
4% |0A/13/18 14.44 | Relnspection Photo 0| lmoews | A
50 |(D8/12718 14:44 Aeinspection Photo 0 | ladwes | A
51 |08/12/18 14:48 | Reinspection Photo 0 | wsaces | B
57 |DB/12/18 14:44 Reinspection Phots 0| leadiec | A
53 |0H/12/18 14:44 | Relnspection Photo D iswws | B
Documentation o 1 per pags v] BA
Wo | Relabsl fReorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid [HD) Thumbnail | Print
1 |03/0B/18 15:08 ACKNOWLEOGEMENT EMAIL TO I1I DD 02.08.2018 © | (osd Por

I |03/0B/18 15:08 TP ESTIMATE + TP GIA REPORT Load POF

3 |03/08/18 15:08 TP GIA REPORT Load POF

4 | 10/0B/18 D048 TP ESTIMATE - MARKED Load PDF

15 |1By01/719 09:27 WORKSHOP INVOICE Load POF

6 |18/01/1909:27 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load PDF

7 |1as01/19 09:27 DISCHARGE VOUCHER Laad BOF

B |18/01/19 09:27 LOD Load POF

No | Finalized On India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
|1 |DB/DH/18 09:01 | Singapors Accident Statement Load PDF

Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST meset | save | prme |

There are no document checkiists configured.

Our Chechlist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

Show Remarks Te: [ Handling Insurer
MilE EEETRE B RO N 0L BN L OENa St

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc... 18/1/2019



Adjuster Repon

Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd co reg ne tessor1ser)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park

Singapore 408933

Tel 6266-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Emall: sur@lkkauto.com assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Flle No: CC4/MINB014125/R1PA302
Date: 18/01/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer. India International Insurance Pte Lid Paolicy No: M485176
ﬁ':':“““' Vehicle .oy so88m Insured Vehicle No : XD3520D
Dale of Loss: 12/077r2018 MNature of Claim: Lix Claim No:  N/A
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reqg No: FBKS0BEM
Make & Model: KAWASAKI ZG1400E, 1.4 Engine No: IXTADAEDTE418
Reg. Date: 03N2015 (Man_ Year: 2015) Chassis No: JEBZGTADEEADO1860
Colour: Grey Ddometer: 48880 km
Engine Capacity: 1352 cc
Marke! Valua™ew Car Price: NIA
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
M 1 F VEHI AT TI Y
General Condition: Stearing (Serviceabls): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceabla) Yes
Handbrake (Serviceablea) Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition.
CONDITION OF TYRES
Fronl Tyre Size 120/70Z R17 Rear Tyre Size: 190/70Z R19
Front Left Side: Bridgestone 4 mm Rear Left Side Bridgestone 4 mm
From Right Side: 0 mm Rear Right Side: 0 mm
The above values represant the remaring fye resds depih
COST OF CLAIMS - Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %i
Parts B,629.20 B,D03.70 625.50 725
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 790.00 590.00 200.00 2532
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S$) 9.419.20 8.593.70 B825.50 B.76
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S$) 659.34 B801.56 57.78 B.76
Nett Amount {S§) 10,078.54 9,195.26 883.28 B.76
+ Loss of Use (3.0 x 5520.00/day) (58) 60.00
Nett Liability (58) 9,255.26
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 02/08/2018
Date Inspected: D2/08/2018 Inspecied Al Southern Mator (HQ)
BLK 1006 BUKIT MERAH LANE 2, #01-10
Singapore 158762
Estimated Period of Repair 3.0 days

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_...

18/1/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: MOHD RASUL Manager: CHEW HSIAD TONG

NOTE: This report mpragents our findings at the fime and place of ingpeotion stated herein. Such inspection has besen carmed out fo the best of our
knowledge and abiity buf any athar Fabiity undar any cther ccumstances s hereby expressly archided

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 18/1/2019



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4
REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: (Last Synchronised. 02 Jan 2019)

Parts: MIA KAWASAKI ZG1400E 1.4 (Model not available in database)

Labour: Repairers
Print Code: (Uinsubmitted, no print-code for FBKS0BEM)

These estimates are vahd only if they contain the pnnt code {above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

Validity:

{Price-denominated Standard List)

Further Info: [tems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Parl No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *HEAD LAMP Scralched 1,450.00 FL *1,450.00 FL
2 1 *FRONT MUDGUARD Cracked 380.00FL *380.00 FL
i *FRONT FAIRING Scralched 1,800.00 FL *1,800.00 FL
4 1 *CENTRE FAIRING Cracked 1,500.00 FL *1,500.00 FL
5 1 ‘LOWER COWLING Cracked 1,450.00 FL *1,450,00 FL
6 1 ‘FAIRING BRACKET Broken 380.00FL *380.00 FL
T *FRONT FOOTREST Cracked 85.00FL *85.00 FL
8 1 *SIDE BOX LH Scralched 1.550.00FL *1.550.00 FL
8 1 *CENTRE FAIRING CAP Nol Necessary 485 00FL “FL
0 1 "MIRROR Cracked 288.00FL *288 D0FL
1" 1 *MIRROR COVER Repair 210.00FL *-FL
FeFranchise pant LsLiatliemDise
Sub Total (S$) 9,588.00 8,893.00
- List Item Discount on L ltems 10.00/10.00% (S$) 858 .80 889.30
Total Parts (S$) 8,629.20 8,003.70
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out |
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 18/1/2019



Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4
Recommended Miscellaneous Items

Thare are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer’s Amount
Labour ltems

1 TRANSPORT New 40.00 40.00
2 SPRAY PAINTING New 300.00 250.00
3 LABOUR New 450.00 300.00

Gross Labour Cost (S§) 790.00 590.00
Report was unsubmitted dunng this print-out.
< END OF ESTIMATES >

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 18/1/2019



