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51 UBIAVE I, #00-25 PAYA LIRL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62363561 FAX : (065 62564315

Your Ref: XD368J/SL/pl Date: 22nd November 2018

Our Ref: CS/EGI8014073/Ugb

The Motor Claims Department
ERGO Insurance

Attn: Pei Li
Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO._YN 5942D

We thank you for the instruction on _01/08/2018.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 03/08/2018 at the premises of M/s COMPLETE VMS and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount ;S$  101.493.00 .

Revised Estimate Amount : S$ 68.000.00 (Lump Sum) .
“Check” ltems Amount 1 5% - P

Lump Sum Repair Estimate Amount : 88 -

Market Value : S% =

LTA Reimbursement Value 1 53 -

Nett Value : S8 Z

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the
o/s rear portion & n/s body.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages consistent.

Days of repair: 10 days.

We have NOT authorize repair.

Yours faithfully

CHUA KANG SENG
Licensed Appraiser



Catherine Chnnﬂ (LKK Auto)

From: survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 1 August, 2018 11:38 AM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com

Cc: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Subject: Ol XD368J / TP : YN5942D/LKK / DOA : 30/072018

Attachments: XD368) - SAS.pdf; YN5342D - SAS.pdf; YN5942D - PRS FORM.pdf

Dear Catherine/Nivitha,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016” in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,

both TP repairer and Ergo Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single loint Expert”.

Please assist to conduct this survey from COMPLETE VMS PTE LTD,

ADDRESS ¢ 176 5IN MING DRIVE

#03-14

5INGAPORE 575721
PERSON TO CONTACT : MSLILY /LI HUIl @ 6455 0012
ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE : STEVE LIM

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Please obtain estimate from workshop and inform the repairer in

writing, that you are require to conduct a re-survey before vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your
office directly. Please do keep us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey

status via Survey.Report@e FEQ.COM.5E.

Attached are our insured's and TP's SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party). No estimates was
provided,

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Regards,
Yee Peili
Claims Assistant (Mator)

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

5 Temasek Boulevard, #04-01 Suntec Towear Fiva
Singapore 038585

DID - =65 GE20 91464

Tel +G55 BB2G 9199

Fax +65 6825 9247

WAL g0, COm. 59 E RG 0

ERGO iz one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe Worldwide. ERGO is represented in more than 30 countries and concentrates
on Europe and Asia, ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one of the world's leading risk carriers
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Vehlele Far Inspection: YN 59420

Insured's Vehiclel XD 3eR)

Date Cf Accident: 30.07.2018

Wa acknowledge recelpt of your reguast far PRS on:

18.07.2018

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.l of 2016", do select an assessor from
the llstbelew and Indicate your selection In the box marked ®, * L

LK LKK Auta Consuliants Pte Lid

We acknowied ge your interest for direct settlement

V |others:  OFFICER-IN-CHARGE - STEVE LIM

vV vour request for inspoction déos nal have your ellenl's complete cost of repalr extimate, kindly farward 2 copy,
Your request for inspectlen doas not have your client's QU8 repard/polica reperd, kindly forward 3 sapy.

e will assess & revert soon upon recelpt of estimate,

Our Insured ‘s driver kas not reported the accldent 1o ustodate,

Prapared by: Q_é/_\_/ Pell §E19 5154 COM.S
Slgnatura! r FAX ; 8825 5247
Asyesnor s only; Worksheyp uts saly:
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Axxgnment Date: Cate:
Asmslgnment Time; Yims

Inspegton
Remarks: ] vehieln not svallsbla at the uppointed date and Ume.

Kindly atknewledge our Assassor prasance for the shave Job ,

Workshop Acknowliedgement & Stamp,
Nate; Cor inspection Ir on & without gdmlorion to lobWty basls,
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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

E

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Thursday, 22 November 2018 4:08 PM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd.); 'Steve Lim'
Cc: assignments; SUR

Subject: RE: XD368) / TP : YN5942D/LKK / DOA : 30/072018
Attachments: CSEGI18014073Uqb.pdf

Dear Steve,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of YN 5942D.

Best Regards,

Shian Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email; siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 6 August 2018 2:37 PM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>; 'Steve Lim' <steve.lim@ergo.com.sg>
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com=; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: XD368) / TP : YN5942D/LKK / DOA : 30/072018

Dear Steve,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle on 03/08/2018.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkanto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{4080933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 2 August 2018 2:08 PM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: XD368) / TP : YN5942D/LKK / DOA : 30/072018

Dear Pei Li,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuta)

Sent: Monday, 6 August 2018 2:37 PM

To: 'survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.); "Steve Lim’
Cc assignments; SUR

Subject: RE: XD368) / TP : YN5942D/LKK / DOA : 30/072018
Dear Steve,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle on 03/08/2018.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 2 August 2018 2:08 PM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Cc: assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: XD368) / TP : ¥YMN5942D/LKK / DOA : 30/072018

Dear Pei Li,

Thank you for the assignment.
Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

[.LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) [mailto:Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 1 August, 2018 11:38 AM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com

Ce: ASSIGNMENTS@ LKKAUTO.COM
Subject: OI : XD368) / TP : YN5942D/LKK / DOA : 30/072018

Dear Catherine/Nivitha,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016" in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and Ergo Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please assist to conduct this survey from COMPLETE VMS PTE LTD



per, Sanbai BEajun 1Uas
By 100 e SpdEney R e (5] causn o dpeiod
U puE peesna B pinoys (slenbsyl e
JO #Ep w0y SAED F) UL DRMSFLALIE S A0 g
samdanep Ay REeLENal U B D0 Spoan

K2 0Zi00ik PICZ/E0/E0

4

a1 31d (S) OINITH “GHLYINEY
JING 00° T MOY¥Y ONINNITE TYNCLIOTHICQ J3T K# E2TH-MSED
Od (ENTHOWW NI TIVLSNI . W3y JAALS TENOTLIAdY ETTZ-A000SOHL
24 (EANIHOWKM HI TIWLENI SAJIHLES ONMILOETIEY FZET-ADDOSONL
ad (ENIHONH NI TIVISHL HOMr DTTOWHOAH SOLO=-AQQOSONL
Od (ENIHDWHW NI TIWLSHI THLL THYIS T0LO=-AODQSTHL
M o't HANIYINOD ISNd 000G OAZTINd HOd HWANIVHLS d £89 839 -0NL
Od (ANIHOWH NI TIWLSNI HOOd MOILIAdASHL ﬁu:ﬂﬁhﬁlﬂ L.060~-AQ00SIAL
LINN (ANIHOWW NI TIVLSNI JWNd INOHLIM WILSAS ONISWAHD TWNNYM JZZ2 ITYdINED Q0E0-MNOOOSTAL
24 (ANTHOWW MI TTWLSME HALTIA-Fdd XALYYA TWNOLLIOOY SOS0-A000 SOHL

SIMC  (EAMIHIYH-
LINO [ INIHOWH

NI
NI

TTYLSNIHE TTYONZLYE INOYMI HOJd HOTSNALXA OMITHNTHdS HELWM
TIYLENI] IGZF M SAHSMYE FAALS YOI WALSXS ONLTHNIHAS HZiWM

F0Z0-A00DSIND
1020~A0D0SaNL

“

- s S ——

ey

LINA (ANTHOWK NI TTYLSNT!N HSNE ATIVONALYXE INOHS aNWH L3IFT/INYH IHOTY «081  €000-A000SAAL
od (ANMIHOWW HI TTWYISNI MAMO0ZZ OL 40 ONIJWNd OTTINVECEH Q000=-A000GSANL
00°008°GTE OD'008’STE LINO 00°1 YIVAHYD YIAFAMES QYO FOOTIA 0005 OAZINd TAAOQDS -HIHL
INDONY 3218d LiNN KON ALD 43 NOLLd 1935240 3000 ¥201S
e
- S ~ 2-1E61100-Z1 ¢ ON NOILVHLSIOIH 159
: ON LOVANQOD ¥ qc HZOPOOLLE] | ON NOILVHLSIOZH ANVAHOD
MOOH IEH N AQd MKW A8 03H3AHO WoZ 43S L} bb5 N LUK B{SB-DILAN MMM IO BISE-00Uap B 0jW
-  ON43H ENOA . 0ovE 1999 (c8) Xed  £196 1989 (g9} J0L  SARg
G 1430 SIWS _ (“SUNHL) vI-6-b NO WAAITAA OL | c/c/ jopy(co)xed  BeEe2esn(SolieL o0
HN MYHSTIVE H%WHHH@WN BOCS - HYAS FDONTUYTD :NILY JZoszg siodebulg Ladsel] |79 ‘5L
éalesLd ..ammﬁﬂm__m ZIEGES 3\ INVT TN230 1 "ON a1 31d {IHOJVONIS) OINI
Sivad S ——— R va
| A n_m ” 39vd . ,._H_ ..V._ Gl - | HEanS AT EALuS JaEap B o) sionpad @y
L w102/60/50 ° 3o ) WA7 90 mem T8¥9 N¥d 8896 109 TAL o
_u \ == <l EE 0 D) 6F060E THOJIWONIS .ww.u.ﬂ -
i - == e & VIV Z€ -
ek IR AN JII0AN! XVL (= il LATNTAN N | -’
1 . p i ' La Lt T ¥ .m .u i 1
Ll U S e e swe) LAY
; (" » e g . @ 5
JAN 0I5 ( ‘

. |

Aehl. AW 11§

|
|
|



LEE

N ™ P, ankad £5a)un 1L L
F%d S o s SIOEEE CPI Sed (5] ooy o) pgeded Fd Q2300 FICZ E0/ED |
i BPEL DuE peshoi O DegE (Slnbey) cacined i
J0 aIPp i SAED pL LR POUROWE @q U0 pe !
saputdardD fuy SUELOME. VoUW DS BPOCD L
a1 314 (S) 00NN : : smnad |
ira - = T o : ™ |
s . :
LINY 00°T HMOWMY ONIMNITE TYNOIIOZHIC AT H €O TP -MSED ||
Sd (INTHOWW NI TIVISNI VHAAYD FATS TYNOILIAAY  €1TZ-A0COSANE |
22 (GNIHOWH NI TTYLSNI S3ITHIS ONILOZTITH  b2€T-A0COSCYL w
54 (INTHOWW NI TIVISNI MOWP DTTAWMOAH  SOLO-AOCOSUNL ||
24 (INIHIWH NT TIVISNT : GMTL EH¥4S  TOLO-AOQGSUNL |
53 00°1 YANIYINOD 1SNA 000§ OAZTOA WO WANIVMLS 289939-GML |
54 (EMIHOMW NI TTVLSNT MOoOd NOLLOAASNT WANIWINOD  LOGO-AQCOSANL |l
ITNO (EMTHOWW NI TIVISNI dknd LNOHLIM WAISAS ONISYZYD THANWW QHZ IIVHINID  0080-ADCCSGML

34 [ANITHOWW NI TTYLSNI YELTId-Tdd HALHYA TYNOTLIAOY SO0S0-ADCOSONL
NN [AMIHOMW - NI TTYISNIME STWINZLXI INOHd HO4 HOISHNALXA ONTTINIH4S dALYM Y0Z20-A000 SONRL
IINO (AMIHOWW NI TTYISNII 'I1GZy ‘M SIHSMHE FAIS ¥Od WALSAS ONITINTHJIS HALWM 10Z20-A000SaNL
LINA (ANIHOVH NI TIVLSNIIN HESNY ITEHWINILYE INOH aMyH LAET/ANYH JHOIH 08T £0C0-A00DSINL
ad
N

[
s o — ———

LI

—

(ANTHOYK NI TTYISNI WH00Z2Z OL 40 ONTJWNA DITNWHOAH  00CO-ADDOGANL
00 008‘CIE  00°008°GTE IINO 00°T WENIHYD ¥E4EEME QYOM FDOTAA 000§ 0AZING TAAD00S ~WANE
INNOWY  3OMdLINN  WON  ALD 43y NOLLIHOS30 3000 %00LS x__
b o —— ;s L i
R ~ 2-1£61100-2H : OH NOILYH1SI93H 159 _
¢ ON LOVINOO ¥ Gch " | HZOYOU 1461 : ON NOILYELSIDAE ANVAN0D |
J0H IG9M KWL ACA HH A8 438300 "0z 438 Ll o N WOC'E|SE-CRIBH MMM LUIOD EISE-DaLSN B OjU!
P OCNAIHHNOA | . 00vE 10@9(se)xed  E196 1996 (52) BL  Sdlaes ¢
60 & 1d430s3Wws {*unHL} kT-6~F NO WHAITIO OL ' gyq; yopgice)weq @BEE2989(S2liBL 8OO
: MYRSIIVS Hkﬁ.ﬁw@w« 8006 -~ HYIS FINFHYTD NILY | /Z5h29 awcdeburg juaaser) (N5 ‘gL |
SaLeHln ¢ 434 HNO ZIE6ER 3\l ANVL TAIEA 74 "OK (17 31d {(IHOJVONIS) DONITH
Siv _m_*»..r ” wﬂmw.n_p rH.-.. M_W.xwu._m_r_ e — TUBLLCIALG JBUED(D B 10y 5120poud 1ajlag
ﬁ W02/60/50 © 26 iy jag g P8 TN Xe_ goss Tees T . _
i o L 6P0605 FUOIVDONIS _
: ‘ _
\mﬁmmﬁ 33I0ANI XYL ATy q_ LOINTIH NYTVC  2F m ®
. ; qx T
T U N agg soNiEsnIve WKL Gxk0) (P I S nqﬁ,,_%% ! |
P P e |

_ A Mwim_m__ﬁ L C T AehLSHL 619 ;

— - L



[EFIIENPUT)

{aTun
AN

b Iwgd D

salliey? vone|c no

] 5 ' 1 - i ! il
4 r % (3T T 33§ 10 e
. " : i TSP a3 N0 pajiivd & 07 avy Nilos By
Uay¥e] UoTIow
i WA ATy ._... buypioase pabuey 20 PImos
L . ¥ ' L va'ipedar jo aAN0D by Butanp Aressadou
% 1w ¥ pino PUY 2IVUTIAED ATuo a1 uoririonb 137]
BIRLITE 133 ie10] puei
fovas Yol 10480 1
08 0%
MY 3 1
BV T 18
ulie =1 I 4V B0 LANIYHE
¥ i 0 3% _.mq.“...r‘._l__.._._l_ - =

HOOO My

! MEANE Tel Al “_.h.-ﬂ__,.l._._Hu.._.-

LA HIAYA> 00050 - 3Uv g dvaw 86419007
=0 Lo o
! i I HOILDAL O SFE0OH MY i, 2
= | 050 Oxvno MYIH M s - .. .

: B ASSY 4VE Al3gvs :
LD SR o
- T b T .

1] ,n_..._._Jr.u.mi_ﬂwn.‘I ety Vis
UV HINTL S 4 i

¥ b7 HLAYL= D00ZD - HIBWIN SSOHD vy pEE-c
0O O 1 Ml v 1 QuYTID0NN e 3y Wy i
LTHEYD OEVND HEYIdS et -

~ AT

i COLl
NOILTEFE5E0 x

d 40 31v¥3

UCFOaNAY Hid3

L9FR 59 AP G

*3 g

LI50

AL 1AL (AUOdVH




* TN SAFETY PTE LTD

1090 LCWER DELTA ROAD #01-03
SINGAPORE 1685201
TEL: 62767957 FAX: 62727261
E-MATL: tnsafetyplégmail.com
GST REG NO.: 201806425M
CO REG NHO.: 201B06425M

TO: COMPLETE VMS PTE LTD TAXINVOICE : INV 00210095
176 SIN MING DRIVE
" DATE : 08/11/2018
#03-14/07 %
gIN MING AUTOCARE COMPLEX gj;g " SiiRssai
SINGAPORE 575721 TERME 5
SALESMAN CODE :
ATTN : ACCOUNTS DEPARTMENT FAGE WO. . 001
TEL/FAX : 6455 0012/6554 0012
NO. DESCRIPTION QTY UOM UNIT-PRICE AMOUNT
=lein) s@D
ORDERED BY: MR DARREN CHIU -83332118
TRUCK NO : YN 5942 D
TO SUPPLY & INSTALL
001 ALPHA 2290 TRUCK MOUNTED ATTENUATOR 1.00 UNIT 36800.00  36,800.00
(TMA'8) C/W ATTACHMENT & HYDRAULICS
LIFT UP
8/N: A3633 [13/09/18]
REMARKS: THE ALPHA 2290 TRUCK MOUNTED
ATTENUATORS MEETS NCHRF 230
CRITERIA FOR MAXIMUM IMPACT
SEEED OF 7O0EM/H
TERMS: 1ST DAYMENT - 50% DEPOSIT
BAL PAYMENT - 50% UPON
INSTALLATION OF TMA
ONTO YOUR VEHICLE &
COLLECTION OF YOUR
VEHICLE
SUB-TOTAL 36,800.00
ADD 7.00% GST 2,576.00
TOTAL 39,376.00

SINGAPORE DOLLARS THIRTY NINE THGUEM THEEE HUNDRED BEVENTY SIX ONLY.

ALL CHEQUEZS SHOULD BE CROSSED TH SAFE PTE LTD
'A/C PAYEE ONLY' & MADE PAYABLE TO
TN SAFETY PTE LTD

E. & O.E



aliar01AR PARE/COF Rahala Franuiird

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner 1D Type: Company

Owner |D: 1700E

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: YN5942D

Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration Date: 13 Sep 2018

Vehicle Make: DULEVO

Vehicle Model: 5000 VELOCE EUS A/T 2WD ROAD
SWEEPER

Primary Colour: Yellow

Secondary Colour: Grey

Manufacturing Year. 2014

Engine No.: 1231053

Chassis No.: ZA?SSDEDEEACSBlBE

Maximum Power Output: -

Open Market Value: $219,893.00

Original Registration Date: 29 Aug 2014

First Registration Date: 29 Aug 2014

Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $10,995.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: No

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 28 Aug 2024

COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus

COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $43,001.00

COE Rebate Amount: $25,615.00

Total Rebate Amount: $25,615.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 13 5ep 2018

OK
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176 5in Ming Drive, #03-14, 50 Ming Autccare Complex, Singapone 575721
hr“"r Tel S455 0012 (Fax) 6554 0012 [Weh) wanw completeymacom.sg

A aLid

Email : darren@completevims.com.sg (
p

Aot M; ﬁ(AJ lily@completevms.com.sg (

LW

lhui@completevms.com.sg {

sfff it
CHYE THIAM MAINTENANCE PTE LTD Estimate : ES006411

32 JALAN KELULUT )]
SINGAPORE B03049 blé ,/'ﬁ-h:-l" rl Date : 30/07/2018
Vehicla Mum. :YNEQ-‘E{? ELOCEE i
: Make/Model : DULEVO 5000 VELOCE EUS AT 2WC
Al THEANCR J Chassis/Eng# : ZAOSE020E5AC3E18/123105%
Contact : 84819588 B3518833 Accident Date : 30/07/2018

Claim Neo. ;
Refarence
Policy No. :
SN Quantity  Particular Unit Price  Amount 85
~SPECHAE-NEFFITEMS , J [
.1 REAR TIRE R/H bpg U7 é.. AL =4 85000 "/
2. 1 REAR RIM R/H , 1,650.00 '
1 HOPFER BACK DOOR . 8,800.00
4, 1 HOPPER BACK DOOR HANDLE 4 ,r" 390.00,,
5, 1 HOPPER BACK DOOR HINGE 1) 196.00y
6 2 HOPPER BACK DOOR CYLINDER ! 7 389.00 778.00,
7. 1 HOPPER SEAL HOLDER ¢ A 284.00 %
8 1 HOPPER DRAINAGE WATERPRC! GUIDE 182.00 %
9, 1 REAR FENDER R/H % b@, iﬂnf 1,950.0
10. 1 REAR FENDER GARNISH R/H 285,00
1, 1 REAR BUMPER 1,760.00—
12. 1 REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMRNT | - Bl - 2.960.00-
13, 1 TAIL LAMP R/H L Y 359.00
14. 1 REAR NUMBER PLATE i1 0 25,00
15, 2 VACUUM SUCTION BOX BRUSH bl 7 5 182 .00 78400 77C
16. 1 CURB BROOM L/H o J 950.009¢ .
7. 4 CURB BROOM MECHANICAL ARM L/H  [Zé/ 1,650.009"
18, 1 REAR MUD GUARD LM A« 1,630.00 X
19. 1 REAR MUD GUARD R/H D oS - 1,530.00 =~
20. 1 LHGUARDPLATE 9% ) |13/ 1,980.00~ -
24 1 REAR PANEL Ao o Ly 112000
22, 1 LED SIGNAL BOARD M?.L | L, i 3,520.00
23. 1 BRACKET FOR ARROW LIGHT - 380,00
Special Nett Total 85 : 33,883.00
LABOUR : 3
SPRAY PAINT DAMAGED AREA AFFECTED 2.800.00 /%9
COMPUTER WHEEL ALIGNMENT 250.00 /)

CONTINUE /..,



CHYE THIAM MAINTENANCE PTE LTD

32 JALAN KELULUT
SINGAPORE 809049

Attention @ THE GWNER
Contact ; 64818588 B8351883%

Page2/2
COMPLETE VMS PTELTD The Premier One-Stop Vehicle Aceident Clams Cenlre

176 Sin Ming Drbve, #03-14, 5in Ming Aurocare Complex. Singapone ST5T

[Tell f455 0012 (Fax) 6554 02 (Wak) www.completevms com.ig

Email : darren®completevms.comsg( )
lily@complatevms.comsg ()
lihui@ecompletevms.comsg [ )

Estimate : ES006411

Data : 30/07/2016
Wehiele Num. : YNSG420
MakaMode! : DULEVO 5000 VELOCE EUS AT 2WL
Chassis/Eng# : ZASS3020ESACIE188/ 1231053
Accidant Date : 30/07/2018

Claim No, |
Roferance :
Policy No. :
S/N  Quanlity Particular UnitPrice  Amount 58
—TOW VEHICLE -
RUST PROOFING TREATMENT 280.00 /&0
CHECK ALL LIGHTIMNG AND WIRING 450,00 10

REMOVE & REINSTALL REAR AXLE

-4 T 280,00 4

TO SUPPLY & INSTALL ALPHA 2200 TMA (NARROW ALUMINIUM D/
CARTRIDGE) CAW HYDRAULIC LIFT UP §9,800.00~
LABCUR CHARGES T0O CHANGE ALL PARTS e e ——
TO CUSTOMISE REFLECTIVE STICK ON REAR END PANEL AND Yoo
CROSS MEMBER 650.00
LABOUR CHARGE TO CHANGE ALL THE ABOVE PARTS :!,nun_mlc,ﬂﬁ
Labour Total S5 67,610.00
5 y itify
Hoo
Li] il
# Supplemear :.'j', darm(s) rmusi be resurveyed gnd
Wil approvid irom Insurancs Company
Acknowiedged by Repsier
Signariume:
SingNediar . Cing Fhandreg Orse Thousand Four Hurdred Nmaly-Thoas Grly
Total 58 101,483.00
smEsSs=s==

N

YMS PTELTD

Trils i anfy an astimate bases on our prafiminury mepeclion s does not cover addlipnal parts and iabour ema which

may ba required after the work hes bagun



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 8#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 4085833

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607196-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automoblle

ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD

5 TEMASEK BOULEVARD
#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE

SINGAPORE 038885

Ref - GS/EGI8014073/Ugbn2

Date 04-12-2018

Code ; EGI

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. XD 368 Veh. Inspected YN 55420
Policy No. Coverage (%) 0.00
Claim No. KD3e8J/SLpl Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From YEE PEI LI Assign Date 01/08/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model DULEVO 5000 SWEEPER c.c 5883
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2014
Chassis No. ZADS5020ESAC3E1BE Colour YELLOW
Odometer 133485 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |285/60 R22.5 FIREMZA & mm
L/H Front Tyre |295/60 R22.5 FIREMZA, & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |2095/60R225 FIREMNZA, 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 285/60 R22.5 FIREMZA & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S REAR PORTION AND N/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  30/07/2018 |Inspection Date 03/08/2018
Survey held at BLK 19 DEFU LANE 8
Repairer COMPLETE VMS PTE LTD
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BiIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 10 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. YN 5942D

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg Mo 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-89607198-R

Fage MNo.:1 of 2

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | o8 e () [SJ]

REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|HOPPER BACK DOOR DENTED / BENT B,800.00 8,800.00
1|HOPPER BACK DOOR HANDLE NOT NECESSARY 390 00 -
1|HOPPER BACK DOOR HINGE NOT MECESSARY 196.00 -
2|HOPPER BACK DOOR CYLINDER @%389.00 NOT NECESSARY T76.00 -
1|HOPPER SEAL HOLDER NOT NECESSARY 284 .00 -
1|HOPPER DRAINAGE WATERPROOF GUIDE MOT NECESSARY 182.00 #
1|REAR FENDER R/H BADLY DENTED / 1,950.00 1,850.00

BENT
1|REAR FENDER GARNISH R/H DISTORTED 28500 285.00
1|REAR BUMFER BENT / TWISTED 1,750.00 1.750.00
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMEMNT BENT 2,860.00 2,960.00
1| TAIL LAMP R/H CRACKED 35900 358.00
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE NOT NECESSARY 2500 =
2IVACULM SUCTION BOX BRUSH @5382.00 gNﬂ\.T.GED (1 PC TE4.00 38200
NLY)
1|CURB BROOM L/H NOT MECESSARY 850.00 -
1|{CURB BRCOM MECHANICAL ARM LIH BENT 1,650.00 1,650.00
1|REAR MUD GUARD LH NOT NECESSARY 1,530.00 -
1|REAR MUD GUARD R/H DISTORTED 1,530.00 1,530.00
1|L'H GUARD PLATE DISTORTED 1,980.00 1,980.00
1|REAR PANEL BENT 1,120.00 1,120.00
1|(LED SIGMAL BOARD DAMAGED 3,520.00 3,400.00
1|BRACKET FOR ARROW LIGHT TO REPAIR SEE 380.00 -
LABOUR
LESS 10% DISCOUNT - -2,616.60
31,383.00 23,549.40
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS

1|REAR TIRE R/H (LOCAL PURCHASE)(S600 D0)(60%)(SN) CUT f PUNCTURE 850,00 3680.00
1|REAR RIM R/H (SN} BENT 1,650.00 1,000.00
2.,500.00 1,360.00

Report Ref Mo. CS/EGI18014073/Ugbn2




' V4 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
‘-_‘ o e e 51 Ubi fwe 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
/_‘ TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 100607198R GST Reg. No. 18-9607136-R Page No.:2 of 2
s Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition Workshop l:;]'i {J,
LABOUR
SPRAY PAINT DAMAGED AREA AFFECTED 2,800.00 1,400 00
COMPUTER WHEEL ALIGNMENT 250.00 100.00
RUST PROCFING TREATMENT 280.00 150.00
CHECK ALL LIGHTING AND WIRING. 450.00 50.00
REMOVE & REINSTALL REAR AXLE MOT NECESSARY 380.00 -
TO SUPPLY & INSTALL ALPHA 2200 TMA (NARROW 59,800.00 56,000.00
ALUMINIUM CARTRIDGE) CAW HYDRAULIC LIFT UP
LABOUR CHARGES TO CHANGE ALL PARTS TO B50.00 400.00
CUSTOMISE REFLECTIVE STICK ON REAR END PANEL
AND CROSS MEMBER
LABOUR CHARGE TO CHANGE ALL THE ABOVE PARTS 3.000.00 2,000 00
INGLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF BRACKET FOR ARROW
LIGHT.
67.610.00 60.100.00

GRAND TOTAL 101,493.00 85,009.40
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 68,000.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18014073/Ugbn2

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appralser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TD THIRD PARTIES:- This Bepor is made solely for the use and benefit of the Cliend named on the front page of this Repor.
bio fakility of responsibility whatseever, in contact or tof, i accepted 1o any third party who may reely on the Repom whelly ofin part. Any third pary acting or reelying on this
Bepor, in whole o kn parl, does 50 al his or er own risk.




