Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 3 September 2018 8:33 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: OD Claim Survey Request - SMA6449R  D.O.A :30/07/2018
Attachments: FINAL BILL & DV.PDF

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Justin Wong <justin.wong@egqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 29 August 2018 10:58 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OD Claim Survey Request - SMA6449R D.0O.A : 30/07/2018

Dear LKK,

Kindly let us have the finalized survey report and survey invoice.
Thank you.

Regards,

Justin Wong
Executive | Claims

| “etre Gpets Triewols

EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9115 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 115 | fax 65 6223 4190

www.eqinsurance.com.sg (@‘E
~b~ A Member of Citystate

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the .

From: Justin Wong

Sent: Thursday, August 2, 2018 9:22 AM

To: richard <richard@Itm.sg>

Cc: mandy@Iltm.sg; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OD Claim Survey Request - SMA6449R D.0O.A : 30/07/2018
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Dear Richard,
Please liaise with LKK Auto Consultants for OD Survey.
Excess is $500.00/-.

Thank you.

Regards,
Justin Wong
Executive | Claims

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9115 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 115 | fax 65 6223 4190
WWW.eginsurance.com.sg

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the .

From: richard [mailto:richard@Itm.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, August 1, 2018 5:40 PM

To: EQI PRS <EQIPRS@eginsurance.com.sg>

Cc: mandy@ltm.sg

Subject: OD Claim Survey Request - SMA6449R D.0.A : 30/07/2018
Importance: High

Good Evening Sir / Mdm,
We now enclosed the following documents for Own Damage survey request to the above mentioned vehicle.

® Repair Estimate
® GIAReport

Vehicle is not in the workshop.

Please arrange for survey soonest and we shall appreciate if you could advised us the excess amount so as for us to
inform your insured accordingly.

Thank you and regards,

Blehard ﬁl/y

Claims Executive
Lim Tan Motor Pte Ltd

www. LTM.sg
+65 6452 0893 (Office)



+65 6458 9127 (Facsimile)
+65 8484 5418 (Mobile)

Like us in Facebook!!
www.facebook.com/LTMsg
www.facebook.com/LTM.Performance.Singapore
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