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=t Consultanis
i Pte L Company Registration No. 199607136

-' -" '/ duto

1 UHTAYE 1. #02-28 PAYA LELINDUSTRIAL PARK. SISGAPORE 308933 TEL @ (0651 62363561 FAN BTN S B B

Y our ref: D1g005761MESH
Our Ref: CS/FCIE014031/R1vh Date :6/8/2018

The Motor Claims Department
M/s FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO.SCL 21997

We thank you for your instruction on 1/8/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned
2/8/2018 at the premises of M/s MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5%9,976.50
Revised Estimate Amount 1 538,473.50
“Check"” Items Amount : 5%351.00
Market Value : 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%

Nett Value 1 8%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the roar
n's body

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Some of the parts pending for parts prices

Yours faithfully,

MOHAMMED RASUL
Automotive Assessor



MS‘ FirstCapital

6 Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore D4BSED
Tel: (B5) 6222 2311 Fax |65} 6222 3547

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited (oReg o 1950001050 G5 Reg ho M2 00016769

Clalms & Mot Underwiting Dept 36 Robinson Road #1E6-01 Gty House Singapore DBBATT

Tel: (65) 6507 3848 Fax (65} 5507 3849
www. mfirstcapitaloom.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location

Contact Person.

Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
30-07-2018 Our Ref No.
27-07-2018 Claim Type.
SHAS116R Third Party Vehicle.

BLOCK 1008 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 #01-04/06/08
NITHA

62723892/ 0 Fax Mo.
DIRECT SETTLEMENT;

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MA Fax Mo.

MA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

01800576 1MFSH

Third Party

SCL2199Z

62708314

68416315

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE ;
Attention. NIL
LTD
MA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
LURENE
IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

A Memier of EUSERINE INSURANCE GROUF




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 13 September 2018 4:32 PM
To: Tan Yoong Wei'; SUR

Subject: RE: FINALISE SCL2199Z

Dear Yoong Wei,

Noted with thanks.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Tan Yoong Wei <tanyw@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 13 September 2018 3:05 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: FINALISE SCL2199Z

Ok we accept your offer $7500 with & working days.

Best Regards,

Tan Yoong Wei

Estimator

Mova Automotive Pte Ltd

Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314

@MOVA ¢ ©

Automolive Pte Lid

This message is confidential and s for the use of the intended recipient only if you have received this message in error, please do not copy, disclose or use
its content. We would be grateful if you would notify us by email and delete the orginal transmission and any attachment from your syslam.

Any atiachment to this e-mail may contain software viruses that could damage your computer system. Although we will take reasonable precaution o
minimize this risk, we do not accept any liability resulting fram software viruses. Please cary out your own virus checks before apening any attachment.

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:ver nilk .com]
Sent: Thursday, 13 September 2018 11:40 AM

To: Tan Yoong Wei; Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: FINALISE 5CL21992

Dear Yoong Wei,



WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Offer Lump Sum $7500 @ 6 working days.
Labour remain at $600.

Please check and confirm.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tan Yoong Wei <tanyw@mova.coOm.sg=>
sent: Monday, 10 September 2018 4:57 PM
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ikkauto.com=>
Cc: SUR <sur@|kkauto.com>

Subject: FINALISE 5CL21997

HI rasul,
Please advice whether we can finalise cost of repair $7700 lumpsum with 6 working days ?
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Tan Yoong Wei

Estimator

Mova Automotive Pte Ltd

Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314

@MOVA o ©

ﬂulumotw.o Ple Ltd

This message is confidential and is for the use of the intended reciplent only. If you have received thizs message in error, please do nat copy, disclose or usa
its content, WWe would be grateful If you would natify us by amail and delete the original transmission and any attachment from yaur system.

Any attachment to this e-mail may contain software viruses that could damage your computer syster. Although we will take reasonable precaution to
minimize this risk, we do not accept any liability resulting from software viruses. Please carry out your own virus checks before opening any attachment



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 6 August 2018 2:04 PM

To: ‘Claim Workflow System’

Cc: LURENEJAW®@ MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005761MFSH/1, SCL 21992
Attachments: SCL 2199Z PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SCL 21992
Date of survey: 2/8/2018
Number of days : 6 days

Some of the parts.pending for parts prices.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

sent: Wednesday, 1 August 2018 5:27 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: LUHENE_IAW@MSFLHSTCAPITAL.EDM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005761MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

(. Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: H256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Claim Workflow System Irn:-:iIm:-:wsmoturc1aims@msﬁfsttani[a'l_mm.5g]

sent: Wednesday, 1 August 2018 5:10 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@ LKEAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMDTDRCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPIT&L.CGM.SG; Ly RENE]AW@MSF!RSTCAPITAL.CDM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005761MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

1



Best Regards.

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

pPs: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
i Www.avg.com



TiIFRIZOMA

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Dwner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Craner 10:

Wehicle Details

Wehicle Mo

wfehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Wehicle Make:

Wehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Ergine Mo.:

Chassis No.:

Mlaximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period|{Years):

PGP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained hereinis correct as at 28 Jul 2018

PAREICOE Rahata Frniird

Singapore NRIC
1281F

SCL2199Z

Yes

28 Jul 2018
MERCEDES BENZ
SLK 280

Sibver

2007
27294230601760
WDB1714542F 161753
170.0kW (227 bhp)
$546,017.00

14 Aug 2007

14 Aug 2007

1

$61621.00

Forfeited

$0.00

13 Aug 2027

B - Car [1601cc & above)
10

£50.972.00

14400400

$46.094.00

OK 33{01)-\)
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to Page #

Veh #
31/07/2018

\eh Model -
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED Estimate#
36 Robinson Road )
#16-01 City House Claim #
Singapore 068877, ACC. Date :

Terms
Altention - XA026 Remarks

L

1

SCL2199Z
MERCEDES BENZ

CKATTTT

27/07/18
C.0.D Days

@MOVA

Automotive

Main Office:
WAerias Billeing
r-i- w2 |1| V
mpapore 158418
iﬁE}Bd‘?ﬁaﬂES
715 IF"
Mo

WAL TRV, O

Fax: [B5) B

Wnrkshnp_ﬂgFt'.

Tel {55362?23392
Fax: (G5) B2r00314

Mo.  Description Gty U.Price Amounts S%
LIST ITEMS :
¥, FROMT FENDER LH 1 PG 24500 ‘H " 24500
2 SIDE SKIRT LH 1 PC 915 008w < 91500
1 SIDE SKIRT CLIPS 15 BC 400MLe —  60.00
4  FRONTDOOR LH 1 PC 3.665.00 M~ 3.665.00
5.  FRONT DOOR LOCK LH 1 PC 375. nuX;H. 375.00
B FRONT DOOR CATCH LH 4 PO e 308 00 X 405.00
) REAR WHEEL RIM LH 265/35/R18 (AMG) 1 P /1'.34u_nu$d~ * 1,840.00 7
a8  FRONT DOOR STEP RUBBER LH 1 PC 290.00 290.00
9 REAR WHEEL BEARING LH 1 PC 390.00 - g, 390.00
0. FRONT WINDOW REGULATOR LH - CHECK 0" 1 PG 4
11 FRONT POWER WINDOW MOTOR LH - CHECK AT 1 PG
12 FRONT DOOR WEATHERSTRIP LH - CHECK n2 1 PC
13 REAR WHEEL HUB LH - CHECK 7, L 1 PC
14, REAR ABSORBER LH - CHECK )c_ gL 1 PC
15  REAR ABSORBER MOUNTING LH - CHECK 7&'5' 1 PC
16. REAR LOWER ARM LH - CHECHK . 1 PC
17,  REAR UPPER ARM LH - CHECK 1 PC
18,  REAR BRAKE CALIBER LH - CHECK 1 PC
18, REAR DISC BRAKE LH - CHECK sveL 1 PC
20 REAR AXLE SHAFT - CHEGK ~ 1 PC
21,  REAR AXLE - CHECK 1 PC
22 REAR AXLE OIL - CHECK ?’-'~ 1 PC
23 REAR FENDER LH - REPAIR 1 PC
LIST TOTAL S% 8,785.00
10% DISCOUNT S8 -878.50
7,806.50
LABOUR :
TO REPAIR REAR FENDER LH & TO REALIGN
ACCIDENT AEFECTED AREAS. TO REMOVE & REPLACE é
ALL ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS ov

TO SPRAY PAINT ON ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS

T0 REMOVE FRONT DOOR LH MECHANISM, FRONT
POWER WINDOW & REGULATOR AND CHECK WIRING

TO CHECK REAR WHEEL ALIGNMEMNT
TO REMOVE REAR WHEEL RIM & CONDUCT BALANCING

TO RUST PROOF AFFECTED AREAS

LABOUR TOTAL S5



@MOVA

Main Office:

Page# - 1 132188 ; .':Iéigilééﬁﬁ"s:'iaé
E.ﬂmate ax (65) 6271 5891
Veh# .~ SCL2199Z
31/07/2018 Wor HSF:F?LDIEFE..
Veh Model -~ MERCEDES BENZ Bukit Merah Lans 3,
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED Estimate#t - CK417777 ingapore: 159722
36 Robinson Road . Tel . (65) 62723892
#16-01 City House AT 2 gl o ume
Singapore 068877, ACC. Date - 27/07/18 T e M2-0088064-2
Terms . C.0.D Days
Attention - XAD2E Remarks -
MNo. Description ity U.Price Amounts 55
. & 0. . .
ES&0E NON-TAX AMOUNT & 1o, 534X
AMOUNT S§ 0.976.50
GST@ 7% 698.36
— AMOUNT DUE S8 10,674.86

Customer's Sianature/Co. Stamp MOVA ﬁUTUMDTWE PTE LTD




— e — e —

Estimate
34/07/2018

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED
36 Robinson Road
#16-01 City House
Singapore 068877.

Afiention - XADZE

Page # |

Veh# .. SCL2199Z

Veah Model - MERCEDES BENZ
Estimate# - CK417777

Claim# -

ACC. Date :- 27/07/18

Terms .. C.O0D Days
Remarks :-

MOV

P ———

Automotive Pte Ltd

Main Office:

Mova Building

Bo, 22, Jukan Kilang,
Singapara 15341

Tel; (B5) 64763333

Fax | (§5) 8271 5887

WL MIOVE. CO. 50

Workshop Dept:
Block 1008,

Bukit Morah Lans 3,
#01-04/08/08/24
Singepore 159722

Tol: (65) 6272 3892
Fax: (65) 62708314

Co, Feg. 1985040336
GST Reg. M2-0088364-2

No.  Description Qty U.Price Amounts S$
LIST ITEMS :
4. FROMNT FENDER LH 1 PC aas.00 A7 045,00
7 SIDE SKIRT LH 1 PC 315,008 915.00
3. SIDE SKIRT CUIPS 15 PC 0OMe ~  B0.00
4.  FRONT DOORLH 1 PC 3,665.00 P <~ 3,665.00
5, —FRONTDOUDRTOCKLH r—PC SRy 47580
8. —FRONT DOOR-CATCHtH —pe——5 IS0 98509
7. REARWHEEL RIM LH 265/35/R18 (AMG) 1 PCPZE - 1,840,005 vk - 1,840.00
3.  FRONT DOOR STEP RUBBER LH 1 PC 250.00 280.00
9.  REAR WHEEL BEARING LH 1 PC 390.00 - 380.00
10— FRONTWREOW-REBUCATORHHEHESK S +—PE
1. FRONTPOWERWNOOW HMETOR tHCHESK 4—PE
12.——m-rmnmﬂamrh+?&% e
13 REARWHEEL HUBLH-CHECK 7. ¢ 330 1 PC
14, —ERRARSOREER-EH—SHESH-He— p—r
15 Bk —r
18 REAR LOWER ARM LH - CHECK 7. _zqd" 1 PC
;I —FE
1B REARRRAKECALSER b GGt Pt
10, —ReAR-DISCRRAKE-LE CHECKSL —rC
LA - 1= = R === Bl S P ";":_ 7
21, AR o —FC
22 REAR-ANEE-CH—GHEGK—% —PC
23, REAR FENDER LH - REPAIR 1 PC
LIST TOTAL 5% 8, 785,00
10% DISCOUNT 5% -B78.50
7,806.50
LABOUR :

TO REPAIR REAR FENDER LH & TO REALIGN

ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREAS. TO REMOVE & REFLACE

ALL ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS

TO SPRAY PAINT ON ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS

T0 REMOVE FRONT DOOR LH MECHANISM, FRONT

POWER WINDOW & REGULATOR AND CHECK WIRING

TO CHEGK REAR WHEEL ALIGNMENT

TO REMOVE REAR WHEEL RIM & CONDUCT BALANCING

TO RUST PROOF AFFECTED AREAS

LABOUR TOTAL 5%

Pk $8795-.10%
.F F857.50

Labowr¢ §f (726

Joral Ye 1; JF00 LDAUS .

—H

£ 850




§MOVA

Automotive Pte Lid

Maln Office:
Mova Building
No\. 22 Jakzn Ki!angg
) pore 15841
Page # L 132188 Tel: tas}m?a 3333
mte Fax: [65) 271 5891
Veh # . SCL2199Z m";’:;g
0 H
31/07/2018 .. MERCEDES BENZ Block 1008,
WVeh Model Bukit Marah Lare 3,
#01-04/0B/08/04
26 Robinson Road Tal: (B5) 62723862
#16-01 City House Claim# - Fax: (B5) 6270 8314
Singapore 068877. ACC. Date - 27/07/18 e 0003812
Terms .. C.0.D Days
Anentlon ;= XAD26 Remarks -
NMo. Description Qity U.Price Amounts 5%
E. .E
: &R NON-TAX AMOUNT S
AMOUNT S$% 8,876.50
GST@ 7% £08.36
AMOUNT DUE S% 10,674.86

Customer's Sianature/Co. Stamp MGVALWDMGTI"JE PTELTD

|

LKK Auto Consultants
ihe Repairer of the following:

hence nolify

« To resurvey belorefaller spay painfing

+ To diaplay damaged pari[s) during resurvey

« Parts prices are subjectto confimalion

» Third party survey i o aWithout Prejudice” bass
= Nofllegal madification(s) 15 allowad

« Supplementary iem{s) must be resurveyed and
mummmapprmnmimumﬂmw
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Eigrahure:
Date:
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Tyre Warehouse Pte. Ltd

ELK. 1002, Bukit Merah Lane 3

#01-89, Singapore 159719
Phone Number: 8828 7733/ 8866 7733 168163089
Fax Number:
Customer: Date: 1/8/2018 12:05 PM
Company: VIN
License NO: SCL2188 Z Technician:
Odometer: Order NO:
VEHICLE ALIGNMENT REPORT
MERCEDES-BENZ, 171 SLK Steel Suspension / Standard, 04-09 (Customized)
Primary Angles Initial Specifications Final
Min. Max.
Caster Left — 10.48° 11.48° —
Right — 10.48° 11.48° —
e Camber Left -1.39° -1.83° .47 -1,39°
td Right -1.69° -1.83° 1.47° -1.69°
Toe Ceft 0.39° 0.02° 0.19° 0.39°
Right -0.25° 0.02° 0.19° -0.24°
Total 0.14° 0.03° 0.37° 0.156°
Camber Left -2.00° -1.74° -1.02° -2.00°
Right -1.41° 1.74° -1.02° -1.41°
Rear Toe Left 0.16° 0.22° 0.34° 0.15°
<Right 0.28° 0.22° 0.34° 0.28°
Total 0.44° 0.43° 0.67° 0.43°
Max Thrust Angle 0.06° 0.25° 0.06°
Sec Initial Specifications Final
econdary Angles R I
sAl Left = == = -
Right — — = i
included Angle Left — — —— R
Right = = — —
Toe Out On Tums Left — 1.40° 2.40° =
Right — 1.40° 2 40° T
Max Turn Inside Left — 41.60° 41.60° —
Right — 41.60° 41.60° —
Toe Curve Change Left o — — —
Right - T s =i
SEtbaCk ant -ﬂ_'l?" —_— i _.011 ?u
‘Rear -0.25" — — -0.25"
Track Width Diff. -2.08" -2.08"
Whee! Base Diff. 0.08" 0.08"
Front Ride Height Left -— 0.04" 0.83" —
Right — 0.04" 083" e
Rear Ride Height Left == 0.28" 1.08" iR
Right — 0.28" 1.06" -
Frame Angle o

kk.tyrewarehouse@gmail.com




¢ Tyre Warehouse Pte. Ltd

BLK. 1002, Bukit Merah Lane 3
#01-89, Singapore 159719

Phone Number: 8828 7733 [ 8866 7733 / 68163089

Fax Number:
Customer: Date: 7/8/2018 1:44 PM
Company: VIN
License NO: SCL2199Z Technician:
Odometer: Order NO:

VEHICLE ALIGNMENT REPORT
MERCEDES-BENZ, 171 SLK Europa Version / USA Version Normal, 04-05 (Customized)

Primary Angles Initial Specifications Final
Min. Max.
Caster Left — 10.48° 11.48° —_—
Right — 10.48° 11.48° —
E Camber Ceft 1.43° -1.83° 47" -1.42°
ront Right -1.50° -1.83° A47° 1.51°
Toe Ceft 0.23° 0.02° 0.18° 0.07°
Right £0.12° 0.02° 0.19° 0.07°
Total 0.11° 0.03° 0.37° 0.14°
Camber Left -1.80° A74° -.02° 4.73°
Right A3 1.74° 4.027 -1.30°
Rear Toe Left 0.08° 0.15° 0.40° 0.26°
Right 0.24* 0.15° 0.40° 0.26°
], Total 0.32° 0.30° 0.80° 0.52°
Max Thrust Angle 0.08° 0.25° 0.00°
Initial Specifications Final
Secondary Angles . )
SAl Left b = e —
Right — — — —
Included Angle Leit — — — -
_Right — — — —_
Toe Out On Turns Left - 1.40° 2.40° EEE
Right = 1.40° 2.40° =
Max Turn Inside Left — — i i
Hig_ht — e — =
Toe Curve Change Left — — —_— -
Right _ — == S —
Sethack Front 0.18" = o T
Rear -0.28" — — -0.28"
Track Width Diff. -2.04" 204"
Whael Base Diff. 0.10" 010"
Front Ride Height Left - 0.04" 0.83" B
Right s 0.04" 0.83" i
Rear Ride Height Left — 0.28" 1.06" s
Right - 0.28" 1.06" -
Frame Angle —

Kk.tyr&warehnust!@gma[l,mm




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapaore 408933
TEL: 5256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607138R GST Reg. No 19-0607198-R

[-% Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref - CS/FCI18014031/R1vbn2

36 ROBINSON ROAD
D 17-08-201

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 ate: 17-09-2018 lemmmmm
Code: FCI2

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. SHA 9116R Veh. Inspected SCL 21992
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18006761MFSH Excess (5) 0.00
Assign From LURENE Assign Date 01/08/2018
5 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MERCEDES BENZ 5LK 280  |c.c 2997
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2007
Chassis No. WDB1714542F 161753 Colour BLUE
Odometer 132828 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |2B535 R18 BRIDGESTONE & mm
L/H Front Tyre |265/35 R18 BRIDGESTONE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |265/35 R18 BRIDGESTONE & mm
UM Rear Tyre |265/35R18 BRIDGESTONE & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  27/07/2018 [inspection Date 02/08/2018
Survey held at  MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
BLK 1008 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 #01-04/08/08 .
SINGAPORE 153722
5a. Remarks
AIDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON ATWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
CjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 6 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SCL 2199Z

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Awe 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Feg. No: 198607198R GST Reg. Mo, 18-9807188.R

Page Mo.1of 2

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition 'lﬂ‘; uhop {¥]} “j}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT FENDER LH BENT 94500 §45.00
1|SIDE SKIRT LH SCRATCHED 915.00 915.00
15|SIDE SKIRT CLIPS @34.00 NECESSARY 60.00 60.00
1|FRONT DOOR LH BENT 3.665.00 3,665.00
1|FRONT DOOR LOCK LH SERVICEABLE ars.00 -
1|FRONT DOOR CATCH LH SERVICEABLE 305.00 i
1|REAR WHEEL RIM LH 285/35/R18 (AMG) SCRATCHED 1,840.00 1,840.00
1|FRONT DOOR STEP RUBBER LH cuT 290.00 290.00
1|REAR WHEEL BEARING LH MECESSARY 390.00 390.00
1|FRONT WINDOW REGULATOR LH (NPA) NOT NECESSARY = -
1|FRONT POWER WINDOW MOTOR LH (NPA) MOT NECESSARY -
1|FRONT DOOR WEATHERSTRIP LH (NPA) NOT NECESSARY -
1|REAR WHEEL HUB LH BENT 330.00 330.00
1|REAR ABSORBER LH (NPA) SERVICEABLE - -
1|REAR ABSORBER MOUNTING LH (NPA} SERVICEABLE 2 -
1|REAR LOWER ARM LH BENT 290.00 290.00
1|REAR UPPER ARM LH (NPA) SERVICEAEBLE -
1|REAR BRAKE CALIBER LH (NPA) SERVICEABLE -
1|REAR DISC BRAKE LH (NPA) SERVICEABLE - <
1|REAR AXLE SHAFT (NPA) SERVICEABLE - -
1|REAR AXLE (NPA) SERVICEABLE - -
1|REAR AXLE OIL (NPA) SERVICEABLE - -
1|REAR FENDER LH {NPA) T REPAIR SEE - -
LABOUR
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -040.50 -872.50
8,464.50 7.852.50
LABOUR
TO REPAIR REAR FENDER LH & TO REALIGN ACCIDENT 950.00 60000
AFFECTED AREAS TO REMOVE & REPLACE ALL
ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS
TO SPRAY PAINT OM ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS. 850.00 700.00

Report Ref No. CSIFCI18014031/R1vbn2




' Vd V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
"J . ; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 406933
apm TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 193607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607 198-R Page No.:2 of 2
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition |\ v shop [:}1 ;{
T0 REMOVE FRONT DOOR LH MECHANISM FRONT B0.00 60.00
POWER WINDOW & REGULATOR AND CHECK WIRING.
TO CHECK REAR WHEEL ALIGNMENT. B0.00 60.00
7O CHECK REAR WHEEL RIM & CONDUCT BALANCING 50.00 50.00
TO RUST PROOF AFFECTED AREAS. &0.00 B60.00
2,070.00 1,530.00
GRAND TOTAL 10,534.50 9,382.50
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 7.500.00
(TOITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/IFCI18014031/R1vbn2
MARKET VALLUE: $85,000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $46,094.00=NETT VALUE: §38,906.00

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS ADRIAN LING WAI PING

Automotive Assessor B.Eng,AHSDE,AHIRTE,AHEAE-AM.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Raport is made sclely Tor the use &nd benefit of the Client named an tha front pags af this Report.
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