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Catherine Chung (LKK Auto)

From: Julie Mangubat <julie. m@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 1 August, 2018 5:11 PM

To: SUR; 'assignments'

Cc: Albert Hong

Subject: FW: Third party survey - SLN1155P Your Insured: SIB2764L DOA: 20.07.2018 || Claim
ref: C10001792/AH

Attachments: MSGR-MARSO0000710-SLN1155P-GIA PDF

Hi Team

Please accept TPPD survey and survey on a without prejudice basis.
TP workshop would like to request for Mohd Taufihk from LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to survey
their client’s car.

Thank you,
-Julie

From: Pegasus Engineering <ar_claims@pegasusengrg.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 21 July, 2018 5:35 PM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Third party survey - SLN1155P Your Insured: SIB2764L DOA: 20.07.2018

Your Ref: SIB2764L

Our Ref: SLN1155P
DOA: 20.07.2018
Without Prejudice

Dear All,

We refer to the above matter,

We enclose the following documents for your attention:-
a. Copy of our client's SAS report and damaged photos:
b. Copy of the estimated cost of repair. (sending soon)

Pursuant to paragraph 2.3 of Pre-Action Protocol for NIMA Cases, please let us have a list of 10 motor surveyors for
our selection and

please let us know within 2 working days whether you would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of our client's vehicle, If
we do not hear from you within the stipulated timeline, our client shall proceed to repair the vehicle without further
reference to you.

In the event that you request for post repair inspection pursuant to paragraph 4.1 under the NIMA Protocol, you must
compensate our client for the loss of use of his/her vehicle far the day that the inspection is conducted.

In additicn, please confirm in writing whether you are agreeable to direct settle with us at 100% liability for this case.

Vehicle will be in our premises at 24/07/2018@11.00am , please arrange to survey our client's vehicle at 74 Kian
Teck Road S628800.

Thank you



Regards,

Queenie Quay

Fegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd
74 Kian Teck Road

Singapaore

628800

Tel

6513 7748

Fax i
6251 3161

Email : ar claims@pegasusenarg.com.sgq

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential
and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and
privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised.



Shirlez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Vivian Tan <vivian.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 12 June 2019 6:48 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Finalise For SLN1155P (DOA 20/07/2018)

Dear Shirley Hiew,

We confirm final fig $ 1.792.63 (@ 4 days of repairs before GST.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Vivian Tan

On Tue, 11 Jun 2019 at 12:05, Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew(@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Vivian,

Please re-confirm final fig $ 1.792.63 (@ 4 days of repairs before GST.

Thank you.

Best Repards

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LE ansultants

Phone; 6256-3561 | email: Sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408333)

From: Vivian Tan [mailto:vivian.pegasusengrg@gmail.com]
Sent: Friday, 7 June 2019 8:50 AM

To: ShirleyHiew @lkkauto.com

Ce: ar clai egasusengre.com.s
Subject: Fwd: Finalise For SLN1155P (DO
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Dwner |0 Type:

Creener 1D

Vehicle Details

Vehicle Na.:

Vehicle to be Exported;
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Yehicle Madel:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
~irst Registration Date:
Transfer Caunt:

Actual ARF Paid;

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amaount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

P Paid:

COE Rebate Amount

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 20 Jul 2018

Company
72006

SLM1155P

Mo

20 Jul 2018
TOYOTA

VIOS L5ECVT
Silver

2017
ZMRX145383
MHFB29F3302009825
79.0 kW (105 bhp)
$12,246.00

24 Apr 2017

24 Apr 2017

0

$7, 944,00

Yes
23 Apr 2027
4595900

23 Apr 2027

A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$51.765.00

$45,337.00

$51,294.00

OK
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SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE
1, Pizasa repor correctly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.
2. Thig Fasm mus! ba completed by the Policyholder andfor the Authorised Driver.

3, Informaticn proveiesd most be as ool and accurale as possile Any wilful misrepresentation or withalkding al maberial facts may allo inSUrance campanias b

repudiate policy ability

4. The msue and acceptance of this Farm by insurance companies is nat an admission of policy kability on the part of tha insurance companies.
4. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

i, This report will be forsarded by the msurers of the GlA Records Managemen! Cenlre established by the General inswrance Associabion of Singapore (G1A) for
archiving and that coples of this report will, for a fee, be made available upon application by interested parties
7. By tha lodgament of this raport b the msurers, you hereby consand o the archiving of this report at tha cantre and 10 copies of tha repor Doang mada avanaa

aforegaid.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report

Date Of Accident

Exact Location OF Accidant
Country/State of Loss

2000772018 1107

2000772018 0740

AYE(TUAS) AROUND CLEMENTI AVE 2/CLEMENT! RD
SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
Mame Of Registered Owner
Co Reg Mo

Email Addrass

Mabila Phone MNa

Alternative Phane No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair to your vehicle?

If Mo, Please state action to be taken
Yehicle Categaory

Insurance Company

Mame of Insurance Company
Typa Of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Policy Mumber

Cover Note Number

Driver

Mame of Driver

NRIC No

Date Of Birth

Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Dnving Experience

Gandar

Mobile Mumber

Fax Mumber

Contact Mumber

EMail Addrass

SLN1153F

GRAB RENTALS PTE LTD
2018172006
NOEMAIL

OFFICE-66550005

TOYQTA
WIOS 1.5E CVT

HIRE & REWARD

MO

THIRD PARTY
PRIVATE HIRE

MSIG INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.
COMPREHENSIVE

YES

AZ9069TEEMKF

LI HU CHARMAME
570165301

18/05/1970

OUTDOOR

2B/03/2001

17 YEARS AND 3 MONTHS
FEMALE

(LOCAL)Y +65-98650032

NGEE\"-‘E\."‘.
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Address MA

Postcode

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company MNO

If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured OTHER - HIRER

Wehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own
Wehicle

Insurance Company of Dover's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
Weather Conditions CLEAR
Road Surface DRY

Other Infarmation

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident?  NO

Mumber of vehicles invalved in the accident 2

Was any body injured in the Accident? YES

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by NO

ambulanca?

Was any other material or property damaged? YES

| ha*.'_r-, bean appmacr_&ed by u;knnvm _pcrsenfs] NO

soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Mumber of Passengers (Including Drivar) 2

Passenger 1 NAME: . Pi
GEMNDER: FEMALE

Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the palice? NG

If Yes Plaase state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Proseculion given? MO

If ¥es,against whom?
Circumstances of Accident

| WAS DRIVING ALONG THE SAID LOCATION IN THE EXTREME RIGHT LANE. THE TRAFFIC WAS HEAVY AND THE ROAD
WaAS DAMP. THEREFORE, | HAD KEPT QUITE A DISTAMCE BETWEEN THE VEHICLE IN FRONT FOR SAFETY REASONS.
WHEN THE TRAFFIC AHEAD HAD CAME TO A STOP, | HAD ALSO MANAGE TO STOP ONM TIME, SUDDEMLY | FELT AN
IMPACT FROM THE REAR OF MY VEHICLE. VEHICLE B HAD COLLIDED ONTO THE REAR PORTION OF MY VEHICLE NO
INJURIES WERE INVOLVED AT THE TIME OF THE INCIDENT HOWEVER, MY PASSENGER WILL BE SEEING THE
DOCTOR LATER ON DUE TO NECK PAIN.

Attachment(s)
Are accident photos available for attachment? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? YES

Remarks/ Reasons YES-RETRIEVING
Was thera any audio recorded? NO

Vehicle Registration Number SJB2TE4L

Vehicle Make/Model/Colour TOYOTA/ISIS 1.8LX A
Details OF Propertias

Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR

Mame of Driver WOO KENG KHIEW
MRIC/Passport Number S1177003G

Contact Number 96262922

Address

Page 2 of 14



Postcoda
Insurance Company Name
Mature OF Damage

Ma, Of Passenger (Including Driver) 1

Mame PASSENGER 1
Approximate Age

Injuries Sustain NECHK PAIN
Injured parson in which vehicla? SLNT1155F
Were zeat balts warn? YES

Was this injured conveyed fo hospital by

ambulance? L

Addrass

Postoode

Page 3af 14
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<~~~ PEGASUS
ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD

GST / ROC COMPANY NO : 201101753C
Quotation

From : Customer :

PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING FTE LTD
74 KIaN TECK ROAD
SINGAPORE 628800

GRAB RENTALS PTE LTD
18 SIN MING LANE
#01-08 MIDVIEW CITY

SINGAP 7
Officer in Charge : QUAY SIEW TENG ORE 573960

Tel : Aftn:
Email : Tel :
Fax Mo. !

Quotation No. : Q018/08-1012

Quotation Date : 01/08/2018

Terms : 30 DAYS

Vehicle No. : SLN1155F

Chassis No. : MHFB28F 3302009826

Third Party Insurer :

Model ; VIOS

Date of Accident : 27/07/2018

Remarks : THIRD PARTY INSURER: AIG, INSURED'S VEH NO: SLB8377, DOA: 28.07.2018

| ITEM | DESCRIPTION | Qty | UNITPRICE | AMOUNT (SGD)|
1 REAR BUMPER 1 504.9000 P~  504.90
2 REAR BUMPER REFLECTORS 1 1305000 X pq 13050
3 REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINERS 1 116.3000 7(5 116.30
4  REAR BUMOER SIDE HOLDERS 1 223000 A% <~ 2230
5  REAR BUMPER YELLOW CLIPS 1 g.numm*"%f 9.00
6  REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT 1 32300007, 323.00
7 REAR BUMPER CLIPS 1 4.3000Mea 7 430
8  REAR BUMPER END SPLASHIELD COVER 1 89.8000 YV ags0
9  LESS 25% (ITEM 1-8) 1 -300.0300 -300.03
10 REAR LICENSE PLATE 1 ap.mﬁf:‘&&‘ ™.~ 8000
11 REAR BUMPER PARKING SENSOR 1 4500000 - 1&'-1'?}56’56‘ S
12 TO REINSTALL OF REAR BUMPER PARKING SENSOR 1 12;9066'41: 120.00
13 TO RUST PROOFING OF THE AFFECTED AREAS 1 180.0000 > M\ 180.00
14 PANEL BEATING, KNOCKING AND STRAIGHTEN THE NECESSARY

PORTION, REMOVE AND RENEWAL OF PARTS, ADJUST AND
REALIGN THE SAME

15 PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING OF THE AFFECTED PORTICN

E

i ; 4 Sub Total 4.530.07
GST(7.00% 3710
| acinowes ﬂl[ﬂgll%’ 8 ”;"U Totali [SGD]:: 484717

Please conduct the survey at
Pegasus Engingefing @ 74 Kian Teck-Road-Singapore 628800

?qﬁ-‘b b f fm‘j
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ENGINEERING

PEGASUS

& TRADING PTE LTD

GST/ ROC COMPANY NO : 201101753C

' Quotation
From: Customer :
PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD GRAB RENTALS PTELTD -
74 KIAN TECK ROAD 18 SIN MING LANE
SINGAPORE 628800 gﬁ—ﬂﬂ MIDVIEW CITY

INGAPORE
Officer In Charge : QUAY SIEW TENG s
Tel: Attn; ¢
Emall ; Ted :
Fax Mo. :

Myotation No. : QO18/08-1012

Quotation Date :

01/08/2018 Terms ! 30 DAYS

vwhicle No. : SLN1155P

Chassls No. : MHFBZ8F 3302009826

Third Party Insurer:

Maodel : VIOS

Date of Accident ; 27/07/2018

Remarks : THIRD PARTY INSURER: AIG, INSURED'S VEH NO: SLB&377, DOA: 28.07.2018

[ Em | ~ DESCRIPTION [ ay | UNITPRICE | AMOUNT (SGD)]
1 REAR BUMPER 1 504.8000 P~ 50490
2  REAR BUMPER REFLECTORS g{LB 1 1305000 X 130.50

'3 REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINERS }r § g 1163000 X 116.30
4  REAR BUMOER S/DE HOLDERS 4 W } 1 22,3000 A% <~ 2230
5  REAR BUMPER YELLOW CLIPS k{ | £ — A 5.0000 AM—=" 9.00
6  REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT “ , 'k ’. [,i 1 32300007, ¥ 7 323,00
7  REAR BUMPER CLIPS \ #* (lf f 1 4.3000M~ 7~ 430
8  REAR BUMPER END SPLASHIELD COVER 1 89.8000 P& 89,80
@  LESS 25% (ITEM 1-8) )X .;pl 1 -300.0300 -300.03
0 REAR LICENSE PLATE 1 WST F"’/sﬂm
11 REAR BUMPER PARKING SENSOR 1 4500000 - %00 gseﬁ){
12 TO REINSTALL OF REAR BUMPER FARKING SENSOR 1 1293@‘ éu 120.00
13 TORUST PROOFING OF THE AFFECTED AREAS 1 180.0000 > 180.00
14  PANEL BEATING, KNOCKING AND STRAIGHTEN THE NECESSARY g (11O 16002000 207V 1,600.00

PORTION, REMOVE AND RENEWAL OF PARTS, ADJUST AND
REALIGN THE SAME
16 PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING OF THE AFFECTED PORTION 1 1.239.-5&'(: ) - 1,200.00
KK 4i1p Consultants hence notify w_ B Cgh)
the Repairer of [ha followling: .
» Ta restrvey beforelafier spray painting u-r ‘i‘ﬂf fdté’
« To display damaged parl(s) during resunvey
= Parts prices 2re subject la conlirmation ’
» Third parly susvey 15 on 8 "Withoul Prejudice” basls B
« No Hlagal medlicalion]s) is alkowed [0
o5 Mary ilamds) musl be resurveyed ani .
Eﬁf@z—”ﬂmr :p:m1 from Insurance Company F glé?]‘[.l;‘o;:;i} 4-*;}?2?3
Acknawledged by Repaliar ﬂ-"{ﬂg Iy € Wl () Total (SGD) 4,847.17

Please congu IH'IE 1] n-'{._.r at

8800 %"‘b b ? rﬁ.ﬂ-’k
Paasl Beakt. ‘¥, E‘m{}dﬂLw‘\%‘- Bow\1id B Eud fand — B %/’ }5 /



e  PEGASUS

ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD

GST/ROC COMPANY NO : 201101753C

Quotation
From : Customer :
PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD GRAB RENTALS PTE LTD
74 KIAN TECK ROAD 18 SIN MING LANE
SINGAPORE 828800 #01-08 MIDVIEW CITY
SINGAPORE 573960
Officer in Charge | QUAY SIEW TENG
Tel: Aftn: -
Email : Tel:
Fax No. :
I Quotation No. : QO18/05-1038 Quotation Date : 03/08/2018 Terms : 30 DAYS
.ehicle No. : SLN1155P Chassis No. : MHFB29F 3302009826 Third Party Insurer :
Model : VIOS Date of Accident ; 20/07/2018
Remarks : SUPPLEMENTARY ITEMS
| ITEM | DESCRIPTION Qty | UNITPRICE | AMOUNT (SGD)|
1 REAR END PANEL 4 2gfcia- P_vﬁv 1 624, 7000 594.70/
2 BOOTLID " Reps'r 1 1,662 4000 1,662.40
3 BOOTLID WEATHERSTRIP XX AsSVe 1 188.0000 188.00
4  REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BRACE PANEL < /Ne Jwyg
_ 7w 2
& o)
[~ 4
! : r
f B fi 1O VY
I I
b7 - = = 3
1
Sub Total 254510
GST(7.00%) 178.16
Total (SGD) 2,723.26

Please conduct the survey st
Pegasus Engineering @ 74 Klan Teck Road Singapere 828800



¥y L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

- 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6258 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-96071588-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
AUTO & GENERAL INSURAMNCE (S) PL Ref . CS/AGHB014029/R1sbn2
0 EVENCEAU AVENUE 0 [
15?3&531 E g g Elglé ?:LE;NS EE N#"P RES INGAPORE ~ Date: 13062019
238924
Code : AGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJB 2764L Veh. Inspected SLN 1155P
Palicy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. C10001792/AH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  JULIE Assign Date 01/08/2018
21 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAVIOS 1.5E c.c 1406
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. MHFB29F 3302009826 Colour GREY
Odometer BEEOO Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/50 R16 WEST LAKE 5 mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/50 R16 WEST LAKE 5 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/50 R16 WEST LAKE 5 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/50 R16 WEST LAKE 5 mm
4, Description of Damages '
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
- General Information
Accident Date  20/07/2018 Inspection Date 02/08/2018
Survey held at 74 KIAN TECK RD
Repairer PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




'’ 74

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

L o ; ; ; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No..1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLN 1155P
Qty Description of Parts Condition ﬁ?ﬂ;‘:ﬁg} ﬂurA;]}pstad
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 504.90 504.90
1|REAR BUMPER REFLECTORS NOT NECESSARY 130.50 -
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINERS NOT NECESSARY 116.30 -
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDERS NECESSARY 22.30 22.30
1|REAR BUMPER YELLOW CLIPS MECESSARY 8.00 9.00
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BENT 323.00 323.00
1|REAR BUMPER CLIPS NECESSARY 4.30 4.30
1|REAR BUMPER END SPLASHIELD COVER NOT MECESSARY 89.80 -
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -300.03 -215.87
900.07 647.63
ITEMS
1|REAR LICENSE PLATE (SN) BENT 80.00 35.00
1|REAR BUMPER PARKING SENSOR (SN) NOT NECESSARY 450,00 -
1|REAR END PANEL (ADDITIOMAL)(SN) TO REPAIR SEE 6594 .70 -
LABOUR
1|BOOTLID (ADDITIONALNSN) TO REPAIR SEE 1,662.40 -
LABOUR
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BRACE PANEL (NPA) |NO DAMAGED = -
(ADDITIONAL)(SN)
1|BOOTLID WEATHERSTRIP (ADDITIONAL) (SN} SERVICEABLE 188.00 -
3,075.10 35.00
LABOUR
TO REINSTALL OF REAR BUMPER PARKING SENSOR. 120.00 60.00
TO RUST PROOFING OF THE AFFECTED AREAS. NOT NECESSARY 180.00 -
PANEL BEATING KNOCKING AND STRAIGHTEN THE 1,600.00 450.00
NECESSARY PORTION REMOVE AND RENEWAL OF
PARTS ADJUST AND REALIGN THE SAME.INCLUSIVE OF
THE REPAIR OF REAR END PANEL AND BOOTLID.
PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING OF THE AFFECTED 1,200.00 600.00
PORTION.
3,100.00 1,110.00
GRAND TOTAL 7,076.17 1,792.63

Report Ref No. CS/AGI18014029/R1sbn2
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Page No.:2 of 2
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS 1,792.63

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS

Automotive Assessor

Report Ref No, CS/AGI18014029/R1sbn2

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser




