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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

A dE BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ub Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
i TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607188R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Faderation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI8014026/Arb

36 ROBINSON ROAD

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877

Date ; 01-08-2018

LA

Code: FCI2
G |- Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA B2TTR Veh. Inspected SKF 2097X
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. D18005832MFSH Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From CWS (LURENE JAW) Assign Date 01/08/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model G.C 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
a. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mrm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  23/07/2018 Inspection Date 02/08/2018
Survey held at ZERO GRAVITY
2 KAKI BUKIT AVE 2
#01-25 KAKI BUKIT AUTOHUB
SINGAFPORE 417921
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,




! Ul’l Auto

gy Consultanis
F Pl Uit

51 UBT AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065] 62563561 FAX : (145 EISMIJES

Your Ref: D18005632MFSH

Our Ref: CS/FCI18014026/Arb

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir'Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _SKF 2097X .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle
on 02.08.2018 at the premises of M/s ZERO GRAVITY and have the following to

report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
“Check™ Items Amount
Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
Nett Value

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages

at rear portion.

Yours faithfully

ADRIAN LING
Automotive Assessor

: S§ 9.521.95 .
: S% 6.027.60 .
: 5%
- 5%
b
: 5%
Nearsice
rear [ pE—
[ i ™
= Moy



MS ‘ FirstCaPital M5 First Capital Insurance Limited Comeq o 15500001060 GST Reg b M2 00016769

& Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tek (65) 6222 2311 Fax [65)6222 3547

Clalmes & Metor Undenweiting Dept: 36 Robinson Road BLE-QL City House Singapore 0BBA77
Tek {65) 6507 3848 Fax: [65) 6507 3849
waww.msfirstcapital.com.sg

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date 24-07-2018 Qur Ref No. D18005632MFSH
Accident Date 23-07-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHABZ2T7R Third Party Vehicle. SKF2097X
Survey Location 2 KAKI BUKIT AVE 2 #01-25 KAKI BUKIT AUTOHUB
Contact Person. TIFFANY
Contact No. 67412845/ 67477100 Fax Mo. 67412170
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:
Appointed

PP LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person MNA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use {based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop ZERO GRAVITY Attention. MIL
Cc : TP Solicitor MA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge LURENE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is a computer generated letler, no signature required.




Janice Lee (LKKAuto) :

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, September 11, 2018 10:26 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System’; LURENEJAW@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005632MFSH/1

Attachments: SKF 2097X pdf

Dear Sir/ Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised for SKF 2097X.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jannice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janiceles@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, August 01, 2018 5:44 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: LURENEJAW@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005632MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@ msfirstcapital.com.sg)

Sent: Wednesday, 1 August, 2018 4:52 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @LEKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; LUREN EJAW@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005632M FSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.



Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.
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72372048 Policy Search

eBaoTech GeneralClaim
Helto, NAC PAYA UBI_800601 ' Change Language ' Change Password * Log Out
My Desktop Policy Query '
Motice of Loss T e -
Policy Mo, . ] Date of Accident 2U07/2018 17:53 9
Vehicle Ne.(For Motor) EkFzoeTx ]

Sn‘rn‘:h

o Policyhokder Policyholder Vehicle Insured Cammanc "
Select Policy Mo e E\IYF.TC. Product Cover Typs o, Object D:'::F:'Il'\e Explry Date
AT URENTT Ses15a19)  GRC drivo PREMIUM SKF2007X SKF2097X  0B/OS/2018  07/05/2019

ttp:igiclaim.income. com.sgigesiicmiaclaimdiCMpolicySearch.do 1M



EﬁI:ARMc&RT-EﬂM Login | Sign up m f-.‘

New “"’m SellMyCar  Directory  Products lncurance  Articles  Forum s
Sign-Up Gift
HSBC = - A Samsonite Astra
{x §5em Luggags OR S$ 1 00
fworth SE360) cash back

Fﬂ'“E Past an Advertisement i!?_ P 1 CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED
5.,%“‘5!‘ Sall |t yourselt Advertise 1t at just —a . MERCEDES-BENZI
B $58 until it's SOLD! S

| Browse by Category

12 vehicles

Search Selection 320 Ay Any 2012 Ay Ay Ay Avallable
n BMW 3 Series 320§ M-Sport %63,.800 £12,750 fyr 0d-Jan-2012 1,995 cc B3,000 kmn Lusury Available
Immaculate Condition! Very Well Maintained By Presvious Owner, Highest O™V Valwe. M-Spart Model With M-5port Steering Wheel, And Rims. Full
Spac |-Deiva With Navigation And Bluetooth. No Repair Needed.... " Peskin AT
Lay Auto Pte Lid
E| BMW 3 Series 3200 Coupe $69,500 $13,510 fyr 17-Apr-2012 1,995 cc 70,000 km Sparts Available

Sunroof
Doctar Cwied, Mint Condition With AR Bells And Whistles, Seling Due To New Addition To Family Requiring Upgrade Ta SUV. Warry Free Luxurious
Continental Drive With Beautiful Exterior And Interior Co...
Prim Roy Matoring

Tt ! 4 waic 272 BRI T206, EMW T207, EMW, 320

I:] BMW 3 Serics 3200 Luxury S5 000 317,310 fyr 17-May-2012 1,997 cC 103,000 km Lumury Available
well Maintained fare White Color 18" Original BMW Sports Rims With Micheln P54 Tyres One Year Ol Front And Rear Camera, [ et camir: |
D BMW 3 Series 320§ Coupe $76,800 14,740 fyr 22-May-2012 1,995 e 51,000 km Sports Avallable

Sunroof

High COE $52k! Super Low Miesge! Only 51,000KM! Sporty Blue Coupe With Cream Interior! Upgraded 19" Sports Rims? High Paper Valye For Min
Losses! Guarantesd Best Condition In Town! Free 1 Year Wamran..,

SIOIH  Tags: EII2 BMAWC3 BMW 3204, BMW, 310, Llced BN

E Car Buying » 6) Car Selling » ’P Car Owmership »
E Car Aftermarket » EE.] Gn The Mave » 1 Lifestyle *

[7] eMw 3 Series 320i Coupe $75.800 $14,580 fyr 27-Jun-2012 1,955 ¢ : Sports Avallable
Sunroaf
Evalusted By Vicom, Free 6 Months Maintenance And 1 Grooming, High COE At §B58E89.
Yong Lee Seng Motar
Poicted ] 82 -Jr : 20, BMW 3204, 8M T
[7] BMW 2 Series 320i §75,500 $15,510 fyr 28-Jun-2012 1,997 oc 161,000 km Luury Avaliabie
FML Unit! Regularty Agent Senviging! 1 Cwner, High OMY Of $38582, The Sporty 3 Series Sel Unsurpass Standards Far Style And Dynamics,
Malntaining The Leading Pasition As The Mest Widely Sold Premium C... e
Car Search
] BMW 3 Series 3201 $79,000 $15,280 fyr 28-Jun-2012 1,997 ex 75,110 lam Lupoury Avaitahle

PML Uinit! 1 Owner, High OMV Of $39582, The Sporty BMW 3 Series Sets Unsurpass Standards For Style And Dynamics, Maintaining The Leading
Position As The Mast Widely Sold Premium Car In The Woeld, Immac....

woaTETID__mvosy 78 Wheeler Capltal Ple Lid




Das WeltAuto,

Used cors you can st Gunrantesd.

Save up to $30,000 on
.ni:_.

] BMw 3 Sarles 320i Luxury 467,888 | $12,360 fyr 27-3uk-2012 1,997 ¢ 66,316 km Lupury Available
Graded B ty STH

{ High In House Loan Package! ) New Facelifted! Free 1 Year P.Irsurance! Fully Agent (FML) Serviced. Free 1 Year Extended Premium Warranity Plus
Servicing For Peace OF Mind, High Trade-1n Are Welcome! ...

Autohyb Pte Lid

Hamiltzn

[[] BMW 3 Series 320i Sport S76 60D $13,750 fyr 12-Dac-2012 1,997 ec 75,049 km Lursuary Avaliable
Graded B by ST
Spart Modell 90% Finarcing Avadalbial 1 Owner! Low Mileage Unit! ETA Cartified Unit For & Peace OF Mind! View Today!

23% OFF petrol at Shell

EetIns'tantd’nsu:umwhenympunpatihellwmummdﬁmmm.ummmwhtﬂuﬂmmmm.
Find ot monel

[7] BMW 3 Series 320i M-Spart £83,333 £14,860 fyr 20-Dec-2012 1,997 cc 100,000 km Lipsuiry Available

Extremely Well Manitained Agent Uit BMW 3201 M-Sport In Sporty Grey With Lush Black Interior For Sale! This Unit Comes With A& Full Spec Option] .

100% Arccident Fres And Well Maintained Far & Worry Fres.., [ s i)
: e 30-May-2013 . T 2002 MW 2206, BFW 201 B 3500, Uges) BRTWY

D BMW 3 Series 3201 M-Sport 81,800 §14,360 fyr 21-Dec-2012 1,997 cc 57,000 krmi Lupsury Awailable

Lusiiry BMW 3208 M-Sport F301 Full Sarvicing Records Froem PML Except The Recent Last Servicing, Super Handling And Pawer, Making It The Top
(hioioe For Everyone! Beauliful Brown Esterior With Black, Re... I Wactianind 40 ]

Eurp Parfoermance Asla Pte Ltd

D BMW 3 Series 320§ 80,151 $14,120 fyr 31-Dec-2012 1,957 cc 100,000 km Lusury Available

059% In House Loan Approval! Seifing At Export Value, Low Risk, High CDE Amount At 54,000, Black On Beige Intevior Trade In Are Welcome,Fled In
House Loan Availabie, In House Extanded 1 Year Warranty. .

Dosh Car

G-lid-2OEA  Taga: 2003 EMOW 20, Bl 1200, BMW, 320, Used BN
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Cwer ID Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner |D: 5419)
Y303 71 1 e A R 200 b A s 57 A 1S, AT L St S S R |
Viehicle No.: SKF2097X
Vehiche to be Exported: Yes
Intended De-registration Date: 02 Aug 2018
Wehicle Make: B,
Vehicle Model: 3201 AT D/AB 4DR ABS HID NAY
Primary Colour: Blue
Manufacturing Year: 2012
Engine Mo.; B3040171M20B20B
Chassis No.: WEBA3B12040F136314
Maximum Power Output: 135.0 kW (181 bhp)
Open Market Value: $39.716.00
Original Registration Date: 08 May 2012
First Registration Date: 08 May 2012
Transfer Count: 0
Actual ARF Paid: 239.7156.00
T T 2| 3P GO L T St o A ) e e 0 25 i S St e |
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date; 07 May 2022
PARF Rebate Amount; $25,815.00
o O R T D e e e e L e e ]
COE Expiry Date: 07 May 2022
COE Category: E - Open Category
COE Period(Years): 10
CP Paid: $84.590.00
COE Rebate Amount: $31.499.00
Total Rebate Amount: $57,314.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 02 Aug 2018



ZERO GRAVITY

2 Kaki Bukit Avenue 2, #01-25 Kaki Bukit Autohub, Singapore 417921
Tal: +#65 67412045 Fax No: +65 67412170

Ernail: zero_gravity@singnel.com.sg
Buss.Reg.No,: H2388BETX

&HI-\: WM

Il

QUOTATION No : QT-000143
[MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANGE LIMITED | vouwkef, : SHASZ7R
Vehicla No. » SKF209TX
36 ROBINSOM ROAD T Maks & Model : BMW 301
#16-01 CITY HOUSE S Chasls No. t WBA3B12040F136314
CINGAPCRE 068877 Engire No. ; B2040171M20EZCB
Attention: Motor Claim Departrment hecident’ Date 1 23-07-2018
| TEL  ©55073848/68543466  FAX 65073849 - Policy No. : 5090206675-01
Date : 02-08-2018 .
Thank you for your inquiry. We are piaased to submit cur quote as follows: Page 1of2
Ttem = Pescription oy U7 Price  Amount
2 5%
1 REAR BUMPER o L= 1.0 PCs T 1,210.00 1,210.00
5 BUMPER BEAIM SCREW/INNER (LIPS 58+ /0% 1.0 SET 90.00 $a:00 7
3 BUMPER REINFORCEMENT £ 1.0 PCS 479,00 479.00.
4 BUMPER BEAM RETAINER (' 1.0 PCS .00 20.00-"
S5 BUMPER BEAM RETAINER LOWEF, d 1.0 PCs 75.00 7500
£ PROTECTOR BUMPER (CENTER) [ -f 1.6 PCE 155.00 155.00
7 REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR (L/H) 1.0 PCS 42.00 42,00 *
@ BUMPER BRACKET (LyH) wirf Arfes 1.0 PCE 62.00 62.00
5  REAR END PANEL 1.0 PCS 660.00 660,00 <
10 REAR BOOT WEATHERSTRIP [ 1.0 PCs 182,00 182,00
11 REAR BOOT INMER LOCK . 1.0 P 238.00 238.00°
12 CONTROL UNIT (REVERSE smmrq 1.0 PCE 58500 585.00
13 REVERSZ SENSOR i = 20 PCS 408.00 81600
14 CONTROL UNIT (REAR BOOT) -:‘;‘ 5008 1.0 PCS 530.00 S
1S SENSOR (REAR BOOT) AT15]7-60 L0 PCS 185.00 185,00~
16 SENSOR (KEY) &~%¢ 10 PCS 176.00 176.00 %
17 EXHAUST HEAT SHIELD 1.0 PCE 23:.00 P, 232.00
18 EXHAUST MUFFLER 10 PCS 1,625.00 _’1/,515."611.*
19 Diseount 3 % -3549.05
20 SubTotal (L) 7,011.95
71 REAR EHD PANEL SEALANT 1.0 BT 50.00 50,00 <
22 SubTotal (S) 50,00
23 PANEL BEAT % REPAIR REAR DAMAGE 10 X 240 swee
24  TO FUTTY AND RE-SPRAY AFFECTED PORTION 1.0 - % £ 60960
25 TO PROVIDE UNDER TURFCODE 1.0 X \ A 180.00
26 TO REMOVE AND REPLAGE DAMAGED EXHAUST SYSTEM TC 8 15300



7ERO GRAVITY g R

2 Kaki Bukit Avenue 2, $01-256 Kaki Bukit Autohub, Singapore 417321
Tel: +65 674412845 Fax No: +85 7412170

Email: zero_gravity@signet.com.eg

Buse Flag.No.: 52888887X

QUOTATION Ho : QT-DON143
[ MS FIRST CAPTTAL INSURANCE LIMITED ] Your Ref. . SHAE2TTR
, Vehice No, 1 SKF2097X
#16-01 CITY HOUSE Chasis Mo. © WBA3B12040F136314
SINGAPORE (68877 Enging No. « B3040171N20B208
Attention: Mctor Claim Departmerit Acsiden: Dete @ 23-07-201E
TIL  : 65073848/68543466  FAX 65073849 B Policy No. : 5090206675-01
i Date + 02-0B3-2018
Thank you for your inguiry. We are pleased to submit clr guote as foliows: Page p 20f2
Ttam Diescription = O L Price Arncunt
5% 5%
37 TO CHECK WIRING SYSTEM & FNSURE FUNCTION OF COMPONENT 10 X AU 8606
23 CONTROL UNIT ADAPTATION AND REPROGRAMMING 1.0 X e i
29 TORIMOVE REVERSE SENSOR 10 X _ L) Ao
30 TOREMOVE AND REFIT COMPONENTS / FACILITATE THE REPAIR 10 X 270 g 25600
31 SubTatal (LABOUR) 2,460,000
foted 6037 60

SINGAPORE DOLLAF. NINE THOUSAND FIVE HUNDIRED TWENTY ONE AND CENTS NINETY

FIVEQNEY

E.&0E Total S 9,521.95
e Discount 5% (.00
f? N Ty ne:Total 59§ 9,521.95
{\_ __._'___...-"" =

- i
; S SRS = s Terms: C.0.0.
Customer's Signature/Co. Stamp’ TERD GRAVIETY

Ay claim for fau ty workmaraifip.is lyitad colaiy in tha reciification ree of Jost of such wo'k ro daet for loes
consaguentlal or othenwize Deing admissible. Any nbjedtions 16 tra validity of these charges must be mode saven (7)
days from the date of this invoice othurwise if is assumed that 1hi3 bill 3 secepted as comect.

) -



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internatlonale Des Experts En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI18014026/Arbn2
#16.01 CITy HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 pate. 18082018 N”lmwml||m M
Code . FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 8277R Veh. Inspected SKF 2097X
Policy No. Coverage ($) o.00
Claim No. D18005632MFSH Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From LURENE Assign Date 01/08/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model  BMW 320 c.C 1997
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2012
Chassis No. WBA3IB12040F 136314 Colour BLUE
Odometer 67579 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GooD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/50 R17 BRIDGESTONE & rmm
L/H Front Tyre |[225/50 R17 BRIDGESTONE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/50 R17 ERIDGESTOMNE & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/50 R17 BRIDGESTONE & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  23/07/2018 Inspection Date 02/0872018
Survey held at ZERO GRAVITY
2 KAKI BUKIT AVE 2
#01-25 KAKI BUKIT AUTOHUE
SINGAPORE 417821
5a. Remarks
ADAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT,
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKF 2087X

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

£1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Feg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-9607198-R

Page MNo.:1 of 2

: Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wo rkshup?;}; {:{i
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 1,210.00 1,210.00
1|SET BUMPER BEAM SCREW/INMER CLIPS NECESSARY 90.00 30.00
1|BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BENT 479.00 479.00
1{BUMPER BEAM RETAINER CRACKED 39.00 38.00
1|BUMPER BEAM RETAINER LOWER CRACKED 75.00 75.00
1|PROTECTOR BUMPER (CENTER) MISSING 155.00 156.00
1|REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR (L/H) DAMAGED 42.00 42.00
1|BUMPER BRACKET (L/H) NOT NECESSARY 62.00 .
1|REAR END PAMEL TO REPAIR SEE 650.00
LABOUR
1|REAR BOOT WEATHERSTRIP NOT NECESSARY 182.00
1|REAR BOOT INNER LOCK NOT NECESSARY 238.00 -
1|CONTROL UNIT {(REVERSE SENSOR) NOT NECESSARY 585.00
2|REVERSE SENSOR @%408.00 DAMAGED 816.00 500,00
1|CONTROL UNIT (REAR BOOT) DAMAGED 530.00 420.00
1|SENSCOR (REAR BOOT) DAMAGED 185.00 185.00
1|SENSOR (KEY) DAMAGED 176.00 176.00
1|EXHAUST HEAT SHIELD CRUMPLED 232,00 23200
1|EXHAUST MUFFLER BENT 1,625.00 146500
LESS 5% DISCOUNT -389.05 -250.40
7.011.85 4,757 60
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|BTL REAR END PANEL SEALANT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
50.00
LABOUR
PAMNEL BEAT & REPAIR REAR DAMAGE.INCLUSIVE OF 800.00 450.00
THE REPAIR OF REAR END PAMEL
TO PUTTY AND RE-SPRAY AFFECTED PORTION 600.00 500.00
TO PROVIDE UNDER TURFCODE. NOT NECESSARY 180.00 -
TO REMOVE AND REPLACE DAMAGED EXHAUST 150.00 B80.00
SYSTEM.
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Description of Parts Condition
s gee ; Workshop ($)|  (8)
TO CHECK WIRING SYSTEM & ENSURE FUNCTION OF 80,00 30.00
COMPONENT.
CONTROL UMIT ADAPTATION AND REPROGRAMMING. 250.00 100.00
TO REMOVE REVERSE SENSOR. 150.00 60.00
TO REMOVE AND REFIT COMPONENTS/FACILITATE THE 250.00 50.00
REPAIR.
2.460.00 1,270.00

GRAND TOTAL 9,521.95 6,027.60
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 4,800.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
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MARKET VALUE: $73,000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $57,314.00=NETT VALUE: $15,686.00
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Licensed Appraiser

DISCLABMER OF LIARILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:. This Report ks made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Repen.
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