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I V4 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Alm BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408333
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-9607195-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL Ref : CS/SMO18014004/Gsd3
o AN
#05-01/08 Date: 01-08-2018
SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623
Code: SMO
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJ5 B383Z Veh. Inspected SLG 44850
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD1803235/THE Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From GRACE TED Assign Date 01/08/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mim
R/H Rear Tyre mim
L/H Rear Tyre mim
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  28/07/2018 Inspection Date 03/08/2018

Survey held at VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE SINGAPORE

1 KAMPONG AMPAT OFF MACPHERSON ROAD
SINGAPORE 368314

Sa. Remarks

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




B 74 74

. e Consultants
e s . Pte Lid Gompany Registration No, 199607 138R

SELIBEAVE 1, #2-25 PAY A UBLINDUST RIAL PAKK, SINGAPORE 208933 TEL - (B65) 62563561 FAX 651 HISHIIEE

Your ref: CMTD1803235/THE
Our ref: CS/SMO18014004/Gsd3 Date: 6/8/2018
The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE

M/s SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SLG 4485D
We thank you for your instruction on_1/8/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle
on 3/8/2018 at the premises of M/s
VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE SINGAPORE and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :558,875.63
Revised Estimate Amount :554,139.90
"Check" Items Amount :5%1,455.73
Market Value ' 8%
LTA Reimbursement Value .
Nett Value : S§

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
rear portion,

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

XING GUO QIANG
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A
Automobile Assessor



RIRIZNARA PLRFIMNF Rehate Frniing

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner ID: 2318C
SR T HCA I E| ittt s s R g S |
Vehicle No.: SLG4485D
WVehicle to be Exported: No
Intended De-registration Date: 06 Aug 2018
Vehicle Make: VOLKSWAGEN
Vehicle Model: JETTAGP 1.4 TSI20 A/THLHID 1634G5
Primary Colour: Grey
Manufacturing Year: 2015
Engine Mo.: CAXFB4345
Chassis No.: WVWZZZ16ZGM024127
Maximum Power Output: 90.0 kW (120 bhp)
Open Market Value: $20,867.00
Original Registration Date: 29 Sep 2016
First Registration Date: 29 Sep 2016
Transfer Count: 1
Actual ARF Paid: £21,214.00
Elntended PARE Rebate D et s s e e ]
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 28 Sep 2026
PARF Rebate Amount: $15,910.00
B DT e Keo] ol 1 RIS st S s S D S |
COE Expiry Date: 28 Sep 2026
COE Category: A-Carupto 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $50,000.00
COE Rebate Amount: $40,722.00
Total Rebate Amount: $56,632.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 06 Aug 2018

OK

nitps.iivrlita.gov.sgitasvi/action/enguireHebataByHFublicBatoreLereginput Y FUNL TION_ID=FU3040UE | ]

11



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAutQ)

Sent: Monday, 6 August 2018 5:02 PM

To: ‘Teo, Grace'

Ce: 'Choo, Thelma'; 'Henry, Irene James’; SUR

Subject: RE: CMTD1803235/THE - SUV(LKK)/ SJS8383Z & SLG4485D DOA: 28/07/2018
Attachments: SLG 44850 PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Grace,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLG 4485D
Date of survey: 3/8/2018
Number of days :3 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler on behalf of Shirley

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Teo, Grace [mailto:grace.teo@sompo.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 1 August 2018 1:27 PM

To: Chee, Steven (VWG Singapore) <steven.chee @vw.com.sg>; admin-d@Ikkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com
Cc: Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore) <shushi.tang@vw.COM.5g>; Choo, Thelma <thelma.choo@sompo.com.sg>;
Henry, Irene James <irene.hen SOMpo.com.sg>

Subject: CMTD1803235/THE - SUV(LKK)/ 51583832 & SLG4485D DOA: 28/07/2018

Qur Claim Reference: CMTD1803235/THE
Your Reference: SLGA485D

Hi Steven,

Please be informed that we have appointed LKK AUTO to conduct the survey.

Aside to LKK AUTO,

Please make arrangement to conduct the survey for SLG4485D.
Please submit with your report to my colleague, Ms. Thelma Choo.
Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division
D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147



= Innovation for Wellbeing
@; SOMPO A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
£0 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission’ & Product Purchase’ via Sompo SG

‘-" DG oo Thal

App Stor

Download now @ PP or

tEar Travel Personal Accident & Home Insurance | ? For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete thiz message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Folicy

From: Chee, Steven (VWG Singapore) [mailto:steven.chee@vw.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, August 01, 2018 12:22 PM

To: Choo, Thelma; Teo, Grace

Cc: Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore); Henry, Irene James

Subject: RE: CMTD1803235/THE - & 5]S83837 DOA: 28/07/2018 \ REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Dear claims,

Please arrange survey tomorrow 2/8/2018. Customer will leave car from 9AM to 11AM.
Please revert to confirm.

Best Regards,

Steven Chee
Aftersales

Volkswagen Centre Singapore (Macpherson)
1 Kampong Ampat
Singapore 368314

Main Line : +65 6305-7298
Main Fax: +65 6285-8620
steven.chee@vw.com.s
http:/wew vw.com.5g

The Golf, - =
The most eligible hatchback
on the market. [ 3

-,




From: Choo, Thelma [mailto:thelma.choo@sompa.com

Sent: Wednesday, 1 August, 2018 11:46 AM

To: Teo, Grace; Chee, Steven (VWG Singapore)

Cc: Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore); Henry, Irene James

Subject: RE: CMTD1803235/THE - & SJS8383Z DOA: 28/07/2018 \ REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir,

We refer to your email below

Liability is clear and we have no objection in having a direct settlement.

The LOU/Rental will be based on benchmark rate and the number of days will follow surveyor
recommendation.

Best Regards

Thelma Choo

Claims Divisions

D: 6322 4681 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission® & Product Purchase’ via Sompo 5G

ﬁﬁ- ;é.; s Ll
Download now @ ‘ PP tore or

LFor Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance | 2 For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid. may collect, use and disciose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy.

From: Teo, Grace

Sent: Tuesday, July 31, 2018 10:54 AM

To: Chee, Steven (VWG Singapore) <steven.chee @vw.com.sg>

Cc: Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore) <shushi.tang@vw.com.sg>; Choo, Thelma <thelma.choo@sompo.com.sg>,
Henry, Irene James <irene.hen OMmpo.com.sg>

Subject: CMTD1803235/THE - & 5J58383Z DOA: 28/07/2018 \ REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Our Claim Reference: CMTD1803235/THE
Your Reference; SLG4485D



Hi Steven,

We acknowledged receipt of your claim documents.
Please be informed that Thelma Choo is the handler of this case.

Kindly advise us when the vehicle is in for the survey.

Our in-house proposed the vehicle to be left at your premises for the day or at least half a day for survey.

Aside to Thelma,

Please refer to the liability request from Volkswagen Group Singapore Pte Ltd.

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

—

‘e, 'SOR;I ;gmmg A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase’ via Sompo SG

[ ot

& App Store

Download now @ or
LFor Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance | 2 For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally priviléged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom

disclasure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents {acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Chee, Steven (VWG Singapore) [mailto:steven.chee@vw.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, July 30, 2018 5:27 PM

To: Claims - Motor Survey

Cc: Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore)

Subject: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR SLG4485D & 5J58383Z DOA: 28/07/2018

Dear claims,

Please revert liability & arrange survey for this claims.

Best Regards,

Steven Chee
Aftersales



\Volkswagen Centre Singapore (Macpherson)
1 Kampong Ampat
Singapore 368314

Main Line : +65 6305-7299
Main Fax: +65 6285-8620
steven.chee@vw.COMm.543
http: /W vw. com, 59

ThEI Galf :
The most ehglble hatchbaclr: 7

on the marlfet

From: steven.chee@vw.COM.5g [maiIto:steven.chee@w.wm.sm
Sent: Monday, 30 July, 2018 5:25 PM

To: Chee, Steven (VWG Singapore)

Subject: Scan von MyMFP

Scan from MyMFP

i AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 1 August 2018 1:27 PM

To: Chee, Steven (VWG Singapore); admin-d@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com
Cc Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore); Choo, Thelma; Henry, Irene James

Subject: CMTD1803235/THE - SUV(LKK)/ 5J58383Z & 5LG4485D DOA; 28/07/2018
Attachments: MyDocument_2018_07_30_05_24_10.pdf

Our Claim Reference: CMTD1803235/THE
Your Reference: SLG4485D

Hi Steven,

Please be informed that we have appointed LKK AUTO to conduct the survey.,

Aside to LKK AUTO,
Please make arrangement to conduct the survey for SLG4485D.

Please submit with your report to my colleague, Ms. Thelma Choo.

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T. 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

g

Innovation for Welibeing A C f T
e

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com sq | Facebook: www facebook.com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase’ via Sompo 5G

Download now @ ppStore e ¥ Google Play

'For Travel, Personal &ccident & Home Insurance | 2 For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information, Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permittedirequired by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy



From: Chee, Steven (VWG Singapore) [mailto:steven.chee@wvw.com.sg]
‘Sent: Wednesday, August 01, 2018 12:22 PM
To: Choo, Thelma; Teo, Grace

Cc: Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore); Henry, Irene James
Subject: RE: CMTD1803235/THE - & S1S83837 DOA: 28/07/2018 \ REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Dear claims,

Please arrange survey tomorrow 2/8/2018. Customer will leave car from 9AM to 11AM.
Please revert to confirm.

Best Regards,

Steven Chee
Aftersales

‘olkswagen Centre Singapore (Macpherson)
1 Kampong Ampat
Singapore 368314

Main Line ; +65 6305-7293
Main Fax: +65 6285-8620
steven chee@vw. com. sq
hitp: /fwWww. vW.corm.sq

From: Choo, Thelma [mailto:thelma.choo@sompo.com.sg]

Sent; Wednesday, 1 August, 2018 11;46 AM

To: Teo, Grace; Chee, Steven (VWG Singapore)

Cc: Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore); Henry, Irene James

Subject: RE: CMTD1803235/THE - & S]S8383Z DOA: 28/07/2018 \ REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Without Prejudice

Dear 5ir,
We refer to your email below
Liability is clear and we have no objection in having a direct settlement.

The LOU/Rental will be based on benchmark rate and the number of days will follow surveyor
recommendation.



Best Regards

Thelma Choo

Claims Divisions

D: 6322 4681 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www.facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission® & Product Purchase? via Sompo 5G

I i t
Download now @ pp tore or Goochiay

'For Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance | 2 For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy, This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy.

From: Teo, Grace

Sent: Tuesday, July 31, 2018 10:54 AM

To: Chee, Steven (VWG Singapore) <steven.chee @vw.com.sg>

Cc: Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore) <shushi.tang@vw.com.sg>; Choo, Thelma <thelma.choo@sompo.com.sg;
Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: CMTD1803235/THE - & SIS8383Z DOA: 28/07/2018 \ REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Our Claim Reference: CMTD1803235,/THE

Your Reference: 5LG4485D

Hi Steven,

We acknowledged receipt of your claim documents,
Please be informed that Thelma Choo is the handler of this case.
Kindly advise us when the vehicle is in for the survey.

Our in-house proposed the vehicle to be left at your premises for the day or at least half a day for survey.

Aside to Thelma,
Please refer to the liability request from Volkswagen Group Singapore Pte Ltd.
Best Regards

Grace Teo
Claims Division



D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

@; gaoﬂ;:r;lf;glmm A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission’ & Product Purchase? via Sompo 5G

Download now @ pp Store or 'EPhY
I_

For Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance | 2 For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Mator Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the pUrposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Chee, Steven (VWG Singapore) [mailto:steven.chee@vw,com.sq]

Sent: Monday, July 30, 2018 5:27 PM

To: Claims - Motor Survey

Cc: Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore)

Subject: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR SLG4485D & SJ58383Z DOA: 28/07/2018

Dear claims,
Please revert liability & arrange survey for this claims.

Best Regards,

Steven Chee
Aftersales

Volkswagen Centre Singapore (Macpherson)
1 Kampong Ampat
Singapore 368314

Main Line : +65 6305-7299
Main Fax: +65 6285-8620
steven.chee@vw.com.sq
http:/fwww . vw.com.sq

“The most eligible
& 2on the market.

B,




From: steven.chee@vw.com.sg [mailto:steven.chee@vw.com.sq]
Sent: Monday, 30 July, 2018 5:25 PM

To: Chee, Steven (VWG Singapore)

Subject: Scan von MyMFP

Scan from MyMFP
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maode differant
Certificate of Insurance

MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD PARTY RISKS AND COMPENSATION) ACT (CHAPTER 189)
MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD PARTY RISKS AND COMPENSATION) RULES, 1360

ROAD TRAMSPORT ACT, 1987 [MALAYSIA]}

MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD PARTY RISKS) RULES, 1959 (MALAYSIA)

Certificate Number: 5101533952 Cover : driva PREMIUM
1. Index mark and Registration Mumber of Vehicle : 5LG4485D

Chassis Number CWNVWIEZZ1BZGMO24127
2. Mame of Policyholder : FOG HSIN YEN
3, Effective Date of Insurance ) : 21 Jun 2018
4, Expiry Date of Insurance 1 20 lun 2013
5. Persons or Classes of Persons entitled to drives

{a) The Policyholder.

(b} Any other person wha is driving on the Policyholder's order or with his/her permission.
Provided that the person driving is permitted in accordance with the licensing or other laws or regulations to drive
the Motor Vehicle or has been so permitted and is not disgqualified by order of a Court of Law or by reason of any
enactment or regulation in that behalf from driving the Motar Vehicle.

6. Limitations as ta Usal
{a) Use for social domestic and pleasure purposes and in connection with the Policyholder's business or profession.

This Policy does not cover
{a] Use for hire or reward.
(b} Use for racing, pace-making, reliability tnial or speed-testing.
{c) Use Far the carriage of goods |other than samples) in cosnection with any trade or business.
{d) Use for any purpose in connection with the Mator Trade.
# Limitations rendered inoperative by Section 8 of the Motor Vehicle {Third Party Risks and Compensation)
Act Chapter 189) and Section 95 of the Road Transport Act, 1987 (Malaysia), are not to be included under these

headings.
EXCESS [SECTION 1} : 55600
EXCESS (SECTION 2) CNSA
WINDSCREEM EXCESS : 55100
ADDITIONAL EXCESS : NfA
UNMAMED DRIVER EXCESS : PLEASE REFER QOVERLEAF
REPAIR AT OWMER'S PREFERRED WORKSHOP - YES
INSURE WITH COE < YES
NED PROTECTION : YES
TRAMSPORT ALLOWANCE : NG
EXCESS WAIVER : NO
PRIMARY DRIVER : FOO H5IN YEM
MAMED DRIVER (1) : NJA
MAMED DRIVER (2} : NJA
HIRE PURCHASE COMPANY ¢ SING INVESTMENTS & FINANCE LTD
SUM INSURED : MARKET VALUE OF INSURED VEHICLE AT TIME OF LOSS

I/We herehy Cartify that the Policy to which this Certificate relates is issued in accordance with the provisions of the Maotor
vehicles (Third Party Risks and Compensation) Act (Chapter 189) and Part IV of the Road Transport Act, 1987 (Malaysia)

Agancy : JIN-SHI (HOLDINGS) PTE LTD (00000614359)
Date of Issue + 21 Jun 2018 10:11 hrs

For NTUC INCOME INSURANCE CO-OPERATIVE LIMITED

s he

Authorised Officer Chief Executive

Countersigned By:




REPUBLIC OF SINGAPORE
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VOLKSWAGEN

GROUP |
SINGAPORE ; PDI TUAS
P |
Y |
A \kll'!.%::-) |
31030002
FPhaone No.
Fax No.
BOI TUAS ng’}%o)&%m“
FOO HSIN YEN

10 CANBERRA DRIVE

#06-13 EIGHT COURTYARDS
Singapore, 768142

Tax No.

Singapore
Customer Na. Cvi41328
s Quote MNo. SER/QUOMBO1213
T ulf; QuoteDate 30/07/18
| gr Of [ne TONaw . Salesperson
| # R . . ey Fage 1
:_ nrices ane ; s THIS IS NOT AN OFFICIAL TAX INVOICE
1 o Y Y L = -_ - e
Make odel DBSGI‘IPUH-FI st be 'Milea Service Advisor
Volkswagen Passeng %m TSI(DSG) rman-ﬁ.mE Hfﬂ{: 48,820 Tang Shu Shi
License No. N Initial Registration Sales Advisor
SLG4485D ZABZOMD24127 29/09/1
Engine Code Labor Type: ’——_/-g:;i_r:Elo. Model Code
M4 Do 345 1634GT
No. Description Qty. UoM Unit Price Amount
F B&P MACP LABOUR LABOUR 3 UNIT &G 2.520.00
P B&P MACP PAINT SPRAY PAINT 3 UNIT EGG 2400.00
P BA&P DIAG PROGRAMMING & CALIBRATION 1 Time Un 480.00
COMPULSORY TO DO AFTER AC
P B&F MECH CHECK WIRE HARMNESS. ECU, § 1 Time Un — 280.00
Mett
Sum Labor 5,680.00
P 5C6807305 REINFORCEMENT ﬂ, 1 Pigces 51420
P 5CE8073T5 LHR BUMPER BRACKET ,4\{ 1 Pieces 96.13 -
P 5C6807376 RHR BUMPER BRACKET 1 Pieces 96.13
P 5CE807393D LHR TAILIGHT BRACKET 1 Pieces 80.55
P 5C68073940 RHRE TAILIGHT BRACKET 1 Pieces a0.55
P 5CE6807421H GRU REAR BUMPER - 1 Pieces 1,452 .28
Wedecemrﬁyﬁm%‘% N
P 5C6807433J SPOILER "1‘ FPieces 476,26,
P 5CEB807863B REAR BUMPER CENTRE BRACK 1 Pieces 111891
P 5C6919491D SENSOR BRACKET .~ 1 Pieces 27.45
P 5C6919491E SENSOR BRACKET 2 Pieces 5490
P 5C68919492D SENSOR BRACKET o ﬂ:.’(_ 3 1 Pieces 2745
P D 180KUZA1 2KADHESIVE _- 1 Pieces 103 .66
P D 822150A1 BONDAGENT 1 Pieces 7416
Sum carried forward B,875.63

Payments to: -BEN: - Acc -No.

VAT Registration No. M20088505-2

1991014947

Service Quote



PDI TUAS

FOO HSIN YEN

10 CANBERRA DRIVE
#06-13 EIGHT COURTYARDS
Singapore, 768142

Singapore

Make Model Description
Volkswagen Passeng JETTA TSI (DSG) HIGHLINE HIDC
License No. VIN

SLG44850 WYWZZZ16ZGM024127
Engine Code Labor Type
M4
Sum Item

Explanations
P = Proportionately Charged

Payment Terms Mo Cradit

Payments to: - BBN: - Acc.-No

PDI TUAS

Phane Mo,
Fax No
E-Mail

VAT Registration No. M20098505-2
Tax Mo, 1991014942

Service Quote

Customer Mo CwWD41328

Cluote Mo. SER/QUOMBO1213
CuoteDate 30/0718
Salesperson

FPage 2

THIS IS NOT AN OFFICIAL TAX INVOICE

Mileage Service Advisor
38,820 Tang Shu Shi
Initial Registration Sales Advisor
29/09/16
Engine No. Model Code
CAX FB84345 1634GT

Continued

Sum Labor

Sum Item

Total 5GD

7% GST 887563

Total SGD Incl. GET

8,875.63

3,195.623

5.680.00
3,195.63

8,875.63
621.29
9,496.92



SERVICE DRDER NO:
CUSTOMER NO.:
CUSTOMER NAME:

TELEPHONE NO.:

Service Order Confirmation

BP0
Cvoda1328

FOO H3IN YEN

ADDRESS: 10 CANBERRAA DRIVE #05-13 EIGHT COURTYARDS
Singapore

VEH No.: SLG4485D
Ovoer Date: 0608718
Fieg Date: ZBOHE KM: 38,820
VIN NO.: WYWEIZZ 1 BIGMO24127 ENGINE NO:
MODEL: JETTATS! [D5G) HIGHLINE HIDCMODEL NO.: 163467

Ho, RESCRIPTION ary Yok

Labar
1 B&P DIAG PACGRAMMING & CALIBRATION- NETT 1 ait]
2 B&P MECH CHECK WIRE HARMESS, ECU, SENSOR SOCKET 1 TU
3 BA&P MACP LABCUR LABOLIR 1 UNIT
" BAF MAGE BAINT SPAAY PAINT i UNIT
3 EXTDO03T Tow 5¥G- Quality Racovary Sarvicas i UNIT
] EXTO0037 Tow SVG- Guality Recovery Senices 1 umIT

Hem

7 ECEROTAZTH GAU AZAR BUMPER 1 PCS
8 SCE91 341D SEMNSOR BRACKET 1 PCS
H HCES184B1E SENSOR BRACKET 1 PGS
1 [1] ECEANS4SIE SENSOR BRACKET 1 PCS
1 BLES 134820 SENSOA BRACKET 1 FGS
12 0 1B0KLIZAY ZKADHESIVE 1 PGS
13 D B22150A1 BOMDASENT 1 PCS

FRamaks : SOMPO INSURANGCE DHAECT SETTLEMENT

DOA: 28072018

TP VEHICLE: SJSE3B3T

SURNVEY BY: GO QHANG (LKK}

145228
2745
2745
g L]
2745
10386

T4.16

SA: Tang Shu Shi

aaggﬁﬁ

1A 28
aras
a7 A5
2745
27T AG
103,66

7416



Service Order Confirmation

SEAVICE ORDER NO:  1BIP2010

CUSTOMER NO.: CW41328

CUSTOMER MAME:  FOO HSIN YEN

TELEPHONE RO.:

ADDRESS: 10 CANBERRA DRIVE #06-13 EXGHT COURTYARDS
Singapore

VEH No.: SLG4485D

Order Dute: DEfOEME

Reg Date: 29708018 LY 38,820
WiN NO. WAWIEE 1 BEGMIZH ZT ENGINE MO:
MODEL: JETTA 751 (DSG) HIGHLINE HIDCMODEL NO.: 183407
He. DESCRIPTION ary uom WHIT PRICE QISC %

Cn Behall Of “COMPANY

Authorized Signature

MOTE: THIS IS NOT AN OFFICIAL RECEIPT

BA: Tang Shu Shi

AMOUNT

4,133.50
28079

442068

Cartified Goods/Service recelved:

Customer



| 3 74 74
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reag. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 18-9607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL Ref :  CS/SMO18014004/Gsd3n2
e IIIREIN
#05-01/06 Date . 28-08-2018
SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623
Code: SMO
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  SJ5 83832 Veh. Inspected SLG 4485D
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD1803235/THE Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From GRACE TEO Assign Date 01/08/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model VOLKSWAGEN JETTA c.c 1380
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 20186
Chassis No. WWWZZZ16ZGM024127 Colour GREY
Odometer 42410 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/55 R16 PIRELLI & mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/55 R16 PIRELLI & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R16 PIRELLI & mm
L/H Rear Tyre 205/55 R16 PIRELLI 6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  28/07/2018 Inspection Date 03/08/2018
Survey held at VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE SINGAPORE
1 KAMPONG AMPAT OFF MACPHERSON ROAD
SINGAPORE 368314
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




'Y V4l V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
id’ = ; — ; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
G TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLG 4485D
Qty Description of Parts Gonfiion -  [uoianie ol | e AEstd
PLA PARTS
1|REINFORCEMENT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 514.20
1|LHR BUMPER BRACKET (SN) NOT NECESSARY 96.13 .
1|RHR BUMPER BRACKET (SN) MOT NECESSARY 96.13 o
1|LHR TAILIGHT BRACKET (SN) NOT NECESSARY 80.55 g
1|RHR TAILIGHT BRACKET (SN) NOT NECESSARY 80.55 -
1|REAR BUMPER (SN) DEFORMED 1,452.28 1,452 28
1|SPOILER (SN} NOT NECESSARY 476.26 !
1|REAR BUMPER CENTRE BRACK (SN) NOT NECESSARY 111.91 :
1|SENSOR BRACKET (SN) NECESSARY 27.45 27.45
2|SENSOR BRACKET (SN) NECESSARY 54.90 54.90
1|SENSOR BRACKET (SN) NECESSARY 27 45 27.45
1|2KADHESIVE (SN) NECESSARY 103.66 103.66
1|BONDAGENT (SN) NECESSARY 74.16 74.16
3,195.63 1,739.90
LABOUR
LABOUR. 2,520.00 840.00
SPRAY PAINT, 2,400.00 800.00
PROGRAMMING & CALIBRATION COMPULSORY TO DO 480.00 480.00
AFTER AC.
CHECK WIRE HARNESS ECU,S. 280.00 280.00
5,680.00 2,400.00
GRAND TOTAL 8,875.63 4,139.90
[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | 4,139.90|

Report Ref No, CS/SMO18014004/Gsd3n2

XING GUO QIANG

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng, AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser




