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B/Z0e ‘Mariman & Claims

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(New Assignment)

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING B —
Come  [Motified  jEat Sibmitted | &d) Adsighed | Ad| lbr _ Ry submitted [lne Authed S
01 Aug 2018
P 3130l 2018 09:36 New Assignmant
] | _asmign | -

Referance

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by insurer]
Psured:
Maln
Elatmant:
\ierhicle Feg.
| Nip:

CHEW SOOK YEE

SLN2904M ‘Date of Loss: | 28/07/2018 00:00 - :59

Clalm Type: | TP / SNM1BDO3735C02 CYICOVER | DMPCSNLSS4951702

|enicla Reg, e

M. £1Z6559K Fare..
_——— Excess: 550.00
Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd (HQ) 5 Ubl Close, 408505 Ubi - Tal:

Chinz Taiping Insurance (Singapora) Pre. Ltd, (HQ) - Tel: 638% 6111 ... [Handled by Hwang Shiang Yi - 63596541

AL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ | View All || Search Tusis | | Create New Task | | Complete |
Due Date Pribwity Fype Tashk Grodp Sutrject Hanvgl e Axwigred By Completed On Craated On Dane? |

. ! M results.,

hitpi-isingapare mermen, com/claimalindex.ofm Husebox=MTRad|uster&lussaction=dsp_cimheaterbcasaid=7T300054elid=2TROTOACFID=2825... 112
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View Sent Message

This mail s associated with

*SLNZO0AM (FNML1EDD3I735C02)
[5126559K]
™

CHEW SO0 YEE
Iyl 26 2018 12:004M

Trans Eyrokars Palid

_hesend || View Recipignts | _Print Message | | Detete Message | | Forward | S

From LKK Auto Cansultants Pte Ltd (LKK_HQ), sent on 03/05/3018 16:09 PM.
Te siaine.cheong@so.crtaiping .com '
Subject  SLN2904M

Chsar Sir/Mdm,

Pluase te Infarmed that we are unable to conduct the inspection for SLNZS04M after some atlempts to Inlarm the warkshop to presant the vehicie.
Tlils case has been pending for a lang time due te the unavallablility of tha ownes, therefore we decided to temporarly closs this case.

Kingly advise us i there is any arrangerment mage and will be glad to re-open the case accordingly.

Bist Regardy,

G, Nivitha| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd _
Prone: 6B41-1972 | emall: sssignmentsSikkalto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Ele 51, Paya Ubl industrial Park, Ubl Aﬂnun 1; #02-25 | 5{4:!&931)

—

'DOCUMENTS SUMMARY - B -
There are nn documints,




Mivitha (LKK Auta!

From: Admin-D (LKKAute) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 3 May 2019 4:08 PM

To: ‘Elaine Cheong'; assignments

Cc SUR; 'Chong Boon Sen'

Subject: RE: YOUR REF; SJZ6559K / OUR REF: SLN2904M THIRD PARTY CLAIM (REQUESTING

FOR SURVEY AND A DIRECT SETTLEMENT)

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please be informed that we are unable to conduct the inspection for SLN 2904M after some attempts to inform the
workshop to present the vehicles

This case has been pending for a long time due to the unavailability of the owrer, therefore we decided to
temporarily close this case,

Kmdly advise us if there is any arrangement made and will be glad to re-open the case accordingly.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: psiznments@lbbouto som | fas: G2s6-4315
Wk 51, Paya Ubd Industrial Pack, Ubi Avsinue 1, #02-25 | S{408941)

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 25 October 2018 5:55 PM

To: 'vien.lim@eurokars.com.sg' <vion.lim@eurakars.com.sg>

C: 'ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM' <ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTD.COM>

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SJ26559K / OUR REF: SLN2904M THIRD PARTY CLAIM (REQUESTING FOR SURVEY AND A
DIRECT SETTLEMENT)

Dear Vian,

Thank you for the email,

The QIC for CT1 is Hwang Shiang Yi, but she is no longer with CTI.
You may contact Elaine Cheong for further updates,

elaine.cheong(@sg.cntalping.com

BUST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LAK Anto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 68415972 | emvail: gesienments@ikkalo.com | fax: 6256-4515

Bl 51. Paya Ui Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #oa-25 | S(4089a3)
1



From: vion lim{@ eurokars.com.sg [rnaiItg:'n.r]mn.llm@eurgkars.mm.sgl
Sunt; Thursday, 25 October 2018 5:45 PM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com
Subject: FW: YOUR REF: 5]26559K / OUR REF: SLN2904M THIRD PARTY CLAIM [REQUESTING FOR SURVEY AND A
DIRECT SETTLEMENT)

Hi Nivitha,
Attached case assigned to LKK. Can help me check & revert the OIC for china taiping please. Thank you.

Best Regards.

(15 ELROKARS GROUP
Vion Lim

Irsurance Claims Officer

EUROKARS SERVICES PTE LTD
27A Tanjong Penjuru, Singapore 609042
D: (65) 6331 0B84 H: (65) 9111 7463

E: vion Iim@eurokars.com.sg

Webhsite: www. eurokars.com.sg

From: Vion Lim

Sent: 22 October 2018 8:41 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@se cntalping com>

Subject: FW: YOUR REF: 5JZ6559K / OUR REF: SLN2904M THIRD PARTY CLAIM (REQUESTING FOR SURVEY AND A
DIRECT SETTLEMENT)

Daar Sir / Mdm,
Would appreciate if you could revert the OIC for the above case. Thank you.

Bes! Regards.

() ELROIGARS GROUIP
Vion Lim

Insurance Claims Officer

EUROKARS SERVICES PTELTD

27A Tanjong Penjuru, Singapore 609042
D: (65) 8331 0684 H: (65) 9111 7463

E: vion im@eurokars.com.sq

Website; www.eurokars.com.sg

From: Samuel Ng

Sent: 31 July 2018'9:35 AM _

To: claimsdepti@sg.cntaiping com; Vion Lim <vionlim@eurokars.com.sg>

Ciz: Siew Guek Catherine Chua <catherinechua@eurokars.com.sg>; Eric Pau <eric_pau@eurckars.com.sg>; Jess
Francis <jess francis@eurokars. com.sg>; Ronald Yap <ronald yap@eurokars.com.sg>

Subject: YOUR REF: SIZ6559K / OUR REF: SLN2Z904M THIRD PARTY CLAIM (REQUESTING FOR SURVEY AND A DIRECT
SETTLEMENT)

YOUR REF: SJZ6559K / OUR REF: SLN2%04M THIRD PARTY CLAIM (REQUESTING FOR SURVEY
AND A DIRECT SETTLEMENT)

Dear Sir/Mdm,



Kindly arrange the survey of our client's vehicle ASAP.

Attached s the ESTIMATE, SAS REPORT, SKETCH PLAN for your perusal.
L aise with Vion for survey arrangement.

Best Regards,

Samuel Ng
Irsurance Claim Officer

. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW. avg.com



