Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, July 18, 2018 4:56 PM

To: Yap Chee Ling

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: GBB3487A | MT/1003345 [DOA: 17/07/2018] - MV requisition

Dear Chee Ling,

The market value for GBB 3487A is $6,000 - $7,000 (Est) as at July 2018

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jannice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Yap Chee Ling [mailto:CheelLing.Yap@income.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, July 18,2018 3:59 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>; Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com>; Janice Lee
(LKKAuto) <JaniceLee@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: GBB3487A | MT/1003345 [DOA: 17/07/2018] - MV requisition

Hi,
Any updates please?

Thank you.

Yap Chee Ling (Ms)
Claims Executive
Motor Insurance

T +65 6430 7893
www.income.com.sg
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From: Yap Chee Ling
Sent: Wednesday, July 18,2018 2:44 PM



To: 'ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com' <ShirleyHiew @I|kkauto.com>; 'Denise Tay (LKKAuto)' <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; 'Janice
Lee (LKKAuto)' <JaniceLee@lkkauto.com>

Subject: GBB3487A | MT/1003345 [DOA: 17/07/2018] - MV requisition

Importance: High

Hi LKK,
Please assist to provide the MV.

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No. GBB3487A

Vehicle to be Exported No

Intended De-registration Date 18 Jul 2018
Vehicle Make VOLKSWAGEN

Vehicle Model CADDY 2.0

Primary Colour Silver

Manufacturing Year 2008

Engine No. BST087987

Chassis No. WV1ZZ772KZ9X048871
Maximum Power Output -

Open Market Value $23,428.00
Original Registration Date 23 Dec 2008
First Registration Date 23 Dec 2008
Transfer Count 0

Actual ARF Paid $1,172.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PAREF Eligibility No

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date -

PARF Rebate Amount $0.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date 22 Dec 2018

COE Category C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years) 10

QP Paid $6,189.00

COE Rebate Amount $264.00

Total Rebate Amount $264.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 18 Jul 2018

Thank you.

Yap Chee Ling (Ms)
Claims Executive
Motor Insurance

T +65 6430 7893
WWW.income.com.sg
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Disclaimer

This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the recipient(s)
named above. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all
copies of it. Thank you.



