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Celine Fnﬁ (LKKAuto)

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Fricday, 20 July 2018 2:.05 AM

To: ‘Darren Leg'

Cc Vanessa Ngoi; Jensen Ow

Subject: RE: QUOTATION FOR DESKTGP VALUATION JULY 2018 GBF7138K
Dear Darren,

The valuation of GBF 7138K is as below:

MV: 554K FS: 543K

Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LEEK Auto Consultants Ple Ltd

phone: 6256-a561 | email: celinefong@lkkautu.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pavt Ubl Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Darren Lee <Darren.Lee@hlbank.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 18 luly 2018 9:38 AM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAute) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Vanessa Ngol <Vanessa.Ngoi@hlbank.com.sg>; Jensen Ow <Jensen.Ow@hlbank.com.sg>
Subject: QUOTATION FOR DESKTOP VALUATION JULY 2018 GBF7138K

Dear Celine,
We would like to have a desktop Valuation tor GBF 7138 K
Attached with log card and picture

Thank you

Best Regards

Darren Lee
PF5 Credit Approval & Collections
HL Bank Singapore



Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Dajren Lee <Darren.Lee@hibank.comsg>

Sent: Wednesday, 18 July 2018 938 AM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAUG)

Co Vanessa Ngol; lensen Ow . _
Subject: QUOTATION FOR DESKTOP VALUATION JULY 2018 GBF7138K
Attachments: 04072018 GBF7138K zip; img-718093345-0007 pdf

Dear Celine,
We would like to have a deskiop Valuation for GBF 7138 K
Attached with log card and picture

Thank vou

Best Regards

Darren Lee
PFS Credit Approval & Collections
HL Bank Singapore
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nquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
ghicle Owner Particulars

at 10 Type Company

5500M ,

vehicle Details MV ¢ ‘#

GBFT138K

;I.Fah;cdla IOD;EIWHM. Yes a e % <? — Ykl = \{«}

intendad De-registration

Dl 28 Fab 2017

Vahicle Make: MISSAN

Vehlcls Model: NVIED PANEL VAN 2.5 SMT SDR EURC W

Prirary Calour, Binck W
Manufecturing Year: 2016 VY L.JL( Lf 'Caftau‘tt.. tfw

Enging No.: YD25410457A et te Teasn -‘”‘{ ?M L.A-L[A
Chassis No. JN1MCZE2EZ0007487 E,{ L-’L‘-.J\V Tb‘-iiu’&-\ -l.--l-’{ le 4 A-L/{

Miamiim Powar
Output:
Open Market Valus: £23,6688.00

Original Reglstratian
Dete.

First Realstration Date: 23 Feb 2017

23 Feb 2077

Transler Count: 1
Actuml ARF Pala: $1,184.00
Intended PARF Rabate Detalls

PARF Eugibliity No

PARF Ehgfollity Expiry
Dale

PARF Rebate Amount 50,00
Intended COE Rebato Details

COE Expity Dals: 22 Fab 2027

COE Calegory: C - Goods Vahicle & Bus
COE Peflod{Yaars): 10

POF Paid: $44,575.00

COE Rebate Amount:  $35,6680.00

Total Rebate Amount: $35,660.00
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