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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 1 August 2018 1:23 PM

To: ‘Irene Tan'; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Please let us have the pre-accident market value of FL2068H prevailing around

the date of accident on 1.3.2018; Our claim no.: 551222/IT

Dear Irene,

The market value of FL 2068H is $4K-$8K (Estimated) as at Mar 2018.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Irene Tan <irene_tan@sg.msig-asia.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 31 July 2018 5:02 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ilkkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D
(LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Subject: Please let us have the pre-accident market value of FL2068H prevailing around the date of accident on
1.3.2018; Our claim no.: 551222/IT

Importance: High

URGENT
Good afternoon Veron,

Please see attached and let us have the pre-accident market value of FL2068H prevailing around the date of
accident on 1.3.2018 asap or within the next 7 days by Tuesday, 7.8.18.

Best Regards

Irene Tan
Senior Executive, Claims Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6594 2541 | Direct fax +65 6225 7402 | irene_tan@sg.msig-asia.com

CLATYED Insurer Claims
MSIG A 1y’ Team of the Year
| IF-} 2016
MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Bu1ldmg, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220

w-‘ma
9644 | F; +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg é«ﬁ

AMember of TIRTA] INSURANCE GROUP



Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

von: (plis

Total Rebate Amount‘

$892. 0a

The information contained herem is correct as at 09 Mar 2018
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Vehicle Owner Partlculars

) VOwnerIDType Singapore NRIC ] cms\g)
Owner iD: 7440! N 7 7 A
Vehicle Details

” Vehfde No: : FL2068H
Vehlde to be Exported: No -
!ntended De~registratmn 09Mar2018
Date

V Vehide Make VESPA

| Vehlde Model EXCELP150XE )
Prlmary Colour 7 Red . . o N
Manufacturngear: 1993 -

7 Engine Nou VLX1M7;2493 ) :
ChaSSIs No Vt.)(lTﬂié;?? -
Maximum Pewer Output: - 7 o
Open Market Value: 7$1.755.0,0 -
VOrlgmal Registraﬂon Date 7 28 Sep 1993

; Flrst Reglstration Date: ' 285ep 1993 B

7 Transfer Count 3 B T

| Actual ARF Paid: © $26400
Intended PARF Rebate Details
. PARF Elgibity: ' No 7 -
} VPARF Eliglb lity Expiry Date. .
PARF RebateAmount: V $0.00M “ - ) B
| intended COE Rebate Details
WCOE Expary Date: - 31Dec 202é )
A COE Category. D -Motorcycle
COE Penod(Years) 10 - ) )
PQP Paid: * $1, 856, 00 )
' COE Rebate Amount: $89200




