Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 20 August, 2018 9:09 AM

To: Shaun & Bernice

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Accident involving SLR5332Y and SJW9463Z along Republic Ave on 29.07.2018

Dear Shaun,

We refer to your below email and the contents were noted.

Please be informed that we are still in the midst of finalizing the cost of repair to the claimant’s repairer.
We will get back to you for an update in due course.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

" Save the Larth Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Shaun & Bernice [mailto:shaunandbernice@gmail.com]

Sent: Sunday, 19 August, 2018 9:54 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Accident involving SLR5332Y and SJW9463Z along Republic Ave on 29.07.2018

Your Ref: CC6/A1G18013884/Uhb3
AIG's Ref: WSVC18001140

Dear Vic

| refer to your letter of 6 August 2018 (bearing Singpost's stamp dated 13 August 2018) on the above
matter.

Please note that all the relevant documents/details relating to the motor incident on 29 July 2018 had
been submitted online to AIG. This includes a USB thumb-drive containing video footage of the incident
which was mailed to AIG's office on 6 August 2018. As such, you may wish to check with them if you have
not received any of the above.



Meanwhile, could you update the status and outcome of your investigations and how much the counter-
party is claiming for?

Thanks.

Best regards
Shaun
Hp: 9620 5603



