Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com=

Sent: Thursday, & December 2018 8:52 AM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: RE: SEEK MANDATE; ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS, GBE

2849E(Ol) AND SLG 7610P(TP) ON 26-07-2018; LKK ref : CC4/LPC18013851/R1fb3;
Lonpac ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020791

Dear Poh Kin,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) [mailto:pohkin@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 28 November, 2018 7:27 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A

Subject: SEEK. MANDATE; ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. GBE 2849E(OI) AND 5LG
7610P(TP) ON 26-07-2018; LKK ref : CC4/LPC18013851/R1fb3; Lonpac ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020791
Importance: High

Our Ref: CC4/LPC18013851/R1fb3
Your Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020791

Dear Gerald,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 2849E (O1) AND SLG 7610P (TP) ALONG SPOONER ROAD
OUTDOOR CARPARK ON 26/07/2018

We refer to the above matter.

Liability: The accident occurred when our insured collided into third party parked vehicle while moving off
from parking lot. Liability is down against our Insured.

Summary to offer to third party repairer, Vermogen ACE Pte Ltd is as follows: -

_ Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $15,189.99 (514,196.25 + 7%) S 5,243.00 (54,900.00 + 7%)
2. Loss of Use $ 1,100.00 (5100.00x 11days) |S 600.00 ($60.00 x 10 days)
3. Towing fee S 50.00 $  50.00
4, GIA search fee S 2.00 ) 2.00

Total | $16,341.99 $ 5,895.00

**07 days recommendation for repair + 2 days PRI + 1 day weekend = 10 days
1



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuta)

Sent: Wednesday, 28 November 2018 7:.27 PM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN'

Cc: ‘MT_Claim_5G"; Admin A

Subject: SEEK MAMNDATE; ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. GBE

2B49E(OI) AND SLG 7610P(TP) ON 26-07-2018; LKK ref : CC4/LPC18013851/R1fb3;
Lonpac ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020791

Attachments: LKK ADJUSTMENT REPORT.pdf; LKK INSPECTION REPORT pdf; LKK RESURVEY
PHOTO-AFTER REPAIR.pdf; LKK SURVEY PHOTO pdf: TP LOD- SLG 7610P.pdf

Importance; High

Our Ref: CC4/LPC18013851/R1fb3
Your Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020791

Dear Gerald,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 2849E (Ol) AND SLG 7610P (TP) ALONG SPOONER ROAD
OUTDOOR CARPARK ON 26/07/2018

We refer to the above matter.

Liability: The accident occurred when our insured collided into third party parked vehicle while moving off
from parking lot. Liability is down against our Insured.

Summary to offer to third party repairer, Vermogen ACE Pte Ltd is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $15,189.99 ($14,196.25+ 7%) | S 5,243.00 ($4,900.00 + 7%)
2. Loss of Use S 1,100.00 ($100.00x 11 days) | S 600.00 ($60.00 x 10 days)
3. Towing fee S 50.00 S 50.00
4. GIA search fee S 2.00 S 2.00
Total | $16,341.99 5,895.00

**07 days recommendation for repair + 2 days PRI + 1 day weekend = 10 days

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The above is for your approval.



Vermogen ACE Pte Ltd

1 Buklt Batok Crescant

#05-23 Wecega Plaza

Singapors 6580654

Co. Reg No.:201606023C GST Reg No.:201606023C
Tel: 66094 4919 Fax:5694 4929
Email:vermogenacedgmail,com

¥r Ref : GBE2BASE (17/18/18/vP0s/020791)
Qur Ref : SLG7610P

08 October 2018

Attn: Motor Claim Dept

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

100 Beach Road
#19-00 Shaw Tower

Singapore 189702
Dear Sir/Mdm,

Without Prejudice

Accident involving SLG7610P & GBE2849E on 26/07/2018 03:15 hrs at SPOONER ROAD BLK 2 OSCP

We refer to the above said accident.

As instructed, we are claiming the following as stated below:-

Cost of repair

Loss of use {$100 X 11days)
Towing fee

GlA search fee

it O O

We enclosed herewith relevant document as stated below:-

Accident report
Final Repair Bill
Letter of authority
Towing receipt
GlA search receipt

i

s 5,243.00

. 1,100.00 -
5 50.00

s 2.00

s £,395.00

We do not have the survey report and photographs as our client’s motor vehicle was surveyed by

your appointed surveyor.

Please kindly let us know whether you are prepared to settle our client’s claim & we look forward to

hear from you soonest.
Thank you.
Best Regards,

Pila (Claim dept)
Vermogen ACE PTE LTD
Tel : 6904 4596 Fax: 6694 4929

Email: pila@vermogen-group.com
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Vermogen ACE Pte Lid

1 BUKIT BATOK CRESCENT #05-23 WCEGA PLAZA 5(658084)
TEL : 6694 4319 FAX ;5594 49728

Email | vermogenace@gmail.com

REG Mo : 20¥608023C

LETTER OF AUTHORITY & INDEMNITY

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO._ SIL 7S 1 oFr =
GBE2849E(DOA 26 JULY 2018
1ST1SHRERS) =

"We LCRF PTE LTD UEN/NRICNO.201624597Kowner of Vehicle No.SLGT610P___
Jhereby authorise M/S Vermogen ACE Pte Ltd to commence repairs to myvehicle andto
forward the claim for damages sustained in the above accident to the third party driver and
for his employer and for the vehicle owner and /or the nsurer concerned. |/We agree that in
consideration of you glving up your repairer's lien. |/We agree

to assign the whole proceeds of my/our third party claim to you and if applicable,our
solicitors (to be appointed by you on my /eur behalf) shall accept this as my four irevocable
authority to pay the amount compensated direct to you after deduction of their costs on a
solicitor & client basis. I/'WWe undertake to co-operate fully with you and our solicitors to see |
the claim to a successful conclusion.

Fthird party driver and and/or his employer and/or the vehicle owner and/or nsurer reject
liability, i'We will fully be responsible for the repair costs and other incidentals,

I'We also authorise you to sign all discharge vouchers/indemnity forms and all necessary
paper in connection with the above claim in mylour absence,

|/We authorise you to appoint such a firm of solicitors on my/our.behalf as you shall deem fit
for the purpose of the third party/own insurer's claim.,

liwe undertake to inform you and/or the solicitors appointed by you on my/our behalf in the
event of the third party’s insurance company communicate with me/us directly by telephone
or inwriting and I/'We further undertake not to accept any monies or offer of settlement from
the third party's insurers without first communicating with you.

My/our vehicle Is repaired by the repairer on my/our willwithout any inducement, threat
and/or promise,

I the event that the repairer is compelled to enforce this undertaking, /We agree that I/shall
pay for the legal costs incurred by the repairer on a solicitor and client's full indemnity basis.

L

Owner Signature
(Company Stamp if applicable)



TO:

Dear Sirs,
CLAIMANT :
ACCIDENT INVOLVING _ 5LG7610P and__ GBE2B49E
on
268 JULY 2018 Al ___SPOONER ROAD BLK 2 OSCP

IWWE LCRF PTE LTD, am/are the registered Owner of Vehicle No._SLG7610P

Please note that | have assigned all compensation monies due -to me/us in the above said
accident to Vermogen ACE Pte Ltd,

IiWe, hereby authorize you to release all compensation monies pertaining to the above said
accident to Vermogen ACE Pte Ltd and forward your settlement chequeto Vermogen
ACE Pte Ltd whom lAve had authorized to collectthe said compensation monies .

Thankyou. ié";i !

Signature of Claimant
{company Stamp, if applicable)

Name me

NRIC Mo. :




ELED LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
2
LONPAL WITHOUT PREJUDICE to:
{a) Insurers’ Subrogated Claim andlor
AIMNO  17/18/18/VPOS/0207) ©) MYTF;'SSETQL”U‘;‘?::;”:E -
B ‘ ote: L]
DATE P &bkl vOL Enmnsislﬂnﬂiﬂﬂ found in thig
ischarge Voucher]
DISCHARGE VOUCHER mei

I/We, LCRF PTE LTD confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD and/or the owner of GBE 2849E the sum of Singapore Dollars Five Thousand
Eight Hundred Minety-Five Only ($5,895.00) in full and final satisfaction, liquidation
and discharge of property claim competent to me/us upon the said M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD in respect of property claim sustained by me/us whether now or
hereafter to become manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from an accident to
my vehicle, SLG 7610P on 26 July 2018 along/at Spooner Road.

[ /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (TREESCAPES PTE LTD
/LONFPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims whatscever made
by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to Mfs
VERMOGEN ACE PTE LTD.

I/'We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of

liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action. ;

Name of vehicle owner/Date



Vermogen ACE Pre Ltd
1 BUKIT BATOK CRESCENT #05-23

WCEGA PLAZA 5{658064)
TEL - 6694 4919 FAX : 5694 4919
CO. & GST REG MO : 201606023C

Tax Invoice: 20229

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Bill Date: 8/10/2018
100, Beach Road Vehicle No: SLGTE10P
#19-00 Shaw Tower Vehicle Model: TOYOTA AXIO
Singapore 185702 Date of Accident: 26/07/2018
Tel+65 625073 Fam:+ 296 3767 Claim No:

Attn: Motor Claims Dept

S/N QTY Descriptions Unit Price Amount 55

1 Lumpsum repair 4500.00

Total 55 4300.00
GST 7% 55 343.00
Amount Due 55 5243.00

for Vermogen ACE Pre Ltd™~ \



10VB/2018 . : ; Invaice

GENERAL IHSURAHGE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Rafiles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Dparathq Huu:rs: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE C°! Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE
Our Ref No: GR-18-115352
Date of Request: 271072018 Your Ref Mo: Online Purchase
Vermogen Ace Fte Ltd
Blk B, 44 Benol Rd
Singapore 629804
Dear SirfMadam,
Enquiry Date 27/07/2018 -
Enquiry By Lim Jian Zhi, Edmond
TP Vehicle No. GBEZ2B49E
Accident Date 26/07/2018
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S§)
TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You,

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature,

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[X] GIRO [ ] Cash [ ] Chegue

hl‘tpa:ﬂnhgapnrnJ'I'Im'lrn-n.mdulmsﬂndﬂ!.ﬂM?Mﬂhﬂ:=MTF:ﬂﬁlhmlcﬂm=dw_ﬂmhﬁpﬁmﬁd*1 871830&CFID=41883101&CFTOKEN=280... 22



e Ah D Mobile: 8588 8877
: A
SErEs Email : effizienttowing.sgiElgmail.com
24 Hours Towing Services Business Reg, No.: 53349344K

CASH SALE / JOB ORDER
Messrs: VW% M

ﬁcﬁclc No. %U:'-i' Flew¥ f{.ﬁﬂ No: ‘E\ﬁ'ﬂ"'\ ‘bw

stiE (B /&) e 85 520 D
Emc {day/night): M Contact Mo: % i
Location: Pu W E‘J

k1] =

To: b Bmel Sctdwe

45 55 A

Cash§___©0 Others:

o Tow Truck

Authorised By: D?-;u*nﬁcame: w h’j/

BE: RS Ads, ARG PR EH &SRR,
'_ﬁﬁ' -f'}- ﬂ 'ﬁ'ﬁ t!

Note: Vehicle is towed at owner's risk. The company sccepts no responsibility
for damages or other misdemeanour to your vehicle whilst being towed,

Ei‘ficieh-t T;t)wing Services

403 Sin Ming Avenue-#13.307, Sin Ming Garden, Singapore 570403

no. 17702
Date :?BW

D Jump Start/Changing of battery
D Tyre Replacement
[] Accident/Breakdown
D Multi/Basement

[] with Load/Cargo Box
[J King Dolly

[] Transport Charge
[] Low Body Kit

[] Door Opening Service
[] Crane Up/Winch Out
[] Collect Doc/Key

D Repo

[[] Woodlands and Tuas Checkpoint

E.&0.E




