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TEO SPRAY PAINTING

= (INCORPORATED IN THE REPUBLIC OF SINGAFORE]
Reg. Address. BLOCK B, DEFU LANE 10, DEFU INDUSTRIAL PARK C, #01-558

SINGAPORE 539187 TEL:6283 5474 (2 LINES) FAX: 6287 2012
REG. NO, 275084 / 00X

T4
Yy
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. N A A«Z,_r,/
AlG Building
78 Shenton Way #07-16 AP
Singapore 079120 V4 v_‘i’?
Tel: 64193000 7 (;
, / P
Fax: 68357416 25/ /};ﬁ, y
':,,{n ;L('M ZA
Dear Sir/Madam 27.07.2018
/2R 357(:
RE: THIRD PARTY CLAIMS FOR FBH7937K AGAINST YOUR s
INSURED SKR7514M, ACCIDENT ON 11.07.2018 AT
JUNCTION OF ROCHOR ROAD AND BEACH ROAD
I LAMP STAY 7Cg g750 X
2 EXHAUST COVER ¢l 8 27.00 —
3 EXHAUST BLACK COVER tuls 2400
4 SIDE COVER INNER M1s 7200 X
5 SIDE COVER OUTER uls 7200~
8 HANDLE BAR $«f § 8700 e
$ 34950 7~ J’I‘rj{,
Less 10% § 3495 T
—_— 159
Sub Total $ 31455
NETT ITEM e
1 LABOUR CHARGES $ 22500 °
2 ENGINE OIL 44 81800 X
Total $ 243.00
Sub Total S 55756
Thanks

TSP



) S Y <
E TEO SPRAY PAINTING

(INCORPORATED IN THE REPUBLIC OF SINGAPORE)
Reg. Address: BLOCK &, DEFU LANE 10, DEFU INDUSTRIAL PARK C, #01-558
SINGAPORE 539187 TEL: 6283 5474 (2 LINES) FAX: 6287 2012
REG. NO, 275084/ 00X

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

AIG Building

78 Shenton Way #07-16 ’3

Singapore 078120 -3

Tel: 64193000 22/ 7/c

Fax: 68357416 ) {A‘/ ‘s M”}”H
Dear Sir/Madam 27.07.2018

RE: THIRD PARTY CLAIMS FOR FBH7937K AGAINST YOUR
INSURED SKR7514M, ACCIDENT ON 11.07.2018 AT
JUNCTION OF ROCHOR ROAD AND BEACH ROAD

| LAMP STAY < § 6750
2 EXHAUST COVER Cur § 2700 —
3 EXHAUST BLACK COVER Cul s 2400 —
4 SIDE COVER INNER $ 72007
5 SIDE COVER OUTER Cun § T200—
6 HANDLE BAR Ya/ S 8700 o~
§ 34950
Less 10% 3 34.95
Sub Total $ 31455
NETT ITEM
1 LABOUR CHARGES § 2500 —
2 ENGINE OIL A1 5§ 1B.00X
Total $ 43.00
Sub Total é&
Thanks
TSP
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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry Page | of |
> Back to OneMotoring
Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner ID: 1227A
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.: FBH7937K
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended De-registration Date: 30 Jul 2018
Vehicle Make: YAMAHA
Vehicle Model: FZ165T
Primary Colour: Black
Secondary Colour: Red
Manufacturing Year: 2013
Engine No.: 4558010290
Chassis No.: ME14550B6D2010318
Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value: $2.417.00
Original Registration Date: 050ct 2013
First Registration Date: 050ct 2013
Transfer Count: 1
Actual ARF Paid: $363.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: No
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -
PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 04 Oct 2023
COE Category: D - Motorcycle
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $1,703.00
COE Rebate Amount: $881.00
Total Rebate Amount: $881.00
Message

The information contained herein is correct as at 30 Jul 2018
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« Pre fpaif inspection request - FBHTHITM VS SKRTS14M (01 DOA: 11072018

Fom  Mingsengh Reafmeenieniime

ot asen-afflibe pate o mIEgnrEOIED A sls care

T T Lhy (AG) Fang, Aoy far Ben Omn LeeTieg, b Messe, N Mermsa. Wi inres, Watif imess, Line Sfang Yarg. Suprsrmaes, Dashars, ddian Byatavtin Chan foba B
Berm  TTTCRONE A VT 0N P

Amscrran [ umpumin g

HL
Puamse rufar io the snciossd request om Teo Spray Painting

Kirisly carty ouf Palicy coverage verfioaton firgt before contuciling the pre-raoes napsction wilhin 48 fours

445 ::l;:qlle
iﬂmﬂmﬁmﬁﬂ'ﬁmmmmw f’!llﬂn@ 'R
T e AW O 20|ctle

I oaprmes Ciaimd Adsaman i
505 Clme=a (irarmers | AIG Bhared Services

From: irene Suan [maiio-inens @sosprayirading com.sg)
Sent: Frday, July I7, 2018 4108 PH

Ton Mimaosngh, Asshweenjeetiaur
Subject: fe: FRE-REFUR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OLR INSURED VEHICLE SKRZE14M AMD FRHTSITR ON 11077018

Cood afemoon,

W choose Marcus Chua ol LKK
Thanka

Jy = 7SPMOTOR

X MORE

On Fr, Jul 27, 2018 at 318 PM, Mitboomingh, Aashweenpeetiaar “Apsnween|estiaurMithocsingh@aig com™ wrote:
Without Prejudice

Vi Relersnce FRHT9ATE
Ot Meference SKERTSI4M
Diear Sis/Miudam,

W refer 1o your Nonee of Accident of even date,

"N-lm»m:WﬁWHMWumM'mW.Mwymﬁmmm W pruposs @ use one of the Mot
wrveyors samed m e aftachesd i comiduct the joom pre-repsar wrvey a4 8 single joint espert:

Nume of Survevor _E_ﬂlr Name

Fen Wong AIG Axia Pacific Insurance Tie Lid
Kaurnar Uthaya AlG Asin Pucific Insarance Pre Lid
Forig Soon Yee AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Ple Lid
Lawrznce Ng Chun Kee Priority Services
Jefftey Ong Leng Kine Priarity Services
Jimmmy Lee Priority Services
EC Lo Automotile Inspection Services Pie Ligd
Pung Kiah Keen (Franksc) Formizarm Adjusters Pre Lid

| Ng You Han Farmteam Adjusters Pre [id
Soon HanXin (Gary) Formteam Adjusters Pre Lid
Chow Bo Xi Farmiesm Adjusters Pre Ltd
Chua So0 Teck (Henjamin) | Formbenm Adjusters Ple Ll
Kalvin Ang LEE Awo Conaultants Pye Lad
Hing mgﬂ LEK Auto Comultans Pac Lid
Marcuys Chus LKE Auto Conaultands Pre Lid
Mahamad Teufikh LEE Auto Connultants Pre Lid
Adrian Ling LEX Auto Conwltants Pre Lid
Maohumemed Rasul LEK Auto Comuliungs Pre Lid

[ Kenneth Kong KK Auto Consultunis Piz Lid




Pleass fet ua kaow wathin two (1) woeking davs whesher you agres © ithe appoistment of any of tes motor surveyors s 8 single wint expert. You may select one of more of
the Aistned smustor marveyors. We will bear B cou of the preropalr survey sarmmd out by the single gom svpent

Thmmis and regards.

Laxt jaed Kaur |Ranh I

G

Exmasd Carms Ad)uster ||

B3 Canmy Opeeatioes | ARG Shated Secvcos

IMPORTANT ROTICE:

The informatian in this email {and any sttachments) i confideniial 1f you are not the imended recipient, you maus not use or diseminaie the miormation. [ vou kave
teceived this emall in error, please immediately notify me by “Reply” command il permanently delete the origingl and sny cophes or printouts thereal Although this
email and amy arischments are believed 1o be free of any viru or other defiect thar might affect sny computer yystem mio which it s received and opened, i is the
respansibility of the recipsent 1o enisure that it is vines free and no responsibility s sccepted by American International Oroup, Inc. or ks subsidiaries or affil labes
either jointly ar severally, lor sy loss or damage srising in any way from it e

IMPORTANT MOTICE:

The ifuUrIRIG = Fus e (AN ary Stachments) (s soefigenisl I o s nof e niseoed mapent, o musl A0l e o s Te FRion 1f pus heve eseed e BT e pEEe
immmSasay naity ma by Taphy” command and peTmanantly dulel e cging sed BNy copes ot Frvuts el Altheug® s small Bnd sy SEAZMERTS S8 SEseved & be Fee of vy wina o Sifer
“uwmnmmmmlnmnu—-l-hmﬂhmumhllnmmwum;mﬂhlﬂm
Irprmatonal Dreug e or ite sutasanes o affilaies sdhee minity & levacsly for any iSee o SEMBgE BNKING N BRy wiy YoM B e
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Br14/2018 Marimen e-Claims

. View Received Message

Thes mail is associated with @

“FBM7937K (06088768155G)
[SKR7514M]
™

AHMAD TARMIZI BIN ABDUL RAHIM
Jul 11 2018 B:25PM
[MELATT OKA MASAGUNG]

Teo Spray Painting

feoly | Resly All | Mark as Unread | Print Message | Delete Message | Forward

From AIG Asim Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd, (AIG_5G), sent on 06/08/2018 10:10 AM.

Te LKK_HG

cc NoorManess Abukassm@aig.com; ShengYang Lim@ag,com; Imran Ishak@ag.com; yokeshi chan@aig,com; Darshene.Sopramaniamifial
g.com; Syarairdina Azlan@aig.com; Aashweenjeetiaur MithoosinghiBalg. com

Subject Re: No OI GIA Report (SKR7514M VS FBH7S37K)

[HI Shu Pe|, |

Ol has not reported yet. Kindly find O| detalls sent in merimen |

Thaiks and regards,

Syaza Irding Azlan

<-— Original Message -

From: LKK_HQ

To: AlG_SG; NoorMariesa. AbukassimFaig.com] ShengYang. Lim@aig.com| Imranshak@aig.com; yokashi.chan@aig.com;
Darshene. Supramaniam@aig.com; Syazalrdina Azlanialg com,; AashweenjeetiaurMithoosingh@alg.com

Sent On; D6/0E/2018 09:54 AM

Subject: Re: No Ol GIA Report (SKRTS514M VS FBHT937K)

Dear Sir / Madam,
Kindly advice whather insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured's accident repoart for our necessary acthon.
Thank you.

Besg Aegards,
Shu Pel| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Fte Lid

<= Original Message -->

Frem: AIG_5G

Tor LKK_HQ

Sent On: 31/07/2018 01:22 PM

Subject: No Of GIA Report (SKR7514M V5 FEHT93ITK)

Hi

Fig be adwce that no O GIA repar received
Pis find Ol details below for your further actions

O name * Melati Oka Masagung

Agdress
25 Anderson Road ‘

Avalon Apartment #10-05
Singapore 259986

Mobile Ne' $62B8088
Thank you

Regards

Syaza Irdina Axtan

BDCUM!HTE_#_UHH!.RY
There are no documents,

hittps-/feingapore neriman comiclaims/index.cim Husebox=5VCmall&iuseaction=dsp_view&mode=14&linboxid=1331847&IDomainid=114i0b|ld=64. ., 1/2



S1UBLAVE L #0123 PAYA UBLINDESTRIAL PARK, SINGAPURE S08933 TEL : (0631 GIERA50] FAN (065} 61560315

Our Ref: CCHAIGIB013822/Ueb3

14™ Aug 2018

Melati Oka Masagung

25 Anderson Road

Avalon Apartment #10-05

Singapore 259986

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKR 7514M AND FBH 7937K ON 11/07/2018 ALONG/ AT
ROCHOR ROAD & BEACH ROAD

We. LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd has been appointed 1o act on the behalf of your insurer, AIG
Asia Pacific Insurnnce Pre Lid (AlG) 1o settle a THIRD PARTY cluim agminst you for an accident
which happened on the above-mentioned date and location.

Kindly proceed to lodge your GIA report within five (05) working days of receipt of this letter,
giving the version of the accident mmongst other things related to the accident, The GIA report
can be lodged at any of AIG reporting centres, You may refer to your Certificate of Insurance for
the list of the reporting centres.

If vou have any information to add or any amendments to make, please contact the undersigned
within five days from the date of this lerter,

Please note that the standing of vour insurance policy such as NCD, premium & etc would be
affected.

Yours faithfully,

A\

Asher Sng

Claims

Tel : 6841 6051

Fax: 6741 4108

Email : AsherSng @ Ikkauto.com

.. Claims Munager
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lrd
{Muotor Claims Dept)



Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 28 November 2018 10:24 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 06088768155G-003 || Accident Involving SKR7514M / FBHTI3TK an
11/07/2018

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Hi Asher

You have my mandate to reject TP claim with the resultant PIR against TP for inconsiderate driving.

Please upload Ol vehicle photos in merimem as well,

Best Regards

Bennie Tan

AlG

Senlor Complex Claims Examiner

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1718 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416

Bennie-WZ Tan@aig.com | www aig.com.sg

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto; AsherSng@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, November 08, 2018 2:50 PM

To: Tan, Bennle-W2Z

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 06088768155G-003 || Accdent Involving SKR7514M / FBH7937K an 11/07/2018

Hi Bennie,

We refer to the emall below,

TP reported that Ol move forward and hit onto his stationary vehicle.

Ol reported that TP make a right turn from Ol left side and hit onto his vehicle.

We are of the opinion that liability is not In third party favour as TP committed an offence of Inconsiderate Driving.

In view of the above, we are intending to reject TP claim.



For your approval/ comments/ instruction,

Thank You.

Bast Regards,

Asher Sng | Cote Hondler

LEK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

phons: 4841-4051 | emoll: gghenngBlkkauta.com | fox 474)-4108
Bl 51. Foya Ubi Indushial Pork. Ui Avenue 1, #03-25 | 5|408733)

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ.Tan@alg.com>

Sent: Monday, 29 October 2018 2:59 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Our Ref: 06088768155G-003 | | Accident Involving SKR7514M / FBH7937K on 11/07/2018

Hi Asher

Referring to the above matter handled by you.

Fyl, Injury claim received from TP rider and Insured has received PIR against TP rider, (See attached)

Fyna pls.

Best Regards

Bennie Tan

AIG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1718| Fax+{65) 6835 7416

Bennie-WZ Tan@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this emall (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not
use or disseminate the information. If you have received this emall in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply”
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any
attachments are belleved to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it Is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility Is
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or
damage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The Information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipiant, you must not

i



use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email In error, please immediately notify me by "Reply”
command and permanently delete the original and any coples or printouts thereof, Although this email and any
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or
damage arising in any way from its use,



Asher Eni (LKKAuto)

From; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 9 April 2019 337 AM

To: irene@teospraytrading.com.sg

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBH 7937K AND SKR 7574M ON 11/07/2018
Attachments: SKETCH PLAN.pdf; OI PIR.pdf

Your Ref: FBH 7937K
Our Ref: CCA4/AIG18013822/Ueb3

WITHOUT PREIUDICE”
SAVE ASTO COSTS

Hi Sir/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBH 7937K AND SKR 7514M ON 11/07/2018

We attached here with a copy of our insured’s accident statement and our insured police investigation result for your
easy reference.

Our principal has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client make a right turn
from left side of our insured and your client was charged by the traffic police for inconsiderate driving.

We are of the opinion that liability is not in your client’s favar.

Under such a circumstances, we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable
to look into your client’s claim.

Thank You.

Bett Begoidy,

Asher Sng | Coase Handier

LK Aulo Consultanis Ple Lid

phone; 6841-46051 | emoil: gthesngSkkgyln com | fox &741-4108
Biic 51, Paya Utd Ingusiricd Porke, Ubd Avenue 1. #02-25 | 5(408733)
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Asher SnE (LKKAuto)

From: Tan. Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ.Tan@ajg.com=>

Sent: Monday, 29 October 2018 2:59 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: Our Ref; 06088768155G-003 || Accident Invalving SKR7514M / FBH7937K on
11/07/2018

Attachments: PIRjpg

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Hi Asher

Referring to the above matter handled by you.

Fyl, Injury claim received from TP rider and Insured has received PIR against TP rider. (See attached)

Fyna pls.

Best Regards

Bennle Tan

AlG

Senior Camplex Clalms Examiner

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1718]| Fax +{65) 6835 7416

Bennie-WZ Tan{@alg.com | www.aig.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The infarmation in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not
use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply”
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
recejved and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by American international Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or
damage arising In any way from its use.
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Revoked [ Ne sethlemant

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING |

Case | Notified Est Submated | Ad) Assigned | Ad) fipt [Ag) Sutmittes | Ins Auth'ed Status
130 Jul 2018 J0 0 se330.00 |5$339.00 m forBunyey |
i Mairy | _Eait Rea | e agyme | | Hn[m-unl! view Rt | Cancel Case |

Main Reference Clalm Detalls

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS |[Created by adjuster]
{Insured: MELATI OKA MASAGUNG, ID: F2262227R

Main .

o o AMMAD TARMIZI BIN ABDUL RANIM, D: 581712274
Vehicle Reg, ; (11072018 20:00 - :59

Mo FBHT937K Date of LasS: | 157 Months and 6 Days From LTA fieg Date (Man Yr)]

TP / DEDBB7EB155G :‘:::"’H"g“" |2100504282-01 (Comprohensive)

Policy Mo.
SHRTS514M (Ciaimant):
Excess: |
Teo Spray Painting (HQ) BLK & DEFU LANE 10, DEFU IND PARK C #01-558, 539187 Defu Lane - Tel:
AlG Azla Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. (Express) - Tel 65-6215-3000 ... [Handled by Tan, Bennle-WZI - 6415 1T18] 8=nnie-
WZ . Tanidaig.com

ME1G Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: +65 GE27 7888

|ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View Al | Compase Case Mail |

's AIG_SG (06/08/2018): Re: No O GIA Report (SKR7514M VS FBN7937K)
* AIG_SG (31/07/2018): Reguest To Upload TP GIA Report
« AN SG[11/07/2018): Mo O GIA Heport (SKA7S14M VS FAH7937K)

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS— view Al | Search Tasks | Crests New Task | Complete

Due Date Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Donae?
o resuns

hitps://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp_... 15/4/2019
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Claim Documents

*FBH7937K (060BB768155G)
[SKR7514M]
™
AHMAD TARMIZI BIN ABDUL RAHIM
Jul 11 2018 8:25PM

Page | of |

[MELATI OKA MASAGUNG])
Teo Spray Painting

| Assessment Reports 1 par 1| ™ |
Na | Finalized On [A1G Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (5G) | Thumbnall| Print|

’ Accident Statement |
1 ___WE"'“ 11:51 Prom:SS - Nag. No: SKRPU L4, Ciaimant: MELATE DKA MASAGUNG O | Load v |
Photos/Images 3 par page wil & |
Mo | Relatrel/Reorder | LKK Auto Comsultants Pta Ltd (HQ) Thumtinall| Print
I 11/04/19 14:54 | LKK INSPECTION PHOTOS —_—— © | caaror
r! |11/04/19 14:54 LEK RE-INSPECTION PHOTOS o Load POF | |
fbmmmtlun B o h o ';ww TT A
(Mo | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Aute Consultants Pte Lid (HQ) | Thumbsnall| Print
0 [J107/18 19:32 | EMAIL_FROM_AIG_DD_27072018 Load POF
4 J1/07/18 19:22 WHSP_NOTICE Load POF
3 14/DA/18 20:56 | TP POLICE REPORT Load POF |
4 14/08/18 20:56 | TP GIA REPORT Load FOF
5 |15/08/18 09:24 Hon reporting letter | Load POF |
1& | 09/04/10 0O:28 APPROVAL TO REJECT TP CLAIM Load POF
|No | Finalized On !llﬂl.ill Pacific Insurance Pio. Ltd, (5G) Thumbinail | Print
|1 [20/10/18 14:51 | PIR against TP rider (le FEH7S37K) D | ldivc | B

Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST N

There are no document chacklists configured,

Our - LK Pre Ltd (HQ) |
vi
Show Remarks Tor [ Handiing Insurer
Hote! SeEanii T BRVALE BURSS YOu SWaw | 1B other Sactie
https://singapore.menimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 15/4/2019
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd co reg no 1ess071smm

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax' 6844-8805 Email: sur@ikkauto. com;assignmentsi@ikkauto com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/AIG18013822/UEB3Q2

Data: 15/04/2019
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Policy No: 2100504282-01
Claimant Vehicle ¢g117037k Insured Vehicle No : SKR7514M
Date of Loss: 11072018 Mature of Claim: TP Claim No: 0BDBBTEE155G
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: FBHTSITK
Make & Model: YAMAHA FZ185T, 153cc (M) Engine No: 4558010280
Req. Date: 05/10/2013 (Man. Year: 2013) Chassis No: ME145S0BED2010318
Colour Red/Black Odometer: 92487 km
Engine Capacity 153 cc
Market Value/Mew Car Price; N/A
Sum Insured (55); Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
Genearal Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceabls): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabla): Yes Engine Modification Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size 100/80-17 Rear Tyre Size: 13077017
Front Lefi Side: Pirelli 8 mm Rear Lafi Side: Pirelll & mm
Front Right Side: 0mm Rear Right Side: O mm
The sbove valuss represen the remaining fyre ireads deoth
(COST OF CLAIMS ~ Repalrers Adjuster's Difference _ DIff %
Parts 33255 189.00 143.55 4317
Miscallanaous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 225.00 150.00 75.00 333
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Natt Amount [S§) 557.55 339.00 218.55 39.20
Global Sum Settlement (55) 0.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 30/072018
Date Inspected: A0/077/2018 Inspected At: Teo Spray Painting (HQ)
BLK 6 DEFU LANE 10, DEFU IND PARK
C #01-558
Singapore 539187
Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days

Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA

Manager: Asher Sng Rong Yi

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 15/4/2019
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NOTE: This repor represents our findings af e lime and piece of inspection stated Ao, Such nspection has boen carried oot o he best of our
knowledgs and ahifity but any other fahitify under sy otfer clrcumstances is hersby srpressly pxclugad,

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 15/4/2019
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
Mo. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 "LAMP STAY Repair 67.50FL *FL
2 1 ‘EXHAUST COVER Cut 27.00FL *27.00FL
3 1 *EXHAUST BLACK COVER Cut 24 DOFL *24 DOFL
4 1 *SIDE COVER INNER Mol Necessary T2.00FL *FL
5§ 1 *SIDE COVER OUTER Cut T200FL *T2.00FL
-] 1 *HANDLE BAR Bent B7T.00FL *BT.00FL
7 A *ENGINE OIL Not Necessary 18.00FS “-FS
F=Franchisa part. 5=SpcNetl. L=LiatitamDisc
Sub Total (S§) 367.50 210,00
- List tem Discount on L Items 10.00/10.00% (S$) 3495 21.00
Total Parts (5%) 33255 189.00
[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out, I
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 15/4/2019



Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4

Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellansous items selected.

Recommended Labour

Ne Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 LABOUR CHARGES New 225.00 150.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 225.00 150.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 15/4/2019



