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' Pl V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

- - -
i B =
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Rag. No 199507 198R G5T Reg No. 19-8807196-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automaobile

FWD SINGAPORE PTELTD Ref CC4/FWD18013806/Keb3
416,01 SUNTEC TOWER 4SINGAPORE 038086 D¥te  30:07:2018 ” ‘llll"”lmm“ll
Code : FWD
1k Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SLG 2726Y Veh. Inspected SJP 3775A
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 30/a7/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c o
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Maodification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date 25/07/2018 |1nsp-nnﬁan Date Jovzose
Survey held at  KING'S AUTO SPRAY PAINT PTE. LTD
160 SIN MING DRIVE #05-10 SIN MING AUTOCITY SINGAPORE 575722
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS
B)IN ACCORDAMNCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,




l-“lﬂﬂ'lri PARFICOE Rebate Enguiry
. »Back to OneMotoring

Eaquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Owrizr |0 Type: Simgapare MRIC
Owrar (D 05510
Vehicle Detalls
Wehichs Mo SIPITTSA
Vehicle to be Exparted No
Intended De-reglstration Date: 01 Aug 2018
Wehiche Make: MERCEDES BENZ
WVehicle Model: E220 AUTO
Frimary Colour; Blug
Manutacturing Year; 1997
Engire Mo 11196022104028
Chasshs Mo WOB1240326C 288427
Maimium Pevesr Output: =
Open Market Value 2307200
Original Regivtratlon Date: 13 Aug 1968
First Registration Date: 13 Aug 1998
Tramfer Count: ]
Actusl ARF Paid: §32.301.00
Intended PARF Rebate Detalls
PARF Eliglblity: Farfeited
PARF Ellgibdlity Expiry Date: .
PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Exgiry Date 31 Mar I028
COE Category: B+ Car {1401cc & abeve)
COE Period{Vears): 1o
POP Pald: $44.998.00
COE Rebate Armount: $431,48500
Total Rebate Amount: 32348500

The informaton contained herein i cormect as at 01 Aug 2018
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_. Asher Sng (LKKAuto) D —

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 7 August 2018 9:54 AM

To: 'venking13@hotmail.com’

Subject: RE: Accident involving SLG2726Y & SJP3775A on 25/07/2018 (FWD Ref:
1201800009514)

WTHOUT PREJUDICE

Hi Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter,

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under BOLA
(subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to your
client’s vehicle.

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the
days of LOU/ LOR will base on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at her DID 6841 6051

In order to expedite the claim process, please forward all relevant documents to us (LKK) to proceed on negotiate
settlement.

Thank You.

Baat Regoarcly

Asher Sng | Cosa Handler

LEK Auto Consullants Ple Lid

pnone: sBd 60531 | emaoi gehenng@kkaulo com | fox: 4741.4108

Bl 51, Poya Ut ingustial Pork. Libl Avernue | 202225 | S(408F33)

From: ALEX QUEK [mailto:venking13@hotmail.com]
Sent: Saturday, 28 July, 2018 10:09 AM

To: Josey Loh Kah Wai - SGUser

Subject: Sjp3775a

Sent rom my samsung Galixy smuartplione

ATTENTION:



The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the use of the

* individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please notify the sender

" immediately and delete this emall and any attachments from your system. You should not use, disclose, copy or store
this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any attachments
at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT been scanned for viruses
by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any attachments.



Claim Audit

/= AUDIT TRAIL

| e On J‘l.nrh; Hormaras By
i fﬂi;: 2018 ¢y veh Model Changed (205120) MERCEDES-BENZ £220 2.0 (A). L’,‘ﬂu"f'"'ﬁ
30 Jul 2018 Reg No: SIPI775A, Acct Date: 2018/07/25. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: FWD Singapore Pt (o Lol
2 ; Clm Created & Ltd. [HQ). TP Insurer: AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ), Workshop: King's Auta Spray Pal |
14:55 né Pre L1g (HQ) Shu Pei |
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30 Jul 2018 ) [A) Lau
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1]
310012018 Cim Registration B :
? 350 gl Pol Not->PNFV2017-00006998. lnL:ﬁv
{1
31 Jul 2018  Cim Registration Ve
] 16:21 Modified Excess: -> 100000, .'IE::y
01 Aug 2018 Adj Im, Advice . . [A] Lau
% Y3ia o Bsededep: Next RptiFinal Rpt.Oue Date:2018/08/08 Sha Pel
JOANNE
10 0o 307 1% adj Rpt Tnitiated LEE
= KHANG
MIN
mﬂne
11 2120 300 eym o Modified IPJ Reg. Date: -> 1998/06/13. LEE
: KHANG
MIN
Ja.tn?qlue
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: KHANG
MIN
Sep 2018 .n.-ii:l
21 Sep § er
13 Label Added (2000%): Direct Settlement . 5
Rong ¥i
Sie e Cur.Req: 10550.00:LIABILITY: 100% B:24 OID EXIT PARKING LOT HIT TP QUANTUM: AL;]”
14 82w Adj Mandate Request () COR : $5,500.00 + (b) LOR : $1,050.00 (7days x $150) Total: 2+b = $10,550.00 P "2/
LEASE REVERT WITH YOUR AFPROVAL / MANDATE / INSTRUCTIDNS, [F ANY, i :w
Date From 4|7 »| pateTo 4| T » | Audit Type None v o
ACTIVITY I =————==
Mo record
Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History - o =
01/08/2018 LK Auto LKK Auto
LBT66S2 1250 Maotor Consyltants Pte | Consultsnts Pte SIB3TI5A SLG2726Y 10.70

Led Ltd (HQ)



Print Received Message

This mall is associaled with

*SJP3TTSA (1201800009514)
[SLG2726Y]
™
YAP SUEN MEI CELESTIAL THERESE
Jul 25 2018 4:00PM

[Daniel Higgins]
King's Auto Spray Paint Pte Lid

From FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd. (HQ) (FWD_SG), sent on 18/110/2018 10:47 AM,
To LKK_HO

Subject  Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (5§10550.00) - 5JP3775A - Claim Handler: Clara LI 2i Rong

Approved: 10550.00.




FWD SINGAPORE PTE. LTI,
6 TEMASER BOULEVARD,
#18.01 SUNTEC TOWER FOUR,
SINGAPORE 038986

Attn: Motor Claims Dept

Dear Sir/ Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLFE NO SJP 3775A & SLG 2716Y ALONG
CLEMENTIST 13 ONAS/T2018

We are authorized by the owner of SIP 3775A their above claims.

I/'We therefore propose to claum from your as follows:

I Cost of Repairs S$ 9.500.00
2 loss of Hse/Rental (SS200 x 7 days) S§ 1, 400000
3. LTA Search Fee/GIA Repons S8

TOTAL S8 10,.900.00

Please let us have your reply soonest possible

Thank vou.

Y ours faithfully

S
/S z
< Z|
2 v
3 >
"\'?4 a0 f\?;



AUTHORISATION TO ACT

With regard to the accident involving my/our metor vehicle SIP 3775A and other{s) SLG 2726Y
on 25/07/2018 at/aiong CLEMENTI SY 13, [/We, YAP SUEN MEI CELESTIAL THERESE, NRIC/Company
Heg. Mo S69405610 hereby authorize and appoint KING'S AUTO SPRAY PAINT PTE. LTD (“Warkshop )

to act tor mefus for the purpose of maging a third party clam.

I/We turther authorize the Workshop to settle my/our above mentioned claim in any manner that
they deem fit and 1he Workshop is also authorized to receive any payment on my behalf for the

settiement of my/our claim with the chegue or paymient to be made in favor of the Workshop.

|/ We also knowledge that any settlement the Workshop may reach on my/our behall is on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basls insofar as the drivers/owners/ insurers of the other
vehicles are concermed.

Dated this 2 2 day of oet 2018

interpreted and/or witnessed by

GO n,f:‘% fw
o
) -
\@
Signature NoH Signature

O
Name f‘/_j {;:-_. %"1 Name ,f,glg,ﬁrfd_. UAP SUW ME
NRIC _@25 2574 /H MRIC _ﬂ#‘?bﬂféf D




RELEASE

| Claim Reference: | 1201800009512 B - T
 Surveyor's Reference: | CC4/FWD18U13806/Keb3 o
| TP Reference: | SIP 3775A

authorized by the owner ("Claimant” ) of motor vehicle $1P 37754 {"Vehicle”) to accept the sum of §10,550.00,
being the amount claimed for $9,500.00 (repair costs), $1,050.00 {loss of rental/ use), § - {loss of income),
S - {search fees) as compensation for the loss of or damage to the Vehicle, as a result of an accident
("Accident”} which occurred on 25/07/2018 (date of accident] at / along CLEMENTI ST 13 (location) invelving
vehicle no/s. 5JP 37754 and 5LG 2726Y

This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 31/07/2018 (date! at the Workshop.

We confirm that this acceptance is in full and final settlement of all claims arising from the damage to
the Vehicle {whether now or hereafter to become manifest], to the intent that FWD Singapore Pte Ltd and
all other persons, in particular the driver of $LG 2726Y be absolutely and tinally exonerated and discharged
from all claims of every nature and kind whatsoever which have been made or which may be made in respect

of 1his Actcident.

We also declare that we are authorized by the Claimant to recene the above compensation and we
have full authority to make the claim as set out above and to settle the matter on behalf of the Claimant in

any manner we deem fit

This settlement ls reached on a without prejudice and without admission of liability basis. As such, this
Release is not to be construed as an admission of liability on the part of FWD Singapore Pte Ltd, their
policyhalder and / or authorised driver and shall not be used as evidence in any claims and / or actlon which
may be lodged by any of them.

Dated this = “dayof __ < T 2018

CLAIMANT / Z?RTH
7 &
-8 =
Y L KSC
[Signed by the “Workshop” with Ce Stampl [FWD's appointed surveyor with Co. Stamgp)

For and on behalf of the “Claimant” For and on behalf of FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd.



’é King's Auto Spray Paint Pte Ltd
Blk (Ao SINMInGDF Ve ab-10 TinmingAuTaCity Iih G40 S5AR

ol 5% Cotanumpmver ssolepminatocity Trgtpas e
Tax Reg, No.: NA Business Reg No:! 201308328C

« Spray Painting of Motor Vehicle «

M/S ‘(A—F’ fn"ﬁd wE| CELEST/IAL JTHERESE INVOICE

SP NO.: 15256
Date : 5’ - ?"’ ' d g
Terms:
Vehicle Nn:s'jf? S35 A Mndel:ﬁjﬂmuaagﬂ;
Qty Description Unit Price Ag‘””“‘ .
RE: REPAIRS To SIP3775h
Cost ot repgirs at Proved Ay
"':/s FWP Singapas Pleitd fusuisinee
SurveNpr at /ar';P Sum Fipo | —
f;llggliq::tsn s;:f:l: ;::_: ;trﬁ:ed :_nd made payable to Total

King's Auto Spray Pain

Customer's Stamp / Sign Auffiorised Signature
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A —-Tu'b | | OFFICIAL RECEIPT
Bik 15 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector A #01-103

Rent&Drlue Singapore 575673 Tel: 6451 4450 Fax: 6451 4402

Pte Ltd (Co. Aleg. No. 201535358D) g, l N7 _]_ 4

- Date: :}'/r/;f
Racsived from /462 3Ven e ¢ A

the sum of Dollars (Oni{ ?‘Z’h‘- $¢n ;,,/ ,J'."-u;n.v" b/ vin / , 1./ 6). /}7 —

Being payment for S}'r-d. FLOLH ( T'/?/’J)"'* ;/J’/'{/)
my; DN.E: for RENT & DRIVE PTE LTD

2 [] cheque / Visa / Master ,
S | #0o/== ’ o;~




*g 3]1-’ 3:"!_‘)‘41\ M

. - ”

Ll L -
. m Blk 15 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector A #01-103
Rent &D rlve Singapore 575673 Tel: 6451 4450 Fax: 6451 4402
Pte Ltd

{Co. Reg. No. 201535359D)

VEHICLE RENTAL AGREEMENT NO. 10500
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Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Settiement

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

Cas2 | Natified Est Submitted | Ad) Assigned | Ad] Rot Adj Submitted | Ins Auth'ed Status T
30 Jul 2018 Pending for Survey
o H“.'h;l Iz:u 00:00 sn.mm ‘ v_ 0 J Report
i he | Ean Ady Ape | Cancsl Case |

Main Raference

| [Croated by adjuster]

CLATM SUBFOLDER DETAILS )
Insured: Daniel Higgine, 1D: G50004347
Hain YAP SUEN MEI CELESTIAL THERESE, 10 S63405610

Il:'-lllﬁ'hlﬂt'-
. [25/07/2018 16:00 - :59
SIPI775A Date of LOSS: | {239 Manths and 32 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)]

TP / 1201800009514 | RolCHEAVRT | pNpy2017-00006998 (Comprehensive)

Policy Ma.
|lumr:wr (Claimant):
N (Excess:  |581,000.00

fllnl IMnIprlf Paint Pre Ltd (HQ) BLK 160 SIN MING DRIVE #05-10 5IN HINﬁALﬂm 5?5?215in Ming - Tei:

| FWD Singapers Pta. Lid. (HQ) - Tel: 5727 5700 .. [Handied by Clara Ui 21 Rong]

| AXA Insurance Pre Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6330 7268
| LKK Auto Consultanis Pte Lid (HQ) - Tei: 6256-3561 ... [Handiea by KENNETH KONG] ... [Final Rpt due 08/08/2018]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view M0 |  Compose Case mail |
= FWD_SG (16/10/2018): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved [S$10550.00) - SIPIT7SA - Claim Handler: Clara U Z...
* FWD_SG (10/10/2018): Alert - Adj Mandate Maintained - S1IPI775A - Claim Handler: Clara LI Zi Rong

« FWD_SG (25/09/2018): Alert - Adj Mandate Maintalned - SIPITT5A - Claim Handler: Josey Loh

view Al | Search Tasks | Create New Task | Complete |}

ALL ASSDCIATED TASKS=
Created On Done? |

Due Date Priority Type Task Grougp Subject  Handlar Assigned By Completed On
No results

hitps://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp_... 1/11/2018



Menmen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SJP3775A (1201800009514}
[SLG2726Y]
™
YAP SUEN MEI CELESTIAL THERESE
Jul 25 2018 4:00PM

Page | of 2

[Daniel Higgins]
King's Auto Spray Paint PLe Ltd

Upload Documents | _Uplaad #hotos | _ Compose New Letter | View [View in Browser | <]
Letters/Correspondences 1 per page Ei .0
No_|Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbmall | Print|
1 |(Deaft) Third Party Express Settlement - Paymaent Broakdown [ NEET ]
Assessment Reports B [tperpoge  [V]| B4 |
Wo | Finalged On LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid {HQ) Thumbnall| Print
l: (0L/0A/18 12:50 | Adjuster Immediate Advice Load HTM |

Photos/Images 3 per page E v
Mo | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 2U0%16 14:37 | General View D | wws | B2
2 |21/091814:37 | General View . © | waarws | 2
3 |21/00/18 14:37 | Ganeral View 0| o | A
4 [20/00/18 14:37 | General View 0 | Lead g 2 |
5 |21/00/18 14:37 | General View D | eeawrs | B
6 |2Y00/18 14137 | General View D | tcaows |
7 |2109/18 14:37 | General View ﬁ Lead 196 |
8 |20/00/18 14:37 | General View D | eadws | B2
9 |[21/09/1B 14:37 | General View D | cadws | A
10 |2400/18 14:37 | General View 0| caaws | A
11 [21/08/18 14:37 | Ganeral View ﬁ Load PG | BA
12 |20/08/18 14:37 | General View 0 | swcws | A
13 |21/09/18 14:37 | Genersl View © | owws | B
14 |21/09/18 14137 | Geners) View © | oavs | |
15 (20/09/18 14:37 | General View - 0 | Lsaws | A
168 [21/09/18 14:37 General View 0 | adwc | B
17T | 21/09/18 14:37 General View o B | wes s |
18 21/09/18 14:37  Odometer Asading O | teadws | A
18 121/08/18 14:37 | General View 0 | orc | 4
I,’.“ 21/09/18 14137 | Ganersl View O | weaws | B
21 |21/09/18 14:37 | Geners] View D | cswe | A
22 |21/09/18 14:38 | Reinspection Photo D | lesdws | A
73 |21/09/18 14:33 | Reinspection Photo D s | A
24 |21/09/18 14:38 Reinspection Photo D | wwars | M
| Documentation I per page || B4
[No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 [30/07/18 14:57 | EMAIL FROM FWD DD 30072018 @ | Loed por

2 |30/07/18 14:57 | TP ESTIMATE D | Load pOF

3 [30/07/18 14:57 | TP GIA REPORT e @ | Losa ror

4 [30/07/18 14:57 | WKSP NOTICE 0| leadwrs | A

https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc...

/1172018
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Page 2 of 2

Letters/Correspondences 1perpage v} B |
Finakaed On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ) Thumbnail| Primt

5 [01/08/18 16:36 | TP ESTIMATE- MARKED o Load PDF

& [21/09/18 10:42 WORKSHOP INVOICE Load PDF

7 |[21/08/18 10:42 | RENTAL RECEIPT = Load PDF

& |11/10/18 16:26 | LTA PARF COE Rebate Details Load PDF

?’_H_E'Hllnl 07:37 AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load POF

10 (0111/18 07:37 | Release Voucher 0 | Losd poF

1101118 07:37 LoD I @ | Load ror

[No_|Finalized On FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd. (HQ) Thumbnall| Print

1 31/07/18 16:21 | Insured GIA Report © | tosaror |

Documents Checklist

| DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST

neset | Save | poew |

|Ther| are no document checklsts configured,

= Consultants Pte Ltd

Show Remarks To: [ Handling Imeurer
Motm BeTatl dee Preats yriesd pog ihos @ to obhe partios.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 1/11/2018



Preview Page | of |

NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM
THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
!"H"ohil:l! No: SLG2726Y (Insd veh) Model: ERCEDES-BENZ E220 2.0
SJPITTSA (TP veh) A)
|Date of Accident: |25/07/2018
Global Sum Settlement | | [ | Yes | [X] No
Repair Estimate -1 18,508.00
Final Repar Cost -1 8,500.00
Loss of Use 3 days at $0.00 per day
Rental (if any) -1 1,05000| 7 days
LTA / GIA Search Fee '8 0.00
Others: 5 0.00
-]
Final Settlement Sum ] 10,550.00
Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ ] YES [ X] NO (Kindly indicate
below)
A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability ____ 100 (%)

A Y i :
B) For GIA Registered W - BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenaria No

BOLA Liahility: (%) Assessed Liability (*): (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply
Remarks

Paymenl Instruction: Payea's Breakdown

1) |King's Auto Spray Paint Pte Ltd - 10,550.00
2) -
01 Nov
JOANME LEE KHANG MIN 2018
LKK Auto Consultants Ple Ltd Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
{Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice, Release Voucher, Authorisation to Act, Survey Report; Madical
Report/ Bill (if any)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_docl... 1/11/2018



Adjuster Report

Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd co reqne tsssor1sam
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408833

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6B44-BBO5 Email sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Flle No: CC4/FWD1B013808/KEB302
Date; D1/11/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer- FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd.  Policy No PNPV2017-00006998
A Vol sepsrren Insured Vehicle No :  SLG2726Y
Date of Loss: 25/07/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 1201800008514
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SJP3TT5A
Make & Modal: MERCEDES-BENZ E220, 2.0 (A) Engine No 11186022104028
Reg. Dale: 13/08/1998 (Man. Year, 1997) Chassis No: WDB1240226C 288427
Colour: Metallic Pearl White Odometer: 240750 km
Engine Capacity 2199 cc
Markel Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S§) Market Value/New Car Price
MDITION OF VEHI AT T
General Condition, Steering (Serviceabls). Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable), Yes
Handbrake {Serviceable) Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 205/55 R16 Rear Tyre Size 205/55 R16
Front Left Side Hankook 9 mm Rear Left Side: Hankook 8 mm
Front Right Side Hankook 8 mm Rear Right Side: Hankook 9 mm
Thee above values repressnt the remaining fyre eads dapih
COSTOF CLAIMS - - Repairer's Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %|
Parts 15,848.00 11.211.20 4 B37.80 2826
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2.660.00 1.890.00 770.00 28.95
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 18,509.00 13,101.20 5,407.80 29.22
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§%) 9,500.00
Nett Amount (S§) 18,509.00 9,500.00 9,009.00 48.67
+ Car Rental (7.0 x $$150.00/day) (S$) 1,050.00
Natt Liability (S5) 10,550.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 30/07/2018
Date Inspected 31/07/2018 Inspecied AL King's Auto Spray Paint Pie Lid (HQ)
BLK 180 SIN MING DRIVE #05-10 SIN
MING AUTOCARE
Singapore 575722
Estimaled Period of Repair 5.0 days

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen _...

171172018



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: Asher Sng Rong i

MOTE: This report nepresents owr findings af Me fime and place of inspection stafed herein. Such inspeciion has been camed out o the best of our
knowiledge and abiity buf any other lability under any other circumstances (& hersby axpressly excluded

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 1/11/2018



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4
REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-5G Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 21 Sep 2018)

Parts: 143 MERCEDES-BENZ E220 2.0 (A) (Catalogus:Mearimen Singapore 1.0)

Labour: Repairars (Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmilted, no print-code for SJP3TT5A)

Validity: These eslimales are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page

numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimale page
Further Info: ltems/values nol in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *

Recommended Parts

No. Oty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT DOOR Bent 2,050.00FL "2,050.00FL
2 1 “FRONT DOOR RUBBER INNER (50%) Necessary 443 70FS “246.50FS
3 1 *FRONT DOOR HANDLE OUTER Serviceable T8.00FL *-FL
4 1 *FRONT DOOR OUTER GARNISH Bent / Dented 1.133.00FL *1,133.00FL
5 1 *FRONT GARNISH MLDG Necessary 14B00FL *148.00FL
B 14 *FRONT GARNISH CLIPS Necessary 112.00FL *11200FL
7 1 “FRONT DOOR LOCK INNER Repair 546.00 FL *FL
8 1 *FRONT DOOR HINGES Repair 55.00FL *-FL
9 1 *FRONT DOOR HINGES LOWER Repair 132.00FL *-FL
0 1 *FRONT DOOR REGULATOR Distorted §29.00FL *529.00FL
111 *FRONT DOOR POWER WINDOW MOTOR Jammed 970.00FL *9T0.00FL
12 1 *FRONT DOOR CENTER LOCK MOTOR Serviceable 1.218.00FL *FL
13 1 *REAR DOOR Bent 1,785.00FL *1,785.00FL
14 1 *REAR DOOR GARNISH OUTER Dented / Cut 1,004 00FL *1,004.00FL
1 1 ‘REAR DOOR GARNISH MLDG Necessary 11200FL *112.00FL
16 14 *REAR DOOR GARNISH CLIPS Mecessary 11200FL *11200FL
71 *REAR DOOR HINGES Repair 120.00FL *-FL
18 1 *REAR DOOR HINGES LOWER Repair 132.00FL *-FL
1|8 1 ‘REAR DOOR POWER WINDOW MOTOR Serviceable 875.00FL “-FL
20 1 “REAR DOOR CENTER LOCK MOTOR Serviceable 87.00FL *-FL
21 1 *REAR DOOR RUBBER INNER (50%) Necessary 534 60FS "297.00FS
22 1 *REAR FENDER GARNISH SIDE Serviceable 150.00 FL *FL
23 1 *REAR BUMPER Dislorted / Cracked =~ 2,8900.00FL *2,800.00 FL
24 1 "REAR BUMPER CENTER GARNISH Dented / Cul 518.00FL *51B.00FL
25 1 *FRONT L/H ROCKER PANEL OUTER GARNISH Serviceable 1,133.00FL *FL
26 18 *FRONT ROCKER PANEL GARNISH CLIPS Nol Necessary 144 DOFL *-FL
27 1 *FRONT FENDER GARNISH SIDE Dented / Cut 50000FL *S00.00FL

F=Franchise pan. 3=Spchett. LeListhemDisc.

Sub Total (S§) 17,501.30  12,396.50

= List ltem Discount on L ltems 10.00/10,00% (S5%) 165230 1,185.30

Total Parts (S§) 15,849.00 11.211.20
Report was unsubmitied during this print-out ]
https:/singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 1/11/2018



Adjuster Repont Page 4 of 4
Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellansous items selocted.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO CHECK WIRING New 80.00 20.00
2 TO TRANSFER FRONT & REAR DOORS New 30000 120.00
MECHANISMS POWER WINDOW & CENTRAL LOCKNG
SYSTEM TO NEW DOORS
3 TO RENEW THE ABOVE MENTIONED PARTS New 780.00 650.00
KNOCKING .CUTTING,WELDING & STRAIGHTEN DAMAGED
PARTS
4 RESPRAY PAINTING New 1,500.00 1,100.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 2,660.00 1,890.00
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
< END OF ESTIMATES >
https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 1/11/2018



