Hsiao Tnna

From: Hsiao Tong

Sent: Monday, 8 December, 2014 917 AM

To: Saliha.Syed-Yusoff@aig.com

Cc CS A Team

Subject: Temporary Close File [Trans-Cab Auto Services Pte Ltd]
Dear Saliha,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that the following cases has been settled with TP repairer.

No: | Claim No: TP vehicle: | Ol vehicle: | DOA: Settlement Amount: | Date of settlement:

1. 8006832500 SHD 9597 GW B063A | 16/11/2012 | §1,420.00 31A10/2013

2. 800619808 SHC SJW 9710K | 01122012 | $980.00 31110/2013
5942M

3. 800565113 SHD GBB 4989L | 12/04/2012 | $940.00 01/07/2013
56670

4, 800685393 SHD SJX 748D 24/09/2013 | $1,578.32 20/11/2013
5138M

a. 800632500 SHD 5032J | SFJ 1279H | 13/01/2013 | $760.00 27/09/2013

. 800636391 SHD SFD 35858 | 30/01/2013 | $3,556.95 15/08/2013
9197H

We have given 10 days' notice to TP on 12/11/2014. However, up-to-date TP has yet submitted the supporting
documents to us.

In view of the above, we will proceed to tempaorary close the file and submit report to your good office.
If there are any new developments in future, kindly inform us and we will follow up if necessary.

Best regards,

Chew Hsiao Tong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1

#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
(S) 408933

DID: 6742 3197

Fax: 67414108

Email: chewht@lkkauto.com




Hsiao Tnnﬂ (LKKAuto)

From: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.comsg>

Sent: Monday, 23 July 2018 4:44 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)

Ce: jasminetan@transcab.com.sg; claims@transcab.com.sg; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto);
C5 A Team

Subject: RE: Pending Documents for Closure (Trans-cab) LKK REF: CC3/AIG13002833/Kp
TCS REF: AAD1301-357

Attachments: AADT301-357 - LOD.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Hsiao Tong

| 6. [SHD9197R | SFD 35855 | 30/01/2013 | $3,556.95|

Please refer to the above mention case.

Please proceed to send us the DV with amount $3,556.95,

"** Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@ transcab.com.sg

ﬁ'— TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
N No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111
,.-..,ca JE Main Line: [45) 6287 4666 Fax Line: (45) 6287 7764

Website: www tfranscab.com.sg

From: Hsiao Tong [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 12 November, 2014 11:28 AM

To: JasmineTan' (jasminetan @transcabservices.com.sg) <jasminetan@transcabservices.com.sg>;
claims@transcabservices.com.sg

Cc: Kenneth Kong <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Pending Documents for Closure (Trans-cab)

Dear Sirs/Madam,

Please let us have the supporting documents for the following cases in order for us to proceed further, -

No: | Your Taxi: Our Insured{AIG) | DOA: Settlement Amount:

T, SHD 9597 -GV-60634 -6t H2e12—1 31,420.00
2 SHC 5942M | SJW 9710K 01/12/2012 $980.00[
3 SHD-6667C | GBB 40801 12i04/2012 $840.00(
4 SHD 5138M | SJX 748D 24/09/2013 $1.578:32) -




) SHD 5032. SFJ 1278H 13/01/2013 $760.00

6 SHD 8197R | SFD 35858 a0/01/2013 33,556.95
-7 SHB 77720 S6Z 2016A— 1 261032014 — 5192247

8§— - SHE-9821H—{- 86V 5342G- 0704201 5505571

Appreciate if you could revert within the next 10days. Otherwise, we have our principal instruction to close the file at
our end.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best regards,

Chew Hsiao Tong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1

#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
(S) 408933

DID: 6742 31497

Fax 6741 4108

Email: chewhti@|kkauto.com




Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent; Friday, 27 July 2018 3:52 PM

To: ‘Syed-Yusoff, Saliha'

Ce: Admin A

Subject: Your Ref: 800636391 *Our Ref: CC3/AIG13002833/Kpa3w2-1[ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SFD 35855(01) AND SHD 9197R(TP) ON 30,/01/2013]

Attachments: Email to AIG dd 081214.pdf; AAD1301-357 - LOD.PDF

Your Ref: B0D&34371
Our Ref: CC3/AIG13002833/Kpadw2-]

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFD 35855(OI) AND SHD 9197R(TP) ON 30/01/2013

We refer to the above matter.

we have temporary close our file on Dec 2014 due to no submission of documents by third party.
Now, Third Party repairer had submitted all the relevant documents for payment(see attached).

In view of this, appreciate if you could assist to re-open the case in Merimen for our necessary action.

Mon 23/7/2018 4:44 PM
NW Ng Wai Yin <walyin.ng@transcab.comsa>
RE: Pending Documents for Closure (Trans-cab) LKK REF: CC3/AIG13002833/Kp ; TGS RER AADI30N-357

To Hsiao Tong (LEXAUtD)

jasminetan@transcab, com, sa; dams@transcab,com.sg; Kerneth Kong (LKKAuto); Bl S ATeam

K@ AAD1301-357 - LOD pdf
/~ 2MB

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Hsiao Tong

[6. | SHD9197R | SFD 35858 | 30/01/2013 | $3,556.95|

Please refer to the above mention case.

Please proceed to send us the DV with amount 53,556.95.

Thank You

| Best Regards,

! Mg Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

#&& plagce he reminded that all cloims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

1



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lud

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Bl 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



Hsiao Tuns (LKKAuto)

From: Khoo, Kay-Eng <Kay-Eng.Khoo@aig.com>

Sent: Friday, 3 August 2018 2:54 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: Your Ref: B00636391 *Our Ref: CC3/AIG13002833/Kpadw2-1]ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SFD 35855(01) AND SHD 8187R(TP) ON 20/01/2013]

Attachments: Email to AIG dd 081214.pdf; AAD1301-357 - LOD.PDF

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Case is now pending adjuster survey in Merimen.

Khoo Kay Eng

AlG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 078120
Tel +HB5) 8419 1026 | Fax +(B5) 6835 7416

kay-eng khoo@aig.com | www aig. com_ sq

Follow us:

IMPORTANT NOTICE

The information in this email (and any attachments} is confidential If you are nol ihe infended recigienl, you i
irrfarmatiin, I you have recelved this email in amor. please immediately notify me by "Reply® command and perm

gny copies or prinfouts thereaf. Althaugh this emall and any altachiments are beliaved to be frée of any virus or other defect that
sompoter system info which i is received and opened. it is the responsibiity of the recipient la ensure thal it s winus free and no responsibiliy i3
aocepled by AlG for any loss or damage ansing in any way from is use

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@|kkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, August 03, 2018 11:09 AM

To: Khoo, Kay-Eng

Subject: RE: Your Ref: 800636391 *Our Ref: CC3/AIG13002833/Kpa3w2-1[ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFD 35855(01)
AND 5HD 9197R(TP) ON 30/01/2013]

Hi Mr Khoo.
We refer to the above matter and our tele-conversation earlier, the submission of LOD s less than 6 years,

Kindly assist to re-open the case and send back our adjuster report in Merimen for our necessary action.

Thank you,



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3107 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Khoo, Kay-Eng <Kay-Eng.Khoo@aig.com>

Sent: Thursday, 2 August 2018 4:33 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com:>

Cc: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha <Saliha.Syed-Yusoff@aig.com>

Subject: FW: Your Ref: 800636391 *Qur Ref: CC3/AIG13002833/Kpa3w2-1[ACCIDENT INVOLVING SED 35855(01)
AND SHD 2197R(TP) ON 30/01/2013]

Our Ref: 8006363918
Dear Hsiao Tong,

Regret unable to consider this case, the submission of this LOD is already more than 6 years from the date of
accident,

Thanks.

Khoo Kay Eng

AlG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid.
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 078120

Tel +{B5) 6419 1026 | Fax +(B5) 6835 7418

kay-eng. khoo@aig.com | www aig.com sg

Follow us:

IMPORTANT NOTICE

The information in this email (and any altachments) is confidenhal if your arg nol the infended recipien], vou must nol use orF disseminate the
infarmation. If you beave received this email in error, please immedialely nolily me by "Reply” command and permanently delete the orginal and
any copes or printouts thereof. Aithough this email and any attachments are believed fo be free of any wirus or other dafeet hat might affect any
computer system into which it is received and opened, if is the responsibiiity of the recipient to ensure that i s virus free and no respor 1sibility is
accapted by AlG for any loss or damage arising in any way from ifs use

From: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha

Sent: Wednesday, August 01, 2018 5:26 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Khoo, Kay-Eng



Subject: FW: Your Ref: 800636391 *Our Ref: CC3/AIG13002833/Kpa3w2-1[ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFD 35855(01)
AND SHD 9197R(TP) ON 30/01/2013]

Dear Hsiao Tong,
Kindly be informed that the OIC for this matter is Kay Eng.
Aside to Kay Eng,

for your further handling please.

Thank you,

PLEASE NOTE THAT CONTENTS OF THIS EMAIL SHOULD NOT BE CONSTRUED AS ANY
ADMISSION OF LIABILITY ON THE PART OF OUR INSURED AND/OR INSURERS. WE HEREBY
MAINTAIN FULL RESERVATION OF RIGHTS AND ALL DEFENCES AVAILABLE TO Us

Saliha Syed Yusoff

AlG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple, Ltd
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)

Tel +{65) 6418 1917 | Fax +(65) 68357416

saliha.syed-yusoff@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE

The infarmation in s amail (and any atfachments) is confidential  If yvou are nol the infended recipient. you must not use or dissemnate the
irfarmation. I you have received this email i error, please immediately notify me by “Rephy” command: and paifanently delste the original and
afly

copres o pantouls thereaf Although' this email and any atfachments are beliaved 1o be freo of any virus or other dafac! that migh! affect any
cornpitar -

system info which it is recefved and opened, it iz the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that if 1s virus free and no responsibilily (s aceepled by
Al

for any loss or damage ansing in any way from s yse

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, July 27, 2018 3:52 PM

To: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Your Ref: 800636391 *Our Ref: CC3/AIG13002833/Kpa3w2-1[ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFD 35855(01) AND
SHD 9197R(TP) ON 30/01/2013]

Your Ref: 800636391
Our Ref: CC3/AIGI3002833/Kpadw2-1

Dear Sirs/Madam,



ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFD 35855(0CI1) AND SHD 9197R(TP) ON 30/01/2013

We refer to the above matter.

We have temporary close our file on Dec 2014 due to no submission of documents by third party.

Now, Third Party repairer had submitted all the relevant documents for payment(see attached).

In view of this, appreciate if you could assist to re-open the case in Merimen for our necessary action,

Maon 23/7/2018 4:44 PM

Nw --IE'; I'.I..-?ll L N <wavinno ""r'-n:_il_:-!.: COMSo:

| BRI RS S |

RE: Pending Decuments for Closure (Trans-cab) LKK REF: CC3/A1G13002833/Kp : TCS REF: AAD1301-357

To Hsiao Tong [(LKKAUto)

Cc jasminetan@transcab.com.sg; dams@ranscab.com.sq; Kennath Kong (LKKAuto}: B S A Team

(IR AAD1301-357 - LOD.pdf

M ame

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Hsiao Tong

| 6. [ SHD9197R [ SFD 358558 | 30/01/2013 | $3.556.95|

Please refer to the above mention case.

Please proceed to send us the DV with amount $3,556.55.

Mank You

Best Regards,

Mg Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.se

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto,com | fax: 6741-4108
BIk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408a33)



IMPORTAMNT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or

severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.
IMPORTANT MOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply” command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Express

i Rpt | Adi Submitted | Ins Auth'ed _l:-'.-'d'-..-

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

131 Jan 2013

4 = L 3 * | w - em e
i 15 Feb 2013 bl 5$2,550.00 $%2,550.00 ::::E:’ for Survey
Aain X 3 2
Edit Reg Edit Ad] Rpt I Edit Estimates I Wiew Rpt I , Cancal Cags ]
[ Main Reference Claim Details Documents Show All
| |CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS o o | [Created by adjuster] B ]
Insured: MOHAMMAD GHAZALI BIN MOHAMED HASHIM, [0 571431440 I
d | ! . — |
Main ‘
(Claimant: _TRAHS-CABERU’IL‘ESI PTE I:Tlf. Co. Reg. No.: 200303878K - B - .
Vahicle Reg. . |30/01/2013 21:00 - :59
Mo.: SHD9197R Dlakel:bosst [15 Menths and 16 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)) [
N ] = ==
Clalm Type: TP/ 800636351 | E‘;’é‘;"’;ﬁ“ﬁ'ﬂ 2100298918 (Comprehensive)
.'l."e‘hide Reqg. | . i_- : o
No. SFD35855 [Clatmaniy: | D-12047359MFSH g
{Insured): % il [ — {
. = | Excess: ]
|Repairer: (Trans Cab Auto Services Pte Ltd (HQ) No 58 Defu Lane 1, 539498 Defu Lane - Tel: I
= |
|

Handling
Insurer:

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd, (5G) - Tel: 65-6419-3000
[Claimant's

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 62222311
_ LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handied by KENNETH KONG] ... [Final Rpt due 07/08/2018]

| ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED

View All | Compose Case M;|_|
+« AIG_SG (03/08/2018): Report Send Back Alerts - SHD9197R (TP)

 ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ View All | Search Tasks | Create New Task | Complete | |
Due Date Priority Type Tashk Group Subject Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
Mo results.

B R A i = e e g ———
=
= |
|
I
m |
iy

hitps:/isingapore. merimen.com/claimsindex cim?fusebox=MTRadjusler&luseaction=dsp_cimheader&caseid=17T6498exlid=966418CFID=45902363... 1/2
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https://singapora. meriman.com/claimsindex cimPusabox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_clmheaderfcaseid=1776498exlid=966414CFID=45502363... 272



122472018 Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SHD9197R (800636391)
[SFD35855]
TP
TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
Jan 30 2013 9:00PM
[MOHAMMAD GHAZALI BIN MOHAMED HASHIM]

Trans Cab Auto Services Pte Ltd

Upload Documents i Uphad Photos | Compose New Leittr I Upl:)ad 'ul'ldecr f I.Iph:»ad Audio I View | View in Browser ¥
I.m:tar:':.nr Co rrﬂ-pund ences - - - 1 per page v el
No | Finalized Or th Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ) TI'IIJrI'IbI'IEI“"F;i.'i.I'III
1 |(Draft) Third Party Express Settlement — Payment Breakdown o | Eait '
2 17/12/14 0G:43 Insurer Offer Letter/DV “

HTM
[Dffer superseded on 2018/08/03] Load

Photus,flmnges - 3 D-e_r'page v
_M:. REI.':bLUFlLurder :I KK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) | - _':I"hum_l:u'tail_EF!r_intl
1 13/02/1317:40  General View ©  loadiec | @

2 13/02/1317:40  General View €&  loadic | W
3 13/02/13 17:40 Ganeral View Q&  loadirc | & |
4 13/02/13 17:40 General View ©  loadirc | @

5 13/02/13 17:40 General View € | lcadws | ¥
6  13/02/1317:40  General View €  loadirc | ¥
7 13/02/1317:40  General View © | laiws | @

|8  13/02/13 17:40 General View © | Load G | !

g 13/02/1317:40  Odometer Reading € | Loadiec | &

il | | ol e i B

(10 13/02/1317:40  Chassis Number Q@ | Loadirc | W

|I:Im:umentutmn N 1 per page vii &

ENU Rulabelfﬂenrder LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) — __.l'_“""_"E!".‘?”:.Pri";

't |13/02/1317:33 TP GIA REPORT o ) € | Loas POF |

12 113/02/13 17:39 TP WORKSHOP ESTIMATE S © | LoasPOF |

3 09/12/1414:26  Email to TP wksp dd 121114 - - | € | LoagpoF |

4 D9/12/14 14:26  Email to Saliha dd 081214 © | LoacPoF

|5 10/12/1410:32 | LETTER TO OI B B € | Load POF |

|6 24/12/1B09:15  AUTHORISATION TO ACT - € | LoacrOF

|7 |24/12/1809:16 | RELEASE VOUCHER € | LoadPOF |

|8 |24/12/18 09:16 MunstnP INVOICE - €9 | Load POF |

9 [2a112/18 ~ RENTAL RECEIPT € | Loac POF |

10 |24/12/18 09:16 EHEHTAL MILEAGE € | Load POF 'f

11 24/12/1809:16 LTA SEARCH — == | €9 | Load POF | _

No _fu alized Ch |AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd. (SG) S e [ Thumbnail ' Print |

1 15/02/1308:47 | OIGIAREPORT | @ | Loageor |
Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST ' - Reset | Save | Print ||

Tﬁere are no documeant EhEEkliELE ccrnr‘iéﬁred.

hitps://singapore. merimen.comfclaims/index cimMusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_docview&domainid=18objid=177649&exlid=966414corole=48C ... 12
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Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

Show Remarks To: — Handling Insurer

i Kote: Remarks are private unless you show it to other partias

hitps:/'singapore. merimen.com/claimsiindex. cfmfusebox=MTRdoc&luseaction=dsp_docview&domainid=1&0bjid=17TE49&extid=96641&corole=4&C... 272



12/24/2018

Preview
NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM
AIG THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
FOR ACCIDENTS ON OR AFTER 1ST JUNE 2008
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
[\I’ehir:le Mo: SFD35855 (Insd veh) Model: CHEVROLET EPICA 2.0 (A)
SHD9197R (TP veh)

| Date of Accident: | 30/01/2013

Global Sum Settlement || [ ] Yes | X1 No

Repair Estimate 5 5,742.50

Final Repair Cost ' 5 2,728.50

Loss of Use 5. 250.00 5.00 days at $50.00 per day

Rental (if any) o 572.45 5 days

LTA / GlA Search Fee % 6.00

Others: 8

-

Final Setflernent Sum ' % 3,55B.95

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? YES [ X] (Kindly indicate below)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability:

(%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:
Assessed Liability {*);
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.

(o)

Remarks

Paymant Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |Trans-Cab Auto Services Pte Lid

3,556.95

2)

3)

4)

& | e | e | eh

NUR SHAQILAH BTE ABDOL WAHAB

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

24 Dec
2018

Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
{Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical Report/ Bill

(if any)

11



1224/2018 Adjuster Report
LKK Auto CDHSUitEﬂtS Pte Ltd (Co.Reg.No: 199607 198R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com
VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT
Qur File No: CC3/AIG13002833/KPASS21
Date: 24/12/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer:  AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. Policy No: 2100298918
o A Vehicle  oin9197R insured Vehicle No:  SFD3585S
Date of Loss: 30/01/2013 Mature of Claim: TP Claim Mo: 800636381
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg Ma: SHDS197TR
Make & Model: CHEWVROLET EPICA, 2.0 (A} Engine Mo: Z2051443559K
Reg. Date: 14/10/2011 (Man. Year: 2011) Chassis No: KL1LAGIRJBBOS8498
Colour: Red/White Odometer: 212926 km
Engine Capacity: 1991 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: M
Sum Insured [(S$); Market Value/Mew Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition; Good  Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake |Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition:
OMNDITI TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 195/65 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 195/65 R15
Front Left Side: West Lake 7 mm Rear Left Side: West Lake 6 mm
Front Right Side: West Lake 7 mm Rear Right Side: West Lake 6 mm
The above values represent the remaining fyre treads deplh
(COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %)
Parts 2016.82 1,911.82 105.00 £5.21
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 3,350.00 1,300.00 2,050.00 61.19
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 5,366.82 3,211.82 2,155.00 40.15
Approved Total (Overridden) (S5) 2,550.00
(5%) 5,366.82 2,550.00 2,816.82 5248
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) a75.68 178.50 197.18 5249
Nett Amount {S%) 5,742.50 2,728.50 3,014.00 52.49
+ Loss of Use (5.0 x $$50.00/day) {5%5) 250.00
+ Car Rental (5.0 x $§114.49/day) (55) 572.45
+ Doc/Search Fee (S§) 6.00
Nett Liability (5$) 3,556.95
INSPECTION

Date of Assignment:
Date Inspected:

Estimated Period of Repair:

hitps:/isingapone. merimen comiclaimsfindex cim?lusebox=MTRadjusler&luseaction=gen_pri nirpl&caseid=1776494extid=96641&CFID=45902363&C ...

31012013

Trans Cab Auto Services Ple Lid (HQ)
31/01/2013 Inspected At: Mo 58 Defu Lane 1

Singapore 539498
4.0 days
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1212442018 Adjuster Report

Adjuster:  KENNETH KONG Manager: CHEW HSIAO TONG

NOTE: Thia repart represents our fingdings at the time and place of inspection stated herein. Such inspection has been carried out ta the best of our knowladge and ahilily bul
any othar iabiity under any other circumstances is heraby exprossly excivded.

hilps /isingapore. merimen.com/claimsfindex cfm?lusebox=MTRadjusier&fuseaction=gen_printrpt&caseid=1776498exlid=966414CFID=45002363&C... 24



1202472018

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo.

1
2
3
4
5
6
F

S A

1

=Franchise parl. 3=Spchetl, L=ListitemDisc,

Adjustar Report

Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
*REAR BUMPER (BUMPER A-RR) Buckled/Distorted 1,202.00FL *1,202.00FL
*REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH Cracked 6876 FL *68.76 FL
*REAR FENDER RH Bent 1,14500FL *1,145.00FL
*SET REAR BUMPER FASTENER CLIP Mecessary J0.00FS *J0.00FS
*REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT Necessary 100.00FS “40.00F3
*REAR WINDSCREEN INNER SPONGE SEAL Mecessary T5.00FS *30.00FS

Sub Total (S5) 2,620.76 2,515.76

- List tem Discount on L ltems 25.00/25.00% (S%) 603.94 603.94

2,016.82 1,911.82

Total Parts (5%)

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

hitps/isingapore. merimen.com/claimsfindex.cim?iusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_printrpt&caseid=177649&exlid=0664 14CFID=459023634C... 34



1212412018

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellanaous items selected,

Recommended Labour
No Particulars

Labour ltems

1

PANEL BEATING KNOCKING AND STRAIGHTENING THE NECESSARY
PORTION ,REMOVE AND RENEWAL OF PARTS ADJUST AND REALIGN

THE SAME.

TO RUST-PROOFING OF THE AFFECTED AREAS.
PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING OF THE AFFECTED PORTION.

TO TRANSFER OF FENDER FITTINGS ATTACHMENTS AND PERFORM

WATER SEEPAGE TEST.

TO REMOVE AND REFIT INTERIOR FITTINGS ,TRIMINGS ,GARNISH
JFITTINGS AND OTHER ,TO ENABLE REPAIR,

TO REMOVE AND REFIT REAR W/SCREEN GLASS TO FACILITATE

BODYWORK REPAIR.

TO RESEAL SEALANT ON GAP.
TOWING FEES.

Adjuster Report
Lab.Type Repairer's
Mew 1,250.00
MNew 200.00
New 900.00
Mew 300.00
MNew 350,00
New 150.00
MNew 100.00
Mew 100.00
Gross Labour Cost (5§) 3,350.00

Amount

600.00

30.00

400.00
100.00

0.00

120.00

50.00
0.00

1,300.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out,

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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