Hsiao Tnng (LKKAuto)

From: Catherine Thia <catherine.thia@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 30 January 2019 11:33 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: <Seek Mandate>: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving XD7119R (OI : CT| -
SNM18D03694C02) AND SMAS337L (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CT118013744/Upb3) on
27.07.2018

Dear Hsia Tong

- Without Prejudice —
We are agreeable to settle at 100% and quantum at $6922
Please proceed

Thanks

Catherine Thia
Senior Executive
Motor Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079509
Direct (65) 6389 6193

www.sg.cntaiping.com

ANNIVERSARY
In Simpapore vince 1935

Disclaimer

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Ltd except
where provided for in a writien agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Ltd Any unauthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message,
please notify the sender immediately,

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com)]
Sent: Wednesday, 2 January, 2019 11:00 AM



To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>
Ce: Catherine Thia <catherine.thia@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com:

Subject: RE: <Seek Mandate>: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving XD7119R (Ol : CTI - SNM18D03694C02) AND
SMAS337L (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18013744/Upb3) on 27.07.2018

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to our mandate request dated 15/12/2018.

Kindly let us have your instruction.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 15 December 2018 8:52 AM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI' <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: catherine.thia@sg.cntaiping.com; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: <Seek Mandate>: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving XD7119R (OI : CTI - SNM18D03694C02) AND
SMAS337L (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CT118013744/Upb3) on 27.07.2018

Hi Sirs/ Mdrmn,
We refer to our mandate request dated 13 Oct 2018.

Kindly let us have your instruction/mandate as third party is chasing for this case.



hlon 197712018 10:35 AM
J_F lason Fastech Auto <jasen@fastechauta com sg»
YOUR REF: XDTT19R (CHINA) MY REF: SMASI3TL DOA:27/07/2018.

To rH=as Tong LKAUTD)
Without Prejudice

Dear Hslao Tong,

Please refer to our LOD dated 13/08/2018.

We have yet to receive any offer from your good office
We await your reply.

Thank you.

Best Regards

lason Tang

Fastech Auto Pte Lid

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#01-46/48/50 AutoBay
Singapore 417883

Tel: 67465405

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Fhone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 3 November 2018 10:59 AM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI' <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com:; Catherine Thia <catherine.thia@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving XD7119R (Ol : CTI - SNM18D03694C02) AND SMAS337L (TP : LKK
REF - CC6/CT118013744/Upb3) on 27.07.2018

Hi Sirs/ Mdm,
We refer to our mandate request dated 13 Oct 2018.

Kindly let us have your instruction/mandate.



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 13 October 2018 12:30 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>; Catherine Thia <catherine.thia@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving XD7119R (01 : CTI - SNM18D03694C02) AND SMA5337L (TP : LKK
REF - CC6/CTI18013744/Upb3) on 27.07.2018

Yourref : SNM18D034694C02
Qur ref : CC4/CTI8013744/Upb3s2

Dear Sirs/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD7119R(OI) & SMAS5337L(TP) ON 27/07/2018
We refer to the above matter.

It is a head-to-rear collision. Liability is down against our insured driver.
We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be affected.

We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer " FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD" at $6,922.00(all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Amount Revised
Claimed

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $19.638.99 $ 6,420.00

2. Loss of Rental (5days x $100.00) $F 50000 % 50000

3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee % 2.00 3 200

Total $20,140.9%  $6,922.00
**05 days recommendation for repair.
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal,

For your approval please.



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 23 August 2018 12:00 PM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI' <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Lucas Lee <|ucas. lee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>; Hwang Shiang Yi
<shiangyi.hwang@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving XD7119R (01 : CTI - SNM18D03694C02) AND SMAS5337L (TP : LKK
REF - CC6/CTI18013744/Upb3) on 27.07.2018

You Ref: SNM18D03694C02
Dear Sirs/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed for your perusal is: -

- Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice
- Photographs of TF vehicle in its damaged condition

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@]kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8(408933)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 30 July 2018 6:41 PM
To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Sharon Han <sharon.han@sg.cntaiping.com>; Lucas Lee <lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)

<chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving XD7119R (Ol : CTI - TBA) AND SMA5337L (TP : LKK REF -

CCe/CTI18013744/Upb3) on 27.07.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,



We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SMA 5337L at M/s Fastech Auto Pte Ltd.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
c TP GIA report

Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong and she can be contacted at DID: 6742 3197.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com




FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay
Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67465405 / 67465376  Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

Date:  13.08.2018

China Taiping Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road

#16-00 Springleal Tower
Singapore 079909

Attn: Motor Claim Department

Dear Sir'/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SMA 5337L/ XD T119R ON 27.07.2018

We are the authorized repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicle no: ~ SMA 5337L , which was involved
in the captioned accident with your insured vehicle no: XD 7119R . The vehicle owner has requested and
authorized us to assist him in presenting his'her claim against the party responsible for the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving, we are submitting these claims for
your consideration on behalf of the owner/claimant.

1Y Cost of Repair (inclusive of GST) g 6,420.00

2)  Loss of Rental 8 500.00

3)  GIA Search Fee s 2.0
5 6,922.00

We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims:

a) Final Repair Invoice b) Car Rental Invoice / Agreement

&) GLA Search Result d) Letter of Authorisation, etc...

e) GIA Report ) UC & Driving Licence

£} Insurance Motor Cover Note h) Vehicle Registration Log Card

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of our customer’s claims
as soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to
any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/claimant.

Thank vou.
Yours faithfully||

Jason Tang (jasbn@fastechauto.com.sg)
For Fastech AMto Pre Ltd
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BY UBL AVE I, #0122 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL ; (0651 62563201 FAX ; (43} 625364315

Our Ref: CC6/CTI18013744/Uph3

03 AUG 2018

TAT HONG CONSTRUCTION & TRANSPORT PTE LTD
22 8T MICHAEL'S ROAD

#09-05 SUNVILLE
SINGAPORE 327981

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD 7119R AND SMA 5337L ON 27/07/2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to deal with
the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from SMA 5337L against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

CHEW HSIAO TONG

Case Handler

DID: 6742 3197

FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: chewht@lkkauto.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)
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DATE : 1.6

TO : '}'r.i".."l T"T"“": ISuran (e -:1"._1_ 110 ¢ fte 144
I
RE : ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLENO. €M A 227 L g0/
VD FN9de
‘J&LDNG 'L-.‘ ! . :'.._ - Dl ret i ."i- -_-rJL r:_'..- .\_.E'_.-"? -\-"':.J'-" _.l'-'-:"_-'._- ."J'.. _I'.__,_ y f
= o7

ON 2[4 20/
Uwe, Il_'_* t_ I.'.+I|I'-:::I Ill jl-.-l:':;-‘..! 1 "I
of (NRIC No./ROC No.) SIRIRAE T
of Mt X2 Qmptcvale Mt 41395 Simgapole sN0S2

Vo T 5 i P . . | .
owner of vehicleno. =" (2231 4 consideration of M/s FASTECH AUTO

SN AL

PTE LTD repairing my/our vehicle *#Z at my/our instruction and hereby
authorise M/s FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD to demand claim settlement whatever
amount settled/payable by the Insurance Company and/or third party or to commence legal

proceedings, if necessary, under my name, for the cost of repairs, car rental and/or loss of use,
etc. and to their appointing solicitor to act for me/us in respect of the said accident/claim and
all claimed and/or settled shall belong to them absolutely.

I/We further agree and undertake to indemnify them against the above-mentioned claim cost

which may arisen therewith.

Signature of Owner : ) 7l

Name of Qwner :




LE 2]

MOTOR CLATMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER

Folicy No : DOMCVSN1757101700
Claimant KOK CHOON KEONG
Amount 556,922.00

Claim Ho

This Discharge Voucher applies only to the clamant's claim
ferr his properts damage and will not effec his persanal

injunes g |.l||1| ...I'I".! or innsared levsdek ¢laim i a later date
Ferther, the setilement terms hercin should not be ysed a5 an
evidence 1o prejudice o the claiman's personal inurics claim
andior oilier uninsered losses claim irising of the

subject maiter m this action

SNM1E8D03694C02

STNGAPORE DOLLARS S5TX THOUSAND NINE HUNDRED TWENTY TWO Only

I/We agree to accept the above menticned amount to be paid to mefus in full &

final settlement of all claims,

sustained by mefus through an accident involving

Claimant ¥ehicle Ro. : SMAS3I3TL
Insured Vehicle No. : XD7119R
bate of Loss £ 27,07 /2018

PFlace of Accident

costs & disbursements for

: KFE TWDS ECE TWDS TAMPINES ROAD

injuries / damages

IN CONSTIDERATION of the payment made to mefus of the aforementioned sum by
I/We -agree absoclutely to

CHINA TAIPING INSURRNCE
diecharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE

Insured Name
Driver Name

from all claims,

YU HOWG QUAN

[SINGAFPORE)

LTD.,
[SINGRPORE)

present or future in respect of a&ll loss,
sustalned by mefus arising out of the said accident,

PTE. LTD. andfor

¢ TAT HONG CONSTRUCTION £ TEAMEPORT PTE LTD

injury or damage

I ackmowledge that this payment is made without admission of liability on the

part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) FTE. LTD.
(1) General Damages E5
(2} Cost of Repair/Exeess 85 6,420.00
13} Less of Yae/Rental/Barateg 85 200.00
{4} GIASfPolice Reports/
Investigation Results/Seéarch Fees g8 2.00
15) Medical Reports/Expenses 5%
(6] Burvey Fees/P.T. Fees 55
{7] Cost including Disbursement S5
TOTAT e w0 o v on i 0 o w 55 6,8922.00
ble e el s e e
Claimant Name: Ke kK Groew hEows neic no ;W IEPLT
,. Y QR q
Signature z = ,’I Date k ;Hﬁ j/"
i



TAX INVOICE

FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 2000062621

Tax Invoice : 20443
China Taiping Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road Date (13.08.2018
#16-00 Springleal Tower Vehicle No :SMA 5337L
Singapore 079909 Make/Model :TOYOTA VIOS
Chassis/Eng#
Attn : Motor Claim Department Accident Date  :27.07.2018
Claim No
Reference : 0718 -20443
Policy No
Amount
To proceed on lump sum repair 5% 6000.00
E.&O.E. Total : S% 6000.00
GST (@ 7% : 8% 420.00
Amount Due @ 88 6420.00

for FASTECH AYTO PTE LTD

All Invoices are subjected to GST




DYNAMIC CAR RENTAL

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-46 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 6741 7244/ 6746 5405 Fax No: 6745 8520 / 6746 5786
Co. Reg No: 52928467K

To: KOK CHOON KEONG Invoice : DCR-2018-08-02
Date : 01.08.2018

Agreement No : 20441
Payment Term : LOD

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
Rental charges for vehicle : SLH 76317 [ 0718-20443 ) 5 500.00
Rental Period from 27.07.2018 to 01.08.2018
E.& Q. E. Total s 500.00
LINA PANG

for Dynamic Car Rental



Dynamic Car Rental

1 KAK|] BUKIT AVENUE 6, #01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY, SINGAPORE 417883.

TEL: (+65) 6741 7244, 6746 5405 FAX: (+65) 6745 8520, 6746 5786
Co. Reg. No. 52928467K

RENTAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

No.204

41

-

Mamis kﬂt (,hm}n H?an c b MAKE MODEL: ]
AQDRESS J QLH 3632 DiEseL | PETROL | E |14 [12l34| F |
KM | BATE Et‘ ME |
n 0 aEmﬁ ANAGYY -
B | K | DATE & TiME ouT |
| our B.03 08 © 11 2am
KM TIME WSED
DAVEN
MAMED ORIVER
DAVING L|c:EhE3~m DATE OF EXPIRY PLACE OF ISSUE MOURS | @58
PASSPORT rd{.L ' DATE OF [SBLE ~ | PLACE OF ISSUE 5 DAYS | @ss 0 % 5o ' E:
ADD NAMED DRIVER WEEKS | @35
DRIVING LICENCE ND DATE CF EAPIRY PLACE OF 1B5UE voiiis. | ess
"PASSPORT NO DATE OF ISEUE PLACE OF ISSUE BY INITIALLING, RENTER | gug.ToTaL # 500 1,
AGREES TC PAY ADD FEE ; K
F FOA COLLISION DAMAGES '
IMPORTANT NOTES: | WAIVER ([C.EW.}
Thes velicle is lipenced 1o carry 04 passangers only .
N raard. well BE e Br vabes peluma sarsy TOTAL BENTAL
e nafurd will e geden for period ket in vohicle :
Hi £ -t 1 't s tnes of mamipgs whi = uak
:‘and:::::lallln nay ek 54000 urcar secsion 1 &l in any pec e g ) amings while dimagsd sahicie DELIVERY FEE
Hiar g ligble 1o ey & radsng fee and kaific sumenansas
Wuhicle ratarmedurng oifide tour aily, COLLECTION FEE

%o Sardios on Publie Holidey anid Senclay

EXCESE:

“5ng | - Uned m §'pare Oniy - SG02000

*Sec il - Used in §pora Dnly -SGD2000

S | - Lsed Dinide-S'pare Only SSE04D00
*Seg - Lsed Culgide §'pore Only SGIM0G0
Wismaen Excass In 5pers; S0D10D
Wiscrean Excess Cuiside §'pore SGEIR00

ADDITIOHAL CONDITIONS:
* Geograghicai nreas: Singapore & West Matayss
* Capwiar rant be;

&l 18 years gld and above;

15} udding @ winlid relovant class of driveng licenss.

" Adciional Own Dernape Excass of 551,000 15 dpplcatts & any namedynmamel divers wha
8] ape 2210 23 yobre old;
B} Apw B 1o 70 years ald;
) with driving expedsace’ ol 1 yeit to lass thar 2 yéam i Snonpees on the wsssan Hasses of diving
MEBMEE

Additiinal Al Cimima excoss 0l SS2000 5 applicadie lor sy damediurmarad drivers who!
aiis 1A years old 1o 21 yedrs ald aridio

B js 11 years ol s goove Bndfor

G Wit griving #xpesipne'of ees than 1 yaeron Mo reieyint o isses ot drvng licenss

" Hpon miuming Ine reolaarment vahicl, yos musl ansore Mal sl expensive and impartant e b be
resrerme away from this replacament vehicle. We) wil ot be mepanailile for any reparing of such ksses

* Hiror is llable 4o pay firsr S4000 under sacton | & 1| in ary sooder pus isss of saming whil-damape wetsca
In undior mpa

Hirer is responsibte for Additional $4,000.00 Excess

| tathe THIRD PARTY DAMAGE / INJURY claims.

X

FER DAY
&

PER WEEK
§

PER MONTH
3

BY INITIALLING, RENTER
AGREES TO PAY ADD FEE
FORPERSONAL ACCI DENT
INSURANCE (PAL)

X

PER DAY
g

FER WEEK
%

PER MONTH
5

PREPAYMENT

TOTAL CHARGE

CHECK

DEPOSIT

CASH

RECGEIPT NO

NETT CHARGE

AMDUNT DUE | REFUND

| HAVE AREAD THE TERMS AND GONDITIONS ON BOTH SIDES
BF THIS RENTAL AGREEMENT AGREE THEREQF

SIGNED BY THE PARTIESHERETAON THE ..o

DYNAMIC CAR RENTAL

RENTER'S/DR




27072018

Qur Ref No:
Date of Request;

Kim Chwee Auto Pte

GENERAL
INSURANCE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Invoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

GS5T Registration No: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am to Spm

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

GR-18-115074
270712018 Your Ref No:

Lid

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue & #01-48

AutoBay@Kaki Bukit

Online Purchase

Singapore 417883

Dear SirfMadam,

Enquiry Data 27072018
Mouiry By Tang Kok Wee, Allan

1~ Vehicle No, XD7118R

Accident Date 2710772018

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
XDT119R China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 0B/09/2017-07/09/2018 G389 6111
Thank You,

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance Association of
Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any loss or damage arising out of
arin connection with the repons or their images.

i Is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

hitps.//singapare. merimen. com/claimsfindex.cim?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_geninvip&refid=1871390&CFID=380492308CF TOKEN=032 .

112



271072018 Irvoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GE"ERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

INSUWCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax; +65 6224 0030

ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE C°! Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Our Ref No: GR-18-115074
Date of Request: 27107/2018 Your Ref No; Online Purchase

Kim Chwee Auto Pte Lid

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-48
AutoBay@@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883

Dear SirfMadam,

Enquiry Date 27/07/2018

M ouiry By Tang Kok Wee, Allan

1~ Vehicle MNo. XD7119R

Accident Date 2710712018

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S5)

TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature,

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[%] GIRO [ ] Cash [ ] Chegue

_

https:fisingapore. menmen.com/claims/index. cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_geninvip&refid=18713004CFID=380492304CFTOKEN=032... 202



