Without Prejudice
Hi Riza,
We are still pending for our insured videolif any) from AIG.

We will get back to you asap.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or su bsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Caze Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewhtélkkanto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8{408953)

From: Riza <riza@ow.sg>
Sent: Monday, 13 August 2018 9:24 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Ce: winson@ow.sg; lily.loi@ow.sg; puitheng.chong@ow.sg; 'Sharon Ten' <sharon @ow.sg>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: FW: Arrange survey - Accident involving SLP757Z and SLH5789R on 25/07/18 *LKK REE:
CC6/LCR18013737/Kpb3

Dear Hsiao Tong,
Good morning!
May | please ask for your update on this?

Thanks

Best Regards,

Hiza (Ms)

Claims Executiwve

Tel: +85 6484-9919 (ext. 105}
Fax: +b63 6481-1011

OFTIMA WEBRKZ PTE LTD

Hiead office: 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 | Tel: (+65)] 6472 1313 | Fax:
(+65) 8472 2112
Branch; 9A Serangcon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500 | Tel: (+65) 6484 94919 Fax:

(+65) 6481 1011 |



Branch: 531 Upp Themscon Road Singapore 574415 | Tel: (+65) 6452 68568
[+65) 0452 B2Z3 |

WWw . OW. 54

www, facebook. com/opt imawerksz

On 8/10/2018 5:02 PM. Riza wrote:
Dear Hsiao Tong,

As per your phone conversation with Sharon last Wednesday, you will provide us the video footage
of the accident. Kindly send us as soon as possible.

Thanks,

Best Regards,

Riza (Ms)

Claims Executive

Tel: +65 6484-9919 (ext.105)
Fax: +65 &481-1011

CPTIMA WEERKEZ PTE LTD

Head coffice: 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 | 'Tel: [+65) 6472
1313 | Fax: (+65) 6472 2117

Branch: 9A Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500 | Tel: (+65) 6484
9819 | Fax: (+65) 6481 1011 |

Branch: 551 Upp Thomson Road Singapore 574415 | Tel:z: {+865) 6452
BBGE | Fax: {+65) 5452 9223

WW . OW. Sg
www, facebook.com/optimawerkz

On 8/8/2018 9:51 AM., Riza wrote:
Hi Hsiao Tong,

Based on your insured's statement, he already mentioned that he was
moving/driving out from stationary. Secondly, your insured mentioned also that he
was waiting for our insured’s client to pass by but ended up hitting onto our client's
vehicle.

This accident case fall under BOLA scenario 14.

Thanks

Best Regards,

Riza (Ms)

Claims Executive

Tel: +65 6484-9919 lext.105)
Fax: +65 £481-1011

QFTIMA WEREKZ PTE LTD

Head cffice: 6 Kung Chong BRoad Singapore 159143 | Tel:
[+65) 6472 1313 | Fax: (+685) 6472 2112 |

Branich: 94 Serangocon North Zve S Singapore 554500 | Tel:
[+65) &4E4 9919 [ Fax: (+65) 6481 1011 [

Branch: 351 Upp Thomson Road Singapore 574415 | Tel:
(+65) 6452 BBGE | Fax: (+65) 6452 9223
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Without Prejudice
Hi Riza,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that liability is unclear at this moment. Our insured

On 8/8/2018 9:25 AM. Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) wrote:

driver reported that he had stopped and your client hit onto his car. Anached
is a copy of our insured driver accident report for your easy reference.

pust

f"’

A L)
N

- T - S e e
| ol | i ‘4| \
4 '] e .J L
A -t + G A
il B
{
<= |
| — —
é‘lq,}‘--\.-]_ hor ows 2y
|
|
. o : F o) m ny el -
A 22 oh Jols (@ gheuf 1308kes , J
1 “T"od o sd o
‘:.J;_ i 5148 1}-- :f'luﬁ _(_5:“ 115_ Lok 3C, A0 1 Cofup
ad '{].u_ = idi i‘ni -::II'...;_-\ foag _h:'{..n._l o F‘,-‘_'l\rr-:*. “fa
L _stufed o demtdvic ou?t Ae can/ aud
ke f gt Compiy —tval{, ¢ 7 Bad Ao
£ : art L
. g i ; L
oepxt @row J fuva ouf 4 fov QLP 78T
'i.: i lh AL fpac Lo b 4 % Pr-.-r‘- tlt Ces" crane
| g R i _ i "
Bt f_ﬂ:' I',-'-i""',».- o /L7 ! '..\l' e 'k,l "L P e
¥ i ] ] fo sl e L0 5 Wy
5 B -t (o (SLWSIR9R),

We are pending for instruction from AIG and will get back to you asap,

Meantime, kindly advise if there is any evidence from vour client (ie: video
footage/ scenc photos / PIR). If so, please forward to us for our further

action,

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a
without prejudice basis with the sale intention of resolving the matter amicably
without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of

terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by
either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation

terms/settlement.”
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Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Riza <riza@ow.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 7 August 2018 6:02 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Ce: winson@ow.sg; lily.loi@ow.sg; puitheng.chong@ow.sg; 'Sharon
Ten' <sharon@ow.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>: Admin-D
(LKKAuto) <admin-d @Ikkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@Ilkkauto.com:

Subject: Re: FW: Arrange survey - Accident involving SLP7572Z and
SLH5789R on 25/07/18

Dear Shu Pei,

May | please know the update on the liability?
Kindly advise us as soon as possible.

Thanks

Best BRegards,

Riza {Ms)

Claims Executive

Tel: +65 6484-9%1%9 (ext.105)

Fax: +65 6481-1011

CPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD

Head office: 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore
159143 | Tel: (+65) 6472 1313 | Fax:
(+65) 6472 2112 |

Branch: 3A Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore

554500 | Tel: (+65) 64B4 9318 | Fax: (+65)
6481 1011 |

Branch: 551 Upp Thomsen Road Singapore

574415 | Tel: (+85) 6452 G8&8 | Fax:

(+B63) 6452 9223 |
WWI  OW . S0

W . faceboak. com/optimawerksz

On 8/3/2018 4:15 PM. Riza wrote:
Dear Shu Pei,

May | please ask for any update on the liability?



Kindly advise as soon as possible.

Thanks

Best Regards,

Riza (Ms)

Claims Executive

Tel: +65 6484-991% (ext.105)
Fax: +65 6481-1011

OFTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD

Head office: & Kung Chong Road

Singapore 158143 | Tel: (+65) 6472
L3l = | Fax: (+65) 6472
2112 |

Branch: 9A Serangoon North Ave 5
Singapore 554500 | Tel: (+65) E484

9913 | Fax: (+65) 6481 1011 |
Branch: 551 Upp Thomson Road Singapore
574415 | Tel: (+65) 6452

GE6H | Fax: (+65) 6452 9223 1
Wik . OW . 5T

www . facebook. com/opt inawerks

On 7/30/2018 1:29 PM, Riza wrote:
Dear Shu Pei,
This is noted.

Thanks

Best Regards,

Riza (Ms)

Claims Executive

Tel: +65 6484-9919
(ext.105)

Fax: +65 6481-1011

OQPTIMA WERKE PTE LTD

Head office: €& Kung Chong
Road Singapors 159143 I
Tel: (+65) 6472

1313 | Fax: [(+65)
6472 2112

Branch: %A Serangoon North
Ave 5 Singapore 554500 |
Tel: (+65) 6484

go1g9 | Fax: (+65)
6481 1011 |

Branch: 5531 Upp Thomson
Road Singapore

a74415 | Tali: [(+65)
6452 6E6H | Fax:
(+65) 6452 8223 |

WWW, OW, 50

www. facebook.com/opt imawer
Kz

On 7/30/2018 12:54 PM. Shu Pei
(LKKAuto) wrote:

Dear Riza,
[




We refer to the
below email,

Please he
informed that we
are currently
pending for our

insured'’s report.

Kindly note that
for liability, claim
negotiation and
scttlement, please
contact Hsiao
Tong at 6742
3197.

Our respective
case handler will
look into the
matter and revert
to you in due
course,

Thank you

To check
availability of
the case
handler, you
may contact the
undersigned.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants
Pte Ltd

Phona: 6366-0055 |
email:

shupei@ikkauto.com

fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi
Industrial Park, Ubi
Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)

From: Riza
<riza{@ow. sg>
Sent: Monday, 30
July 2018 12:16 PM
To: Admin A
=admin-
aE@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin-D

7



(LKKAuto) <admin-
d@lkkauto.com>:
assignments
<assignments@|kka
uto.com:;
winson@ow.sg;
ily.loi@ow.sg;
puitheng.chong@o
w.sg; 'Sharon Ten’
<sharon@ow. sg>
Subject: Re:
Arrange survey -
Accident involving
5LP757Z and
S5LH5789R on
25/07/18

Dear all,

The above vehicle
has just been
surveyed today.

Please advise us the
liability as soon as
possible,

Thanks

Best Regards,

Riza (Ms)
Claims
Executive

Tel: +65 6484-
9919 (ext.l058)
Fax: +65 6491-
1011

OPTIMA WERKE
PTE LTD

Head office: 6
Eung' Chong
Road Singapore
158143

Tel: (+65)
€472

1321k3 | F
ax: (+#85) 472
2112 |
Branch: 92
Serangoon
North Awve 5
Singapocre

554500 | Tel:
[+tE5) ©4B4
a51¢ F
ax: (+65%) 8481
1811 |



Hsiao Tnng (LKKAuto)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAUtS)
Sent: Monday, 5 November 2018 12:02 PM
To: Lily loi@ow.sg
Cc: 'Sharon’; ‘Adeline Lim': Admin A: CS A Team
Subject: FW: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLP757Z & SLH5789R ON 25/06/2018 (AIG)
Attachments: SLPT57Z LOD.pdf
Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email,

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Please note that: -

LKK ref Officer in charge
CC6/LCR18B013737 /Kpb3 Hsiao Tong

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Uhi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Lily. loi@ow.sg <Lily.loi@ow.sg>

Sent: Monday, 5 Movember 2018 11:32 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@|kkauto.com>

Cc: 'Sharon' <sharon@ow.sg>; 'Adeline Lim' <adeline@ow .sg>

Subject: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLP757Z & SLH5789R ON 25/06/2018 (AIG)

Our Ref : SLP737Z / TP#690
Your Ref : SLH5789R
Without Prejudice

Dear Officer-In-Charge,

We refer to the above mentioned accident.

We are claiming as below: ,J,d |
o o o ) 4 k[('dﬂ X
- Cost of Repair (incl. of GST ) S$5.536.73
- Loss of Rental (incl. of GST ) SE513.60 ($128.40 x 04 days)
- LTA/GIA Search Fee $$7.45 /- W
Grand Total $$6,057.78 ,{,{\'\f
5 J

Your prompt attention is most grateful and look forward to your speedy settlement.

e
1 LM'{\



Thank you.

Best Regards,

Lily Loi (Ms)
Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011

OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD

Head office: 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 T: 4656472 1313 F: +656472 2112
Branch : 94 Serangoon Morth Ave 5 Singapore 554500 T: 465 6484 9919  F: +65 6481 1011
Branch : 551 Upp Thomson Road Singapore 574415 T:+65 6452 6868  F- 46564529223
WWW.OW.SE

www. facebook.com/optimawerkz




Our Refl s SLPT7572 / TPH#690
Your Rel * SLH3789R

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Date @ 5 November 2018
AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE, LTD.
AlG BUILDING
78 Shenton Way #07-16
Singapore 079120
Attention: Motor Claims Department
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLP7577 & SLHST89R ON 25/06/2018
ALONG LORONG 35 GEYLANG

We refer to the above captioned.

We are claiming the below followings :

- Cost of Repair (incl. of GST) 555,530,773

- Loss of Rental {incl. of GST ) 55513.600 (5128.40 x (4 days)
- LTA/GIA Scarch Fee 55745

Grand Total S86,057.78

[f yvou have any enquiries, please contact our representative, Ms. Sharon Ten & Ms. Lily at
64849919 or email sharoniwow,sg / hly loiaow.sp

All payment is to be i1ssued direct to Optima Werkz Pte Ltd,

Your prompt attention is most grateful and look forward to your speedy settlement,

Yours faithfully
OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD

Enel.

This is a camputer gencrated printout and o signatre is reguired



Hsiao Tnnﬂ (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 13 November 2078 11:10 AM

To: Lilyloi@ow.sg

Cc: Sharon’; ‘Adeline Lim

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLPTS57Z & SLHS789R OM 25/06/2018 (AIG) *LKK
REF:

Without Frejudice

Hi Lily,

We reter to the above matter,

We propose settlement at a global sum of $5,970.00(all-in).
Flease confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resalving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email; chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Uhi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8(4080932)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 5 November 2018 12:02 PM

To: Lily.loi@ow.sg

Cc: 'Sharon' <sharon@ow.sg>; 'Adeline Lim' <adeline@ow.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-
a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLP757Z & SLH5789R ON 25/06/2018 (AIG)

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Please note that: -

LKK ref | Officer in charge _[

1




Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Lily.loi@ow.sg

Sent: Tuesday, 13 November 2018 4.50 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Ce: ‘Sharon'; 'Adeline Lim'

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLP757Z & SLH5789R ON 25/06/2018 (AIG) *LKK
REF:

Dear Hsiao Tong,

We accepted your offer at amount $5,970
Kindly forward your DV to us.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Lily Loi (Ms)
Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011

OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD

Head office: 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 T:+65 6472 1313  F: +65 6472 2112
Branch :9A Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500 T:+65 6484 9919 F: +65 6481 1011
Branch :551 Upp Thomson Road Singapaore 574415 T:+65 6452 6B6E  F:+65 6452 9223

WWW.OW.58
www.facebook.com/optimawerkz

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 13 November, 2018 11:10 AM

To: Lily.loi@ow.sg

Cc: 'Sharon' <sharon@ow.sg>; 'Adeline Lim' <adeline@ow.sg>

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLP757Z & SLH5789R ON 25/06/2018 (AIG) *LKK REF:

Without Prejudice

Hi Lily,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement at a global sum of $5,270.00(all-in).
Flease confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settiement.”
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113002018

NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR

Praview

TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
[‘J&hicla No: SLH57B9R (Insd veh) Model: TOYOTA C-HR 1.8 HYEBRID SIG
SLP757Z (TP veh) (A)
| Date of Accident:  |25/06/2018
Global Sum Settlement | | [X] Yes | [ 1 nNo
Repair Estimate 3 12,102.10
Final Repair Cost - 1 5,970.00
Loss of Use -] days at 30.00 per day
Rental (if any) - 1 4 days
LTA / GIA Search Fee 3
Others: ]
-
Final Settlement Sum (GLOBAL SUM) ] 5.870.00
Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? YES [ X] NO (Kindly indicate below)
A)  For Nen GIA Resistemd Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: _

%)

e

BOLA Applicable:
Assessed Liability

Yes/ No BOLA Scenario Mo:
*) (%)

* Assessed Liability to be filed only for chain coflisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1} | Optima Werkz Pte Ltd b 5,970.00f
2) 05
3} 5
NUR SHAQILAH BTE ABDOL WAHAB 350’”1‘3"
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical Report/ Bill

(if any)

"



1173002018 Adjuster Repaort

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregno1ssenriasr)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments{@|kkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CCG/LCR18013737/KPB352
Date: J0Mizo18
REFEREMNCE
Handling Insurer AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. Policy No: 0999994827
ﬁf':'““"' Vehicle ¢ p7577 Insured Vehicle No:  SLH5789R
Date of Loss: 25/06/2018 Matura of Claim: TP Claim No: 2515336919506
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg MNo: SLP7572
Make & Model: TOYOTA C-HR, 1.8 HYBRID S/G (&) Engine No: 2ZRB029455
Rag. Date: 25/05/2017 (Man. Year: 2017) Chassis No: Z¥YX102010777
Colour; Metallic Grey Odometer: 40311 km
Engine Capacily: 1797 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: NiA
Sum Insured (S3): Market Value/MNew Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Good  Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes

Handbrake {Serviceable); Yes Engine Modification: No

CONDITION OF TYRES

Pre-accident Condition:

Front Tyre Size: 215/60R17 Rear Tyre Size: 215/60R17
Front Left Side: Bridgestone & mm Rear Left Side: Bridgestone 6 mm
Frent Right Side: Bridgestone 8 mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestone 6 mm
The atave values represend the remaining lyve treads depdh
COST OF CLAIMS ~ Repairer's  Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %
Parts 8.760.37 3,904.50 485587 5543
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2,550.00 1,.270.00 1.280.00 50.20
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S§) 11,310.37 5,174.50 6,135.87 54.25
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S§) 791.73 362.22 42951 54,25
Nett Amount (S5§) 12,102.10 5,536.72 6,565.38 54.25
+ Car Rental (4.0 x $$100.00/day + 7.00% GST) (5%} 428.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (5%) 7.45
Nett Liability (55) 597217
Global Sum Settlement (S§) 5,970.00

INSPECTION

Date of Assignment: 30/07/2018

Date Inspected: 30/07/2018 Inspected Al
Estimated Period of Repair: 4.0 days

Optima Werkz Pte Ltd (HQ)
9A Serangoon NMorth Ave 5

Singapore 554500

hitps:isingapore.manmen comiclaimsindex cim?usebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_printrpt&caseid=7T 28922 &extid=2T8685&4CFID=44623979&C... 14



11/30/2018 Adjuster Report
Adjuster:  KENNETH KONG Manager: CHEW HSIAC TONG

NOTE: This repovt represends our findings af the ime and place of inspection stated Rerewn, Such inspaction has been camied out fo the best of our knowledge and ability but
any ofher fability urder any other circumstances is hereby expressly excivded.

hitps:/isingapore. merimen.com/claims/index clm?lusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_printrpt&caseid=728022&extid=2TA6E58CFID=4462397940C ... 2/4



11732018

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts
Qty Part No. Particulars

Mo.
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*FRONT HEADLAMP
*FRONT BUMPER

“*FRONT BEUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH
“*FRONT BUMPER LOWER DIFFUSER

“FRONT BUMPER CLIPS
‘FRONT FENDER RH

*FRONT FENDER EMBLEM HYBRID
‘FRONT FENDER ARCH GARNISH RH

*FRONT FENDER ARCH GARNISH CLIPS
*FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD VERTICAL RH

‘FRONT FENDER BRACKET RH
*FRONT DOOR RH

*FRONT DOOR BLACK FRAME STICKER HORIZONTAL RH
*FRONT DOOR BLACK FRAME STICKER VERTIZAL RH
*FRONT DOOR BLACK FRAME INNER STICKER RH
FRONT SUSPENSION SHOCK ABSORBER RH

*FRONT SUSPENSION SHOCK ABSORBER TOP MOUNTING RH
*FRONT SUSPENSION KNUCKLE ARM RH

“FRONT SUSPENSION KNUCKLE ARM BEARING RH
*FRONT SUSPENSION LOWER ARM RH

“FRONT SUSPENSION STABILIZER BAR LINK RH

*FRONT SUSPENSION ABS SENSOR RH

*FRONT RH 17 SPORT RIM ORIGINAL

*FRONT RH TYRE 215/60R17 96H

F=Franchise parl. 5=5pcMell. L=ListhtemDigc,

Adjuster Repaori

- List Item Discount on L ltems 25.00/25.00% (S%) 2,314.50

Condition Repairer's Amount
Mtg Cracked 1,725.00FL *1,725.00 FL
Buckled / Dented 1,020 30 FL *974 45FL
Distorted 58.96 FL *58.96 FL
Scratched 499 60FL *499.60FL
MNecessary 65.00FL *65.00FL
Bent 84510FL *780.30FL
MNecessary 49 B0 FL *49.80FL
Cut 153.23FL ™"53.23FL
Necessary 33.00FL  *33.00FL
Serviceable 83.60FL “-FL
Repair 48.50FL *-FL
Repair 1,295.70 FL *-FL
Mot Necessary 48 80 FL “-FL
Mot Necessary 35.60FL *-FL
Mot Necessary 48 80 FL *“_FL
Serviceable 526.90 FL *-FL
Serviceable 298.60FL *-FL
Serviceable 5B5.TOFL “-FL
Not Necessary 637.30FL *-FL
Serviceable 637,80 FL *-FL
Serviceable 175.T0FL *-FL
Serviceahle 325.00FL *=FL
Dented / Cul 1,336.88FS *“650.00F5
Serviceable 480.00FS “-F5

Sub Total (S%) 11,074.87 4,989.34

1,084 84

Total Parts (S$) 8,760.37  3,904.50

Report was unsubmitied during this print-out.

hitps-isingapare menmen.comfclaimsindex.cim?fusebox=MTRadjusler&luseaction=gen_printrpt&casaid=728922 &extid=27TA685&CF ID=4462397094C . 34



11302018 Adjuster Report
Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellanecus items selected,

Recommended Labour

Mo Particulars Lab.Type

Labour ltems

1 TO REMOVE & REPLACED WITH PANEL BEATING ALL ACCIDENT MNew
PORTION.

2 TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING WITH SEALANT ALL ACCIDENT PORTION. MNew

5 TO TUFF KOTE / ANTI-RUST. New

4 TO CHECK WIRING & WATER LEAKAGE. Mew

5  TO DISMANTLE & REINSTALL FRONT RH DOOR INNER COMPONENT TO  MNew
FACILITATE REPAIR.

6 TO DISMANTLE & REPLACED FRONT RH UNDER CARRIAGE, New

T TO SEND VEHICLE FOR 3D COMPUTERISED WHEEL ALIGNMENT. MNew

Gross Labour Cost (58)

Repairer's

1,000.00

1,000.00
60.00
60.00

180.00

190.00
60.00

2,550.00

Amount

500.00

660,00
30.00
20.00

0.00

0.00
60.00

1,270.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-put.

< END OF ESTIMATES =
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