2}' Irene (LKKAuto)

e ———— e ——— S

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Monday, 18 February 2019 9:42 AM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: RE: PA AND MARKED EST. REF : 17/18/18/VPO5/020787 ( SGN 3086B) ON

25.07.2018 (TP ACCORD 5LC 1911G) [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Irene,

Kindly proceed as proposed but for loss of use, you can offer them
from 12 days first.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

e i L The all {New ) lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parfies only.

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:JoyIrene@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 7 February, 2019 11:47 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; Admin A

Subject: RE: PA AND MARKED EST. REF : 17/18/18/VP05/020787 ( SGN 3086B) ON 25.07.2018 (TP ACCORD SLC
1911G)

Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020787

Dear Gerald,
This is frant-to-rear scenario where our insured driver hit third-party from the rear.

BOLA 27-100%.Liability is not in our favour.

Summary to offer to repairer M/s ACCORD AUTO SERIVICES PTE LTD is as follows:

TP CLAIMED OUR REVISED
TO OFFER
Cost of Repairs 512,938.95 (estimate) S 8,628.02 (with G5T)
Loss of Rental 5 2,880.00 (5180 x 16 days) 5 2,100.00 (5150 x 14 days)




Medical Fee 5 180.00 5 180.00
GIA/LTA Search Fee | S 2.00 S 2.00
TOTAL $ 16,000.95 $10,910.02

Relevant supporting claim documents attached for your perusal and reference.
For your approval.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

loy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene @lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.|If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 7 February 2019 9:59 AM

To: '"GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.com=

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: PA AND MARKED EST. REF : 17/18/18/VP05/020787 ( SGN 3086B) ON 25.07.2018 (TP ACCORD 5LC 1911G)

REF: 17/18/18/VP05/020787

Dear Gerald,

We refer to the subject.

We attached PA and Marked estimate for your reference and records.
We will be seeking for mandate approval shortly.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.



ACCORD AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD

BLOCK 1009 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3
#01-80 SINGAPORE 159723
TEL: 6271 5133/6271 7433 FAM: 6274 5715
GST Regn No: 201113141K

24 December 2018

Lonpac Insurance BHD
300 Beach Road
#17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Attn: Motor Claims Department

Dear Sirs,

CC N VOLVING VEHICLE: SL.C191 I(f and SGNIVZ6B on 25.7.2018 Along Boundary Roa

We are the authorized repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicle no:SLC1911G, which was involved in the
captioned accident with your insured vehicle: SGN3086B .The vehicle owner has requested and authorized us to
assist him in presenting his'her claim against the party responsible for the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving, we are submitting these claims for
your consideration on behalf of the owner/claimant.

(1) Cost Of Repair b 8.063.57

02) 7% GST b3 564,45

03) Car Rental 16 days (@ $180 £ 2.880.00
(* Including 2 days PRI 3 non working days on 2972018, 5.8. 2018 & 9.8.2018)

05) GIA/LTA Enquiry Fee g 2.00
06) WTTT @ SG (Medical Fee) 5 180.00
b3 11,690.02
We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims:-
a) GIA report e} Insured NRIC & Driving License
by Repair Statement AMK484 f) GIA'LTA Enquiry Fee
c)  Car Rental Agreement &) Letter OF Authority

d)  Medical Bill

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of our customer’s claims
as soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any
personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/claimant,
A

Thank you
Yours faithfully
o sy Lo, pre,
T S Yy U l s |
AUTO SERVICES PTE L
Celia Lai {

Accord Aubo Services Pte Lid
Tel 6271 7433 / 9274 0950

Email: avelaimsi@ mycarworkshop.com.sg



LETTER OF AUTHORITY

To Whom It May Concern.

Accident Involving Vehicle: SLc (911 G, r-"'ﬂlr UM 28Rt 257 318 Alowa
;‘Iaimlr\:-ﬂf..r,_-! l'l-l."‘e'.r'l.

IWe,  Taw \ue  Muod NRICno.  21%498437]
of ) o
owner of maotor vehicle no. 8Le ¥n g do hereby appoint Accord Auto Services Pte Lid

as mvy/ours authorised representation and

as my/ours solicitors to write, to negotiate and settle my/our claims against the other party/parties

involved in the above mentioned accident. 'We,  Taw L“ Lhoed
J

shall have absolute discerption to settle the matter at the best term.

I/We also confirm and instruct that any agreed settlement sum in respect my/our claims be paid
Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd and such payment will be constitute a full and final discharge of my

claims.

Signature of Owner



LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Without Prejudice

I - 2 . 4 ] .

DATE : 05 JULY 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/'We, TAN LYE HUAT confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD and/or the owner of SGN _3086B the sum of Singapore Dollars Ten Thousand
Six Hundred Ten and Cents Two Only ($10,610.02) in full and final satisfaction,
liquidation and discharge of property claim competent to me/us upon the said M/s
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of properly claim sustained by me/us
whether now or hereafter to become manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from
an accident to my vehicle, SLC _1911G on 25 JULY 2018’ along BOUNDARY
ROAD.

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (DING TECK YONG
GABRIEL / LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims
whatsoever made by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to M/S
ACCORD AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD.

I/'We hereby ac
liability basi

wledge that this payment is made on a without admission of
without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
action,

........ /e 2 UL 08
of vehicle owner/Date
T bye Vot 12 JUL 208

Name of vehicle owner/Date



ACCORD AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD

BLOCK 1009 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3
#01-80 SINGAPORE 159723

TEL: 6271 5133/6271 7433 FAX: 6274 5715
GST Regn No: 201113141K

Date 1 24 Dec 2018
Lonpac Insurance BHD Our Ref No : AMEKA484
300 Beach Road Insured : Tan Lye Huat
#117-04/07 The Concourse Insured NRIC @ 517488431
Singapore 199555 Make & Model : Honda Odyssey 2.4 EXV-S CVT SR
DOA : 25.7.2018
Claim Type : Third Party
REPAIR STATEMENT
Re: Vehicle Registration No: SLCI911G
Cost Of Repair 5 8,063.57
7% GST b 564.45
$ 8.628.02

Accord Auto Services Pte Lid




www. MyCarWorkshop.com.sg

Tan Lye Huat

Accord Rent-A-Car Pte. Ltd.

Blk 1009 Bukit Merah Lane 3
#01-80 Alexandra Village Ind'l Est
Singapore 159723

TEL: 97690531

FAX: 5481 9516

Co Reg Mo, 20011301726

Invoice #: RCS0836

Customer Vehicle Mo, SLCT811G
Replacement Vehicle No,: SJ05073Y
Maka & Model: Toyota Camry 2.4 A

IU No.: 1123081050

Rental Information:

Date | Time

Rental Cost

Daily 16
Weekly

Menthly

cow

Others

Payment Details:

$?Iaﬂﬂlul:l

Start End Actual Duration / Charged
26072018 | 11:30 AM 1082018 | 5:00 PM 16 Days
Days 5180,00 Per day $2,880.00
Waeekly Per week
Mandhly Per manth
Per day

This is a computer generaled invoice, No signalure is required,
Thank you for choosing Accord Rent A Car Ple Lid

Main Branch: 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A, #03-11 AMK Autopoint, Singapore S68047. Tel: 6481 9518, Fax: 6481 9516
Branch: Blk 1009 Bukit Merah Lane 3, #01-80, Singapore 159723, Tel: 6271 5133, Fax: 6274 5715



VEHICLE HIRING AGREEMENT

Wehicle No: S080T3Y

Make & Moded: Toyota Camry 2.4 A
THIRD PARTY INSURANCE NON WAIVER EXCESS: $3500
OWHN DAMAGE INSURANCE NON WAIVER EXCESS: §3500

HIRER'S PARTICULARS

Mame (as in NRIC): Tan Lye Huat
MRIC / Passport Na: 517488434
Date of Birth: 130119686

Address: Blk 256 Kim Keat Avenue #08-164 Singapore 310256

Employment Details:
Driving License Passed Date: 1000411986
Contact 7801056

Vehicle Out Date: 26/07/2018 Time: 1130 AM
Vehicle In Date Tirmve:

4 180 v
Rate Per Day: 5230.00 Mo, of Days:

Total Charges:

ADDITIONAL DRIVER'S PARTICULARS
Mame (as in NRIC):

MRIC / Passport Mo:

Drate of Birh; -
Atdress,

Employment Details:

Driving Licenss Passed Date: -

Contact

MILEAGE OUT : 4~

CONTROL LEVEL {OUT & IN)

ouT IN

EMERGENCY BREAKDOWN AND TOWING SERVICE (24 HOURS) HELPLINE: 6481 8518 / 6271 5133 HP 9229 8191

IMPORTANT INFORMATION AND DECLARATION

Befare signing this agreement you should carefully read and understand the terms and conditions provided with this documants and
canfirm bekow whether you consent o receiving information as set out.

1.
2.
A

Omnly persons abowve 25 & below 65 years of age and signing this agreement may drive the vehbicle,

Vehicle 5 strictly for use in Singapore only and may net drlven out of Singapore without the prior writlen cansant of Precursor Investimenis,
All vehicles are fitted with anti theft device which will respanse to the RF at the Singapore Customs. Hirer will be fully liable for all costs and
charges incurred in event that the iImmobdiser is being activated at the Singapore Customs, There will be no refund of unused rental and the
hirer shall bear the costs of the following charges i) $5200,00 for towing from Singapore Customs i) 5515000 for resetting of immobiliser,

. Use of vehicle for ilegal purposes (e.g. In connection with thell, drug pedaling or frafficking, smuggling} is strictly probibited,

. In case of accident, the hirer shall report to the rental office immediately. i there are bodily injuries, a police report must be made within 24
hours,
. Punclured tyres, emply petrol lank, flat battery dus to negligence, loss of vehicle's key or locked key inside the vehicle. by itself does not

consitute (o a breakdown and thal in the event, the Owner's 24 hours Emergency Service is called upon 1o respond 16 such occurrénce, the
Hirer shall bear the costs of such response a1 S350.00 per trip. Punctured and damaged tyres that carnot be reused will be changed
accordlingly from SS80.00 1o 35200.00 per tyre,

7. All vehiclas are supplied wilh patrel and should be returmed with petrel level Ikewise. Thare will be no refurd for excess petral,

9
0,

. Mo retund or early return of vehicle (The Hirer shall be iable for excess charges for any |ate return &t rate shown per howr per day), Latest by

Bpm,
Windscreen and windows damages are not covered under insurance (Range from S5300.00 1o S$1000.00),
MNe Smaking, Durians and Transportation of Pels are allowed, Hirer 15 responsible for a panalty of S§500,00,

I have read and agree to the terms and conditions on both sides of this agreement as indicated. | consent 1o pay tha final cost of rental and |
uncerstand thal the cost of rental set out above i an estimate only, | may be liable to further charges as 32t out in Clauses § and which include,
bt are ned limited to,my liability asownar of the vehicke for charges for traffic or parking viclations during the currenoy of this agreement.All
informatian | have provided Procursor Investments in connection with this agreement i frue.

Signature/Company Stamp (if Applicable}

Date: 26/07/2018

Custemer name: Tan Lye Huat (hirer)



WTTT@SG

Invoice Tao: Tan Lye
Huat

WTTT@5G - Tan Lye Huat x 1

TOTAL -C

Questions? SgillarEgmail.com

Date: July 31, 2018
Slatus: Paid
Inveice: 2847

180,00

$180.00



7262018 Imvolee

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

GENERAL 6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

l"SURA“CE Fhone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +63 6224 0030

ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE
Our Ref No: GR-18-114869
Date of Request: 280772018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd
10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 24 #03-11
AME Auto Point
Singapore 368047
Dear SirfMadam,
Enquiry Date 26/07/2018
Enquiry By Soe Jie Y
TP Vehicle No, SGNI0BEE
Accident Date 25/0712018
DESCRIFTION AMOUNT (S5)
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date;
[X] GIRO [ ] Cash [ ] Chegue

hitps./isingapore metimen.comdclaims/index cfmTfusebox=MTRsasifuseaction=dsp_geninvip&refld= 187076048 CRID=380116808 CFTOKEN=TE... 212



TI262018 Invoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE -ione 65 624 0010 Fax 268 6224 0030
ASSOCLATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to 5pm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Cur Ref No: GR-18-114669
Date of Request: 26/07/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Accord Auto Services Pte Lid

10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 24 #03-11
AMK Auto Point

Singapore 568047

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enquiry Date 26/07/2018

Enguiry By Soe Jie Yi

TP Vehicle Mo. SGEMN308EE

Accident Date 25/07/2018

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Fericd of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SGN30E6E Lonpac Insurance Bhd 15M1172017-14/11/2018 +635 62507388
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the eriginal reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance Association of
Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any loss or damage arising out of
ar in connection with the reparts or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

hnps:rfsﬁuam.mrimen.cun‘u’nlairrmlndax.cfm'?!'usebux=HTRsaﬁ&fuueactian%sp_gunhwtp& refid=18707604CFID=360116808CFTOKEN=278,.. 1,2



