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Mivitha (LKK Auto)

Fram: LEW JENNY <jennylew@uoicomsg>

Sent: Friday, 27 July 2018 9:29 AM

To: welleemotorworks@gmail.com; assignments@lkkauto.com; "SUR"
Subject: RE: TP survay for vehicle no: SKN30367

Attachments: doc02580720180727090842 zip

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dazar Karen,

As spoken, we will appoint LKK as SIE as per requested
Daar Shiau Chan,
Please arrange to survey the vehicle at Wei Lee Motor Waorks.

Thank You.

Warmes| Regards
Janny Lew

Claims Bepariment
Lrited Dverseas Insurance Umited

A dument Rogd 83001 Spiiidiaal Townr, Stagapore B7 S
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LOB-EMAIL DISCLAIMER

Any parsan receiving this-email and any attachment{s) contained, shall treat the informaticn as confidential and ol misuse, copy,
ditcinse, dislibute ar retain the information in any way that amounts to a reach of canfidentiality. 1f you are niot th Intended
recipient, please delete all copies of this emall from your computer system. As the integrily of this message cannol be guarantsed,
nieither UOE nor any entity in ths UOB Group shall be responsibile fof the contents Any apimion in this emall may not necessarly
represant the opmion of LIDB ar any enfity in the UORB Group

From: karen Seah [mailtoweilesmotarworks@gmail com]
Sent: Friday, July 27, 2018 9:06 AM

To: CORPORATE SERVICES <contactus/@uol.com sg>
Subject: TP survey for vehicle no:

Your insured vehicle No: SIB1828T
Accident involving vehiele no: SKN3036Z/SIB1828T
DOA: 24/07/2018

Dear officer incharge

I refer to the above,attached with the accident report n estimate of repair for the vehicle no: SKN30367.
Kindly arrange to survey the vehicle.

Thank vou,

Best Regards.,

Karen Seah

Wei Lee Maotor Works



Block 9 Sin Ming Industrial Estate
#01-32 Singapore 575644

Tel: 6456 9830

Fax: 6458 0128

Company registrution: 269436/00J



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Mivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 23 August 2018 11:03 AM

To: 'LEW JENNY'; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Ce: 'SUR'

Subject: RE: TP survey for vehicle no: SKN30362

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please be informed according to the repairer, TP owner would like to withdraw claim.

We will close this file at our end without billing.

HEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LEEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Fhone: 6841-1972 | email: peslgnments@Ikkautocom | fax: 62564315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrinl Park, Ubl Avenie 1, #02-25 | §( 408933)

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@Ikkauto.com)

Sent: Friday, 27 July 2018 9:50 AM

To: '"LEW JENNY' <jennylew@uoi.com.sg>; 'ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM' <ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM>
Ce: 'SUR" <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TP survey for vehicle no: SKN30362

Cear Sir/Ndm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lud

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@ikkautocom | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Payn Ubi Industrial Park, Uki Avenue 1, #202-25 | S{408033)

Fraom: LEW JENNY ilto:iEnnylew@uoncom
Sent: Friday, 27 July 2018 9:29 AM

To: welleemotorworks@gmatl.com; assignments@lkkauto.com: “SUR" <suri@lkkauto.coms>
Subject: RE: TP survey for vehicle no: SKN30362

WITHOUT PREIUDICE

Dear Karen,

As spoken, we will appoint LKK as SIE as per requested.

Dear Shiau Chan,

Please arrange to survey the vehicle at Wei Lee Motor Warks.



Thank You,

Warmiest Regards
Jenny Lew

Claima Department

United Overseas Insurance Limited

3 Anson Feoad, 226-01 Sgiringleaf Towsi, Singapore (79008
Main « (65) 8222 T733 | DID + (65) 6480 8370 | Faw » (G5) 8327 2880 | Entiail » jenylssyiiiol ciin sg

OB EMAIL DISCLAIMER

Any person recalving this email and any attachment(s) contained. shall treat the Infarmation as confidéntial and not misuse, copy,
disclose, distribule or retain the information in any way that amourits to abreach of confidentiality. If you are rot the intended
recipient, please delete all copies of this email from your computer system. As the integrity of this message cannot be guarantesd.
neither UOB nar any entity in the UOB Group shall be responsibie for the contents Any opinion in this emall may not necessarily
represent the opinion of UOB or any entity in the UOB Group.

From: karen Seah [mailto:weileemotorworks@gmail.com]

Sent: Friday, July 27, 2018 9:06 AM
To: CORPORATE SERVICES <contactus@uoi.com.sg>
Subject: TP survey for vehicle no;

Your insured vehicle No: SIB1828T
Accident involving vehicle no: SKN3036Z/SIB1828T
DOA: 24/072018

Dear officer incharge

I refer to the above,attached with the accident report n estimate of repair for the vehicle no: SKN30367.
Kindly arrange to survey the vehicle.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Karen Seah

Wei Lee Motor Works

Bluck 9 Sin Ming Industrial Estate
#01-32 Singapore 575644

Tel: 6456 9830

Fax: 6458 0128 |
Company registration: 269436/00J
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