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- PD New Assignment - SLM3409A (OI) VS SJL8606T (TP) DOA 26/07/2018
From: Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur
To: admin-a@lkkauto.com, assignments@lkkauto.com
Cc: Tan, Lily (AIG), Fong, Andy-SY, Kaur, Baljit, Chin, Lee-Ying, Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa, Md Ishak, Mohd Imran, Lim, Sheng Yang, Supramaniam, Darshene, Azlan, Syazairdina, Chan, Yoke Shi
Sent: 7/27/2018 9:47:17 AM
Attachments: SJL8606T Estimate.pdf SJL8606T.PDF

Hi ,
 
Claim number : 0131993326SG
Case owner :  WAN NUR SALIHA BINTE SYED YUSOFF
 
 
Thanks and regards,
 
Aashweenjeet Kaur (Aashween)
AIG
Express Claims Adjuster II
SG Claims Operations  | AIG Shared Services
 
From: Esther Tey Chor Keng (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svcs/AR & SC/ARC/AR) [mailto:TeyChorKeng@smrt.com.sg]  
Sent: Friday, July 27, 2018 9:11 AM 
To: AIG SGP, Claims-Survey; Chin, Lee-Ying; karyong.loo@aig.com 
Cc: Koo Yew Chung (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svs/AR & SC); Peh Eng Hock (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svcs/AR & SC/ARC) 
Subject: TP CLAIMS AGAINTS AIG: SJL8606T
 
A�en�on Motor Claims Dept
 
               
Your Reference :  SLM3409A
Our Reference :   SJL8606T    WL/JUL2018/003
DOA : 26/07/2018
 
RE:          3rd PARTY AGAINST YOUR INSURED'S VEHICLE SLM3409A
                ON 26/07/2018 ALONG CTE TOWARDS CITY BEFORE TUNNEL
 
A�ached is our client's SAS report and our Es�mate cost of repair (based on our visual inspec�on only) for our client's vehicle, SJL8606T for your perusal.
  
Kindly arrange to survey SJL8606T by today. Vehicle currently park at 60 Woodlands Industrial Park E4, Singapore 757705.
We request Single joint expert as per below:
AutoProbe Consultants
LKK
 
We thank you in advance for your assistance in this ma�er.
 
Regards,
Esther
(Tel: 6555-5556)
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