Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 30 March 2020 3:52 PM

To: lionel.tan@fwd.com

Cc: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com

Subject: RE: Accident on 08/07/2018 Along Onan Road Involving YM6737D and SJB5069R Our
Ref: YM6737D180708 Your Ref: 1201800008706

Attachments: RE: Accident on 08/07/2018 Along Onan Road Involving YM6737D and SJB5069R Our

Ref: YM6737D180708 Your Ref: 1201800008706

Hi Lionel,

We refer to the above matter.

Till date, we haven’t receive any acceptance from third party.

In view on above we would like to proceed to temporarily close this matter and submit our WP report accordingly.

Shall seek for further instruction to reopen the case if any new development to the case.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: lionel.tan@fwd.com <lionel.tan@fwd.com>

Sent: Monday, 5 August 2019 1:42 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Cc: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com

Subject: RE: Accident on 08/07/2018 Along Onan Road Involving YM6737D and SIB5069R Our Ref: YM6737D180708
Your Ref: 1201800008706

Hi Asher,

Maintain at 50:50

Best Regards,



Lionel Tan
Senior Executive, Claims

FWD

insurance

FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd.

6 Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986
T (65) 6914 6824

E lionel.tan@fwd.com

W www.fwd.com.sg

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, August 5, 2019 12:13 PM

To: Lionel Tan Tian Pei - SGUser

Cc: Motor Claims SG - SG Common

Subject: RE: Accident on 08/07/2018 Along Onan Road Involving YM6737D and SIB5069R Our Ref: YM6737D180708
Your Ref: 1201800008706

Hi Lionel,

We refer to the email below.

If third party is stationary at the time of the accident the damage to insured vehicle should not be dent.

However third party disagreed with our opinion, he think that we should provide evidence that third party is not

stationary.

Kindly advise.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: lionel.tan@fwd.com <lionel.tan@fwd.com>

Sent: Monday, 5 August 2019 11:54 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Cc: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com

Subject: RE: Accident on 08/07/2018 Along Onan Road Involving YM6737D and SIB5069R Our Ref: YM6737D180708
Your Ref: 1201800008706




Hi Asher,
Damages consistent with whose version?
Best Regards,

Lionel Tan
Senior Executive, Claims

FWD

insurance

FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd.
6 Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986
T (65) 6914 6824

E lionel.tan@fwd.com
W www.fwd.com.sg

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, August 2, 2019 6:06 PM

To: Josey Loh Kah Wai - SGUser; Lionel Tan Tian Pei - SGUser

Cc: Motor Claims SG - SG Common

Subject: RE: Accident on 08/07/2018 Along Onan Road Involving YM6737D and SIB5069R Our Ref: YM6737D180708
Your Ref: 1201800008706

Hi Sir,
We refer to the above matter.
We have try to offer third party multiple times however third party disagreed with our offer of 50%.

Kindly advise.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: josey.loh@fwd.com <josey.loh@fwd.com>

Sent: Thursday, 29 November 2018 10:55 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Cc: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com

Subject: RE: Accident on 08/07/2018 Along Onan Road Involving YM6737D and SIB5069R Our Ref: YM6737D180708
Your Ref: 1201800008706




Hi Asher,

Please let us have your opinion on the consistency of the damages sustained to the insured’s vehicle based on insured’s
GIA.

Thank you.

Kind Regards

Josey Loh
Executive, Claims

FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd.
6 Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986

T (65)6727 5872
E josey.loh@fwd.com

W fwd.com.sg
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From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 20 November, 2018 2:25 PM

To: Josey Loh Kah Wai - SGUser

Subject: Accident on 08/07/2018 Along Onan Road Involving YM6737D and SJB5069R Our Ref: YM6737D180708 Your
Ref: 1201800008706

Hi Josey,
We refer to the above matter.
Third party disagreed with our offer of liability.

Please kindly advise.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108




Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the use of the
individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please notify the sender
immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not use, disclose, copy or store
this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any attachments
at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT been scanned for viruses
by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any attachments.
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