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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 198607198R GST Reg. No. 19-0807108-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY Ref :  CS/GAI18013658/Avd3
NI
#16-01 GENTENNIAL TOWER Date: 26-07-2018
SINGAPORE 038180
Code: GAl
Al Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SLL 4723R Veh. Inspected SKL 318R
Policy No. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From RACHEL TAN Assign Date 26/07/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mim
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  23/07/2018 Inspection Date 30/07/2018
Survey held at MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
BLK 3023A UBI ROAD 1
#01-61
SINGAPORE 408717
5a. Remarks

AYTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




A
' V [/ c.;t:smanr:

el as = Pie Lid Company Registration No. 193607 198R

S1 UBLAVE 1, #02.25 PAYA URLINDUSTHRIAL PARE. SINGAOKRE 408933 TEL @ (65) 62563561 FAN s (B B25R411 5

Your ref: CLMOMVP0O0D0000802
OQur ref: CS/GAIIR013658/Avd3 DATE :5/9/2018
The Motor Claims Department Without Prejudice

M/s: GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.SKL 318R
We thank you for your instruction on 26/7/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned
vehicle on 30/7/2018  at the premises of M/s MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : $820,909.70

Revised Estimate Amount : §%6,600.00 (LUMP SUM)
"Check” Items Amount : 5%

Market Value : 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%

MNett Value : 8%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the rear
n/s body.

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

ADRIAN LING WAL PING
B.Eng AMSOE, AMIRTE AMSAE-AM.MATAI
Licensed Appraiser



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 5 September 2018 11:58 AM

To: Tan, Rachel

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: [External] RE: TP Claim SKL318R & SLL4T23R (GA)
Attachments: SKL 318R PRELI REVISED.pdf

Dear Rachel,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SKL 318R
Date of survey: 30/7/2018
Number of days : 6 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 5256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4313

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Meei Huey <meeihuey@modernautomotive.com.sg=>
Sent: Monday, 30 July 2018 3:21 PM

To: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>

Ce: Chin <chin@modernautomotive.com.sg>

Subject: [External] RE: TP Claim SKL318R & SLL4723R (GA)

Hi Rachel,
We refer to your email below.

As attached is the estimate for our vehicle SKL318R.
Thank you.

Regards,

Mei Hui, Ho

Modern Automotive Pte Ltd | MM Trading Enterprise
Blk 30234 Ubi Road 1 #01-61 5(408717)

Tel: 6744 4422 / 8121 3226

Fax: 6747 6720

From: Tan, Rachel <Rachel. Tan({@sg.gaig.com>

Sent: 26 July, 2018 11:09 AM

To: Meei Huey <meeihuey @ modernautomotive.com.sg>
Cc: LKK Assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: RE: TP Claim SKL318R & SLL4723R (GA)

Without prejudice



Dear Meei Huey

Thank you for taking my call.
Based on the circumstance of the accident, liability is not in the favor of the driver for vehicle : SLL4723R
As agreed, we will arrange for LKK to conduct PRI, please furnish us with the estimates, thank you.

Dear LKK

Please accept assignment. Thank you

Regards

Rachel Tan

Executive, Motor Claims, Great American Insurance Company
Tel: 6804 7846

From: Meei Huey <meeihuey@modernautomotive.com.sg=
Sent: Thursday, July 26, 2018 10:06 AM

To: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg. gaig.com>
Subject: [External] RE: TP Claim SKL318R & SLL4A723R (GA)

Dear Rachel,
We refer to your email below.

Unfortunately, our client’s video was overlapped thus no video provided.
Meanwhile, do advise liability.

Thank you.

Regards,

Mei Hui, Ho

Modern Autamaotive Pte Ltd | MM Trading Enterprise
Blk 3023A Ubi Road 1 #01-61 5{408717)

Tel: 6744 4422 [ 8121 3226

Fax: 6747 6720

From: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>
Sent: 25 July, 2018 12:44 PM

To: meeihuey@modernautomotive.com.sg
Subject: RE: TP Claim SKL318R & SLL4723R (GA)

Without Prejudice

Dear Meei Huey

Can you provide us with the video footage, thank you.
Regards

Rachel Tan

Executive, Motor Claims, Great American Insurance Campany
Tel: 6804 7846



From: Ong, Joanna On Behalf Of General Claims
‘'Sent: Wednesday, July 25,2018 12:18 PM

To: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>
Subject: FW: [External] TP Claim SKL318R & SLLA723R (GA)

Rachel ~ FYMNA!

Jloanna

From: Meei Huey <meeihuey@modernautomotive.com.sg=>
Sent: Wednesday, July 25, 2018 10:01 AM

To: General Claims <GereralClaims@sg. gaig.com>

Cc: Chin <chin@modernautomotive.Com.sg>

Subject: [External] TP Claim SKL318R & SLLA723R

Dear Sir/Madam,

we refer to the above matter.

Kindly advise liability for our vehicle below:

Your Insured: SLL4723R

Our Insured: SKL318R

DOA: 23.07.2018

We enclosed herewith client report for your perusal.
Please reply.

Thank you

Regards,

fei Hui, Ho

Modern Automotive Pte Ltd | MM Trading Enterprise
Blk 3023A Ubi Road 1 #01-61 S(408717)

Tel: 6744 4422 [ 8121 3226
Fax: 6747 6720

are not the intended

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee, If you
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this a-mail is strictly prohibited. If you

immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.

raceive this message in error, please notify the sender

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mall s strictly prohibited. |f you receive this message in error, please notify the sender

immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Tan, Rachel <Rachel Tan@sg.gaig.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 31 July 2018 9:11 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAULS)

Subject: RE: RE: TP Claim SKL318R & 5LL4723R (GA)
CLMOMVPOO00DD0Z02

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, July 31, 2018 8:29 AM

To: Tan, Rachel <Rachel Tan@sg.gaig.com=>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [External] RE: RE: TP Claim SKL318R & SLL4723R (GA)

Dear Rachel,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SKL 318R on 30/7/2018.
We are pending estimate from repairer.

Kindly provides us the claim number. /

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 July 2018 11:36 AM

To: 'Tan, Rachel' <Rachel.Tan@sg gaig.com>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: RE: TP Claim SKL318R & SLL4723R (GA)

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
hone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tan, Rachel [mailto:Rachel.Ta n(@sg.gaig.com]
Sent: Thursday, 26 July 2018 11:09 AM



To: Meei Huey <meeihuey@modernautomaotive.com.sg>
_Cc: LKK Assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: RE: TP Claim SKL318R & SLL4723R (GA)

Without prejudice
Dear Meei Huey

Thank you for taking my call.
Based on the circumstance of the accident, liability is not in the favor of the driver for vehicle : SLL4723R
As agreed, we will arrange for LKK to conduct PRI, please furnish us with the estimates, thank you.

Dear LEK
Please accept assignment. Thank you

Regards

Rachel Tan

Executive, Motor Claims, Great American Insurance Company
Tel: 6804 7846

From: Meei Huey <meeihuey @modernautomotive.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, July 26, 2018 10:06 AM

To: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>

Subject: [External] RE: TP Claim SKL318R & SLL4723R (GA)

Dear Rachel,
We refer to your email below.

Unfortunately, our client’s video was overlapped thus no video provided.
Meanwhile, do advise liability.

Thank you.

Regards,

Mei Hui, Ho

Modern Automaotive Pte Ltd | MM Trading Enterprise
Blk 3023A Ubi Road 1 #01-61 S{408717)

Tel: 6744 4422 /8121 3226

Fax: 6747 6720

From: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.paig.com>
Sent: 25 July, 2018 12:44 PM

To; meeihuey@modernautomotive.com.sg
Subject: RE: TP Claim SKL318R & SLL4723R (GA)

Without Prejudice
Dear Meei Huey
Can you provide us with the video footage, thank you.

Regards
Rachel Tan



Executive, Motor Claims, Great American Insurance Company
Tel: 6804 7846

From: Ong, Joanna On Behalf Of General Claims

Sent: Wednesday, July 25, 2018 12:18 PM

To: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg gaig.com>

Subject: FW: [External] TP Claim SKL318R & SLL4723R (GA)

Rachel ~ FYNA!
loanna

From: Meei Huey <meeihuey@modernautomotive.com.sg>
Sent; Wednesday, July 25, 2018 10:01 AM
To: General Claims <GeneralClaims@sg.gaig.com>

Cc: Chin <chin@modernautomaotive.com.sg>
Subject: [External] TP Claim SKL318R & SLLAT723R

Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
Kindly advise liability for our vehicle below:

Your Insured: SLL4723R
Our Insured: SKL318R
DOA: 23.07.2018

We enclosed herewith client report for your perusal.
Please reply.

Thank you

Regards,

Mei Hui, Ho

Modern Automotive Pte Ltd | MM Trading Enterprise
Blk 30234 Ubi Road 1 #01-61 5(408717)

Tel: 6744 4422 /8121 3226

Fax: 6747 6720

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail Is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender

immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.

The content of this c-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you aré not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in eror, please notify the sender

immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its atachments.

WWW.AVE.COMm

4] This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

#

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 31 July 2018 8:29 AM

To: '‘Tan, Rachel’

Cc SUR

Subject: RE: RE: TP Claim SKL318R & SLL4723R (GA)
Dear Rachel,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SKL 318R on 30/7/2018.
We are pending estimate from repairer.

Kindly provides us the claim number.

Best Regards,

Veran Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D [LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 July 2018 11:36 AM

To: 'Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@|kkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: RE: TP Claim SKL318R & SLL4723R (GA)

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Tan, Rachel [mailto:Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com
sent: Thursday, 26 July 2018 11:09 AM

To: Meei Huey <meeihuey@modernautomotive.com.sg>
Cc: LKK Assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: RE: TP Claim SKL318R & SLL4723R (GA)

Without prejudice

Dear Meei Huey



Thank you for taking my call.
Based on the circumstance of the accident, liability is not in the favor of the driver for vehicle : SLL4723R
As agreed, we will arrange for LKK to conduct PRI, please furnish us with the estimates, thank you.

Dear LKK

Please accept assignment. Thank you

Regards

Rachel Tan

Executive, Motor Claims, Great American Insurance Company
Tel: 6804 7846

From: Meei Huey <meeihuey@modernautomotive.cam.sg>
Sent: Thursday, July 26, 2018 10:06 AM

To: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>
Subject: [External] RE: TP Claim SKL318R & SLLAT23R (GA)

Dear Rachel,
We refer to your email below.

Unfortunately, our client’s video was overlapped thus no video provided.
Meanwhile, do advise liability.

Thank you.

Regards,

Mei Hui, Ho

Modern Automotive Pte Ltd | MM Trading Enterprise
Blk 3023A Ubi Road 1 #01-61 S(408717)

Tel: 6744 4422 /8121 3226

Fax: 6747 6720

From: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>
Sent: 25 July, 2018 12:44 PM

To: meeihuey@modernautomative.com.sg
Subject: RE: TP Claim SKL318R & SLL4723R (GA)

Without Prejudice

Dear Meei Huey

Can you provide us with the video footage, thank you.
Regards

Rachel Tan

Executive, Motor Claims, Great American Insurance Company
Tel: 6804 7846



From: Ong, Joanna On Behalf Of General Claims
Sent: Wednesday, July 25, 2018 12:18 PM

To: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan{@sg.gaig.com>
Subject: FW: [External] TP Claim SKL318R & SLLA723R (GA)

Rachel = FYMNA!

loanna

From: Meei Huey <meeihuey @modernautomotive.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, July 25, 2018 10:01 AM

To: General Claims <GeneralClaims{@sg.gaig.com>

Cc: Chin <chin@modernautomative.com.sg>

Subject: [External] TP Claim SKL318R & SLL4723R

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advise liability for our vehicle below:

Your Insured: SLL4723R

Our Insured:; SKL318R

DOA: 23.07.2018

We enclosed herewith client report for your perusal.
Please reply.

Thank you

Regards,

Mei Hui, Ho

Modern Automotive Pte Ltd | MM Trading Enterprise
Blk 3023A Ubi Road 1 #01-61 5(408717)

Tel: 6744 4422 /8121 3226
Fax: 6747 6720

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. if you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments,

[he content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addresses. IF you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, of copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.

. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
: Www.avg.com



Nivitha (LKK Auto) _

From: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>
Sent: Thursday, 26 July 2018 11:09 AM

To: Meei Huey

Cc: LKK Assignments

Subject: RE: RE: TP Claim SKL318R & SLL4723R (GA]}
Attachments: SKL318R_23072018.pdf

Without prejudice
Dear Meei Huey

Thank you for taking my call.
Based on the circumstance of the accident, liability is not in the favor of the driver far vehicle : SLL4723R
As agreed, we will arrange for LKK to conduct PRI, please furnish us with the estimates, thank you.

Dear LKK
Please accept assignment. Thank you

Regards

Rachel Tan

Executive, Motor Claims, Great American Insurance Company
Tel: 6804 7846

Erom: Meei Huey <meeihuey@moderna utomotive.com.sg>»
sent: Thursday, July 26, 2018 10:06 AM

To: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>

Subject: [External] RE: TP Claim SKL318R % SLL4723R (GA)

Dear Rachel,
We refer to your email below.

Unfortunately, our client’s video was overlapped thus no video provided.
Meanwhile, do advise liability.

Thank you.

Regards,

Mei Hui, Ho

Modern Automotive Pte Ltd | MM Trading Enterprise
Blk 3023A Ubi Road 1 #01-61 5(408717)

Tel: 6744 4422 / 81213226

Fax: 6747 6720

From: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@se gaig.com>
Sent: 25 July, 2018 12:44 PM
To: meeihuey@modernautomotive.com.sg

Subject: RE: TP Claim SKL318R & SLL4723R (GA)

Without Prejudice



Dear Meei Huey

Can you provide us with the video footage, thank you.

Regards
Rachel Tan
Executive, Motor Claims, Great American Insurance Company

Tel: 6804 7346

From: Ong, Joanna On Behalf Of General Claims

Sent: Wednesday, luly 25, 2018 12:18 PM

Ta: Tan, Rachel <Rachel Tan@sg.gaig.com>

Subject: FW: [External] TP Claim SKL318R & SLL4723R (GA)

Rachel ~ FYnNAl

loanna

From: Meei Huey <meeihuey@modernautomotive com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, July 25, 2018 10:01 AM

To: General Claims <GeneralClaims@sg.gaig.com>

Ce: Chin <chin@modernautomotive.com.sg>

Subject: [External] TP Claim SKL218R & SLLA723R

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advise liability for our vehicle below:

Your Insured: SLL4723R

Our Insured: SKL318R

DOA: 23.07.2018

We enclosed herewith client report for your perusal.
Please reply.

Thank you

Regards,

Mei Hui, Ho

Modern Automotive Pte Ltd | MM Trading Enterprise
Blk 3023A Ubi Road 1 #01-61 5{408717)

Tel: 6744 4422 /8121 3226
Fax: 6747 6720

The content of this e-mall message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If yvou recetve this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by rephy emall and destroy the message and its attachments,




The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solefy for the addressee. I vou are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited, I you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immedintzty by reply email and destroy the message and its aftachments.



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Cwener |0 Type: Business
Owener 1D 2213K
N R D e e e e e e e i
Vehicle Mo, SKL31BR
Vehicle to be Exported: es
Intended De-registration Date: 30 Jul 2018
Wehicle Make: TOYOTA
Vehicle Model: VELLFIRE 2.4V A
Primary Colour: White
Manufacturing Year: 2008
Engine Na.: 2AZC501926
Chassis No.: ANHZ0B024074
Maximum Power Output: 125.0kW (167 bhp)
Open Market Value: £45,167.00
Crriginal Registration Date: 18 May 2009
First Registration Date: 18 May 2007
Transfer Count: 5
Actual ARF Paid: $45,167.00
ot PARE Rebate D e e e L
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 17 May 2019
PARF Rebate Amount: $22,583.00
L e O R e e e e e e e ]
COE Expiry Date: 17 May 20179
COE Category: B-Car(1601cc & above)
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: 37.552.00
COE Rebate Amount: 600,00
Total Rebate Amount: $23,183.00

The information cantained herein is correct as at 30 Jul 2018

OK
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Free Car Valuation

Unsure of how much your car is worth?
Let us tell you how much is the value - no charges & no cbligations!

Bkt s Aduetickmant 12/2015 Toyota Dyna With Taflgate At $52.8k

Sell it yourself! Advertise it at just -3 =1 Agent Unit ¥

$58 until it's SOLD!

Think One Automaobile
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vallfire Ay Ay 20089 Ary Any Hay Avallable

l_: Toyota Vellfire 2.4A Z (New S&5,688 58,580 fyr 23-Dot-2009 2,362 o 120,000 km P Available
10-yr COE)

A True MPY That Offers Total Cormfart And Power, Regulady Maintalned Condition. Engine And Gearbox 1n Pristine Condition. Spacious And

Cornfcetable, The Mast Popular And Blegant People Carrier, Comes W.,, (o)

Monster Mators Pre Lid

[ Toyota Vellfire 3.5A 2 845,888 431,840 fyr 25-May-2009 3,456 cc 6,858 km MEY Avallable

Cheapest In Town! Well Maintained And In Good Condition, Spadious MPY, 207 Sport Rims, Afpine DVD With Car Phone Bluetooth, Dual Power Sliding
Docrs, Dual Sunroof, Keyhass Access And Engine Starting, ..

S T ta Vellfire, Tewota, Vellfine, Lsed Toyo

D Toyota Vellfire 2,44 Z [ New $97.898 59,780 fyr 12-May-2009 2:.362 cc 123,000 km MPY Avallable
10-yr COE)

Mew Facelift, Very Attractive, 8-5eater. The King OF Mpy, Tip Top Condition Low Mileage, STA Evaluation Inspection Approved, Grade B, how :

Expengive Napa Leather, Classes Pearl White. Too Good Ta Destr... LT

D Toyota Vellfire 3.5A Z (New $87,800 39,770 fyr 05-Jan=2009 3,456 cc 135,000 km MPY Availtalble
10-yr COE)

Road Tax: January 2019,

H=5018 a0 2009 Toyora VelFfine Toyols WaEllfics, Toyota, Yelifive, Lited Toyols

Save this search oriteris, o gel emeil slers whenever & match i found.
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MODERN AUTOMOTIVE FTE LTD
BLK 30234 UBIRCAD 1 #01-61
SINGAPORE 408717
Tol - 6748 4422/ 6745 4422 Fax : 6747- 6720 REG NO 200501102H

(reat American Ineurance Company Cuotation
3 Temasek Avenus DATE 30072018
#16.01 Cartennlal Towear ",‘llrf“{ o VEH NO . SKLIMER
Sngapore 038190 MODEL : Toyota Velifire
Tal - 6804 G003 COoOA + £3.07.2018
Eax 6235 2616 YR REF  SLLATZ3R
Atin - Motor Claim Dept {Pls arrange vehicle survev & shack liakility)
2E:  ESTIMATE FOR ACCIDENT REPAIR SKL318R {Toyota Vellfire)
Jliem Description Oty Amt
NO  LISTITEMS
1 FrontFender-LH Jod 1 997.50 =~
2 Eront Fender Protector s LH  14{~) : 1 25550 X
3 Front Fender Inner Shiekd - LH D¢ #~—C 1 175,90
4 Eront Fender Inner Shigld Clips - LA M~ 3 20.00 =
g Eront Knuckle Arm - LH '}r 1 628490 ¥
£ Front Wheel Hub ciw Bearing - -H w- 1 680,40/
% Front Shock Absorber - LH o 1 37460%
§  Front Lowsr Armn - LH 1 £85.10 7
6 FrontDoor-LH  DuAts 1 156510~
13 Front Doer Lock - L4 prf #87 1 300.40
11 Front Door Weatherstrip - LH % 1 251.00 v~
12 Front Door inner Trim Beard -LH A0 ™ 1 78580 ¥
13 Front Deor Irner Trim Board Clios - LH 7° 1 30,00 v~
14  Front Deor Lower Pratector - Lix ";?AI* ~t 1 DOR 40
15 SidingDoor-LH  Datt4 1 1,657.90~"
153 Sliding Door Lock - LH  #{ res 1 488 30 ¢
17 Sliding Door Auto Lock Mator - LHAW ~=~ 1 1.667.20 X
15 Siiding Door Weatherstripe - LH 1 1 30710 o~
13 Siding Door Lower Protector- LH  Pepcf 1 280.40
20  Siding Deor Lower Roller - LH LAY 1 332 504
21 Siiding Door Inner Trim Board - L \! 1 1,007.40 1
22 Sliding Door Inner Trim Board Clips Aéw 1 5000 =~
23  Rear Fender-LH T4rc 1 143760
24  Rear Fender Lower Pratector - LH 707 1 12870 ~
25  Rear Bumper o/ ’ i 1,379 80 -~
26 Rear Bumper Clips 't 1 anoo -~
97 Rear Bumper Side Holder - LH 10~ 1 78 50
28 Rear Axle Beam i preu 1 251130 X



RE:  ESTIMATE FOR ACGIDENT REZAIR SKL34BR (Toyota Vellfirel
i Rear Wheael Hub a/w Baanng - LH '?. -"rJ 1 450,680 X
30 Rear Shock Absorber - H s | 39540 ¥
(430 70 5 18,999 €0
4023207 Less25% (4.749.60)
b 14,249.70
5 ITE
1 From Wheel Rim - LH s 1 63800 2°7
2 FrontTyre-~LH & e/ 1 300.00 X
3 FrontDoor Visor-LH  / i 60.00
4 Sliding Daor \isor - L 1210 1 &0.00 "
5  Rear Ferder Glass Seglant - LH 1 5000 ¥
6 RearTwe-LH M@l M 1 300.00 X
7 RearWheelRm-LH Oof 1 - £80.00- 559
3 2,140.00
Total parts b 16,389.70
LABOUR CHARGE
1 To knosking & pull cut front & rear portion & rensw above parts 3 | .6 @C} a
2 To putty & spray up paint works i 1,M 190d
3 Tocheck wiring system 3 w g
4 To underseal $ 150.00
£ To transfer front door fitings $ /50&70/ v
e Touansfer sliding docr fitlings $ 15946 v 2
7 To remove upholstery ‘;D; 2 % 1 5}3( 5 )
&  Toremove front and r=ar undercarriage % 600.00
& To perform wheel alignment 5 160,00 ¢ 0
13 To remove reverse sensol 5 w £0
11 Toremove rear fender glass 5 12000 X
1-_|_- 2 moto Consullants hence r.'.':“l']' $ 4.52‘“»0“
t ,‘.‘,;,; T I T
. ng
. = Grand Taial [s 20,908.70 |
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607138R GST Reg. No. 15-0807198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY Ref . CS/GAINE013658/Avd3In2
TN
#16-01 CENTENNIAL TOWER Date: 11-09-2018
SINGAPORE 039180
Code: GAl
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SLL 4723R Veh. Inspected SKL 318R
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CLMOMYPOO0000802 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  RACHEL TAN Assign Date 26/07/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAWVELLFIRE c.c 2362
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2009
Chassis No. ANH208024074 Colour WHITE
Odometer 326822 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |235/50 R18 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Front Tyre |235/50 R18 MICHELIN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |235/50 R18 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |235/50 R18 MICHELIN & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  23/07/2018 Inspection Date 30/07/2018
Survey held at MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
BLK 3023A UBI ROAD 1
#01-61
SINGAPORE 408717
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

& Working Days




' Vdl V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
;_‘r‘" ; ; = 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: G256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607108R GST Reg. No. 10-9507198-R Page No..1of 3
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKL 318R
Estimate Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition | &8 mmpfg’n ‘;’
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT FENDER-LH DENTED 997 60 997 60
1|FRONT FENDER PROTECTOR-LH TO REPAIR SEE 255.60 -
LABOUR &
1|FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD-LH DEFORMED 17580 175.90
1|FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD CLIPS-LH MECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1|FRONT KNUCKLE ARM-LH NOT NECESSARY 628.90 -
1|FRONT WHEEL HUB C/W BEARING-LH NOT MECESSARY 550 .40 -
1|FRONT SHOCK ABSORBER-LH NOT NECESSARY 374.60 i
1|FRONT LOWER ARM-LH NOT NECESSARY 48510 -
1|FRONT DOOR-LH DENTED 1,565.10 1,565.10
1|FRONT DOCR LOCK-LH MOT NECESSARY 39040
1|FRONT DOOR WEATHERSTRIP-LH MECESSARY 251.00 251.00
1|FRONT DOOR INNER TRIM BOARD-LH NOT NECESSARY 785.50 -
1|FRONT DOOR INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS-LH NECESSARY 30.00 30.0:0
1|FRONT DOOR LOWER PROTECTOR-LH TO REPAIR SEE 298.40
LABOUR =
1|SLIDING DOOR-LH DENTED 1,557.90 1,657.90
1|SLIDING DOOR LOCK-LH NOT NECESSARY 488 .30 -
1|SLIDING DOOR AUTO LOCK MOTOR-LH NOT NECESSARY 1,667.20 I
1|SLIDING DOOR WEATHERSTRIPE-LH NECESSARY 30710 30710
1|SLIDING DOOR LOWER PROTECTOR-LH TO REPAIR SEE 2B0.40 -
LABOUR
1|SLIDING DOOR LOWER ROLLER-LH NOT MECESSARY 332.50 -
1|SLIDING DOOR INMER TRIM BOARD-LH WNOT NECESSARY 1,007 .40 -
1|SLIDING DOOR INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS NECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1|REAR FENDER-LH TO REPAIR SEE 1,437.60 B
LABOUR ~
1|REAR FENDER LOWER PROTECTOR-LH TO REPAIR SEE 128.70 S
LABOUR -
1|REAR BUMPER TORN 1,379.80 1,379.80
1|REAR BUMPER CLIPS NECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDER-LH NECESSARY 76.50 T6.50

Report Ref No, CS/GAI18013658/Avd3n2




TEL: B256 3561 FA

X 6256 4315

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
£1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-26 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

Feg. No: 193607198R GST Reg. No. 12-9607192-R

Page Mo, 2 of 3

Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wo rk:hup?g}} ﬁl}
1|REAR AXLE BEAM NOT NECESSARY 2611.30 -
1|REAR WHEEL HUB C/W BEARING-LH NOT MECESSARY 450.60 -
1|REAR SHOCK ABSORBER-LH NOT NECESSARY 38540 -
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -4,749.90 -1,607.73
14,249.70 482317
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT WHEEL RIM-LH (SN} cuTt BE0.00 550.00
1|FRONT TYRE-LH (SN} NOT NECESSARY 300.00 -
1|FRONT DOOR VISOR-LH (SN} NECESSARY 0.00 60.00
1|SLIDING DOCR VISOR-LH (SN) NECESSARY 60.00 60.00
1|REAR FENDER GLASS SEALANT-LH (SN} NOT NECESSARY £0.00 E
1|REAR TYRE-LH (SN) NOT NECESSARY 300.00 .
1|REAR WHEEL RIM-LH (SN) cuT 680.00 550.00
2,140.00 1,220.00
LABOUR
TO KNOCKING & PULL OUT FRONT & REAR PORTION & 1,500.00 800.00
RENEW ABOVE PARTS. INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF
FRONT FENDER PROTECTOR-LH, FRONT DOOR LOWER
PROTECTOR-LH,SLIDING DOOR LOWER PROTECTOR-
LH.REAR FENDER-LH AND REAR FENDER LOWER
PROTECTOR-LH.
TO PUTTY & SPRAY UP PAINT WORKS. 1,400.00 1,000.00
TO CHECK WIRING SYSTEM. 50.00 30.00
TO UNDERSEAL NOT NECESSARY 150.00
TO TRANSFER FRONT DOOR FITTINGS 150.00 100.00
TO TRANSFER SLIDING DOOR FITTINGS. 150,00 100.00
TO REMOVE UPHOLSTERY 150.00 0,00
TO REMOVE FRONT AND REAR UNDERCARRIAGE NOT NECESSARY £00.00
TO PERFORM WHEEL ALIGNMENT. 150.00 B0.00
TO REMOVE REVERSE SENSOR. 100.00 50.00
TO) REMOVE REAR FENDER GLASS. NOT NECESSARY 120.00 =
4,520.00 2,220.00
GRAND TOTAL 20,908.70 B,263.17

Report Ref No. CS/GAI18013658/Avd3n2
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Page Mo 3 of 3
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 6,600.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CS/GAI18013658/Avd3n2

% g‘
ADRIAM LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE.AMIRTE AMSAE-A JM.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made salaly Tor the use and benefit of the Client Ramad on the from page of this Repon.




