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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 25 July 20'18 4:36 PM

To: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); LKK Valuation; TEO Kitty
Cc: NG Matthew; HO Vincent; CHIONH Hock San Christopher; KKLaU; SUR

Subject: RE: [AXA]: Assistance required: Effect MV for 51N4249H - Mitsubushi Lancer 1.6 GLX

Auto ABS Airbag 2WD 4DR

Dear Kitty,

The market value of SLN 4249H is $20K-$22K (Estimated) as at July 2018

Best Regards,

Veron chen I case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com I fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 25 July 2018 L2:34 PM

To: LKK Valuation <va luation @ lkkauto.com>; TEO Kitty <kitty.teo@axa.com.sg>

Cc: NG Matthew <matthew.nghj@axa.com.sg>; HO Vincent <vincent.ho@axa.com.sg>; CHIONH Hock San

Christopher <chris.chion h hs@axa.com.sg>; KKLaU <kkla u @ lkka uto.com>
Subject: [AXA]: Assistance required: Effect MV for SLN4249H - Mitsubushi Lancer 1.6 GLX Auto ABS Airbag 2WD 4DR

Hi Valuation Team,

Please get back to AXA Kittv.

Thanks.

oi,,i,l,ll'i^.-"r.""n", 'fne
LKK auro consultonlr Qrtlo(L
phone:6256-3561 | emoil: olivicrlqu@lkkouto.com I Ior.:6741 41AB l^* lt{r^
Blk 51. Poyq Ubi lndustriol Pork, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(40S933) .!tt-U
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From: NG Matthew Imailto:matthew.nshi@axa.com.se]
Sent: Wednesday, 25 July, 20L8 10:47 AM
To: bhtaV@autoprobe.com.ss; ad m in (aa utoprobe.com.sg; berna rdonR(aa iaxinspection.com; fra nkie (dfta.com.sg;

motorsurvev@fta.com.se; benson@lbs auto,com; nick(albs-a uto.com; KKLau <kkla u @lkka uto.com>; Olivia Lau

(LKKAuto) <olivia la u.6lkkauto.com>; iim mv.lee @ prioritvservices.sg; cvnthia.onq@prioritvservices.ss;



-

fickv@Jta.com.se
Cc: TEO Kitty <f:!!!yjlee.@qe.gern sg>; CHIONH Hock San Christopher <qb4s€hienhhsJQglq:lern !g>; HO Vincent .l
<vince nt. ho @ axa.com. sg>

Subject: Re: Assistance required: Effect MV for SLN4249H - Mitsubushi Lancer 1.6 GLX Auto ABS Airbag 2WD 4DR



Sent from my iPad

On 25 Jul 2018, at 8:49 AM, NG Matthew <Oa!IigtU.!gLi@3Ig=!9I!=!g> wrote:

Dear Partners,

Please assist to provide Ms Kitty Teo with the Market Va lue for th is case.

DOA: L5/07 /20L8

Thank you.

Warmest Regards
Mafthew NG

Specialist I Claims Services - SlTF

AXA lnsurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sq
Email: matthew.nghi(aaxa.com.se
DID: (65)
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1,'! et"""" consider the environment before printing this email
This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination; either whole or
pa rtia l,

is prohibited. lf you a re not the intended rec;pient of the message, please notify the sender
immediately.

----Disclaimer----
This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use ofthe named addressee. If
you are not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content ofthis
message. If you have received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or
opinions presented in this message are solely those ofthe author and do not necessarily represent those of
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other entity ofthe AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and
duly authorized by the said companies.
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[Axn;Singapore NRIC

.Vebic!9,Dj!e!s-,I Vehicle No.: 51N4249H

i Vehicleto be Exported:

, lntended De-regjstration Date:

v"r,i.rc v"i" -
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MITSUBISHI

Vehicle Model: !4NcqR! j LXAUTqABSATRBAG 2WD4DR

Grey.,l'P,v.919:I,: Manufacturing' Year:

; Engine No.: 4G18KJ4547

i Chassis No.: JMYSRCS3AAUOO3314

79.0 kW {105 bhp)- -si32si.oo- - '-
!2 Aug2OtO

t2 AIE2OTO

Srs,zaz.oo [ 1r.{), ActualARF Paid:

: !,t9!!9q JARIBlletu q9!9!F

. lARf qliejbjLly

' PARF Elicibility Expiry Date:
I'' PARF Rebate Amount:

7! Aus,2O2O

$7,972.OO

77 Auc2O2O

I coE c"t"gory: A- Car{1600cc& below)
I COE Period(Years):

$32,!04.OO

saiiiooi COE RebateAmount:

QP Paid:

: Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at25 )ul2078
$14,539.00

\r? ft .v-
")'o

OK


