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Vehicle: SLK7869P Make & Model: Honda Vezel
Chassis No:

S/N Parts/Labour QTy | Unit Price Price Recommend
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Labour

Interior Upholstery £0.00 A - )(
Check Wiring B0.0D N
Anti Rust Proofing wo00| 3V
Transfer Bootlid Glass 120.00 [ o
Transfer Boot Fitting 1s000| 6 D
Panel Beating 500.00 “1 ﬁap
——

Paint-work T,y rufﬁ q i'rrﬂ Lo kg
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner |D: 2534G

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: SLK7869P
Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended De-registration Date: 25 Jul 2018
Vehicle Make: HONDA

Vehicle Model:
Primary Colour:

Manufacturing Year: 2016

Engine No.: LEB5908871
Chassis No.: RU31208861
Maximum Power Qutput: 112.0 kW (150 bhp)
Open Market Value: $25,349.00

Original Registration Date: 25 Jan 2017

First Registration Date: 25Jan 2017
Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $5,000.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 24 Jan 2027

PARF Rebate Amount: $3,750.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 24 lan 2027

COE Category: B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $52,807.00

COE Rebate Amount: $44,.871.00

Total Rebate Amount: $48,621.00

VEZELHYBRID 1.5X A
Red

The information contained herein is correct as at 25 Jul 2018

htips:/fvrlita gov sg/italvrllactionenguiraHa BatedyruticBetoreUereginput F UNC T ION_ID=FO3UM008T 1
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Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: lanet Tan <janet.tan@eqinsurance.comsg>

Sent: Sunday, 4 August 2019 1158 AM

To: Shu Pel (LKKAuUto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Invalving YN2662M (OI : EQI - DM18HO03383/JT) AND
SLKT869P (TP : LKK REF - CC6/EQI18013523/Ueb3) on 22072018

Attachments: SAS2641045.PDF

Dear Shu Pel

Attach Ol report
Regards,

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

=

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 656223 4190
WWW.BINSUrance. com.sg

T s =

gl o T el

Privifeged/Canfidential information may be contained in this message. If you are nat the intended recipient. please notify the sent

From: Shu Pel (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com)

Sent: Thursday, July 4, 2019 9:42 AM

To: lanet Tan <janet.tan@eqinsurance com.sg>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN2669M (01 : EQI - TBA) AND S5LK7869P (TP : LKK REF -
CCh/EQI18013523/Ueb3) on 22.07.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advice whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured's accident report for our
necessary action.

Thank you,



Best Regards

Shu Pei| Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pe Ltd

Phone: £366-005% | ermall: shupei@lkhauto com | fax 67413108
Bk 51, Faya Ubi Industrial Park, Ut Avenue 1, #02-15 | 5[408933)

From: Shu Pel (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 26 February 2019 4:25 PM

To: ‘Janet Tan' <janet.tan@eginsurance com.sg>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN2663M (01 : EQI - TBA) AND SLE78E9P (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/EQI18013523/Ueb3) on 22.07.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advice whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accldent report for our
necessary action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 8356-0055 | email: shupel@ikkaute.com | fax 67414108
Blk 51, Pays Ubi Indiustrial Park, Ubi Avenus 1, #02-25 | S{408833)

From: Shu Pel [LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 7 January 2019 8:59 AM

To: 'lanet Tan' <janet.tan@eginsurance. com.sg>

Subject: RE; Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN2ZG6SM (Ol : EQI - TBA) AND SLK7BE9P (TP . LKK REF -
CC6/EQI1B013523/Ueb3) on 22.07.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advice whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our
necessary action

Thank you.

Rt Regards,
Shu Pei| Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone GI6E-0055 | emall thugeiditkhsulo com | forc 6741-2108

Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Ubl avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Shu Pe) [LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 10 December 2018 3:16 FM

To: 'lanet Tan' <janet tan@eainsurance.com.sg>

Subject: FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN2669M (Ol : EQI - TBA) AND SLK7869P (TP : LKK REF -
CCh/EQI18013523/Ueb3) on 22.07.2018

PART 3
Dear Janet,
Please find attached as per requested.

Thank you

Best Regards.

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366-0055 | email; shupei@kkauto. com | fas; 6741-4108
Bk 51, Paya Ubi industrial Park, Ubd Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408533)

Fram; Shu Pel (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 10 December 2018 3:08 PM

To: Janet Tan <janet tanBeqinsurance com.sg>

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Invalving YN2669M (01 : EQI - TBA) AND SLK7869P (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/EQI1B013523/Ueb3) on 22.07.2018

Dear Janet,
Please find attached as per requested,

Thank you

Beat Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Aute Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: B3R6-0055 | email: shupe@lkkauto com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, 802-25 | $(408333)

From: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eqginsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 10 December 2018 1:30 PM

To: Shu Pel [LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.coms

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto com>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN2G669M (O1 : EQI - TBA) AND SLK7869P (TP : LKK REF -
CCE/EQI18013523/Ueb3) on 22.07.2018




Dear Shu Pel,

We are following up on non reporting.
Please forward us the video footage if any.
Regards,

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

eqr ISUrance
M en L el

L

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 656223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190

WWW Bginsurance.com.sg

‘t‘.u,-.._.-,,. M Ty vl Lﬂ—- —

Privileged/Confidential Information may be contained in this messoge. If you are not the intended recipient, pleose notify the sent

From: Shu Pel (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]|

Sent: Monday, December 10, 2018 9:27 AM

To: Janet Tan <janet.lan@eginsurance,com.sg>

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@ikkauto.coms>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN2669M (OI : EQY - TBA) AND SLK7869P (TP : LKK REF -
CCH/EQI1B013523/Ueb3) on 22.07.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Pear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Thank you,

Best Regards

Shis Pel| Admin

LKK Aute Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone; B366-0055 | emall: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
8lk 51, Faya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, 802-25 | 5(408233)




From: Shu Pel [LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 20 August 2018 6:03 PM

To: Janet Tan <janet tan@eginsuranca com sg>

Ce: Asher 5ng |LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto com>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>

Subject; RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN2669M (O - EQI - TBA) AND SLK7869P (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/EQI18013523/Ueb3) on 22.07.2018

Dear Janet,

We refer to the above matter,

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action,
Thank you.

Aest Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall: shupe @ kkautocom | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ub ingdustrsl Park, Ubl Avenue 1|, 802-25 | S{408533)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAUto)

Sent: Friday, 17 August 2018 1:49 PM

To: Janet Tan <janet.tan insurance.com.sg>

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuUto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN2669M (OI : EQ - TBA) AND SLK7869P (TP : LKK REF -
CCB/EQI18013523/Ueb3) on 22.07.2018

Importance: High

Dear Janet,
We refer to the above matter,

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GlA report for our necessary action,

Tharik vou,

Bist Regurds,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 oo53 | email: MeiBvan @ kkate.com | fax: 67414108
Mk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{308933)

From: Shu Pel (LKKAutp)
Sent: Thursday, 26 July, 2018 7:51 PM
To: lanet Tan <janet tan@eqinsurance com.sg>

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@ikkauto.coms; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto com>
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN2669M (01 : EQI - TBA) AND SLK7BEIP (TP : LKK REF -

CC6/EQI18013523/Ueb3) on 22.07.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Dear Janet,
We refer to the above matter.
This s a TP direct settlement case.

We had inspected TP vehicle SLK 7869P at M/s Stytech Auto Pte Ltd.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- Estimated cost of repair
Prellminary advice
- TPGIAreport

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone! G366-DO55 | emall: yfiopse @ kkouto coth | Tac 6741-3108

Bl 55, Paya Uly industrial Park, Uty Avenue 1, 802-25 | 5(408933)



Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Stytech Auto Pte Ltd <stytechent@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Sunday, 29 September 2019 5:16 PM

Tao: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SLK7869P *Our Ref: CC6/EQI18013523/Upb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING

YN 2669M(EQ) AND SLK 7869P ON 22/07/2018]

Dear Hsiao Tong,

We agree your below email of the offer amount $2100.00 all in.
Thank you

Best Regards

Winston Teo

Stytech Auto Pte Ltd

Emall: stytechent@singnet.com.sg | Mobile: +65 9685 8843 | Fax: +65 65445 3310
Address: 2 Kak) Bukit Ave 2 #01-02/ 03, Kaki Bukit Autohub, Singapore 417521

IRy,

STYTECH AUTO PTE L(TD

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto} <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Saturday, September 28, 2019 9:30 AM

To: Stytech Auto Pte Ltd <stytechent@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: Your Ref: SLK7869PF *Our Ref: CCB/EQI18013523/Upb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN 2663M(EQ) AND 5LK
7869P ON 22/07/201B]

Your Ref: SLK7B69P Without Prejudice
Our Ref; CCB/EQI18013523/Upb3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN 2669M(EQ) AND SLK 7869P ON 22/07/2018
We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement at a global sum of $2,100.00{all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on
our part or on the part of our Insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed In any other related matter{s) in
respect of the accident. Our offer made In respect of this present matter Is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be
made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer in any other refated matters.

Settiement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for
settlement sum above $20,000/-] by the Plaintitf/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made
payment on the settlement sum.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong. Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: ¢hewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51. Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #oz-25 | SlaoBaag)



‘s% STYTECH AUTO PTE LTD
2 KAKI BUKIT AVE 2 #01-03 SINGAPORE 417921 (Kaki Bukit Auto hub)

TEL: 6444-8125 FAX: 6445-3310 H/P: 9685 8843 Email: stytechent@singnet.com.sg
GST REG. NO: 2016015308 CO. REG. NO: 201801539K

Our Ref: SAPL/98RAT/O8/19

Date: 24/08/2019

To: M/S EQ Insurance Company Lid.
5 Maxwell Road #17-00
Tower Block MND Complex
Singapore 069110

Attn: Motor Claim Dept

Dear Sir'Mdm,
Re: Claim of repair cost & loss of use for veh no. SLK 7869-P
No. Description Price
I.  Lump Sum Repair Cost for Vehicle No. SLK 7869-P S$1,819.00
2. Loss of use for Rental Bill NR: 33765(55100X3Days) S§ 321.00
{ Three Repair Days)
3. OIA Search Fee S§ 200

Total: S$$2.142.00



1 74 74

- - -
el BA B

§§5

£1 UKL AVE 1, #01.25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAN : (065) 2564313

Our Ref: CC6/EQI18013523/Upb3
29 August 2019

POH TAT HARDWARE TRADER
639 ROWELL RD

#11-96

SINGAPORE 200639

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN 2669M AND SLK 7869P ON 22/07/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for EQ INSURANCE COMPANY
LIMITED to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

We have received a claim from SLK 7869P against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not
in your favour as your vehicle reversed and collided onto third party parked vehiclle.
Under Motor Accident Guide, reversing vehicles must exercise greater care than parked
vehicles. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third

Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further quenes.

Yours faithfully,

(W

CHEW HSIAO TONG

Case Handler

DID: 6742 3197

FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: chewht@lkkauto.com

C.C. EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED
{Mator Claims Dept)



Date: | '/ M/s

bl

To: M/S STYTECH AUTO PTE LTD
2 Kaki Bukit Avenue 2 #01-03
Kaki Bukit Autohub

Singapore 417921
Dear Sir/Mdm,

Repair Cost for Vehicle number

Caused by dated on
¥J VAL JELY M at

involving vehidle{s) number

Our Companyfl, -

vehicle number . hereby authorized you to liaise with the
insurance company and undertake all repairs & any other damages incurred as | am involved in the
accident dated on L M e :

Mllegalarepairmﬁtrﬂllhededuc:edfmmﬂmpmceedsnfnwdahnmdbemlusedtulﬂlfs
STYTECH AUTO PTE LTD.

Thank you,

L1

Yours fnlthfully,"\l




2 KAKI BUKIT AVE 2 #01-03 SINGAPORE 417921 (Kaki Bukit Auto hub)
TEL: 5444-8125 FAX: 6445-3310 H/P: 9685 8843 Email: stytechent@singnet.com.sg
GST REG. ND: 201801530 CO. REG. NO: 201601538K

% STYTECH AUTO PTE LTD

Our Ref: SAPL/9BR4T/OR/19

Date: 24/08/2019

To: M/S EQ Insurance Company Lid.
5 Maxwell Road #17-00
Tower Block MND Complex
S’pore 069110

Attn:Motor Claim Dept

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Re: Accident on 22/07/2018 |n\'u[\rmg Vehicle Nos SLK 7869-P YN 2669-M At Along Banda Street
Open Carpark At Budda Tooth Relic.

FINAL BILL FOR VEHICLE NO.SLK 7869-P

DESCRIPTION PRICE
Lump Sum Repair Cost For Vehicle No. SLK 7869-P 535170000
GST ™% S§ 119.00
TOTAL: $31.819.00
Yours Faithfully,

STYTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 \ . ‘x}\ -
N /

Mr. Winston Teo
9685 BB43




STYTECH AUTO PTE LTD

2 KAKI BUKIT AVE 2 #02-30 SINGAPORE 417921 (Kaki Bukit Auto hub)
TEL: 6444-8125 FAX: 6445-3310 H/P: 9685 8843 Email: stytechent@singnet.com.sg

Qik TREqP

GST REG. NO: 201601539K €O, REG. NO: 201801530K

Whideio: QU g0IEM

Make and Type

Terem™ ALTO

4. __s__;(.,' &

Date/Time Out ., ./E?/f‘?

Date/Time In

22/t /-20pm

Fuel Guaga El:tﬂ

EXTENSION CHARGES 15 $12.00 FER HOUR (SINGAPORE LISE)
DEPOSIT WILL BE FORFEITED IN ANY ACCIDENT/OAMAGE/FIRE & THEFT
“HO RETURNING OF YEHICLE AFTER G P & EVE J PUBLIC HOLIDAY

Hirer's Name: <) [, b ihedo# KM KM
- —{our IN
- - - RENTALS CHARGES AMOUNT
Hirer's Address: 5( WE Mokl LBswuce Keqd B L
e . . L Daysatss /¢ Cperdny || gy 207 0
—+ L7~ 4% 74 L pire él?(. [l ! ' :
Tel: VC: Wesk at 55 par weok ——
HIP: Age .
. " : Month st S§ per mth
Driver's Nama: _,1 el Lumt [
- insurance fee 1o cover hired f
; vehicla only
DriversAddress: Z/¢ 7/§  Rodok Msarvow Kl #01-fex7v
Tt F{j5¥19F ve: S{X(75344
Age: gl PetroVDigsal
Driving Licence Dat: gt{g,;;]?.-f Class: 2
Additional Driver's Nama: Others
Drivar's Address: Sub-Total
It InC: Add GST s " -
Tel —— _PLI-JL_ l,q Lr_ Lc,
Age.
Driving Licance Date: Class: Total Nett Charges & 3 321
Guilisuors Nuns *Lass Tatal Prepaymeant/Deposit
Guarantor's Address: Received
Balance Amount Due/Relundable
m m‘; e
Occupation Age: Add ;: EXTENSION CHARGES
ANT METHOD OF PAYMENT
IMPORT, NOTES O Cash [0 ChequeNa: [0 Vies [ BllCo
* This vashicle & restricted 1o SINGAPORE anly
* No ratunt will ba ghven for eatly returm of fusl ialt in vehicia
“ Hires m liabie 1o pay all parking heea, traffic summons & ather claims
* Hirgr who carrigs the number of passangers or load sxcesding tha e
latreed will et T Tk Ehir oo rspONAIGNDS & LTA Summons Aelund
* |n tha svani of vehicle breakdown due to no fusl, hirer s lisble lo pay S50 Recaved 5 By Hirer x

* No replacement ol vehihs in any acodent, damage of loss

* Hirer Is responsibie for tha fiest § / "2 | _excess for fice
ar thaft 1o linst party (Le. STYTECH um FTE LT.HI vihicle (inchsding
windscreen) and siso st § | 1o/ -  excess for colislon/'damagatice
& thaft 1o third party’s vahicla for mmmﬂilw

* In the event of tha rental vehicla is not retum ondhe date due & no
contact is maka bo inform our company of any changes & paymant alter
ona week due. Our Company will take action & reposess the vehicle &
& siTnos charge of $120.00 are mubpc! lo tha Hirer indhushw & he
ovardus charpes with an addilional inlerest ol 3% oet manth

e have read the terms and conditions of the rental agreement and agree therato:-

S

Firors Signohulp

Guarantor's Signature

STYTECH AUTO PTE LTD
Signed By
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RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

GENERAL
INSURANC
ASSOCIATION

Irwodc

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-16-112845
Date of Request: 24072018
Stytech Auto Ple Lid

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2 #02-30
Kaki Bukit Autohub

Your Ref No:

Online Purchase

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday Lo Friday Sam to 5pm
GST Registration No: M400017735

Singapore 417921

Dear SirfMadam,

Enguiry Dale 24/07/2018

Enquiry By Teo CHoon Kiat Winston

TP Vehicle No. YN2669M

Accident Date 22107712018

Enguiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
YN2BEIM EQ Insurance Company Lid 24/08/2017-23/08/2018 6223 9433
Thank You.

The images provided 1o you are taken from the onginal repons forwarded o the centre by the members of the General Insurance Association of

Singapore and we lake no responsibiiity for Ihelr accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any loss or damage afising oul of
oF in connaection with the repons or their images

This is a computer generaled document and requires no signature.

hitps:singapore. manmen. comiclaimafindes. cfmMusabox=M TRseslluseaction=dsp_geninvip&refid=1867 T6RACFID=3788501 1 ACFTOKEN=T34.
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TR242018 Invoice

L]

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

GENERAL 6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

l"sum Phone: 465 6224 0010 Fax +65 6224 0030

ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday Lo Friday %am to 5pm

GST Registration No: MA00017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
TAX INVOICE

Our Ref No: GR-18-112845
Date of Request: 24/07/2018 Your Ref No: Onlina Purchase
Stytech Auto Pta Lid
2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2 #02-30
Kaki Bukit Autohub
Singapore 417921
Dear SirfMadam,
Enquiry Dale 24/0772018
Enquiry By Teo CHoon Kiat Winston
TP Vehicle No. YN2869M
Accident Date 22/07/2018
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S$)
TP Insurer Enquiry 187
GST Amount 0.13
Tolal Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 200
Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date
[X] GIRO [ ] Cash [ ] Cheque

hitps: iisingapore, marimen_comiclaimalindex ofmMusebor=MTRsasE lussaction=dsp _geninvipirefid=1867TTEOACFID=37BRS01ACFTOKEN=T34 = 2/2
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- - - Consuitants
E_dm s = Pre Lt

Company Registration No. 18660T188R

S1 LBIAVE 1, M12-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408933 TEL 1 (065) A2563561 FAX 1 065) A1564315

To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Date: 15/10/2019

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT
VoGl YN 2669M (Insd Veh) |Your Ref. No. | DM1BHOD3383/JT
ehicle No =
SLK 7869P (TP Veh) |Our Ref No.: CC6/EQI18013523/Upb3q2
Date of Accident 22/7/2018
Liability 100%
Final Repair Cost . $ 1,819.00 B
Loss of Use . - days -
Rental (If any) i % 321.00| 3 days
Others: ' $ 2.00
5 —
2,142.00
Final Settlement Sum |: § 2,100.00 |GLOBAL SUM
Remarks _ =
ayment Instruction: Payee's Breakd

1

STYTECH AUTO PTE LTD

. $ 2,100.00

JOANNE LEE
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No: 198607188R GST Reg. No. 19-9607188-R

Affillated to Federation Internaticnale Des Exports En Automoblla

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Rel CCB/EQI18013523/Upb3qg2
Ay VR
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date: 15-10-2018
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 089110
Code: EQI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. YN 2665M Veh. Inspected SLK 7868P
Policy No. DMCPHQ17-004561 Coverage (S) 0.00
Claim No. DM18HO03383/JT Excess (5) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 25/07/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA VEZEL HYBRID (A) c.c 1406
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. RU312088861 Colour RED
Odometer 19954 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 CONTINENTAL 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 CONTINENTAL 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 CONTINENTAL & mm
L/H Rear Tyre 20580 R16 CONTINENTAL 8 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  22/07/2018 Inspection Date 25/07/2018
Survey held at STYTECH AUTO PTELTD
2 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 2 #02-30
KAK|I BUKIT AUTOHUB
SINGAPORE 417821
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 3 Working Days




' N 7d 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
() 51 Ubl Ave 1 £01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapare 408333
,’—_. TEL: 6256 35681 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. No, 18-8607188-R Page No.'1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLK 7868P
Qty Description of Parts Condition | Gl (8)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BOOTLID DENTED / BENT 1,253.30 953.00
1|REAR RIGHT BOOT REFLECTOR CRACKED 454 40 325.00
1|REAR BOOTLID VEZEL EMBLEM NECESSARY 42 90 4260
1|HYBRID EMBLEM NECESSARY 72.50 72.50
1|REAR BUMPER TO REPAIR SEE 849.00
LABOUR
2|6GLASS RUBBER SIDE LH & RH NECESSARY 96.80 96 80
LESS 20% DISCOUNT - -298.04
2.868.90 1,192,186
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|BUMPER CHROME MOULDING {SN) NOT NECESSARY 120.00
1|GLASS SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 60.00 40.00
1|REAR BUMPER GLIPS (SN) NOT NECESSARY 30.00 4
1|REVERSE SENSOR (SN) NOT NECESSARY 200.00
410.00 40.00
LABOUR
INTERIOR UPHOLSTERY NOT NECESSARY 80.00
CHECK WIRING B0.00 20.00
ANTI RUST PROOFING. 100,00 30,00
TRANSFER BOOTLID GLASS. 120.00 120.00
TRANSFER BOOT FITTING 150.00 60.00
PAMEL BEATING.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR 500.00 280.00
BUMPER
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING. 600.00 400.00
1,630.00 910.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,908.90 2,142.18

Report Ref No. CCB/EQI18013523/Upb3qg2




I 74 74

- . .

Al i A B
Papge No. 2 of 2

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

1,700.00

Report Ref No. CC6/EQI18013523/Upb3g2

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensod Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:: This Repart is mase solely ior ihe uss snd bensfi of tha Siient named on the frant pags of this Repon




Joanne Lee (LKK Auto)

——————— e —————————————————

From: Joanne Lee [LKK Auto) <report@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 16 October 2019 3:47 PM

To: ‘eqiprs@eqinsurance.com.sg’

Cc ‘chewht@|kkauto.com’

Subject: TP Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN 2669M (Ol) and SLK 7869P (TP) on
22/07/2018

Attachments: LKK REPORT & PHOTO.pdf; TP DS SUPPORTING DOCUMENT pdf

Dear SirMadam,

Please be informed that the above-mentioned case had been settled.
Enclose herewith final report & relevant documents for your necessary action please.

Thank you

Best Regards,

JOANNE | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: report@|kkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Libi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933
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