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Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Kevin <kevinmong23@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 10 September 2018 10:09 AM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: SGL 6603A (TP), SLK 3321D (OI) (AIG)

Ok $3050 Cor confirm  

 

Sent from my iPhone 
 

On 10 Sep 2018, at 9:59 AM, Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Kevin, 
  
As spoken, please re-confirme final fig of $3,050.00 @ 6 days of repairs before GST.  
  
Apologize for making mistaken on the calculation on labour charge, so you no need to 
amend final invoice and all supporting documents. 
  

  
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Kelvin [mailto:riverview@singnet.com.sg]  

Sent: Saturday, 8 September 2018 2:52 PM 

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SGL 6603A (TP), SLK 3321D (OI) (AIG) 

  

amended and sent to RIAZ LLC already 

  
From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Friday, September 07, 2018 3:31 PM 
To: 'Kelvin'  
Cc: sur@lkkauto.com  
Subject: RE: SGL 6603A (TP), SLK 3321D (OI) (AIG) 

  

Hi Kelvin, 
  

Please amend final invoice and all supporting documents and re-sent over to AIG Asia 

Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. 

  

  
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Kelvin [mailto:riverview@singnet.com.sg]  

Sent: Friday, 7 September 2018 2:04 PM 

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SGL 6603A (TP), SLK 3321D (OI) (AIG) 

  

OK CONFIRM 

  
From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Wednesday, September 05, 2018 10:01 AM 
To: riverview@singnet.com.sg  
Cc: 'Kenneth Kong (LKK Auto)'  
Subject: SGL 6603A (TP), SLK 3321D (OI) (AIG) 

  
Hi Kelvin, 

  

As spoken, please re-confirm final fig of $2,450.00 @ 6 days of repairs before GST. 
  

  

  
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  


