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Consultants

Adm mm Em Pres Ltdl Company Registration No. 199607 138R
S UBIAVE 1, #12-25 PFAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARE, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (B465) 62564315
Your Ref: D18004326MFSH Date: 27 July 2018

Our Ret: CS/FCL18013509/Usb

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _SJT 5303U .
Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 25/07/2018 at the premises of M/s Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd and have the following to
report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 88 2,378.73
Revised Estimate Amount k] 1.522.88
“Check” Items Amount : 5%

Market Value : 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%

Nett Value 1 5%
Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages
at the n/s front portion.

rear

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 3 Days

Yours faithfully,
Marcus Chua
Automotive Assessor



MS @ FirstCapital

6 Raffles Quay #21-00 Sagapane D4ASED
Tel iB5) 6222 311 Fax (G5) G227 3547

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited (o req

Ko 1950001060 G5T Reg o, M2-D000676-9

Clains & Hover Underariting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #116-01 City House Singapere DGBRTT

Tel: (65) 6507 3848 Fax: (5S) 6507 3849
wiw msfirgicapital.com L4:)

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
31-05-2018 Our Ref No.
29-05-2018 Claim Type.
SHB2258E Third Party Vehicle.

BLK 14 #01-410/412 DEFU LANE 10

JOUIS SEOW

62898126/ 0 Fax No.
WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA Fax No.

NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

D18004326MFSH

Third Party

5JT5303U

62870590

68416315

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

JIN AUTO SERVICES PTE

LTD Attention.
NA TP Solicitor Fax No.
LUREMNE

IMPORTANT NOTE

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

NIL

NA

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required,




TI26i2018

Claim Workflow System

| Job Sheet (/ClaimWS/Surveyor/JobSheet/240932) _- PRI Documents Q| Close ¥ |

PRI Header Details

‘ Claimant

Claim No D18004326MFSH Policy No D-18088937MFSH S.No & 1 & JIN AUTO
MName
SR JLE:I‘;‘”‘”TD SERMICESETE f“”:"_'-" BLK 14 #01-410/412 DEFU LANE 10
i i & BRI o coner | Mobile: 0, Phone: 62898126 , Fax: 62870590
: | EmailId: : .
SEOW ) Details mailld: JOUIS@IINAUTO.COM,.5G
Our LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS Instructions WITHOUT PREJUDICE:
Surveyor PTE LTD To Surveyor
Insured Insured TP
CITYCAB PTE LTD SHB2258E Vehicle SIT5303U
Name Vehicle No
Mo
PRI Surveyor Surveyor
Recieved 24-07-2018 08:45:09 PM Appointed 26-07-2018 11:23:22 AM Accept 26-07-2018 0
Date Date Date
Survey Report Upload
i [ - - Surveyor ::::Zd R
| Inspection | ' v 26-07-2018 ¥ Choose File
Report Date Report — e
| Date *: -
Vehicle Particulars
Make Please Select Make * Model Please Select Mode| * Year Select Year ¥
ChasisNo || Engine No o Mileage
Cubic e
I
Comy | Capacity '
Multiple Documents Upload
Upload Multiple Documents
File Name Action

Surveyor Job Remarks

Remarks

————

hittps:iificlaims.com:9001/ClaimWS/Surveyor/Details(240932

12



Shirlez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 27 July 2018 5:20 PM

To: LURENEJAW@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; ‘Claim Workflow System!'
Cc: 'SUR" ‘Nivitha (LKK Auto); ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004326MFSH/N

Attachments: SIT 5303U - Preli Advise.pdf

Dear Lurene,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SIT 5303U.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 26 July 2018 11:42 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Cc: LURENEJAW@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004326MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 26 July 2018 11:24 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; LURENEJAW@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004326MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,
Admin Team
- Claim Workflow System



Motor Claims Department

MS First Capitai Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com
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> Back to OneMotoring

PARFINNE Rahata Framiirg

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner [D:
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
7850)

SJT5303U

No

27 Jul 2018
TOYOTA

VIOSE AUTO
Beige

2009
1INZX976560
MRO53HY9305133124
80.0 kw (107 bhp)
$12,717.00

16 Oct 2009

16 Oct 2009

0

$12,717.00

Yes
15 Oct 2019
$6,994.00

15 Oct 2019

A - Car (1600cc & below)
10

$16,201.00

$1,968.00

$8,962.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 27 Jul 2018

I'I‘L'I.FIS'JNI'I.IIH.ﬂQf'l'.SQfILaJ"nl'rUﬂl;‘.‘[lCII'I."EF!quIFEHEI:IEtG'I:F}'I"'UDlIEHBTDFEUBrBQIHFH.IT:'I‘UNU HUN_IU=Fusuguuy | M



Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 Defu Lane 10 #01-412
Singapore 539195

Tel:62898126 Fax :62870590
Company Reg No:200704370C GST Reg No :200704370C

25772018
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE
DEAR SIR / MADAM
ESTIMATE REPAIR COST FOR SJT5303U
01) MRO53HY9305133124 LIST PRICE
02) 1PC FRONT BUMPER Baup Cury $  407.30—
03 1PC FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER %~/ $ 5470~
04) 1PC FRONT FENDER N L § 53010 —
05) 1 PC FRONT FENDER VVTI EMBLEM ¢ $ 38.40 —
06) 1 PC FRONT HEADLAMP  « 4 s 52530 X
07) 1PC SIDE MIRROR LAMP A1 YRS § 4250 &
772{7 $ 159830
LESS25%  -399.575
Cnfy g 119873
(18) SPRAY PAINTING b} 600.00 ‘lf'ﬂo
09) TUFF COAT $ 80.00 3 O
10) CHECK WIRING g 2000 "
1) LABOUR CHARGE TO REMOVE AND RENEW PARTS § 48000 SO0
$ 2.378.73

i& Subjach 1o inal-app

Acknowledged by Repaires
Signatura;

EnceE n .-::lr-r

| dunng resufney

t Prejudice” basis
sHowed

I,_.rr nsurance Lompany

eyed and




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industral Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: B256 3567 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 198607198R GST Reg. No. 19-96071968-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref CSFCIB013508/Usbn2
#16.01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068677 Date - 02-08-2018 I“”l‘”“"||”l"|l‘|
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHB 2258E Veh. Inspected SJT 53030
Policy No. D-180BB93TMFSH Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18004326MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From LUREME Assign Date 26/07/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAVIOS (A) c.C 1497
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2009
Chassis No. MROS3IHYS305133124 Colour BEIGE
Odometer 135056 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Moedification SPORTS RIM
General GOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/60 R15 YOKOHAMA, & mm
L/H Front Tyre |18560R13 YOKOHAMA & mm
R/H Rear Tlll'l'ﬂ 18560 R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |1B5/60 R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S FRONT PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  29/05/2018 Inspection Date 25/07/2018
Survey held at  JIN AUTO SERVICES PTELTD
BLK 14 DEFL LANE 10
#01-412
SINGAPORE 539195
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
sh. Estimate Days of Repair

|ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. 5JT 5303U

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 1996071898R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Page No.:1 of 1

Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wo rluhnp?:}} ;{
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER DEEP CUT 407 30 407.30
1|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER BENT 54.70 5470
1|FRONT FENDER DENTED / BENT 530,10 530.10
1|FRONT FENDER WWTI EMBLEM NECESSARY 38,40 36.40
1|FRONT HEADLAMP NOT MECESSARY 52530 =
1|SIDE MIRROR LAMP NOT NECESSARY 42 50 .
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -390 57 -257 62
1,198.73 77288
LABOUR
SPRAY PAINTING. 500.00 400.00
TUFF COAT. B0.00 30.00
CHECK WIRING 20.00 20.00
LABOUR CHARGE TO REMOVE AND RENEW PARTS. 480.00 300.00
1,180.00 750.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,37B.73 1,522.88
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,200.00
{TOITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18013509/Usbn2

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser




