Vic (LKKAuto)

From: kuanhwa@singnet.com.sg

Sent: Friday, 28 December, 2018 11:51 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: LOD. Accident involving SLC 662 G & SLW 8034 L on accident date of 23.07.2018
Attachments: Scan0001.jpg; Scan0002.jpg; Scan0003.jpg; Scan0004.jpg

Dear Vic,

Please refer to the Letter of Demand, Repair bill, Letter of Authority and GIA search fee.
Kindly revert with offer.
Thank you.

Regards,

Adeline Lee

Lee Kuan Hwa Motor Service
Tel: 6269 9192 Fax: 6269 2239
H/P: 9028 8798

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, December 12, 2018 11:35 AM
To: kuanhwa@singnet.com.sg

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: SLC 662 G (Finalise) Accident: 23.07.2018

Hi Adeline,
Refer to attached. COR $5602.56 , 7 days.
Regards

Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: kuanhwa@singnet.com.sg [mailto:kuanhwa@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 12 December 2018 11:05 AM

To: taufikh@lkkauto.com

Subject: Fw: SLC 662 G (Finalise) Accident: 23.07.2018

Dear Vic/Taufikh,

Attached the end panel photo as per requests.
Kindly please confirm B-P-B $5,582.40.

Thank you.

Regards,

Adeline Lee
Lee Kuan Hwa Motor Service



Tel: 6269 9192 Fax: 6269 2239
H/P: 9028 8798



