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N PN P LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Mafat i 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

- TEL: 6255 3551 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No. 19980T198R. GST Reg No. 19-9507188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automabile

ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref CS/EGIB013461/Uvd3
104 SUNTEC ToweR LT
#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date: 24-07-2018 |
SINGAPORE 038985
Code: EGI
1, Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBD 3305G Veh. Inspected SDN 81887
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. GBD3305G/SL/pl Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From YEE PEI LI Assign Date 24/07/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c o
Engine No, HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mim
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
3, General Information
Accident Date  18/07/2018 Inspection Date 24/07/2018
Survey held at FASTECH AUTC PTELTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPCRE 417883
5a, Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




74 P

Consultants

o Pre Lid Company Registration No. 199607198R
SEUHLAVE 1 #02.25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL 1 (0651 62563561 FAX - (63) 62564315
Your Ref: GBD3305G/SL/pl

Our Ref: CS/EGI18013461/Uvd3 Date: 14/8/2018

The Motor Claims Department

M/s: ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD Without Prejudice
Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.SDN 8188T

We thank you for your instruction on 24/7/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the ahove mentioned vehicle on

24/7/2018 at the premises of M/s FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5515,342.01
Revised Estimate Amount : 8%6,894.75
"Check” Ttems Amount 158

Market Value ;5%

LTA Reimbursement Value 55

Nett Value 1 8%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the rear
n/s front portion

Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

;

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Tuesday, 14 August 2018 9:27 AM

To: ‘Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd.)’

Ce: SUR

Subject: RE: GED3305G / TP : SONB188T/LKK / DOA : 18.07.2018
Attachments: SDN 81887 PRELI REVISED.pdf

Dear Pe1 Li,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SDN 8188T
Date of survey: 24/7/2018
Number of days : 4 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 27 July 2018 8:21 AM

To: 'survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: GBD3305G / TP : SDN8188T/LKK / DOA : 18.07.2018

Dear Pei Li,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SDN 8188T on 24/7/2018 .

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 24 July 2018 5:15 PM
To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>; assignments

<gssignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: GBD3305G / TP : SDN8188T/LKK / DOA : 18.07.2018

. Dear Sir/Mdm,



Thank you for the assignment,

BEST BEGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8{408033)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) [mailto:Survey. Report@ergo.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 24 July 2018 2:36 PM

Cc: 'ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM' <ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM>
Subject: Ol : GBD3305G / TP : SDN8188T/LKK / DOA : 18.07.2018

Dear Catherine/Nivitha,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016” in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single Joint Expert”,

Please conduct this survey request from FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD.

ADDRESS ;1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883

PERSON TO CONTACT . MNANCY LAM @ 6746 5405

ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE : STEVE LIM

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Obtain estimate and advise the consistency of damages to third party
vehicle that you are require to conduct a re-survey before vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your
office directly. Please do keep us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey

status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg,

Attached are our insured's and TP's SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party). No estimates was
provided.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Regards
Yee Pal L

Claims Assistant (Molar)
ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

5 Temasak Boulevard, #04-01 Suntec Tower Fiva
Singapore 038985
DID.. +55 6R2G 9194
Tel | +85 &t 188

51
Fax ' +65 6820 9247

WA ETg 0. Cam, 59 E RG o




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 27 July 2018 8:21 AM

To: ‘Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)'

Ce: SUR

Subject: RE: GED3205G / TP : SDNB188T/LKK / DOA - 18.07.2018

Dear Pei Li,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SDN 8188T on 24/7/2018 .

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 24 July 2018 5:15 PM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: GBD3305G / TP : SDN8188T/LKK / DOA : 18.07.2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S8(408933)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) [mailto:Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 24 July 2018 2:36 PM

To: 'admin-d@lkkauto.com' <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM' <ASSIGNMENTS@LEKKAUTO.COM>

Subject: Ol : GBD3305G / TP : SDN8188T/LKK / DOA : 18.07.2018

Dear Catherine/Nivitha,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016" in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD to be
the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please conduct this survey request from FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD.
. 1



ADDRESS 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883

PERSON TO CONTACT . NANCY LAM @ 6746 5405
ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE @ STEVE LIM

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Obtain estimate and advise the consistency of damages to third party
vehicle that you are require to conduct a re-survey before vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your
office directly. Please do keep us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey

status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are our insured’s and TP's SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party). No estimates was
provided.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Regards,
Yee PelLi
Claims Assistant (Maotor)

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

5 Temasek Boulevard, #04-01 Suntec Tower Five
Singapore 038585

DiD. +G5 AA2S 9194

Tel | +565 6828 91460

Fax +65 6829 9247
www Brga com sg E R
ERGO Is ane of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe. Worldwide, ERGO s represented in mors than 20 countries and concentrates

on Europe and Asia. ERGO is parl of Munich Re (Group), one of the world's. leading nsk carriers

. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
i WWW. aVE.COIm



Mivitha (LKK Auto)

—_— === “
From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 24 July 2018 2:36 PM
To: ‘admin-d@lkkauto com'
Cc: ‘ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM'
Subject: Ol': GBD3305G / TP : SDN8188T/LKK / DOA : 18.07.2018
Attachments: GBD3305G - SAS.pdf; SDNB8188T - SAS.pdf, SDN8188T - PRS FORM.pdf; RE: Request

for prs SDNB1BST (61.1 KB)

Dear Catherine/Nivitha,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016” in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please conduct this survey request from FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD.

ADDRESS : 1 KAKIBUKIT AVENUE 6
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
PERSON TO CONTACT : NANCY LAM @ 6746 5405
ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE : STEVE LIM

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Obtain estimate and advise the consistency of damages to third party
vehicle that you are require to conduct a re-survey before vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your
office directly. Please do keep us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey

status via Survex.ﬂegmn@ergu.com.sg.

Attached are our insured's and TP's SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party). No estimates was
provided.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Hagards
=

a|ms Assislant (Maotor)

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd




Date:
Our Referance:

Your Reference:

To:

ERGO

19.07.2018 Sent via Fax
GBD 3305G/5L/pl "
or
SDN B188T
Ermiail
FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD nancy.lam@fastechauto.com.sg

Pre-Repair Survey [PRS) Acknowledgement

Vehicle For Inspectian: SDN B1BET

Insured's Vehicle:

Date Of Accident:

GBD 33056

18.07.2018

We acknowledge receipt of your request far PRS on:

18.07.2018

In compliance with "5tate Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016", do select an assessor from

the list below and indicate your selection in the box marked *, * LLK— Fﬂrﬂf'f@
AlS Automobile Inspection Services Pte Lid LBs L.B.S Aute Consultants Pte Ltd
FTA FormTeam Consultancy Ple Ltd LKE LKK Auta Consultants Phe Litd
1AS Infiniti Appraisal Service P Priority Services
IPK JP Knights Pre Lid VAL Vicem Lid

v Your reguest for inspection does not have your elient's cost of repair estimate, kindly Forward a copy.

vV |vour request for inspection does not have your client's GIA report, kindly forward a copy.

We acknowledge your interest for direct settiement, we will assess & revert soon upon receipt of estimate.

1" Qur Insured's driver has not reported the accident 1o us todate.

V |otherss  OFFICER-IN-CHARGE - STEVE LIM
Prepared by: M Pei L 63299134 claims{@ergo.com.s
Fa
Signature: FAX : 6829 9247
As or niby: Waorkshop u rily:
Assessor attended workshop on:
Assignment Date: Date::
Agsignrment Time; Time
Inspectar:
Remarks: [ venicle not available at the appointed date and time.

Kindly acknowledge our Assessor presence for the above Job .

Workshop Acknowledgement & Stamp.
Note: Qur Inspection Is on o without admizsion to Nobility basis.




PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date;

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
3733E

SDNE188T

No

24 Jul 2018
TOYOTA
PRIUSHYBRID 1.85 A
Blue

2010
2ZRR123832
ZVW301192308
73.0 kW (97 bhp)
$30,210.00

02 Sep 2010

02 Sep 2010

1

$18,126.00

Yes
01 Sep 2020
$10,875.00

01 Sep 2020

E - Open Category
10

$42,901.00
$9,030.00
$19,905.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 24 Jul 2018

Page 1 of |

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateBy PublicBeforeDeregInput7ZFUNCTION_ID=F0304... 24-Jul-18



FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#01-46,48,50 Autobay

ok Helltiid
o/

#

k|
e g'f.ﬂ! ":__m T s

“a)
fhl-? .

SINGAPORE 417883
VEHICLE NO:SND 8188T
QTy PARTICULAR
1PCS FRONT BUMPER DS T/ $1.250.10 ~
1PCS FRONT BUMPER LOGO ~$68.50
1PCS FRONT BUMPER CENTRE GRILLE 7%+ § fafde, Lo $242.30 —
1PCS FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE 7. .. A J 288 $366.20 —
2 PCS FRONT BUMPER SIDE HOLDERS @3$85.10 %.e~{ $170.20 —
1PCS FRONT BUMPER TOW COVER 4 -7 $30.00 3¢
1PCS FRONT BUMPER SPONGE A $122.60 X.
1PCS FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMNT 777 $485.11 <
1 SET FRONT BUMPER CLIPS A $50.00 ~
1PCS ERONT BUMPER LOWER COVER ~ Torn  772-10 $366.90
1 SET FRONT BUMPER LOWER COVER CLIPS /44 —%50.00 =
2PCS HEADLAMPS @$1850.10 4o e Jespy. 1ot 2900 20 $370020 77
1 PCS FRONT BUMPER TOP RUBBER $122.50 —
1PCS FRONT FENDER N/S B b7 Q6440 $991.10 <~
1PCS FRONT FENDER 'HYBRID' EMBLEM (22t 10/-8y $165.50 ~
2 PCS FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD @$312.20 &t// DN dPftoxd > Eapa0 962440 Y
1 SET FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD CLIPS  7Zex $50.00 —
1PCS FRONT BUMPER INNER RETAINER e $185.30—
1PCS FRONT SUPPORT PANEL 2= $1,145.20 X
1PCS FRONT SUPPORT PANEL TOP GARNISH 77 77 $350.10 ¥
1PCS HEADLAMP PANEL N/S e - $188.50 X
1PCS BONNET n Z’% $945.10 X
1PCS FRONT FOG LAMP NIS (/4 31L-f0 $350.20 ~
1PCS FROMNT LICENCE PLATE W/IHOLDER Ser_ $52,Uﬂf
$12,072.01
LABOUR CHRAGES:
TOWING CHARGE $100.00 £
TO CHECK WIRING $80.00
TO SPRAY RUST PROOFING $120.00 ¢
TO CONDUCT WHEEL ALIGNMENT A1 $120.00 &
TO REFILL AIR CON GAS A1 $150.00 X
LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING & REPLACING PARTS $1.200.00 £ F0
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING $1,500.00 J?oa
LKK Aulo Consulfantg@emadnotify $15,342.01
sl - | U359
: '. e AR
o o b f 1 o ommpan
Acknowledged by Rapa L Q'Q LP
Signaturs

§ 6200

R

v



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

g M

iikia

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CS/EGITA013461/Uvd3n2

NN

ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref :

5 TEMASEK BOULEVARD

#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date 15-08-2018
SINGAPORE 038985
Code: EGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBD 3305G Veh. Inspected SDN 8188T
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. GBD3305G/SLpI Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From YEE PEI LI Assign Date 24/07/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA PRIUS (A) C.C 1787
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2010
Chassis No. ZVW301192308 Colour BLUE
Odometer 121893 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/55 R16 MICHELIM 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/55R16 MICHELIM 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R16 MICHELIN 7mm
L/H Rear Tyre 205/55 R16 MICHELIN 7 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE YEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S FRONT PU_F-{TIDN.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  18/07/2018 Inspection Date 24/07/2018
Survey held at FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
AITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE” BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 4 Working Days




Reg. Mo: 199607188R GST Rep. No. 15-5607198-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SDN 8188T

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01.25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Page Mo 1 of 2

Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition [ S mshop?g“ ISJ}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER DISTORTED 1,250.10 945 11
1|FRONT BUMPER LOGO NECESSARY 68.50 6850
1|FRONT BUMPER CENTRE GRILLE MISSING 242 30 188.20
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE TORN f MISSING 366.20 2B8.50
2|FRONT BUMPER SIDE HOLDERS {@385.10 BENT 170.20 170.20
1|FRONT BUMPER TOW COVER NOT NECESSARY 30.00 -
1|FRONT BUMPER SPONGE MNOT NECESSARY 122 .60 -
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT NOT NECESSARY 48511 -
1|SET FRONT BUMPER CLIPS MECESSARY 50.00 50.00
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER COVER TORN 366,90 31230
1|SET FRONT BUMPER LOWER COVER CLIPS MECESSARY 50.00 50.00
2|HEADLAMPS @$1850.10 HOLDER CRACKED 3.700.20 2.900.20
1|{FRONT BUMPER TOP RUBBER NECESSARY 122.50 12250
1|FRONT FENDER N/S BADLY DENTED 99110 B56.50
1|FRONT FENDER "HYBRID" EMBLEM NECESSARY 165.50 101.00
2|FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD @3$312.20 DEFORMED { TORM 624 .40 570.20
1|SET FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD CLIPS MECESSARY 50.00 50.00
1|FRONT BUMPER INNER RETAINER CRACKED 185.30 185.30
1|FRONT SUPPORT PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 1,145.20 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT SUPPORT PANEL TOP GARMNISH NOT NECESSARY 35010 -
1|HEADLAMP PANEL N/S TO REPAIR SEE 188.50 -
LABOUR
1|BONNET TO REPAIR SEE 94510 =
LABOUR
1|FRONT FOG LAMP N/S CRACKED 35020 312.50
1|FRONT LICENCE PLATE W/HOLDER SCRATCHED 52.00 52.00
LESS 25% DISCOUNT - -1,B08.26
12.072.01 542475
LABOUR
TOWING CHARGE. 100.00 50.00

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18013461/Uvd3n2




N d’d

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bds BA B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
.r"'__! TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Rag. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 18-0607198-R Page Mo.:2 of 2
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop (8)) (s)
TO CHECK WIRING B0 .00 30.00
TO SPRAY RUST PROOFING 120.00 50.00
TO CONDUCT WHEEL ALIGNMENT, NOT NECESSARY 120.00 =
TO REFILL AIR. CON GAS NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING & REPLACING 1,200.00 540.00
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT SUPPORT
PANEL HEADLAMP PANEL N/S AND BONNET.
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING 1,500.00 800.00
3.270.00 1,470.00
GRAND TOTAL 15,342.01 6,894.75
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIR SUM | | §,200.00|

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18013461/Uvd3n2

NOTE: NEW PARTS REPLACEMENT

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Report is made solely for ihe use and benefit of the Client named on the frond page of this Report.
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