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Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Sent: Monday, 19 October 2020 9:14 AM
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)
Cc: MT_Claim_SG
Subject: RE: LCR _ SLF2707H claim against SKL737P _ DOA05.07.2018 ***LKK 

REF:CC4/LPC18013411/Kdb3 [External Confidential]
Attachments: 19102020090807.pdf; 19102020090830.pdf

Lonpac External - Confidential 
 
Dear Jia le, 
 
We attached a copy of our offer to the third party’s lawyer and their reply. 
 
 
Best Regards 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 
 

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLe@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Friday, 16 October 2020 5:24 pm 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: LCR _ SLF2707H claim against SKL737P _ DOA05.07.2018 ***LKK REF:CC4/LPC18013411/Kdb3 [External 
Confidential] 
 
Dear Gerald, 
 
We have forward the settlement document to third party. However, there was no indication on liability, so they 
request the document to show that insurance have settled their driver BI claim at 50% liability. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much 
regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 



2

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]  
Sent: Friday, 16 October 2020 8:55 AM 
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG 
Subject: RE: LCR _ SLF2707H claim against SKL737P _ DOA05.07.2018 ***LKK REF:CC4/LPC18013411/Kdb3 [External 
Confidential] 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential 
Dear Jia Le, 
 
Please see attached. 
 
Best Regards 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 
 

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLe@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 15 October 2020 5:13 pm 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: LCR _ SLF2707H claim against SKL737P _ DOA05.07.2018 ***LKK REF:CC4/LPC18013411/Kdb3 [External 
Confidential] 
 
Dear Gerald, 
 
We have informed workshop that insurance had settled their driver injury claim at 50%. However, they request the 
settlement document for the injury claim. 

 
 
Kindly advise or let us have a copy of settlement document if can forward to them. 
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Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much 
regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 8 October 2020 4:12 PM 
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG 
Subject: RE: LCR _ SLF2707H claim against SKL737P _ DOA05.07.2018 ***LKK REF:CC4/LPC18013411/Kdb3 [External 
Confidential] 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential 
Dear Jia Le, 
 
Before we revert on our mandate, please highlight to the workshop that we 
have settled the driver of SLF2707H’s injury claim at 50% liability with his 
lawyers, Catherine Lim LLC. 
 
Best Regards 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 
 

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLe@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 8 October 2020 3:24 pm 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: LCR _ SLF2707H claim against SKL737P _ DOA05.07.2018 ***LKK REF:CC4/LPC18013411/Kdb3 [External 
Confidential] 
 
Dear Gerald, 
 
Our colleague has also viewed the video footage and opinion that insured’s statement is not tally with the 
circumstances of accident. According to the video showed that third party vehicle following its front vehicle 
tail by tail in their lane and insured attempted to force his way to join in third party queue as a result both 
vehicles collided. Therefore, we are more to be blamed. 
 
Kindly let us have your instruction.  
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Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much 
regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]  
Sent: Saturday, 19 September 2020 10:44 AM 
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG 
Subject: RE: LCR _ SLF2707H claim against SKL737P _ DOA05.07.2018 ***LKK REF:CC4/LPC18013411/Kdb3 [External 
Confidential] 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential 
Dear Jia Le, 
 
We suggest that you arrange for another personnel to review the video footage 
and seek his opinion. 
 
Best Regards 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 
 

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLe@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 16 September 2020 11:51 am 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: LCR _ SLF2707H claim against SKL737P _ DOA05.07.2018 ***LKK REF:CC4/LPC18013411/Kdb3 [External 
Confidential] 
 
Dear Gerald, 
 
We have maintained the offer at 50%. However, third party did not accept and mentioned that it was our 
insured tried to cut into their client’s path caused the collision. 
 
Kindly let us have your comments/instruction. 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. 
Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
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Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 30 October 2019 11:39 AM 
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG 
Subject: RE: LCR _ SLF2707H claim against SKL737P _ DOA05.07.2018 ***LKK 
REF:CC4/LPC18013411/Kdb3 [External Confidential] 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential 
Dear Jia Le, 
 
Kindly proceed as proposed. 
 
 
Best Regards 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLe@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 23 October, 2019 10:11 AM 
To: MT_Claim_SG 
Cc: GERALD POH WEE BIN 
Subject: RE: LCR _ SLF2707H claim against SKL737P _ DOA05.07.2018 ***LKK 
REF:CC4/LPC18013411/Kdb3 [External Confidential] 
 

Lonpac Ref: TBA 

LKK Ref: CC4/LPC18013411/Kdb3 

Dear Sirs/Madam, 

We refer to the above matter. 

We have highlighted to your good office on 26/07/2018 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement 
with our Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd. 

For amicable settlement, we propose 50% liability to Third Party’s claim. 
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Summary to offer to third party repairer, “COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD” is as 
follows: -  

 Claimed Amount Revised Amount  
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 4,719.21 $ 469.94  
2. Loss of Use (7days x $80) $ 560.00 $ 240.00 (4days x $60.00)  
  $ 709.94  
@50%  $ 354.97  
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $ 2.00 $ 2.00  

Total $ 5,281.21 $ 356.97  
       
       

**03days recommendation for repair + 1PRS = 4days. 

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference. 

The above is for your approval. 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-

4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]  
Sent: Friday, 28 June, 2019 11:09 AM 
To: Vic (LKKAuto) 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG 
Subject: RE: LCR _ SLF2707H claim against SKL737P _ DOA05.07.2018 ***LKK 
REF:CC4/LPC18013411/Khb3 [External Confidential] 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential 
 
Dear Vic, 
 
Please see attached and respond to them. 
 
For your information, we have settled the injury claim at 50%. 
 
 
Best Regards 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
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Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 9 May, 2019 10:15 AM 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN 
Cc: Admin A; MT_Claim_SG; Vic (LKKAuto) 
Subject: RE: LCR _ SLF2707H claim against SKL737P _ DOA05.07.2018 ***LKK 
REF:CC4/LPC18013411/Khb3  
 
Dear Gerald, 
 
We refer to the subject matter and to our telephone conversation earlier. 
 
Please find attached TP video footage for your reference. 
 
Based on the TP video footage, we are of the view that our Insured vehicle was already in queue within the 
lane and TP vehicle was the one merging in. We also noticed that Insured vehicle was ahead of the TP 
vehicle. Collision should be avoided if the TP vehicle give way to our Insured vehicle instead of moving 
forward as our Insured vehicle also move forward. 
 
As such, we are of the opinion that our Insured is not liable of this accident. 
 
For your further instruction please. 
 
Thank you. 
 

Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. 
Use or distribution by an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe 
that you received this e-mail in error, please do not read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the 
e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the sender that you have deleted the e-
mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 
 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Friday, 27 July 2018 9:40 AM 
To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
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Subject: RE: LCR _ SLF2707H claim against SKL737P _ DOA05.07.2018 ***LKK 
REF:CC4/LPC18013411/Kub3  
 
Dear Shu Pei, 
 
Attached copy of insured’s GIA report for your attention. 
 
 
 
 
Best Regards 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 26 July, 2018 7:34 PM 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN; ericwoo; ONG LI LI 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Thin Thin (LKKAuto) 
Subject: RE: LCR _ SLF2707H claim against SKL737P _ DOA05.07.2018 ***LKK 
REF:CC4/LPC18013411/Kub3  
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SLF 2707H at M/s Comfortdelgro 
Engineering Pte Ltd. 
 
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action. 
 
Enclosed for your perusal is:  

- Estimated cost of repair 
- Preliminary advice 
 

Our case handler in-charge is Thin Thin and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2360. 

 
Thank you. 
 

Best Regards, 

Shu Pei| Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Monday, 23 July 2018 4:14 PM 
To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: LCR _ SLF2707H claim against SKL737P _ DOA05.07.2018 
 
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 
Thank you for the assignment. 
 
Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange. 
 
BEST REGARDS, 

G.Nivitha | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]  
Sent: Monday, 23 July 2018 2:58 PM 
To: admin-d@lkkauto.com 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: FW: LCR _ SLF2707H claim against SKL737P _ DOA05.07.2018 
 
 
Dear Catherine, 
 
Kindly proceed to conduct the survey on without prejudice 
as our insured is claiming against the third party. 
 
At the same time, kindly proceed to obtain the video 
footage as indicated in the third party’s report.  
 
 
 
Best Regards 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

From: CDGE Braddell Private Cars Crash Repair Operation 
[mailto:braddell_operation@sparkcarcare.com]  
Sent: Monday, 23 July, 2018 2:43 PM 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN 
Cc: CDGE Braddell Private Cars Crash Repair Counter; Denis Teo Chin Chye 
Subject: LCR _ SLF2707H claim against SKL737P _ DOA05.07.2018 
 

Dear Sir / Madam 
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Please advice on the liability of the accident. 

 

And to arrange for survey the car at CDGE, Braddell. 

 

Andrew 

Best Regards 
External Business | ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd 
Off: 6383 7656 (Ngo - Supervisor) / Off: 6383 8115 (William) / Off: 6383 7362 (Andrew) 

Fax: 6281 5767 
www.SPARKcarcare.com 

 
 

 

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software. 
www.avg.com  
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