1/6/2021 Mail - Asher Sng (LKKAuto) - Outlook
Your Ref: MC20182644 // ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 6002E & SKJ 3705Y ON
20/07/2018

Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Wed 1/6/2021 5:38 PM

To: C Meenachi - Ill <Meenachi@iii.com.sg>

[I]J 1 attachments (158 KB)
FW: SKJ3705Y CLAIMING GBE6002E DOA 20.07.18;

Hi Meenachi,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 6002E & SKJ 3705Y ON 20/07/2018

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that TP claimant have disagreed with our offer and inform that would pass the matter to
solictor to handle the claim.

In view of above, we will submit W/P report to your office.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 | did: 6841-6051

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.
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Re: FW: SKJ3705Y CLAIMING GBE6002E DOA 20.07.18

Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com>

Wed 12/30/2020 10:13 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: chloe@nhtmotor.com <chloe@nhtmotor.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Without Prejudice
Hi Asher

We will pass over for the solicitor to handle the claim, thanks.

Best Regards,

Sukyi Chong

Assistant Manager

New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Blk C #01-43 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit S(417883)
Tel : 6747 9241  Fax: 67417276

On Tue, Nov 10, 2020 at 4:50 PM Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> wrote:

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Sir,

We refer to the above matter.

Our principal maintain the previous offer of 50% settlement at G/S $10,090 (All IN).

Kindly reconsider and let us have your acceptance.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
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Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 | did: 6841-6051

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com>

Sent: Friday, October 30, 2020 10:17 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Cc: chloe@nhtmotor.com <chloe@nhtmotor.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: FW: SKJ3705Y CLAIMING GBE6002E DOA 20.07.18

Without Prejudice
Hi Asher

Please kindly update us the status and revert, thanks.

Best Regards,

Sukyi Chong

Assistant Manager

New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Blk C #01-43 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit S(417883)
Tel : 6747 9241  Fax: 67417276

On Fri, Oct 2, 2020 at 3:42 PM Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com> wrote:
Without Prejudice

Hi Asher
Contents noted and thanks for your update.

We look forward to hearing from you soon for a close case, thanks.
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Best Regards,

Sukyi Chong

Assistant Manager

New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Blk C #01-43 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit S(417883)
Tel : 6747 9241  Fax: 67417276

On Fri, Oct 2, 2020 at 3:30 PM Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> wrote:

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Sir,
We refer to the email below.

We are still seeking approval from our principal, shall revert to you once our principal approved.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com>
Sent: Friday, October 2, 2020 1:33 PM
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
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Cc: chloe@nhtmotor.com <chloe@nhtmotor.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: FW: SKJ3705Y CLAIMING GBE6002E DOA 20.07.18

Without Prejudice - gentle reminder
Hi Asher

Officer of GBE6715G AWA Ms Hew Lee Fong replied to our email on 08.11.2018 that their
insured driver is not the culprit of the accident and got us to redirect our claim to your insured.

Enclosed email and police investigation result provided by her for your reference.
Please kindly double check with India and revert.

We look forward to hearing from you soon of the advice, thanks.

Best Regards,

Sukyi Chong

Assistant Manager

New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Blk C #01-43 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit S(417883)
Tel : 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276

On Fri, Sep 18, 2020 at 6:11 PM Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com> wrote:
Without Prejudice

Hi Asher
Officer of GBE6715G AWA Ms Hew Lee Fong replied to our email on 08.11.2018 that their
insured driver is not the culprit of the accident and got us to redirect our claim to your

insured.

Enclosed email and police investigation result provided by her for your reference.
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Please kindly double check with India and revert.

We look forward to hearing from you soon of the advice, thanks.

Best Regards,

Sukyi Chong

Assistant Manager

New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Blk C #01-43 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit S(417883)
Tel : 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276

On Thu, Sep 17, 2020 at 1:18 PM Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> wrote:

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Sir,

We refer to the above matter.

On a without prejudice, for a quick and amicable settlement, our principal propose the settlement at
Global Sum $$10,090.00 (all-in).

PLEASE RECOVER FROM THE BALANCE 50% FROM GBE6715G.

Please kindly let us have your acceptance.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com>

Sent: Friday, September 4, 2020 11:17 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Cc: chloe@nhtmotor.com <chloe@nhtmotor.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: FW: SKJ3705Y CLAIMING GBE6002E DOA 20.07.18

Without Prejudice
Hi Asher

Contents noted and thanks for your update.

Best Regards,

Sukyi Chong

New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Blk C #01-43 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit S(417883)
Tel : 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276

On Fri, Sep 4, 2020 at 10:39 AM Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com> wrote:
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Sir,

We refer to the email below.

We are still seeking approval from our principal, shall revert to you once our principal

approved.
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Thank You.

Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com>

Sent: Friday, September 4, 2020 10:35 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: chloe@nhtmotor.com <chloe@nhtmotor.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: FW: SKJ3705Y CLAIMING GBE6002E DOA 20.07.18

Without Prejudice - gentle reminder
Hi Asher
Please kindly update us the status of this claim.

We look forward to hearing from you soon,thanks.

Best Regards,

Sukyi Chong

New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Blk C #01-43 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit S(417883)
Tel : 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276

On Fri, Aug 14, 2020 at 11:03 AM Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com> wrote:
Without Prejudice - gentle reminder
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Hi Asher
Please kindly update us the status of this claim.

We look forward to hearing from you soon,thanks.

Best Regards,

Sukyi Chong

New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Blk C #01-43 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit S(417883)
Tel : 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276

On Tue, Jul 14, 2020 at 10:21 AM Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com> wrote:
Without Prejudice - gentle reminder

Hi Asher

Please kindly update us the status of this claim.
We look forward to hearing from you soon,thanks.
Best Regards,

Sukyi Chong

New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Blk C #01-43 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit S(417883)
Tel : 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276
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On Fri, Jun 19, 2020 at 10:23 AM Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com> wrote:
Without Prejudice - gentle reminder

Hi Asher
Please kindly update us the status of this claim.

We look forward to hearing from you soon,thanks.

Best Regards,

Sukyi Chong

New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Blk C #01-43 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit S(417883)
Tel : 6747 9241  Fax: 67417276
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On Fri, Jun 12, 2020 at 1:22 PM Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com> wrote:
Without Prejudice - gentle reminder

Hi Asher

Please kindly update us the status of this claim.
We look forward to hearing from you soon,thanks.
Best Regards,

Sukyi Chong

New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Blk C #01-43 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit S(417883)
Tel : 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276
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On Wed, May 27, 2020 at 1:59 PM Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com> wrote:
Without Prejudice - gentle reminder

Hi Asher

Please kindly update us the status of this claim.
We look forward to hearing from you soon,thanks.
Best Regards,

Sukyi Chong

New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Blk C #01-43 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit S(417883)
Tel : 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276
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On Wed, May 13, 2020 at 9:52 AM Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com>
wrote:
Without Prejudice

Hi Asher
Please kindly update us the status of this claim.

We look forward to hearing from you soon,thanks.

Best Regards,

Sukyi Chong

New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Blk C #01-43 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit S(417883)
Tel : 6747 9241  Fax: 67417276
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On Thu, Apr 23, 2020 at 11:25 AM Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com>
wrote:

Without Prejudice - gentle reminder
Hi Asher

Please kindly update us the status and revert ,thanks.

Best Regards,

Sukyi Chong

New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Blk C #01-43 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit S(417883)
Tel : 6747 9241 Fax:6741 7276
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On Wed, Mar 4, 2020 at 10:36 AM Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com>

wrote:
Without Prejudice - gentle reminder

Hi Asher

Please kindly update us the status and revert ,thanks.

Best Regards,

Sukyi Chong

New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Blk C #01-43 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit S(417883)
Tel : 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276
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On Tue, Feb 18, 2020 at 10:51 AM Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com>

wrote:
Without Prejudice - gentle reminder

Hi Asher

Please kindly update us the status and revert ,thanks.

Best Regards,

Sukyi Chong

New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Blk C #01-43 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit S(417883)
Tel : 6747 9241  Fax: 67417276
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On Mon, Feb 3, 2020 at 11:44 AM Admin nht
<admin@nhtmotor.com> wrote:
Without Prejudice - gentle reminder

Hi Asher

Please kindly update us the status and revert ,thanks.

Best Regards,

Sukyi Chong

New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Blk C #01-43 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit S(417883)
Tel : 6747 9241  Fax: 67417276
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On Wed, Jan 8, 2020 at 9:35 AM Admin nht
<admin@nhtmotor.com> wrote:
Without Prejudice - gentle reminder

Hi Asher

Please kindly update us the status and revert ,thanks.

Best Regards,

Sukyi Chong

New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Blk C #01-43 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit S(417883)
Tel : 6747 9241  Fax: 67417276
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On Fri, Dec 20, 2019 at 10:48 AM Admin nht
<admin@nhtmotor.com> wrote:
Without Prejudice

Hi Asher

Please kindly update us the status and revert ,thanks.

Best Regards,

Sukyi Chong

New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Blk C #01-43 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit
S(417883)

Tel : 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276
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On Fri, Dec 6, 2019 at 10:09 AM Admin nht
<admin@nhtmotor.com> wrote:
Without Prejudice

Hi Asher

Please kindly update us the status and revert ,thanks.

Best Regards,

Sukyi Chong

New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Blk C #01-43 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit
S(417883)

Tel : 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276
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On Mon, Nov 18, 2019 at 9:27 AM Shu Pei (LKKAuto)
<shupei@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Please note that this case has been re-assigned to Asher.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and
revert to you in due course.

Thank you

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact
the undersigned.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chloe <chloe@nhtmotor.com>

Sent: Friday, 15 November 2019 12:21 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com>

Subject: SKJ3705Y CLAIMING GBE6002E DOA 20.07.18

*Without Prejudice*
Dear Motor Claims Department,

Enclosed LOD and supporting documents for your
reference.

Originals have been posted out.

Please kindly advise officer in charge and hope to
receive offer soon.

Thank you.

**Please note that NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE LTD is
now GST-registered*

Regards,

Chloe

New Hock Teck Motor Pte. Ltd.
GST Reg No.: 201718370k

Tel: 67479241 Fax: 67417276

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Blk C #01-43

Singapore 417883

21/21


mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com
mailto:chloe@nhtmotor.com
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
mailto:admin@nhtmotor.com

