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s Connuhltants
i WS Pre Lid Company Registration No. 1996071988

¥ ¥SU7S A
=
SPUEAVE L 20228 PAVA LB INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE J089330 TEL @ (65) 62563801 FAX ; (UA5) 62504115
Y our ref’ TBA Date: 24.07.2018
Our ref: CC3CTIIR013382/Gjal
The Motor Claims Department
M/s CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD
Dear SirfMadam,
PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SHD 3310U
We refer 1o the above maiter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 20.07.2018

at the premises of M/s ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid (Loyang) and have the following to report:-
Workshop Estimate Amount : S§ 2.481.58

Revised Estimate Amount 1 8§ 990,48

"Check" Items Amount : 5§ 806.20

Total (Including Check Items) - 5§ 1,796.68

Market Value - 88 - (esl.)

LTA Reimbursement Value : 88 - esL.)

Netl Value . 8% - est)

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
Rear Portion

Comments/Present Status:
Dumages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 2.0 days

Yours [aithfully,

XING GUO QIANG
Licensed Appraiser



- COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

REPAIR ESTIMATE* . 4 ,l
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i gglg | Paris lksrrigl]nu! Labour | T ype I Lnit Price l Amount n
Rear Bumper D@ - S 603.60.
Rear Bumper Reinforcement . § 504.35 |\ A & .
Rear Bumper Reinforcement Bracket (LH/RH) 2 5 18000 | § 360,00
Rear Bumper Side Brackel )(. A»’)l/ b 49.00
Rear Bumper Clips o~ 24 ' § 22.00
Rear Bumper Sponge 7 =T 5 14340 [
Rear Bumper Under Cover j\ Y.y § 22500
SUB TOTAL $ 190735
LESS 20% S 38147
DISCOUNTED TOTAL $ 152588
Rear Bumper Reverse Sensor ?f A n b 135.70 |Nen
Rear Bumper Rubber Mat P ’g,c 5 50.00 |Nett
] 185.70
Labour Charge
Panel Beating S 35000 | 2ee -
Spray Painting Charge - 25000 | Lo
Winng Charge 5 5000 | x An
R/Refix Reverse Sensor 5 120,00 i tta
TOTAL LABOUR S 770,00
ESTIMATE TOTAL § 248158
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be prepared after the vehicle is surveved by a motor Surveyvor appoimied by the insurance company.
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QurJob Ref No ! 305180237 GINEERING
Date : 230772018 5 Loyars e Brsmee ocboss
Fax: 6546 8156
FINALIZATION FORM
To LKK Fax:
Attn GUD QIANG
SHD3310U Date of Acciden : 20072018

The survay and eslimates of the repairs of the above-mentioned vehicle are as follows:-

1.

2,

The repair job shall bill to: CHINA — SGJaosax
==
The finalized amount shall be:
{a) Spam Parts after List discoun $550.48
(b}  Lsbour Charges = 544000
Total for Part-By-Part Repair Cost $990.48
{e) Lumpsum Repair (if applicable)
Total for Lumpsum repair cost after Less:  20% -
Final Lumpsum Repalr cost
Estimated normal period for repairs: 2 working days

We shall treat the above amount as Comect and

within T working days

Thank you for your assistance.

A

Confirmed if there Is no reply from you

We canfirm the eslimates and
finalizad amount

e G0,

Signatura : Signalturs :
Name : JUMANI ] \ Mama
Tal B ﬂﬁjﬂﬂﬂ ﬁ\ Date -
] = 45 ; E
Fax 65448155
| —
For Offictal Use Only
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2 Loss of Income Pald N
3. Survey Fees
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COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

REPAIR ESTIMATE

COMPANY : THIRD PARTY'S CLAIMS (CAS) JOBNO
CUSTODPMER: 7010045 REGN NO
ADDRE S5 : COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTELTD MILEAGE
383 SIN MING DRIVE MAKE
SMNGAPORE SINGAPORE 575717 MODEL
65508755 DATE OF REGN
DATETIME IN
ACCIDENT DATE

JOB/PARTS DESCRIPTION

Date: 23.07.2018
Time: 14:02:08
Page: |

305190237
SHD3310U
00o0oooo00
HYUNDAI

40

28.07.2016
20.07.2018 10:25
20.07.2018

QTY IND UNIT-PRICE DISC% AMOUNT

PART REQUISITION

0001 04-01-0103-0579-G [40VC COVER ASSY-REBUMPE 1 603.60 20.00 482.88

0002 04-01-0103-1150-A [40VC PROTECTOR MAT 1IN 50.00 2.00- 50.00

0003 04-01-0101-0111-G HYUNDAI BUMPER COVER CLIF 10L 2200 20.00 17.60
SUB-TOTAL 350.48
JOB NATURE
gpooL PANEL BEATING- REAR 200.00
0001 23-502 SPRAYPAINT ON AFFECTED AREA 200.00
goozL REMOVE/REFIX REVERSE SENSOR 40.00
SUB-TOTAL 440.00
TOTAL 590.48
AUTHORISED : YES/NO
MVA NAME & SIGNATURE SURVEYOR NAME & SIGNATURE

DATE : DATE:
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 ENGINEERING
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Jt_:z Irene (LKKAuto)

From: William Tan Thoo Seng <williamtan@cdge comsg>

Sent: Wednesday, 24 April 2019 8:39 AM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto); KKLau; alfred toh@sg.cntaiping.com

Cc Aileen Tan Lee Noi; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: - - - Re:Yrref : CC3/CTI18013382/GjA3 (SGJ 8058 X) VS SHD3310U DOA
200718

Without Prejudice.

Dear Joy

We are unable to accept your global offer at $1,565.00. (277)

The correct settlement should be at global sum of $1,585.00.

TP
L )

Without any further delay, kindly confirm settlement. {

Thank you.

Best Regards .
William Tan i
Claims Department | ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off : 52148737 | Fax: 62141843

b
N

From: Joy Irene [LKKAuto) <Joylrene @lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 April 2019 6:30 PM

To: KKLau; William Tan Thoo Seng; alfred.toh@sg.cntalping.com

Cc: Alleen Tan Lee Noi; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong [LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Yr ref : CC3/CT118013382/GjA3 (5GJ 8058 X) VS SHD 3310 U D.D.A. 20.07.18

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Mr. William Tan,

We refer to the subject and to your e-mail below.

On without prejudice basis and without admission of liability, we offer global sum $1.565.00 {all-in).
Kindly confirm acceptance.

We apologize for any inconvenience caused.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Joy Irene | Case Handler






JEI Irene (LKKAuto)

From: Jason.Tan <hockic@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 11 September 2018 10:25 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Ce: Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGJ BOS8X AND SHD 3310U ON 20/07/18
Attachments: IMG-20180720-WA0001 jpg; IMG-20180720-WAD000.jpg

Hi Irene,

My car has been send to the workshop and the repair cost is born by the car who had hit on my car from
behind. The carplate no is SIN 2799 Z. Unfortunately my car has hit onto the taxi (SHD 3310U) in front of

me. However there were no visible damage as we have taken the photo on site. We enclose the photo for your
reference

For your onwards action, pls.

JASON

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:Joylrene@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 7 September, 2018 3:00 PM

To: hocktc@singnet.com.sg

Cc: Admin A

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGJ 8058X AND SHD 3310U ON 20/07/18

Our ref: CC3/CT118013382/Gja3

TAN CHEOK HOCK
Policy Holder

Dear Sir,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGJ 8058X AND SHD 3310U ON 20/07/18

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to
resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with
them.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other
information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your

insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please
contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.



Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@|kkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or
privileged information.if you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please
notify the sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution
of the material in this email is strictly forbidden.
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire Transfer Fee

Vehicle No.:
Vehicle Type :
Vehicle Attachment
1:

Vehicle Scheme :
Vehicle Make :
Vehicle Model :
Chassis No, :
Propellant :
Engine No.:
Engine Capacity :
Maximum Power
Cutput :

Maximum Laden
Weight :
Unladen Weight :
Year Of
Manufacture:

QOriginal
Registration Date:

Lifespan Expiry
Date:

COE Category:
PQP Paid:
COE Expiry Date :

Road Tax Expiry
Date:

PARF Eligibility
Expiry Date :
Inspection Due
Date:

Intended Transfer
Date:

CO2 Emission:

CEV/VES Rebate
Utilised Amount :

CO Emission :
HC Emission:
NOx Emission :
PM Emission :

SHD3310U
H10 - Public Transport Taxi (Motor Car)
Air-Con (Taxi)

Taxi (Company)

HYUNDAI

140 1.7 CRDI F/L AT ABS AIRBAG 4DR
KMHLBE41UMGUO093148

Diesel

DAFDGUKE7359

1685 cc

100.0 kW (134 bhp)

2100 kg

1501 kg
2016

28 Jul 2016
27 Jul 2024

A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
$39.616.00
27 Jul 2024
27 Jul 2018

27 Jul 2024
27 Jan 2019
23 Jul 2018

159.00 (g/km)

NOESs:ivr ne gov. sg/ilaniachon/enguire |-IHI'L’EIEI'.'BHL}NBIJBFFGH:]I"-’D'LlNL,| UM L=l 10 15

L7y



Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

e ——————————————

From: Lucas Lee <lucas lee@sg.cntaiping.com=

Sent: Tuesday, 24 July, 2018 11:37 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LEKAuto)

Subject: RE Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SGJB058X (OI : CAI - SNM18D03601C02)
and SHD3310U (TP * LKK REF - CC3/CT118013382/Gja3) on 20/07/2018

Attachments: leeSZ_SNM18D03601C01-5G)8058X-

LKKDirectSettlementAccidentLir CLCR95.753 pdf; MSYH18093835-01-5GJB058X pdf

Categories: HMK

Pear Sirs,
Kindly refer to the above attachment.

Case Handler: Elaine Cheong

Lucas Lee

Claims Department (Motor)

China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Pte. Lid.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 078609
Direct (65) 6385 6181

Fax (65)6222 7T175/6224 7478

Emall: jucas lee(@sg.cntaiping.com

Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

T ISAHY
I Smpapurr wn e 003

Discloimer

This message v confidential; iy contents do nor consrinire a commirment by China Taping Insurance (Yingapore) Pre. Lid, except
where provided for in a written agreement berween you and China Taiping Insurance {(Singapare) Pte. Lid. Any unouthorized
dizctosure, we or dissemination, either in whole or partial, i prohibited. If vow are not the intended recipient of the message,
pleae motify the sender inmediately

From: Mei Kwan [LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 24 July, 2018 1104 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Lucas Lee; Flaine Cheong; Joy Irene [LKKAuto); Hslao Tong (LKKAUta); Asher Sng (LKKAuta); Admin A
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SGIBO58X (01 ; CAl - TBA) and SHD3310U (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI18013382/Gja3) on 20/07/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir /Madam,
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CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE [SINGAPORE) FTE. LTD
CHINA TAIPING

3wt Rnd 81800 Spongiam Toes Segannes U0

T EONS 8010 P T 100D
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Ca By MNu. 200000

Our Reference. SNM18D03601/C01/8
Date . 24 JULY 2018 via Ordinary & Registered Mail

TAN CHEOK HOCK

BLK 286A TOH GUAN RD
#18-42

SINGAPORE 601286

Dear Sir / Madam
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGJB058X AND SHD3310U ON 20 JULY 2018
ALONG AYE TOWARDS MCE

\We refer to the abovementioned accident.

Please be advised that the third party vehicle, SHD3310U , is filing a third party property
claim against your vehicle

We have appointed LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd, to administer the said claim on our behalf
and they will contact you for more information about the accidenl.

Kindly render your assistance and co-operation accordingly.

Yours fruly,

Claims Department

(This is a computer generated lelter and no signature is required.)

CC  LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Aftn JOY

Red CCACTIIBO13382/GIAD
Contact No : 88412408

via Email JOYBLKKAUTO.COM

CC - Agent - (ANO412A) - SAFE HARBOUR ENSURANCE

FO1LKKDS-2013



COMFORIDELGRO

Our Ref T 0718/ SHD3310U /WT(st) ENGINEERING
Your Ref : S R TR
Date : 23-Aug-18 CDGE Taxi Claims Dept eBMEIDND ERHaeng BN
59 Loyang Drive 4th Fir _—

CHINA INSURANCE CO LTD Singapore 508969 ax RO GTES
3 ANSON ROAD A ——
#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWER —— it

SINGAPORE 079909 Viareshops
Attn : Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE os "
DEEIF Sir Layang
ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAXI SHD3310U YOUR INSURED SGJB058X = : o

AND OTHER SJN2789Z ON  20.07.18 S Ming

We are the authorised repair workshop for Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd, the owner of mator
Vehicle No:  SHD3310U which was involved in the captioned accident with your insured
vehicle The vehicle owner and the taxi driver concerned have requested and autharized us to
assist them in presenting their claims against the party responsible for all applicable matters 20 Ui Faos
arising from the damage to the vehicle. b

Fandan
]

Uit

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving SGJ80S8X 34 See r f"-?
we are submitting these claims for your consideration on behalf of the claimants. :.I.. R
TAXI OWNER'S CLAIM 7 Sunges Kdut W
1 Cost of Repair $ 1,059.81 ; ;
2 4 dayslossofRental@ _$ 117.00 per day $ 460,00aruin rustris) Park A
3 Survey Report Fees  (Surveyed by Mis LKK) 3 - i
4 LTA Search Fees $ 7.49
5 GlA | Palice Report Fees ] -
51 Towing / Medical / Transporation Fees 3 -

SubTotal: 5 1,535.30
HIRER'S CLAIM
7 4 days Loss of Income @ _§  80.00 perdays 3 320.00

Total Claims : § 1,855.30

We enclose herewith the following documents to support the claims: -

a)  Original repair bill and photocoples of photographs : ] pcs.
b)  LTA search slip/s of : SGJBOSBX
¢) GIA/ Police report/s of : SHD3310U

d)  Letter of autherity from owner / hirer / operator
{ ) Traffic Compound ( ) Towing/Medical billreceipts ( ) Certificate of Insurance
{ ) Photograph/s of Accident Scene ( x ) Downtime/Mileage record { x ) Rental Rale letler

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of the said claims as
soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settiement reached that it shall be without prejudice
to any personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver

Yours faithfully
‘Watliam 'lan

Deputy Manager
CDGE Claims Department
Tel: 6214 8737 Fax: 6214 1843 Emall : williamtan@cdge.com.sg

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

arecmecos Q 4
COMFORIDELGRO g & O



Juz Irene [LKKAuto!

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 7 September 2018 3:00 PM

To: ‘hocktc@singnet com.sg’

Cc Admin A

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGJ 8058X AND SHD 3310U ON 20/0718

Our ref: CC3/CTI118013382/Gja3

TAN CHEOK HOCK
Policy Holder

Dear Sir,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5G) 8058X AND SHD 3310U ON 20/07/18

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to
resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with
them,

pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other
information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your
insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please
contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@Ikkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or
privileged information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have recelved this email in error) please
notify the sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution
of the material in this email is strictly forbidden.



CDG.M’ARS.V.Leltquuthnrisaliun e

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

[NAF [ PAF) /
ACCIDENT INVOLVING | 40 SHD3I31O0U | SG,IIBDEQ} SINZ7B9Z ON 20-Jul-18 07:50
ALONG AYE[CITY) BF ALEXANDRA EXIT
[/ We TAN CHENG GUAN {Hirer) NRIC No.: 512187016
and/ar (Rellef) NRIC No.:

Taxi Number SHD3310U
hereby autharise CamfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd{CDGE):

1. To submit my/our claims for damages, costs and expense, including loss of income, loss of rental,
medical fee and legal costs.

2. To have absolute discretion to agree to any settlement or compensation amount In respect of my/our claim
against third party (except personal injuries and medical clalms).

3. To sign Discharge Voucher on my/our behalf,
4. To accept any payment (claim proceeds) In respect of the clalm agalnst third party and payment by cheque

shall be forward directly to CDGE In accordance with CDGE’s Instruction and made in favour of
"comfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd".

Date 20-Jul-2018
Name of Hirer TAN CHENG GUAN
Hirer NRIC 51218701G Signature :
-
Address 4322 BUKIT BATOK WEST AVENUE 2 ...
650422
Contact No. 98905165

http:f.’cdgek?.srv:EEIRuntimefRuntimefRumimeﬁl‘»‘.untimeNiewaDG.V... 20/07/2018



policy Mo i DMPCSM1512231702

claimant : COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD

Amount ¢ 5%1,6%0,00

SINGATORE DOLLARS ONE THOUSAMD SIX HUNDRED FIFTY OMLY.

1/We agree to accept the above mentioned amount to b= paid to mefus in full &
final settlement of all claims, costs & diabursements for Injuries / damages
sustained by me/us through an accident involving

Claimant Vehicle Ho. 1 sSHD 33100
tnsured Vehicle No. : SGJ BOSBX
pace of Loss T 20/07/2018
Place of Accldent - AYE (CITY)

1% COMSIDEBRATION of the payment made to ma/us of the aforementicned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PIE. LTD., 1/We agree absoclutely Eo
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGRFORE) PTE. LID. and/ar

insured Hams
priver Hams

: TAN CHEOK HOCE
t TAN CHEOK HOCK

from all claima, present or future in r

sgpect of all loss, injury or damage

sustalned by me/us arising out of the said accident.

1 acknowledge that this payment is made

without admimsion of iiability on the

part of CHINA TATPING INSURANCE {SINGAPORE) PTIE. LTD.

{1} Global Sum

TOTAL . o & « = & = & & 2 #

55 1,650.00

55 1,650.00

Claimant Hame : HRIC Mo :
Signatuce 3 (j. __é% Dace i J(‘ . {? "
i
o [T ZF WA Please [rrwsind yuli cheque thiade patahie 1o
S GOMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE 115
i &4 sicaln o e Bocume”
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Our Ref: CT18070577 ,\

comrort
Date: 20 August 2018 A ——
TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN
Dear SirfMadam
ACCIDENT ON 20/07/2018 @ 07:50 hrs
ALONG AYE(CITY) BF ALEXANDRA EXIT
INVOLVING SGJBOSEX, SIN27B9Z

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish 10 inform that Comfort
Transportation Pte Ltd is the registered owner af the taxi bearing vehicle registration
number SHD3310U (the “Taxi"). The Taxl was hired to TAN CHENG GUAN IC NO
S$1218701G a registered hirer-operator of Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd at the
time of occurrence of the aforementioned accident at a rental rate $117.00 per day
(inclusive of GST).

Please be advised that the Taxi was insured with MS First Capital Insurance Ltd on
a third party basis at the material time of the accident.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission to
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the said accident with a motor
workshop of his choice.

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop direclly for

settlement of claims with third party's insurance company in respect of the said
accident.

Yours faithfully
Christine Tay

Assistant Manager, Fleet Safety

This is a computer generated letter. No signalure is required

483 Sin Ming Drive Singapore 575717 Mainline +55 6555 1188 Facsimile +65 6453 3183
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL 6258 1861 FAX B2E8 4315
Reg Ma: 19960T1BBR GST Reg. No. 18-83607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automaoblie

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD Ref 1 CC3/CTN8013382/Galdn2

3 ANSON ROAD #16-00 Date . 18-08-2019 Mllmnllmlllmlll

SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079909

Code: CTI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SGJ B058X Veh. Inspected SHD 3310U
Policy No. DMPCSN1512231702 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SNM18D03601C02 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 20/07/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI 140 c.c 1685
Engine No. HIDDEMN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. KMHLB41UMGUO093148 Colour BLUE
Odometer 349371 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GO0D
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 CAMPEON & mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/60R16 CAMPEON 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/80 R16 CAMPEON 8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/80 R16 CAMPEON 8 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR FORTION.,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  20/07/2018 Inspection Date 20/07/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
59 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508959
5a. Remarks
A)JTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5h. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL 8256 3581 FAX: 6255 4315

Reg MNo: 188607198R GST Reg No. 19-8507198-R Page No.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHD 3310U
; : Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty. | Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) (s)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 603.60 603.60
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT NOT NECESSARY 50435
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BRACKET (LHIRH)  |NOT NECESSARY 360.00
@5180.00
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE BRACKET NOT NECESSARY 49.00
1|REAR BUMPER CLIPS NECESSARY 22.00 22.00
1|REAR BUMPER SPONGE NOT NECESSARY 143 40
1|REAR BUMPER UNDER COVER NOT NECESSARY 225.00
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -381.47 -125.12
1,525.88 500.48
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR (SN) NOT NECESSARY 135.70
1|REAR BUMPER RUBBER MAT (SN) NEGESSARY 50.00 50.00
185.70 50.00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING. 350.00 200.00
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE 250.00 200.00
WIRING CHARGE. NOT NECESSARY 50.00 3
RIREFIX REVERSE SENSOR 120.00 40.00
770.00 440.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,481.58 990.48
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | 990,48

Report Ref No. CC3/CT118013382/Gja3q2

XING GUD QIANG
M.MATAI AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor

Ha

HO LEONG CHUAN

Automotive Assessor

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TD THIRD PARTIES:- This Repart s made sclely for the ase and beoafil of ihe Client nemed on T front page of this Regon.




