Khanchna (LKK Auto)

#

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Monday, 23 September 2019 4:23 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto); MT_Claim_5G

Cc Admin A

Subject: RE: MANDATE REQUEST - SLD5585H / SKZ4774G [OI-LONPAC:18/18/18/ VP05/020770

|Date of accident:19-07-2018

Dear Khanchna

Please proceed.

Regards,
Ong Li Li
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax:

65) 6296 2706

}P
ol g Theall @ lonpac.com.sg
=1 E i Experience It Now »

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 19 September 2019 3:42 PM

To: MT_Claim_5G

Cc: Admin A

Subject: MANDATE REQUEST - 5LD5585H J SKZ4774G [DI-LDNPHC:lSIlEflE}' \P05/020770 |Date of accident:19-07-
2018

Lonpac Ref: 18/18/18/ VP05/020770

LKk Ref; CC4/LPC180133467/T1kb3s2

Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted to your good office on 24/07/2019 of Third-Party's request to do Direct Settlement with our
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

Our Insured from minor road heading to main road hit Third party vehicle. We opine that BOLA 9 is applicable
and liakility is down against Insured,

summary to offer to third party repairer "CYCLE & CARRIAGE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD" as follows: -



Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/G5T) $ 30.293.89 § 24,571.79
2. Loss of Rental (11 days x $ 100) (W/GST) | $1.177.00 $1,177.00
3. LTA/ GlAa Search Fee % 2.00 ] 2.00
Total | $31,472.89 5 27.750.79
**10days recommendation for repair + 1 PRS = 11 days

The above is for your approval.

Thank you,

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{4085333)




Our ref: SLD 5 g o S\H

Your ref:

. ; Direct Settlement
Date: i 2 DEC 2018

| b enns
To: LOMIC L i\ (g

[
Singapore | 171558

Attn: Motor Claims Department

Re:  Accident Involving Motor Vehicle Nos, SLD §}3’5PT & 5‘;{?- {*? ?QIL C—
At/Along THH}UHE [_}PH;}Hru \lyad  on [JNT/I @ b (%

[ am the owner of yehicle no. SLD SS fS)SH that was involved in an accident with your
insured vehicle no. 1 l,(,'j‘]l.[, '[; of the above accident.

As the accident was caused by your insured negligent/inconsiderate driving, thus I am claiming
from vou for the following: -

1. Cost of Repairs

2. Loss of Use /Rental (|| days@$ [00U perday)
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee

4. GIA Report Fee

5. Others

206,571-74

Tow: s 1] 73075

[ hereby give you fourteen (14) days to comply with the above, failing which, I shall instruct my
solicitor to commence legal action against you. If you have any queries, please contact the
representative of CYCLE & CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES PTE LTD at Telephone No:
67714377 (Mr Alan Quek) / 67714304 (Ms Amanda Ang).

& &5 o5 B8

I hereby give full authority to CYCLE & CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES PTE LTD and their
representative to negotiate/comprise settlement of the above claim on my behalf.

Your co-operation and immediate attention to the above is greatly appreciated. I hereby look
forward to hearing from you soon.

Yours faithfully
\ \.j % . y

‘;;_ -
Name & Signature
Address: C/o. 188 Pandan Loop Singapore 128378
Ce: Mr Alan Quek/ Ms Amanda Ang
E-mail: alan.quekiwcyclecarriage.con.sg / aranda.aneaovelecarriage. com.sg
Fax No. 67795383

Updated..22/01/15



LETTER OF AUTHORIZATION

To: L.UHE}L{ (H{MV'&Lq (1

Singapore 9% §‘§S

Attn.: Motor Claims Department

Dear 5ir / Mdm,

MOTOR ACCIDENT INVOLVING __5L]) $$95H  (owner's
VEHICLE NO.) AND KT Y774 (. (3RD PARTY'S VEHICLE NO.)
on _ 19(v7/ig (DATE) AT 16: 8§ (TIME)
AT/ALONG T w0 '--\13 ?Fh_‘;. W 4 Rogd (ROAD)

[ am the registered owner of SLD D) 595 H (Vehicle No.).

I hereby authorise CYCLE & CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES PTE LIMITED and
its agents or any person(s) authorised by Cycle & Carriage Industries Pte
Limited to do all or any of the following:-

* Submit, resolve and make any claims which I may have against the 3%
party insurers; and/or

* Execute and sign discharge voucher, indemnity forms and all necessary
documents in connection with and arising from the above claim.

All payment towards settlement of my claim should be made in favour of
CYCLE & CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES PTE LIMITED.

.-_':'

R;gﬁftre&@wner’s Signature
“(Company stamp & authorized signature if it is a company-registered vehicle)
Name . !g/i'l'"v\
NRIC No. - 5235 IR LE
Date :




ALl

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO  : I8/18/18/ VP05/020770
DATE : 23 SEPTEMBER 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I'We, TANG JOO KIM confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD and/or owner of SKZ 4774G the sum of Singapore Dollar Twenty-Seven
Thousand Seven Hundred Fifty and Seventy-Nine Cents Only ($27.750.79) in full and
final satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of all property losses competent to me/us
upon the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of all property losses
sustained by me/us whether now or hereafter to become manifest, arising either
directly or indirectly from an accident involving SKZ 4774G and SLD 35585H
on 19 July 2018 along Tanjong Penjuru Road.

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD/ NG MING HUI (HUANG MINGHUI)) against all claims and any claims
whatsoever made by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to CYCLE &
CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES PTE LTD.

I'We hereby acknowledged that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

- e

i e
Pl
S
4 o 2
[ H
......... N S R R R
Signature of vehicle owner/Date

Name of vehicle owner /Date



Mercedes-Benz

Cycle & Carriage
Industries Pte Limited
Authorises Dealer

Company No, | 0440036 7W
GET Reg No. MR-880011 1-X

Owner Mame & Vehicle Info

TAX INVOICE
Inveice Name & Address
Cust No/Mame
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
Feq No/Reg Date
MOTOR CLAIM DEPARTMENT Cate InfMileage
300 BEACH ROAD ,
#17-08/07 THE CONCOURSE AL
SINGAPORE 199555 Engine Mo
Make/Maodel

Contact Na 62507388

T ——

/Tang Joo Kim
SLD5585H / 16/12/2014
23/07/2018/ 80409
WDD2050402R009988
27491030216279

MB/ME C 180 SEDAN (W205) “EXCLUSIVE J EX
027 775 Iridium 541/ 041 101 Learther AR

Account No Terms Date/Time Printad CSE Operator WIP Na Invaice/Credit Mote No
WLOD1605 Credit 29/09,/2018/ 14:40 Al 305 / Alan Quek Ai Lun 25413 28126643
Description of Goods / Services Qty Unit Prica 5% Amount 53
M BPNSUN F.0.C:
POLICY WO/ACC DATE V0101343 J/ 19-07-2018
DRIVE IN:20-07-2018 {/ TP CAR NO:SKZ4774G (LONPAC INS)
DATE IN/DATE SURVEY:23-07-2018 S/ LKK TAUFIKH
BY/AUTHRIZED ON  :VIC ALEPH // 06-08-2018
A BPILAB 0.10 380.00
USE XENTRY TO CHECK CONTROL UMITS & RESET MEMORY T
STANDARD SETTINGS.NETT
A BPILAB 96.00
CHECK HEADLAMP WITH FOCUS ADJUSTMENT.NETT
3 BPNTOW 140.00
ACCIDENT TOWING FROM 2 TG PEMJURU TD PLSC
USING CAR CARRIER
WD: 150398
5 BPNSUB 60.00
LABOUR TO REMOVE AND INSTALL TYRE FROM RIM, (RUN FLAT)
WHEEL BALANCE AND INSTALL NEW VALVE HEAD
A BPILAR 240,00
INSPECT & CONDUCT WHEEL ALIGNMENT.NETT
A BPILAB 2400.00
REMOVE & REPLACE FRONT BUMPER, FRONT LEFT FENDER, FRONT BOMMET &
REMOVE FRONT SUPPORT ASSY COMPOMENTS & REFINISH.
A BPIRES 1800.00
RESPRAY FRONT BUMPER, FRONT BONNET & FRONT LEFT FEMDER
A BPILAB 1920.00
REMOVE & INSTALL FRONT SUSPENSION & WHEEL BASE
% FRT BUMPER 1.00 1375.37 1375.37
X LH/F BUMPER BRACKET 1.00 11.2¢ 11.22
A LH/F BOTTOM GRILLE 1.00 63.93 63.93
X LH/F BASIC MOUNTING FOR BUMPER 1.00 68.53 68.53
X LH/F OUTER PARKING SENSOR 1.00 172.07 172.07
X LH/F PARKING SENSOR SEAL 3.00 6.42 19.28
X LH/F FENDER 1.00 881.86 881.86
Fayment should be made strictly by cash, NETS or cradit cards. Thank pou.
Any ciepule to ihe nvaice must be maca within'3 days. This i5 @ computer genorated sacumenl, no sgnatune is required
Pandan Loop Service Center
@@ | WEDRIVEFIRST CLASS 188 Pandan Loogp
CYCLE & CARRIAGE | Singapare 128374
Tel 4777 8348
Fam: 6779 5383
Lok} Mercedes-ferz - are registered trademarks of Daimler, Stutigart, Germany W, merceces-henz.com.eg Paga 1 af 2




TAX INVOICE

Mercedes-Benz

Cycle & Carriage
Industries Pte Limited
Authorised Dealer

Company No, 194400367
GST Reg Mo MR-850011 1

Invoice Mame & Address

Owner Mame & Vehicle Info

LONPAC INSURANCE BHMD

Cust No/Mame

[Tang Joo Kim

Reg No/Reg Date SLO5585H [ 16/12/2014
MOTOR CLAIM DEPARTMENT Date In/Mileage 23/07/2018/  BOAD9
f‘f?gifﬁgﬂ e Chassis No WDDZ050402R009988
SINGAPORE 199555 Engine Mo 27491020216279
Contact No 67507388 MakeMadel ME/ME C 180 SEDAN (W205) “EXCLUSIVE / EX
ColounTrim 027 775 Iridium S11/ 041 101 Learther AR
Account Mo Terms Date/Time Printed CSE Operatar WIP No Inveice/Cradit Mote No
WLO01605 Credit 29,."09}'2018;" 14:40 A 305 / Alan Quek Ai Lun 25413 28146643
Description of Goods / Services City Lnit Price 53 Amount 5%
%X LH/F WHEEL ARCH 1.00 120.14 120,19
X HRADIATOR GRILLE 1.00 1388.66 138B. 66
X BONNET 1.00 1999.27 1999.27
% LH/F BOMNET HINGE 1.00 181.73 181.73
4 RH/F BONMET HINGE 1.00 181.73 181.73
%X BOMNET ACTUATOR 2.00 181.35 362.70
%X FRT END SUFPORT TOP MEMBER 1.00 691.68 691.68
X FRT CROSS MEMBER 1.00 407.90 407.90
X LH/F CROSS MEMBER BRACKET 1.00 £7.58 67.58
X LH/F HEADLAMP 1.00 31126.25 3126.25
% LH/F HEADLAMP CONTROL UNIT 1.00 571.36 571.36
X LH/F DISC WHEEL 1.00 557.10 557.10
¥ LH/F SHOCK-ABSORBER 1.00 827.79 822.70
X LH/F STEERING KNUCKLE 1.00 1208.64 1208.64
X LH/F TRUST ARM 1.00 577.549 577.54
X LH/F LOWER CONTROL ARM 1.00 hG2.02 592.02
X LH/F UPPER CONTROL ARM 1.00 792.13 792.13
X LH/F WHEEL HUB 1.00 524.09 524.09
% BIHEXAGOMAL NUT 2.00 10.17 20.34
X ONUT 2.00 i.53 /.06
X NUT W FLANGE, BINDING 1.00 6.68 6,68
X SCREW W RND. HEXAL. HEAD 2.00 11.13 22.26
¥ SCREW W RND. HEXAL. HEAD 2.00 15.64 31.28
Lo NUT-A-WASHER ASSEMBLY 2.00 10.17 20.34
X HEXAGON NUT 2.00 4.32 8.64
X LH/F STRUT 1.00 42 .56 42.56
% CONSOLE 1.00 202.17 202.17
X FRT UNDER CARRIAGE COVER 1.00 181.76 181.26
% SRS ACCELERATION SENSOR 1.00 133.00 133.00
X HEXALDBULAR BOLT 1.00 1.21 1.21
X SCREW 10.00 5.50 55.00
Parts 17,497.45 Nett 24,833.45
Labour 7,136.00 7% G5T on 24833.45 1738.34
Standard Menu 0.00
Specialist Job 200.00 Total Payable 26,571.79
[Magnostics Job 0.00 Faid 0.00
Sundry /Others 0.00 Total Due 26,571.79
Total{w/o GST) 24,833.45

Payment should be made strictly by cash, NETS or crogit cards. Thank you,
Any dispute o e inveice must oe made wihin 3 @ays. This is @ compuber genersted dooumant, no signabure is reguired

€e

CYCLE & CARRIAGE

| WEDRIVE FIRST CLASS

== Mercedes-Hanz - are registared trademarks of Daimler, Stuttgart, Germany
8 ;

Pandan Loop Sendce Centar
188 Pandan Laap

Singapore 128378

Tel; 6777 8348

Fa: 6779 5383
wanw.meraedes benz.com.ag

Paga 2af 2
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Tel: (A5) 6292 5455 Fax: (65) 4292 2864 e-mail: sales@wellscope.com.sg
H/Phone : 9667 5455 (24 Hrs)

FLEXI-DRIVE enTerrRise

Blk 8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 Premier@kaki bukit gate 2 #06-33 lobby C Singapore 415875

" INVOICE
RA: 08567

V. A No. cie MV Model Typa Rentjs L:@'un
YRR CEQ puai
Reference Agreed Retum Date 5 Hours = 1 Day Rental i
_1.) {1 Day Rental = 5 = 1 Hour Exlension)
) el = ¥ Time / Dage In -
s ‘\W”“\‘ perDay |$ per Y @’5) EEMQ\L 1% . o%00rAd
= =
5 per Week | § per KM i Chat w m
& per Manth | Cts par Kilometre Out < % 1“;-
Hirers Name |- o R WT
[ e ‘-_rf.a‘ - <¢1 ¥ l
o e I ! \ Rental Charges Dollars Cenls
Address

2l ! 55 L/Lfcwr;é{'m,aé g,),J-\_ [
;{;{ o {Z;"fﬁrllll . ,SVM"E 'j_}f.._sz,/ﬁ/f‘

Total ]:\- \ Days Rental

R el & Ty
T

I

WCNo. &f& ZT (% LA

Reference Contact Tel. Mo,

Drivers Name Passport / IC Na. [ Country
A= &V

Addrass

Petrol E 14 12 34 F E 14 12 34 F

Petral
Out \_ﬁl_l_/ LA S A
\
Outstanding Petrl will charge in every 1/4, 1/2, 34, F |

Driving Licence Mo Expiry Issued by @s per 114
Eo— Sub-Total e
Additianal Diriver Tal. Mo, (Home)
Others
Address Passport / IC MNo. /| Cauntry Grand Total = % 1\ 1“‘_&_&
A 5
!
"Driving Licence No. Expiry lssued by E?&ml
By: (Name in Block Letters) CAEH EHEGE
—_— Hi
TR AR . WRRRR
e L = —~—
NS T %‘3 sk :‘:5- Amount Due / Refundable

V8 e s

- RATES QUOTED ARE FOR USE IN SINGAPORE ONLY.

- THE HIRER IS SOLELY RESPONSIBLE FOR BREACH OF
TRAFFIC LAWS AND ANY PARKING FINES OR SURCHARGES
DURING PERIOD OF HIRE.

Hirer's signature signifies acceptance of agreemant

. H

p \—

x Hum‘r}:ﬁignalﬁre ! Cn’n:pany Stamp
]

Refund
Recoivad §

Out by

Remarks

CAR

NE: Please nofify our office should there be any accident Irvolving this hired vehicle as soon as possible,




Alan Quek Ai Lun
\

From: Lynn Wong Lai Yin

Sent: Friday, 20 July 2018 2:46 PM
To: Alan Quek Ai Lun

Subject: Emailing: SKZ4774G

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF

SINGAPORE
GENERAL
INSURANCE RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

BRURANCE ¢oino st o s
o . SAREE AT e rT one: +ba ax: +o3
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-18-111441
Date of Request:  20/07/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Cycle & Carriage Industries Pte Ltd
188 Pandan Loop
Singapore 128378

Dear Sir/Madam,
Enquiry Date 20/07/2018
Enquiry By LYNN WONG LAI YIN

TP Vehicle No. SKZ4774G
Accident Date 19/07/2018

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SKZ4774G Lonpac Insurance Bhd 25/01/2018-24/01/2019 +65 62507388
Thank Yau,

The images provided to you are taken from the ariginal reports forwarded to the cenire by the members of the General Insurance Association of
Singapore and we take no respansibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any loss ar damage arising out
of or in connection with the reports ar their images

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.



GENERAL
INSURANCE

ASSOCIATION
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF
SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raftles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to Spm

GST Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE
Our Ref No: GR-18-111441
Date of Request:  20/07/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Cycle & Carriage Industries Pte Ltd
188 Pandan Loop
Singapore 128378
Dear Sir/Madam.
Enguiry Date 20/07/2018
Enquiry By LYNN WONG LAI YIN

TP Vehicle No. SKZ4774G
Accident Date 19/07/2018

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S%)

TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date;
[X] GIRO [ ] Cash[ | Cheque




