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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: BodyFix <bodyfix@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 12 September, 2018 10:12 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SLK6855K police report LKK REF CC4/ASM18013331/Dhb3       

Hi Vic, 

Regarding this case, your surveyor Mr Bryan already took photos, if no collision, my client car’s damage came from? 

Kindly provide the damage photos to your client. 

 
Best Regards, 

Yuzhen 

 

BODYFIXBODYFIXBODYFIXBODYFIX    

10 ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK 2A    

#04-06 AMK AUTOPOINT 

SINGAPORE 568047 

TEL: 6257 1289 / 6483 7430    FAX: 6483 7432 

 

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 11 September 2018 3:40 PM 

To: BodyFix <bodyfix@singnet.com.sg> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SLK6855K police report LKK REF CC4/ASM18013331/Dhb3  

 
Your Ref:  SLK 6855K                                                                                  “WITHOUT PREJUDICE” 

Our Ref: CC4/ASM18013331/Dhb3        

 

 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES CB 7302L AND SLK 6855K ON 20/07/2018 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

Please be informed that our Insured Driver reported that the there was no collision between both vehciels. There is 

no conclusive evidence yet to substantiate either party’s version. Enclosed herewith in this email is a copy of our 

insured's accident report for your perusal. 

 

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our OI we will 

revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal assistance until you 

heard further from us. 

 

Meanwhile, kindly forward to us with any evidence (if any) your client have to support your claim.  

 

Thank you. 

 

 



2

Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 

 

From: BodyFix [mailto:bodyfix@singnet.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 20 August, 2018 10:24 AM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: FW: SLK6855K police report 

 
 

Hi Vic, 

Kindly refer the attached police report & below is my client’s statement. 

 
Best Regards, 

Yuzhen 

 

BODYFIXBODYFIXBODYFIXBODYFIX    

10 ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK 2A    

#04-06 AMK AUTOPOINT 

SINGAPORE 568047 

TEL: 6257 1289 / 6483 7430    FAX: 6483 7432 

 

From: lee ted [mailto:saxz88@hotmail.com]  

Sent: Thursday, 16 August 2018 11:35 PM 

To: bodyfix@singnet.com.sg 

Subject: SLK6855K 

 

Dear Ms Tang,  

Regarding the accident involving CB7302L and the driver not reporting the accident. 

Please find attached the police report copy made on 14 August 2018.  

 

You may send the report to the bus company 'SFX Transport'.  

Please make sure to inform them that, as it is their vehicle that their driver, Mr Leow Kok Beng (NRIC No. 

S1548701A) was driving on the day of the accident on 20 July, approximately 7am, SFX Transport is fully 

liable to ensure that their authorised driver reports any form of traffic accident to their insurance 

company.  

 

Failure of their authorised driver at the time of the accident to make an accident report to their insurer 

(AXA), will result in SFX Transport (Registration No. 52963394M) having to bear all repair and related costs 

to my vehicle and loss of use.  

 

In the event that there is no satisfactory response from SFX Transport towards this matter to make 

compensation, or assist in making a claim against SFX Transport's insurer, I will not hesitate to take legal 

action against SFX Transport to reimburse all repair and related costs, as well as any legal fees that arise.  
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Best regards, 

Mr. Theodore Lee 

(Owner of SLK6855K) 

 


