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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 18 December, 2019 9:48 AM

To: Cecilia Lee Peng Geok

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: CWR LOD AGAINST AXA/LKK - YM9972X / XB7886U  DOA 28/5/2018 *** LKK 

REF: CC4/ASM18013314/R1ha3 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Cecilia, 

 

We refer to your below email. 

 

Please be informed that we are currently pending for mandate approval and instructions from our principal. 

 

We will get back to you for an update/offer in due course. 

 

Thank you. 

 

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020" 
 

Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessary.... 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: Su Li (LKK Auto)  

Sent: Wednesday, 18 December, 2019 9:03 AM 

To: Cecilia Lee Peng Geok; Vic (LKKAuto) 

Cc: Admin A; CS A Team 

Subject: RE: CWR LOD AGAINST AXA/LKK - YM9972X / XB7886U DOA 28/5/2018 *** LKK REF: 

CC4/ASM18013314/R1ea3  

 
Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

 

Thank you for your email. 

 

Please be informed that this matter is now handled by my colleague, Mr Vic. 
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Hi Vic, 

 

FYNA, our ref CC4/ASM18013314/R1ha3 

 

 

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020" 
 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Su Li | Admin Support 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 (Ext:119) Email: SuLi@lkkauto.com| Fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Cecilia Lee Peng Geok [mailto:cecilialee@sparkcarcare.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 18 December 2019 8:51 AM 

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto) 

Cc: Admin A; CS A Team 

Subject: Re: CWR LOD AGAINST AXA/LKK - YM9972X / XB7886U DOA 28/5/2018 *** LKK REF: 

CC4/ASM18013314/R1ea3  

Importance: High 

 
Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Sir/Madam 

 

This matter has been long protracted. 

 

Please look into the matter and revert with your settlement offer within the next seven (7) days. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards 

Cecilia Lee 

Claims Department | ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd 

Off: 6214 8354 | Fax: 6214 1843 

 
 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, 12 March 2019 12:14 PM 

To: Cecilia Lee Peng Geok <cecilialee@sparkcarcare.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: CWR LOD AGAINST AXA/LKK - YM9972X / XB7886U DOA 28/5/2018 *** LKK REF: 

CC4/ASM18013314/R1ea3  

  
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

  

Dear Sir / Madam, 

  

Thank you for your email.              
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Please note that: -            

                 

LKK ref Officer in charge 

CC4/ASM18013314/R1ea3 Asher – 6841 6051 

  

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course. 
  

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

  
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Cecilia Lee Peng Geok <cecilialee@sparkcarcare.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 12 March, 2019 8:50 AM 

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: CWR LOD AGAINST AXA/LKK - YM9972X / XB7886U DOA 28/5/2018 

  

Without Prejudice 
 

Dear Sir/Madam 

 

Attached our LOD dated 11/3/2019 for your attention and early settlement. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards 

Cecilia Lee 

Claims Department | ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd 

Off: 6214 8354 | Fax: 6214 1843 

  

  


