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§ LS Bs LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
- — 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Uibi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg Mo 199607188R GST Reg. Mo. 19-0807188-R

Affiliated o Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Real CC4/EQINB013258/Kub3
o0 ToNER B [N
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date . 23-07-2018
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110
Code . EQI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. YP 3773C Veh. Inspected SJM 9T13E
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (5) 000
Assign From JOEL GOH Assign Date 2310712018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
RIH Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  19/07/2018 Inspection Date 24/07/2018
Survey held at 180 SIN MING DRIVE # 08-20
Repairer RCAUTOD
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS. WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
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Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

—eeneoo .

From: Joel Goh <joel goh@eqginsurance comsg>
Sent: Maonday, 8 October 2018 536 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Cc Thin Thin (LEEAuUta)

Subject: RE: PRS FOR SIMS713E (EQ: YP3T730C)
Attachments: SIMSTI1IERDF, YP3ITIICPDF

Dear Shu Pei

Attached our insured’s accident report for your attention
Please let us have the survey report soonest.

Best Regards,

loel Goh

eq

£l Insurance Company Limited

did tel fax

. diakaalth A .-

wileged Confidential information moy be contoined in this message. If you are nal the imtendesd recipient, please nolify the wen

From: Shu Pel (LKKAuto) [mallto:shupel@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, August 21, 2018 12:01 PM

To: Joal Goh

Ce: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: PRS FOR SIM9713E (EQ: YP37730)

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Joel,
We refer to the above matter,

Kindly advice whether insured has reported. IT so, kindly let us have a copy of insured's accident report for our
necessary action,

Thank you.

Best Regards,



Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone 63660055 | emall: shupetdtikkawto com | fax: 67414108
&k 51, Paya Ubi industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{a08933)

From: Shu Pei [LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 July 2018 7:42 PM

To: 'Joel Goh' <joel goh@eqginsurance com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.coms; Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: PRS FOR SIMS713E (EQ: YP3T73C)

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Joel,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a T? direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehlcle SIM 97 13E at M/s Rc Auto.

Kindly advice whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured's accident report for our
necessary action.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
s TP's GIA report

Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge Is Thin Thin and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2360,

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupel@ikkauto com | fax: 6741-3104

Bl 51, Paya Ubs industnal Park, Ut Avenue 1, 802-25 | 5(408933)

From: Joel Goh <joel goh@eninsurance com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 23 July 2018 9:28 AM

To: Pinky Wong <pinky @ legal _biz>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto coms

Subject: RE: PRS FOR S/M9713E (EQ: YP3773C)

Without Prejudice
Dear Pinky

Thank you for your confirmation.
We will arrange accordingly.

Dear LKK



Please assist on this PRS.
COur insured has not reported this accident.

Best Regards,

loel Goh

L]
EQ Insurance Company Limited

did tel o f fax

U
Ll

Privileged/Canfrdential informatian muoy be contamed in this messoge. If pou are not the intended recipient, please notify the sen

From: Pinky Wong ' |
Sent: Monday, Jul',r 23, ms 9:18 AM

To: Joel Goh

Subject: Re: PRS FOR SIM9713E (EQ: YP3773C)

Dear Joel,

Our client propose LKK.
The said surveyor

may contact Mr Tan at 9761 9383,
M/s RC Auto at

160 Sin Ming Drive
#06-20, Sin Ming Autocity,
Singapore 575722

If we do not hear from you within 2 days of this email, our clients shall deem that you have agree that the surveyor appainted
by our dients shall be our single joint expert for this matter,

Thanks n regards,
D

) i'l'l-'l:'.lt

Legal Executive

LEGAL OPTIONS LLC
|GST Registration /UEN Mo, 201203815R)
Tel (65) 6513-2800 DID (65) 6513-2803 Fax (65) 6438-8275



Infermation in this message is confidential and may be legally privileged. It is intended solely for the person(s) to
whom it ts addressed. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete the message and any other record of it from
your system, and notify the sender immediately.

On Mon, Jul 23, 2018 art 9:02 AM. Joel Goh <joel.goh'® eginsurance. com.sg> wrote:

Your Relr 18-AIS-MISC-204M2-VLJP

Without Prejudice

Save As To Costs

Dear Pinky,

We reler to your Fax dated 21/07/2018.

il PRS rogiiest ho ea i 8 e inistimiee ol s

We shall be appointing our surveyor to attend to the pre-repair survey of your client's vehicle.

Below is a list of motor surveyors in our panel. Please revert within 2 working days if you agree or have any
objections to the appointment of any of the motor surveyors. If we do not hear from you, you are deemed to
have agreed 10 the appointment of any of the motor surveyors listed by us. Alternatively. please specify one or
more of our proposed motor surveyors to the said assignment.

1y AJAX Inspection Services Pre Lid 2)  Automobile Inspection Services Pie Lid
Tel: 6255 0808 Tel: 6286 0155
Fax: 6849 9155 Fax: 6284 1539

Contact Person: Sophia
3)  LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Lud 4)  Priority Services




L.B.5. Auto Consultants Pre Lid
Tel: 6281 6690 / 62832866
Fax: 6281 8748

Comact Person: Amy/ Grace

Tel: 62934822

Fax: 62963283

Contact Person: Sharon

5)  RT Appraisal Pre Lid
Tel: 67486076
Fux: 67480361

Contact Person: Elson/Elgene

6 LKEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: 6256-3561

Fax: 6741-4108

71 Eelvin Automotive Appraising
Services

Tel: 81825263
Fox: 67461 148

Contact Person: Kelvin

B)  Automotive Appraiser & Surveying
Services

Tel: 96623655
Fax: 67655661

Contact Person: Mr Chee

91 JP Knights Pre Lud

Tel: 63450068

Fax: 63445328

107 Appraisals Associates Pie Lid
Tel : 67472822

Fax: 67470070

I vou object to all the motor surveyors as proposed by us, please provide a list of at least 10 motor surveyors
whom you consider as suitable 1o appoint for our consideration. We shall revert to vou within 2 working days.

Meanwhile, we reserve our rights on Post-Repair Inspection, kindly contact us or our appointed surveyor before
yvou retum your elient's vehicle to him/her.

Best Regards,
Joel Gah



EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower IND Comples .
did el fax :

..‘Ahh—:fﬂ"ﬂﬁr\pq-- \ﬁ__

PeivilegeddConfiaentivl infovingiion may be contgingd in tie messape. I vou aree mil the anténded vecipment, please notg,



]

"Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Shu Pei (LKKALUto) <shupei®Ikkauto.com>
Monday, 23 July 2018 9:32 AM
assignments

FW: PRS FOR SJMS9T13E (EQ: YP37730)

Best Regards,
Shu Pei| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupsi@® lickautea com | fax: 6741-4108

Bik 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, MD2-25 | S[408933)

From: Joel Goh [mailto:joel.goh@eqginsurance.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 23 July 2018 9:28 AM
To: Pinky Wang <pinky@legaloptions.biz>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: PRS FOR SIM9713E (EQ: YP3773C)

Without Prejudice
Dear Pinky

Thank you for your confirmation.
We will arrange accordingly.

Dear LKK

Please assist on this PRS.

Our insured has not reported this accident.

Best Regards,

Joel Goh

eqgnsurance
e Gx j <Pl
EQ Insurance l:'.|:|rn|:|=mr-|.1.|r Limited |

did 65 6500 ¢ tel &

‘.‘-'LI I il i

fax

<

o——

Privifeged/Confidential information may be contained in this message If you are not the intended recipient, please notify tf



From: Pinky Wong [ ipi

Sent: Monday, July 23, 2018 9:18 AM

To: Joel Goh

Subject: Re: PRS FOR SIM9713E (EQ: YP3773C)

Dear Joel,

Our client propose LKK.
The said surveyor

may contact Mr Tan at 9761 9383,
M/s RC Auto at

160 Sin Ming Drive
#{16-20, Sin Ming Autocity,
Singapore 575722

If we do not hear from you within 2 days of this emall, our clients shall deem that you have agree that the surveyor
appointed by our clients shall be our single joint expert for this matter.

Thanks n regards,
)

Hin

Legal Executive

LEGAL OPTIONS LLC
(GST Registration/ UEN No, 201203825R)
Tel (65) 6513-2800 DID (65) 6513-2803 Fax (65) 6438-8275

Infarmation in this message is confidential and may be legally privileged. It is intended solely for the person(s) to
whom it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete the message and any other record of it
from your system, and notify the sender immediately.

On Mon, Jul 23, 2018 at 9:02 AM., Joel Goh <joel.goh/@eqginsurance.com.sg> wrote:

Your Ref: |8-A18-MISC-204M2-VL_IP

Without Prejudice

Save As To Costs

Dear Pinky,

We refer to your fax dated 21/07/2018.

Kindly email all PRS request to egiprsi@eginsurance . com.sg

2



We shall be appointing our surveyor to attend to the pre-repair survey of your client’s vehicle.

Below is a list of motor surveyors in our panel. Please revert within 2 working days if you agree or have any
objections to the appointment of any of the motor surveyors. If we do not hear from you, vou are deemed to

have agreed to the appointment of any of the motor surveyors listed by us. Alternatively, please specify one

or more of our proposed motor surveyors to the said assignment.

1) AJAX Inspection Services Pte Lid
Tel: 6255 0808

Fax: 6849 9155

2)  Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd

Tel: 6286 0155
Fax: 6284 1339

Contact Person: Sophia

3) LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Lid
L.B.S. Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Tel: 6281 6690 / 62832866

Fax: 6281 8748

Contact Person: Amy/ Grace

4) Priority Services
Tel: 62934822
Fax: 62963283

Contact Person: Sharon

5)  RT Appraisal Pte Ltd
Tel: 67486076
Fax: 67480361

Contact Person: Elson/Elgene

6) LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: 6256-3561

Fax: 6741-4108

7} Kelvin Automotive Appraising
Services

Tel: 81825263
Fax: 67461148

Contact Person: Kelvin

8)  Automotive Appraiser & Surveying
Services

Tel: 96623655
Fax: 67655662

Contact Person: Mr Chee

9) P Knights Pte Ltd
Tel: 63450068

Fax: 63445328

10) Appraisals Associates Pre Lid
Tel : 67472822

Fax: 67470070




Af yniu object to all the motor surveyors as proposed by us, please provide a list of at least 10 motor
surveyors whom you consider as suitable to appoint for our consideration. We shall revert to vou within 2

working days.

Meanwhile, we reserve our rights on Post-Repair Inspection, kindly contact us or our appointed surveyor
before you return your client's vehicle to him/her.

Best Regards,

Joel Gah

Executive | Clinms

eﬁnsuronce
L

- T
T fr:.-l-l'- ¥ el

EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower I3lock MND Comples Singapore 0691 10

did 65 6500 6772 [tel 63 6223 9433 ext fax 65 6223 410
HINSHTNCC. COIML S0
aiw#ﬂm

Priviteged Confidential informarion may he contained in this mes sge If vou are not the imtended reciplenm. pleas



y L7y LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Sedlin Jnin = 51 Libi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapare 408933
d"’-—__! TEL 6256 3561 FAX 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg No 19-8607198.R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Exparts En Autamobile
EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Raf CC4/EQI18013296/Kub3q2
0 TowER o |HTHET
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date: 15-10-2018
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110
Coda: EQI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. YP 3773C Veh. Inspected SJM 97T13E
Policy No. DMCHHO17-000188 Coverage () 0.00
Claim No. Excess (5) 0.00
Assign From JOEL GOH Assign Date 23/07/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA AXIO (A) c.c 1466
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2009
Chassis No. NZE 1416083081 Colour METALLIC GREY
Odometer 147851 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STAMDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/70 R14 NEXEN & mm
L/H Front Tyre [185/70 R14 NEXEN 8 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[185/70R14 NEXEN B mm
L/H Rear Tyre [18570R14 NEXEN 8 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR N/S DOOR
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  19/07/2018 [inspection Date 24/07/2018
Survey held at 180 SIN MING DRIVE # 08-20
Repairer R CAUTO
Sa, Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

IEET]MATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 2 Working Days




y L7L” LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

EdE B ™~ 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubd Industnal Park. Singapore 408633
TEL: 6256 3581 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No: 199607198R GST Reg. No 18-8607188-R Page No. 1 of 1

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJM 9713E

Estimate Our
aty Description of Parts Condition | eimute S| ‘%"""’
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR DOOR BENT G680 00 S60.00
1|REAR DOOR HANDLE BROKEN 260.00 24530
1|REAR DOOR INNER LOCK TO REPAIR SEE 154 00
LABOUR
1|REAR DOOR STICKER NECESSARY 45,00 4500
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -35475 -312.58
1,084.25 93T T2
LABOUR
SPRAY PAINTING INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR 25000 250.00
DOOR INNER LOCK
TO TRANSFER DOOR ACCESSORIES 60.00 60.00
TO REPLACE ABOVE PARTS 200.00 280.00
610.00 580.00
GRAND TOTAL 1.674.25 1,527.72
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,200.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION) -

Report Ref No. CC4/EQI18013298/Kub3q2

Y 4va

KONG SENG CHEONG

Liconsed Appraisar

CHSCLARIER OF LIABELITY TO THIRD PARTIEE - This Asport is made ssinly 150 the uss and benafit i the Cliam nemed on the fronl pege of this Asgert.




