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PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICGES PTE LTD

23 CHANGI SOUTH AVENUE 2 #01-02

SINGAPORE 486443
TEL: 65446676 / 65446689 FAX: 62141511
CO. REG:200707743D  GST REG:200707743D

18-Jul-18

ESTIMATE REPAIR BILL FOR HONDA STEAM REGN NO: SJX 3008 P

688.00
58.00
50.80
85.00
35.00

803.20

105.00
34.20
59.80

2,01910
403.82

1pc Rear bumper _—
1 pc Rear bumper tow cover
2 pcs Rear n/s & o/s side bracket @25 40
1 pc Tailgate top handle outer cover —
1pc Rear tow cover X
1pc Tailgate
1 pc Rear windscreen moulding "
1 pe Tailgate logo "STREAM" =
1pc Tailgate logo " HONDA" ~—
Less 20%

SINETT
188t Rear bumper clips #
1 sat Reverse snsor
1pc Sealant

Sundry

To check wiring

To dismantle and replace reverse sensor

To dismantle and refit rear windscreen

To dismantle and refit the inner companent of tallgate into
new shell

To labour charge for dismantle and renew the accident
damaged parts. Including knock-out, straighten, repair,
reshape and adjust of the end pﬁl}ei elc

To putty and spray painting on the Rear bumper, tailgate,

end gfna[

To apply rustproofing on repaired panels

{ ALL THE REPAIR COSTS ARE SUBJECTED TO GST )

THE ABOVE ESTIMATED COST OF REPAIR DO NOT INCLUDE
ANY UNFORESEEN DAMAGES.
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PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD

23 CHANGI SOUTH AVENLUE 2 201-02

SINGAPORE 486441

TEL: 63446670 65446689 FAX- 62141511
CO. REG:200707743D  GST REG:200707743D

ESTIMATE REPAIR BILL FOR HONDA STEAM REGN NO: SJX 3008 P

! pc
1 pc
2 pcs
1 pc
1 pc
1 pec
Tpc
! pe
1 pc

Rear bumper _— W

Rear bumpar low cover
Rear n's & o/s side brackst @25 40 Se S
Tallgate top handie outer cover — on

Rear iow cover W M

Talgate ~— Ae

Rear windscreen moulding o

Taligate logo "STREAM™ = [ Lok comm

i =

Tailgate logo * HONDA* —**| 7

Rear bumper clips =~ ﬁ; ( &a:ﬁ:‘fﬁff

Reverse snsor 4

/
Sealsnt A / /"fﬂ

T A

Sundry I

J L5 .
To check witing A% W f #

To dismantie and raplace reverse sansor

To dsmantle and refit rear windscreen

To dismantie and refit the inner companent of taligate into
ngnw shall

To labour charge for dismantie and renew the acciden|
damaged parts. Including knock-out siraighten, repair
reshape and adjust of the and pg:nel elc

To putty and spray painting on the Rear bumper. tailgale
end en&l

To apply rustproofing on repaired panels

{ ALL THE REPAIR COSTS ARE SUBJECTED TOGST )

THE ABOVE ESTIMATED COST OF REPAIR DO NOT INCLUDE

ANY UNFORESEEN DAMAGES.
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'Garr Shi

From: Gary Shi

Sent: Friday, 9 November, 2018 8.01 AM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)'

Ce: AccReport

Subject: RE: LOD / Accident involving SJX300BP & CB7445H on 16.07 18 (Ill case)
Attachments: SJX3008P - DV _pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear loy,

On a without prejudice basis and without admission of liability whatsoever on our client’s part and driver of SIX3008P,
our client agreed to direct settle the above claims at $3063.00

We enclosed hereby Discharge voucher & ATA for your kind attention, original copies will pass to Mr Kalvin,

Kindly let us have your settlement sum of 553063.00 in our favour = Premier Automaotive Services Pte Ltd within
14days from the date hereof.

Please be informed that this settlement excludes any bodily injuries arising out of the above said accident and pertains
to property damage only.

Regards

Gary Shi
Senior Executive, Claims
Premier Automotive Services Pte Lid

Address: 23 Changi South Ave 2, #01-02 Singapore 486443
Tel: 6214 BBBO Ext 069 | DID: 6544 6671 | Fax: 6214 1511
Visit us at: www.premiertaxi.com.sg

Confidentiality Notice | This =—mail messsge, including any attachments, i for (he sole e of the ntended recipéentis) and may comtain confidential or
proprietary nformation. Any uneuthorioed review, ute, diclosure of ditribution 1§ prohibrted, I you ane not the intended recipient, immediately conlact
the sendar by reply =-mall and destroy all caples of the original mesiasge

":, Please Consider Your Environmental Responsibiiity Before Printing This E-mall, SAVE OUR TREES and REDUCE POLLUTION

L

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:loyirene @lkkauto.com)|

Sent: Thursday, 1 November, 2018 5:48 PM

To: Gary Shi

Cc: AccRepont

Subject: RE: LOD / Accident involving SIX3008P & CB7445H on 16.07.18 (Il case)

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Gary,
DV and ATA attached for your necessary action

Thank you.



252018 Marmen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mall is associated with -

*SIX3008P (MFL201800000014)
[CB7445H]
T
PREMIER RENT A CAR PTE LTD
Jul 16 2018 5:00PM
[COMFORTDELGRO BUS PTE LTD]
Premier Automotive Services Pta Lid

meply | Reply Al | Mark as Unread ] “Print Message | Delete Message | Forward |

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (III_SG), sent an 19/10/2018 10148 AM.
To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$3063,00) - SIXI008P - Claim Handler: Lalitha Krishnan

'ﬁpumed:EDE],uD:Fm offer $120 per day for Rental based on benchmark rates

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
There are no documents.

tps Msingapare merimen com/claimsindes cim?fusebox=SVCmail&luseaction=dsp_viewkmode=1&iinboxid=13732014IDomainid=118I0bjld=800&1... 172



PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVE 2 #01-02
SINGAPORE 486443
TEL:65446671 FAX:62141511
CO. REG:200707743D GST REG:200707743D

Our Ref: SIX3008P/GS
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

10 August 2018
(By Email only)
Attn: The Motor Claims Department
India International Insurance Pre Lt
64 Cecil Street #04/2#03
10B Building
Singapore 049711

Dear SirMadam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIX3008F & CB7445H ALONG SLIP ROAD OF
JURONG EAST CENTRAL ON 16.07.18

We have been authorized by Premier Rent A Car Pte Lid, the owner of vehicle number:
SIX3DO0BP, to claim against the party/parties responsible for the damages arising from the
above-mentioned accident.

Our records show that vou are the insurers of vehicle number: CB7445H at the material
time of the accident with the driver of our client’'s vehicle, Mr Abu Bakar Bin
Muhammad Nor

As a result of the accidemt caused by your Insured Driver's negligent driving and/or
management of your insured’s Vehicle Number: CB7445H. our client’s vehicle was
damaged and we have been put to loss and damage as follows:

(1) Cost of repair $  2461.00 (Incl. GST)
(2) Loss of Rental - 8Days @S$200.00per day $ 160000
(3) GIA Search fee Y 2.00

5 4063.00

A copy of each of the following supporting documents is enclosed:
(1) Final Repair Bill, GIA report & sketch plan of SIX3008P

(2) Driver's I/C and Driving Licence

(3) Vehicle Registration card, Centificate of Insurance

(4) Check In/Out Voucher, GIA search



PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVE 2 #01-02
SINGAPORE 486443
TEL:65446671 FAX:62141511
CO. REG200707743D GST REG:200707743D

Our Refl: SIX3008P/GS

We would appreciate if you could look into the subject matter and let us have your
favorable offer within 14 days. If you are agreeable to the settlement of the above said
claims. please forward us your discharge voucher as for our client’s signature and
payment made to “Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd".

Please note that if we do not hear from vou within the stipulated 14 days. we will have no

alternative but to appoint our solicitor to act on our behall'to commence proceedings
against you without further notice to you.

Yours faithfully,

e -

Claims Depatirhent — Gary Shi

Epﬁﬁ: gary shif@premiertasi.com

NB: We encourage all parties to liaise with us via email to expedite all matters

PS: Please quote our reference no when replying

c.c. Client = Premier Rent A Car Pre Lid



AUTHORISATION TO ACT

I/We, PREMIER RENT A CAR PTE LTD (“the third party claimant”) of 23 CHANGI
SOUTHAVENUE 2 #03-02 SINGAPORE 486443 {address), owner of SJX 08P (vehicle

no.) hereby authorize PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop™)

to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use ("claim™)

for my vehicle no. STX 3008P that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on

16/07/2018 (date) along SLIP OF N (location) involving vehicle
no's CB 7445H (“the accident™).

I/'We further authonze the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they
deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my

claim with payment cheque/s being made in favour of “the workshop™.

We further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driverfowner/insurers

of the other vehicle/s is concerned.

Nf."d,

Dated this 4 (day) of (month) 2018 (year)

i
—— —
-~ .

| =
* """-a"“w | "By —
Rt .

. I <y
Signed by “the third party claimant™ Signed by “the workshop”
{with chop if applicable) (with chop)



® |noia INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE FTE LTD
Can, Reg Mo 1RTOFTOR | GST. Reg N MEY-00700006X
. INTEI‘.N&HDHA.‘L Iod | Cocl Stromt | @04 | @05 | #0400 | 100 Nuilding | Snpipore a4NT I
IHIUI.AN:'I e (AS]AMTEIN  Emll el comag
L Fux (U5} 6ZZHIITY  Webnts wwwilloumnsg
Ill- Direct Settlement (PODS)
India Ref: MFL2018D0000014

Claimant Ref  SJX 3008P

et PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES RTE LTR. ., nereby conti that weil have reached an sgresment

wilh the appointed Surveyot of India Intemational Insurance Pie Lig _LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD _ (name
of Surveyor) with respect lo the amount claimed for S§_ 2.461.00  (mpair cos. ss___600.00  (loss ol
wesrental), 58200 (saarch fee), vehicle no SUX 3008P 4y was damaged pursuant 1o the accident which occurmed
on 16.07.2018  oate) s SLIP ROAD OF JURDONG EAST CENTRAL _ (jocation) invoiving vencie no CB T445H (npured
vehicle) This is pursuant 1o the inspection conducted on 19/07/2018  (date) st “the workshop™

We/l confimm thal we/l arefam authorized by the cwner PREMIER RENT A CAR PTELTD ("Ine third party
daimant®) of vehice no SIX 3008P 15 make the claim as set out inthe above paragraph and we/l have full suthority 1o settle
ihe matter on hisfher behall in & manner thal we'l deem fit We/l enclose herain the letter of authority ghwen by “the third
party ciaimant®.

Wall further confirm that wall will indemnify India International Insurance Pre L1g for afl damages, ioss andior sxpense nat
they will or have aready Incusmed in the event that “the third party claimant® afler the above said agreemenl lodges &
further claim against the former for any loss and expensas sufferad pertaining o cost of repairs andior rental andior loss
of use pursuant fo the damage to SJX 3008P (vehicle no.) @s a result of the accident

Well confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final seftlement of all claims of “the third pary caimant™
pursuanl 1o the accidenl and (hal further this setflement is reached on a withoul prejudice and winoul admission of liability
basis.

Thig agreement Is subjed 1o the application of Singapore law and he Singapore Courns have exciulive jUNSSICHan over any
disputs arising oul of ihe same

We/l authorize youto pay the total amount of S8 3.063.00 4, PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES FTE LTD

— day of "l“q““k'rzn Iy =

S
CLAIMANT: 7 TREGRN, WITNESS: -~/ / M
Signature - Signature

Signed by appomted Surveyar
Name: Name. LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS FTE LTD
NRIC SA bUE hﬁ)' _ NRIC 189607 198R
Address w1 [_"l.'m.n:l L’_l_‘-i“' _&_V_l_ ] Address 51 L1 AVENUE 1801-25
Fil-vr (uxtl €W PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK (S) 408933
Nationalty S poiean Nationaity:
Oczupation: /1 Occupstion




S

PREMIER

PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTELTD
OFFICE 73 Changl South Avenue 2 #01-02 S|4B8441)
TEL B5438878 | 65436886 FAX 62141511

AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES CO REG NO - 2067077430 GST. REG, NO. 2007077430
TAX INVOICE
REMIER RENT A CAR PTELTD DATE 10-Aug-2018
3 CHANGI SOUTH AVENUE 2 #01-03 PAGE 10F1
IINGAPORE 486443
TEM Description QTyY U.PRICE AMOUNT
FINAL REPAIR BILL FOR HONDA STREAM 5 2,300.00

REGN NO: SJX 3008 P

—
TOTAL REPAIR COSTS AS RECOMMENDED BY SURVEYOR $ 2,300.00
GST@7%| $ 161.00
GRAND TOTAL| § 2,461.00
-

(ALL THE REPAIR COSTS ARE SUBJECTED TO GST)




T/ae

GENERAL

INSURANCE
ASSOCIATION

Invoice

GST Registration No: M400017735

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffies Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phane: +85 6224 0010 Fax: +85 6224 0030
Operaling Hours: Monday 1o Friday 9am to Spm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref Mo: GR-18-109665

Date of Request: 18/07/2018 Your Rof No: Online Purchase
Premier Aulomolive Sarvicas Ple Lid
23 Changi South Ave 2
#01=02
Singapore 486443

Dear SirfMadam,

Enquiry Dale 18/0T/2018

Enguiry By GOH WEE DEK

TR I\Fahldﬂ MNo. CBT445H

-ident Date 168/07/2018

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. Mo,
CET445H Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid. 01/04/2018-31/02/2019 B461 6555

Thank You.

Tha images provided 1o you are isken from (he orginal reporis forwarded {0 the cenire by the mambers of the General lnsurance Association of
Singapore and we lake no respormibilily for their accurecy or contents and shall be under no labilily whislsoover lor any loes of dcamage arising oul of
of in connection with the reports or their images.

This Is a compular ganeraled document and requiras no signalure.,

l

hiltps: iwww. giarme ong.splciaimsfindex, ofmPusebor=MTRsas&luseaction=dsp_geninviphrelid=1862T334CFID=375013704CFTOKEN=4L0SDME... 12



Taz018 Irvoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GEHERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

B Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapora 048580
INSURANCE Frone +85 6224 0010 Fax. +65 5224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday lo Friday Sam lo Spm
GST Reglstration No: M400OD17735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
TAX INVOICE

Ciur Rel No: GR-18-100668
Dats of Request: 18/072018 Your Ref No; Online Purchasa
Premler Automotive Saervices Ple Lid
23 Changl South Ave 2
w0o1-02
Singspors 486443
Dear SifMadam,
Enquiry Date 181072018
Enquiry By GOH WEE DEK

Vahicle No. CBT445H

sdent Dale 1672018
DESCRIFTION AMOUNT (S%)
TP Insurer Engulry 187
GST Amount 013
Total Amaunt Due (GST Inclusive) 200
Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signalure,

For GIARMC Official usa;
Data:
[X] GIROD [ ] Cash | ] Chequs

hittps:/fwrww.glarme oo sglclaimalindex.cimiusebox=MTRsashluseection=dsp_geninviphrefid=18627338CFID=3TE813TOACF TOKEN=4b05S9ME,.. 212
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Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Settiamant

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Case | Netified Est Submitted | Adj Assigned | Adj Aot Ad) Submitted | Ins Auth'ed Status
‘ |23 012018 Ficter b $$2,300.00  |$$2,300.00 m Tor Swrvey.
— o g | m_m""""l View ot | Cancel Case |

Claim Dwetails

| [Created by adjuster]

COMFORTDELGRO BUS PTE LTD, Co Reg Mo.: 190607256W
PREMIER RENT A CAR PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No.: 2006129298

o8P | _ [ 16/07/2018 17:00 - |59
i ] D.,!,E “' — [97 Months and 16 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr)]

B i
TP / MFL2018D0D000014 .'E‘.‘,‘»;TE‘.’?"‘ D1AMFLO0OOESE (Comprehensive)

]
CH7445H EE:L'::“ BI90B0721TMC

| Excegs:
Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd (HQ) 23 Changl South Ave 2, #01-02, 485443 Changi - Tel! 62148880

il:ndh- International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 63476100 .. [Handled by Lalitha Krishnan - 5347 5139]

| MS1G Insurnnce (Singapare) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: +45 6H27 7888
LXX Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 5256-3561 . [Handied by KALVIN ANG WEI KUN | ... [Final Rpt due
{31/07/2018]

'ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al |  Compose Case Mail |

. IILEGT!HWEMEN Alert - Ad] Mandote Approved (5$3063.00) - SIX3I008P - Clalm Handier; Lalitha Kri...
= 1I_5G (30/07/2018): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$0.00) - SIX3008P - Claim Handler: Lalitha Krishn...

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS— View All | Search Tasks | Create Mew Task | Complete |
Due Date  Priority Type Task Group Subject  Handier Assigned By Completed On Craated On Dona?
Ne results.

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp... 26/11/2018



Menimen e-Claims Page | of 2

Claim Documents

*5IX3008P (MFL2018D0000014)
[CB7445H]
TP
PREMIER RENT A CAR PTE LTD
Jul 16 2018 5:00PM
[COMFORTDELGRO BUS PTE LTD]
Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Upioad Documents |  Upiosd Photos | Compose tew Leter | View [View in Browser |+ ]
'Photos/Images 3 vl =2
No | Relabel/Reorder |LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
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3 |23/07/1808:10 | General View D | owdiec | A
4 |23/07/18 08:10 | Genersl View 0| tadec | A
& |Z3/07/18 08:10 Ganaral View g Load G | A
& 23/07/1808:10 | General View 0 | loaaws | A
7 23/07/1808:10 | General View D | waaws | A
8 |23/07/18 08:10 | General View O | Loediec | A
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31 |2307/18 08:10 | General View 0 | casws | A
32 |23/07/18 08:10 | General View g Load PG | BA
33 |23/07/18 08110 General View 0| adwc | A
34| 23/07/18 08:10 | General View © | loedic | BA
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3 18/10/18 17:01 GIA SEARCH Load POF
4 18/10/18 17:01 LOD Load POF
5 J6711/18 11:46 WORKSHOP INVOICE Load POF
B J6F11/18 11:46 AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM i Load POF
7 |26/11/18 11:46 | RENTAL MILEAGE s Load POF
B |26/11/18 1146 | DISCHARGE VOUCHER Load POF
No | Finalized On India International Insurance Ple Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 |23/07/18 08:56 | Singapore Accident Statement ) | tosd poF
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There are no document checklists configured,

Show Remarks To: L1 Handling Insurer
Mot Barmarks dow privabs wnism you whow if B other parties

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_do... 26/11/2018



Adjuster Report

Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoregno 1sss071s8m)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408833

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email sur@lkkauto com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CC3/1118013236/K1JA3Q2
Date: 261172018

REFERENCE

Handling Insurer: India Intemational Insurance Pte Lid Policy No: D18MFLO0O00BSE

Claimant Vehicle

No : SJX3008P Insured Vehicle No : CBT445H
Date of Loss: 16/07/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: MFL2018D0000014
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SJx3008P
Make & Model: HONDA STREAM, 1.8 L (A) Engine No: R18A13800800
Reg. Dale: 31/05/2010 (Man. Year: 2008) Chassis No: JHMRNBEE0BS200805
Colour: Whila Odometer 7BB88 km
Engine Capacity 1799 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S$): Market Valua/New Car Price
ONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SUR
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification Mo  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size 205/85 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 205/65 R15
Front Lefi Side: Maxxis 7 mm Rear Left Side: Maxxis 7 mm
Front Right Side: Maxxis 7 mm Rear Right Side: Maxxis 7 mm
The pbove waives reprasand the remaining e reads depth
|COST OF CLAIMS - Eﬂnlmr‘! Adjumr's_ Difference E_i‘l'l' ‘jh|
Paris 204328 1,864 64 178.64 8.74
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,970.00 1.040.00 930,00 4721
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 D.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (5§) 4,013.28 2.904.64 1.108.64 27.62
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 2,300.00
(S5) 401328 2,300.00 1.713.28 42 89
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (5%) 28093 161.00 119.93 42 69
Nett Amount (S§) 4,294.21 2,461.00 1,833.21 42,69
+ Car Rental (5.0 x $5120.00/day) (55) 600.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (S§) 2.00
Nett Liability (55) 3,063.00

INSPECTION
Date of Assignment:

Date Inspected.

19/0772018
19/07/2018 Inspecied At

Premier Automotive Services Pte Lid (HQ)
23 Changl South Ave 2, #01-02
Singapore 486443
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Estimated Period of Repair. 3.0 days

Adjuster: KALVIN ANG WEI KUN Manager: Joy lrene Bascao

NOTE Thus report represents our odings af it bme and place of nspection siated heren, Such inspechon has been carmed out fo the best of our
knowledge and ability but any offier Nablity under any oiher circomstences i haredy expreasly seclided
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REPAIR DETAILS -

Reference

|Part Source: MRM-SG Wersion: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 18 Oct 2018)

Parts: M1-MPV HONDA STREAM 1.8 L [A) (Catalogue:Menmen Singapore 1.0}
Labour: Repairer's {Price-denominated Standard List)

|Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SJX3008F)

|Validity: These estimates are valid anly if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
I numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

|Further Info: ltems/values not in reference calalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Oty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 *REAR BUMPER Deformed 688.00FL *BBB.ODFL
2 1 ‘REAR BUMPER TOW COVER Cracked 58.00 FL *58.00FL
3 2 *REAR NIS & O/S SIDE BRACKET Serviceable 50.80FL *-FL
4 1 *TAILGATE TOP HANDLE OUTER COVER Cracked 85.00FL “B5.00FL
5 1 *REAR TOW COVER Nol Necessary 35.00FL *.FL
a8 1 *TAILGATE Dented 903.20FL  *903.20FL
7 1 *‘REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING Necassary 105.00FL  *105.00FL
B8 1 *TAILGATE TOP STREAM Necessary 34 20FL *34 20FL
9 1 *TAILGATE TOP HONDA Necessary 5880 FL *59.90FL
0 1 *SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS Necessary 48.00FS *4B.00FS
11 1 *SET REVERSE SENSOR Shorted 2B0.00FS *200.00FS
12 1 *SEALANT Necassary 50.00FS *50.00FS
13 1 *SUNDRY Necessary 50.00FS *20.00FS

F=Franchise part. 5=5SpcNefi. L=LstiemDsc
Sub Total (S5) 2,447.10 2,251.30
- List tem Discount on L ltems 20.00/20.00% (S$) 403.82 386.68

Total Parts (S§) 2,043.28 1,864.64

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen... 26/11/2018



Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4
Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
There are no now miscellansous itema selected
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour items
1 TO CHECK WIRING New 40,00 20.00
2 TO DISMANTLE AND REPLACE REVERSE SENSOR MNew 80.00 20.00
3 TO DISMANTLE AND REFIT REAR WINDSCREEN MNew 120,00 100.00
4 TO DISMANTLE AND REFIT THE INNER COMPONENT TO New 80.00 50.00
FACILITATE INTO NEW SHELL
5  TO LABOUR CHARGE FOR DISMANTLE AND RENEW THE New 800.00 400.00
ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS .INCLUDING KNOCK
-0OUT ,STRAIGHTEN ,REPAIR, RESHAPE AND ADJUST OF
THE END PAMNEL ETC
] TO PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING ON THE REAR Mew 700.00 400.00
BUMPER .TAILGATE .END PANEL
7 TO APPLY RUSTPROOFING ON REPAIRED PANELS MNew 150.00 50.00
Gross Labour Cost (S$) 1,970.00 1,040.00

Report was unsubmitied during this print-oul.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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