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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Mavis, Chew <Chew.Mavis@aig.com>
Sent: Thursday, 2 August 2018 11:25 AM
To: Chang Wei Kwong
Cc: insurance@lioncityrentals.com.sg; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: AIG ref: #6467401702SG003#023# | Non Reporting Case / Accident involving 

SLL7939R (OI) AND DCW8742 on 09.07.18 @ 1605H along BKE towards Woodlands

Hi Wei Kwong 
 
Till date, your hirer has not lodged the accident report.  
 
Appreciate your assistance for this case as we have received property damage claim via solicitor, thank you. 
 
 
Hi Hsiao Tong, 
 
Please try contacting the hirer (contact details below) too, thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
Ms. Mavis Chew 
AIG  
Complex Claims Examiner 
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. 
 
78 Shenton Way AIG Building #08-16 Singapore 079120 
Tel +(65) 6419 1970 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416  
chew.mavis@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg 

IMPORTANT NOTICE: 

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential.  If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the 
information.  If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and 
any copies or printouts thereof.  Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any 
computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is 
accepted by AIG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 
 
From: Chang Wei Kwong [mailto:ckwong1@ext.lioncityrentals.com.sg]  
Sent: Tuesday, 24 July, 2018 4:47 PM 
To: Mavis, Chew 
Cc: insurance@lioncityrentals.com.sg 
Subject: Re: AIG ref: #6467401702SG003#023# | Non Reporting Case / Accident involving SLL7939R (OI) AND 
DCW8742 on 09.07.18 @ 1605H along BKE towards Woodlands 
 
Dear Mavis, 
 
As requested here is the driver's contact: 
 
Name/Contact: BEK KWONG LONG/  96963644  

Thanks & Regards  
 
LCR INSURANCE TEAM 
Email: insurance@lioncityrentals.com.sg 
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Main Office 
60 Anson Road 
#11-01 Mapletree Anson 
S079914 
 
Branch @ Textile Centre  
200 Jalan Sultan  
#03-33 S199018 
 
Branch @ Big Box  
1 Venture Ave 
Big Box #02-12U 
S608521 
 
Office  : (+65) 3158 4769 
Web    : www.lioncityrentals.com.sg 

 
 
On Tue, Jul 24, 2018 at 3:32 PM Mavis, Chew <Chew.Mavis@aig.com> wrote: 

AIG reference: 6467401702SG003 

LCR vehicle: SLL7939R 

  

Dear LCR officer, 

  

Referring to above mentioned accident, we noted that our driver has yet to file a GIA report. 

  

Kindly assist to inform him/her urgently as we have received notification of property damage claim. Please 
remind him/her to bring along the copy of Police Investigation Result (PIR) if any. 

  

Do let us have your hirer’s name and address for records purposes. Below will be third party’s statement 
extracted from his police report, thank you. 
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Best Regards, 

Ms. Mavis Chew 

AIG  

Complex Claims Examiner 

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. 

  

78 Shenton Way AIG Building #08-16 Singapore 079120 

Tel +(65) 6419 1970 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416  

chew.mavis@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg 

IMPORTANT NOTICE: 

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential.  If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the 
information.  If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and 
any copies or printouts thereof.  Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any 
computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is 
accepted by AIG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 

IMPORTANT NOTICE:  
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, 
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please 
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or 
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other 
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of 
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International 
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any 
way from its use. 

 
 
 
--  
Thanks & Regards  
 
LCR INSURANCE TEAM 
Email: insurance@lioncityrentals.com.sg 
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Main Office 
60 Anson Road 
#11-01 Mapletree Anson 
S079914 
 
Branch @ Textile Centre  
200 Jalan Sultan  
#03-33 S199018 
 
Branch @ Big Box  
1 Venture Ave 
Big Box #02-12U 
S608521 
 
Office  : (+65) 3158 4769 
Web    : www.lioncityrentals.com.sg 
IMPORTANT NOTICE:  
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must 
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by 
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and 
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into 
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no 
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or 
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 


