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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 11 December, 2018 11:13 AM

To: Chunni motor Work; Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 267 L, SKQ 712 J & OTHER ON 19-07-2018

Attachments: LETTER OF DEMAND.pdf

 

 

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

 

Dear William, 

 

Thank you for the email. 

 

Dear Vic, 

 

Kindly assist CC4/LPC18013221/Dhb3 

 

 

 

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 

resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be 

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 

   

 

 

Thank you 

Best Regards, 

Vivian Lau| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

  

  

 

 

 

From: Chunni motor Work [mailto:chunnimw@yahoo.com.sg]  

Sent: Tuesday, 11 December, 2018 11:08 AM 

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 267 L, SKQ 712 J & OTHER ON 19-07-2018 

 
Your Ref : SKQ 712 J (Lonpac) 
Our  Ref : SHC 267 L (190718)  
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE  
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Dear Vivian 
 
We refer to the above cited accident.  
 
We enclose our client's Letter of Demand dated 20-11-2018 together with all the necessary supporting documents 
(see the attached pdf file) for your kind attention. 
 
This is a Direct Settlement, kindly reciprocate to expedite this matter and revert with your offer of an amicable 
settlement as soon as possible.  
 
Thank you and have a nice day ! 
 
 
 
Best Regards 
William 
Claims Department 
 
Chunni Motor Work Pte Ltd  
10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A 
#03-19 AMK AutoPoint  
Singapore 568047 
 
Tel : 6483-6016 (Claims)  
 
DISCLAIMER: 
 
This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed. 
It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information. 
If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached 
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby 
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination 
of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. 
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be 
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses. 
Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this 
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission 
or any modification. 

� Save the trees - Do you really need to print this e-mail? 


