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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 1 October 2018 10:30 AM

To: Chunni motor Work

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 748 B & SKA 6338 B ON 18-07-2018

Dear William, 

 

We have submit our report to Insurance. You may liaise with Ms Elaine Cheong (OIC) - 
elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com. 

 

Thank you. 

  

Best Regards, 

Jannice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Chunni motor Work [mailto:chunnimw@yahoo.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, October 01, 2018 9:25 AM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 748 B & SKA 6338 B ON 18-07-2018 

 
Your Ref : SKA 6338 B (China TaiPing) 
Our  Ref : SHA 748 B (180718)  
 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE  
 
Dear Veron 
 
Your email of 31-08-2018 refers.  
 
We trust that by now you should received mandate from your principals, M/s China TaiPing Insurance (Singapore) Pte 
Ltd and kindly revert with your offer of an amicable settlement as soon as possible.  
 
Thank you and have a nice day, 
 
 
 
Best Regards 
William 

Claims Department  
 
 
Chunni Motor Work Pte Ltd 
10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A 
#03-19 AMK AutoPoint  
Singapore 568047 
 
Tel : 6483-6016 (Claims) 
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DISCLAIMER: 
This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed. 
It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information. 
If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached 
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby 
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination 
of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. 
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be 
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses. 
Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this 
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission 
or any modification. 

 Save the trees - Do you really need to print this e-mail? 

 
 
On Friday, 31 August 2018, 2:14:41 PM SGT, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote:  
 
 

Dear William, 

  

Received with thanks. 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Chunni motor Work <chunnimw@yahoo.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 31 August 2018 2:12 PM 
To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 748 B & SKA 6338 B ON 18-07-2018 

  

RESEND WITH ATTACHMENT 
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On Friday, 31 August 2018, 2:10:13 PM SGT, Chunni motor Work <chunnimw@yahoo.com.sg> wrote:  

  

  

Your Ref : SKA 6338 B (China TaiPing) 
Our  Ref : SHA 748 B (180718)  
  
Hi Veron  
  
We spoke a moment ago. 
  
Please see the attached LOD as requested. 
  
This is a Direct Settlement, kindly reciprocate to expedite this matter and revert with your offer of an amicable 
settlement as soon as possible.  
  
Thank you and have a nice day.  
  
  
Best Regards 
William 
Claims Department 
  
Chunni Motor Work Pte Ltd  
10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A 
#03-19 AMK AutoPoint  
Singapore 568047 
  
Tel : 6483-6016 (Claims)  
  
DISCLAIMER: 
  
This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed. 
It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information. 
If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached 
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby 
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination 
of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. 
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be 
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses. 
Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this 
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission 
or any modification. 

 Save the trees - Do you really need to print this e-mail? 

  


