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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Sent: Monday, 29 July 2019 9:33 AM
To: cuiping@carway.com.sg
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: Accident Involving SKR1805M & SKV3070G along North CanaL Road twds UOB 

Plaza 1 on 12/07/2018 [DIRECT SETTLEMENT] ***LKK REF:CC6/AIG18013164/hb3
Attachments: 1129395589SG stillshot from googlemap.PNG

TrackingTracking: Recipient Delivery

cuiping@carway.com.sg

Admin A

shupei@lkkauto.com Delivered: 29/7/2019 9:33 AM

Meikwan@lkkauto.com Delivered: 29/7/2019 9:33 AM

olivialau@lkkauto.com Delivered: 29/7/2019 9:33 AM

Your Ref: SKR 1805M                          Without Prejudice 
Our Ref: CC6/AIG18013164/Akb3 
 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKR 1805M & SKV 3070G ON 12/07/2018 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We propose settlement at a global sum on a 50% liability basis for $4,300.00(all-in).  
 
We opine that third party have to keep a lookout for oncoming vehicle from Circular Road as accident 
happened at a junction and there’s road construction  
with road barricade being the blind spot unless claimant is able to prove that there was a stop line as per her 
report. 
 
 
Please confirm acceptance. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 



2

 

From: CuiPing (Ms Lee) [mailto:cuiping@carway.com.sg]  
Sent: Wednesday, 10 July 2019 12:02 PM 
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) 
Subject: Re: Accident Involving SKR1805M & SKV3070G along North CanaL Road twds UOB Plaza 1 on 12/07/2018 
[DIRECT SETTLEMENT] ***LKK REF:CC6/AIG18013164/hb3 
 

Dear Jia Le,  

 

We are sending you the video footage of this accident to your office shortly. 

 

Thank you. 

 

 

Best Regards,             

♦ CuiPing (Ms Lee) ♦    

    

www.carway.com.sg 

Office: (+65) 6744 0777  |  Fax: (+65) 6744 2377  |  Mobile: (+65) 8588 0777 

Address: 53 Ubi Avenue 1 #03-01 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408934 

Disclaimer: This e-mail may contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of recipient(s) named 
herein. If you have received this message in error, please delete all copies of it and notify us immediately. 

 

 

On 2019-05-17 12:06, Jia Le (LKK Auto) wrote: 

Dear Ms LEE, 
 
Please re-send a copy of video footage to us as we are unable to find the video.  
 
Thanks. 
 
Best Regards, 
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Carlor Chan | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: cuiping@carway.com.sg [mailto:cuiping@carway.com.sg]  
Sent: Tuesday, 9 October, 2018 12:46 PM 
To: Vic (LKKAuto) 
Subject: Re: Accident Involving SKR1805M & SKV3070G along North CanaL Road twds UOB Plaza 
1 on 12/07/2018 [DIRECT SETTLEMENT] ***LKK REF:CC6/AIG18013164/hb3 
 
 
Dear Vic, 
 
Writing to follow-up on the liability quantum. 
 
Thanks 
 
Ms LEE 
 
 
 
 
On 2018-10-02 14:47, cuiping@carway.com.sg wrote:  

Dear Mr Vic, 
 
Attached video for your reference. 
 
Thanks 
 
Ms LEE 
6744 0777 
 
 
On 2018-07-19 17:08, Shu Pei (LKKAuto) wrote:  

Dear CuiPing, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Please be informed that we are currently pending for OI GIA report. 
 
Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement,  
please contact Vic at 6841 2096. 
 
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to  
you in due course. 
 
Thank you 
 
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the  
undersigned. 
 
Best Regards, 
Shu Pei| Admin 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51,  
Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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-----Original Message----- 
From: cuiping@carway.com.sg [mailto:cuiping@carway.com.sg] 
Sent: Thursday, 19 July 2018 11:49 AM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: PRS: Accident Involving SKR1805M & SKV3070G along North  
CanaL Road twds UOB Plaza 1 on 12/07/2018 [DIRECT SETTLEMENT] 
 
 
 
 
 
On 2018-07-19 11:42, cuiping@carway.com.sg wrote:  

Dear Catherine, 
 
Pls assist to register the claim accordingly. 
 
We have contacted Mr Adrian Ling to conduct the Pre-Repair Survey. 
 
Thanks 
 
CuiPing 
Best Solution Autocare Pte Ltd 


