Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Justin Wong <justin.wong@eginsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 7 September 2018 5:03 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKU6670K (Ol : EQI - DM18HO01844-JW)
AND SHD6801A (TP : LKK REF - CC3/EQI18013162/K1jb3) on 17.07.2018

Attachments: Ol GIA - SLJ5955S.PDF

Dear Joy,

Please find our insured’s accident report and also note that based on our insured’s report, liability is unclear.
Kindly obtain video evidence from third-party to clear liability before DS.
Regards,

Justin Wong
Executive | Claims

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9115 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 115 | fax 65 6223 4190 B
WWW.eginsurance.com.sg

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the senc

From: Justin Wong

Sent: Friday, August 31, 2018 10:07 AM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKU6670K (Ol : EQI - DM18H001844-JW) AND SHD6801A (TP : LKK
REF - CC3/EQI18013162/K1jb3) on 17.07.2018

Dear Joy,
We have sent notice of non-reporting for the said accident to traffic police dated today.
Regards,

Justin Wong
Executive | Claims



TE

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9115 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 115 | fax 65 6223 4190 B
WWW.eginsurance.com.sg

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the senc

From: Joel Goh

Sent: Friday, August 31, 2018 9:20 AM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Justin Wong <justin.wong@eginsurance.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKU6670K (Ol : EQl - DM18H001844-JW) AND SHD6801A (TP : LKK
REF - CC3/EQI18013162/K1jb3) on 17.07.2018

Dear Joy

Our insured has not reported this accident.
Please be informed that this case is being handled by my colleague, Justin.

Best Regards,

Joel Goh
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Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the senc

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:JoyIrene@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, August 30, 2018 3:20 PM

To: Janet Tan; Joel Goh

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKU6670K (OI : EQI - TBA) AND SHD6801A (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/EQI18013162/K1jb3) on 17.07.2018




Dear Sirs,
Kindly assist to check if Ol GIA is already available.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email is
strictly forbidden.

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 19 July 2018 5:31 PM

To: 'Janet Tan' <janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>; Joel Goh <joel.goh@eginsurance.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@|kkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKU6670K (Ol : EQl - TBA) AND SHD6801A (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/EQI18013162/K1jb3) on 17.07.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SHD 6801A at M/s ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte
Ltd - Loyang.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP’s GIA report
- Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Joy and she can be contacted at DID: 6749 5792.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



Total Control Panel

To: joel.goh @eginsurance.com.sg

Login
From: joyirene @lkkauto.com

Remove this sender from my allow list

You received this message because the sender is on your allow list.



